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Livingston
Homecoming

held last weekend
The Livingston Homecoming was held last week-
end. Shown in the top photo is Grand Marshall
Dell Ponder waving to the crowd during the
Homecoming parade. Middle left is Livingston
Mayor Jason Medley presenting Paul Senters with
the Business of the Year award for the Happy
Trails Cafe. Middle right is Mayor Medley pre-
senting Mike Smith with the “Special Friend of
the City of Livingston” and at left is Mayor Med-
ley presenting Joel Hurley with the “Citizen of
the Year” award for his contributions to the com-
munity.

The Rockcastle Rockets football team will take on South Laurel at home this Friday night in the annual
Jamboree Bowl. Shown above are the senior candidates for Jamboree Bowl Queen, front row from left: Callie
Asher, Hope Dull, Alaina Coguer and Chelsey King. Second row from left: Amelia Eversole, Rachel Cain,
Rakhi Patel, Hannah Whitaker and Abbey Eaton. Back row from left: Kendra Dees, Cheyenne Morgan and
Hannah Hicks. Game time is 7:30 p.m. Festivities will be held at halftime.

Fiscal Court
accepts tax rate
from Board
of Education

At last Friday’s special
meeting of the Rockcastle
County Fiscal Court, the
court accepted the Board of
Education’s tax rate for
2014-15; made a donation to
one service agency and
tabled a request from an-
other pending more infor-
mation; approved a Resolu-
tion for coal severance grant
funding; awarded a bid for
a console for 911 for the
new Emergency Operations
building and paid a few bill.

The board of education
took the compensating rate
for this year’s property tax
rate of 40.2c per $100 as-
sessment for real property.

The court approved a
$2,000 donation to the
American Red Cross with
County Judge/Executive
Buzz Carloftis telling the
court, “the American Red
Cross provides more than
$2,000 to Rockcastle
County in services each

First hemp crop
since WWII
harvested here

At Tuesday’s regular
meeting of the Rockcastle
County Industrial Develop-
ment Authority, board mem-
bers were told by Executive
Director that the first hemp
crop since WWII had been
harvested in Rockcastle
county by Growing War-
riors. Hopkins said that
plans were afoot to expand
the crop to 500 acres within
two to three years and that
Growing Warriors had se-
cured a contract with
Patagonia, manufacturers of
clothing using the hemp fi-
ber, to supply them with the
product and that Patagonia
was considering a possible
manufacturing plant in the
county.

Hopkins also said that
she, along with the Growing
Warriors, was in the process
of writing a federal grant to
the USDA for the Richmond
Street Project. This project
would include an education

year.”
However,  the court

tabled a request from
American Legion Post 71’s
commander Tommy
Hodges  and the VFW for a
donation of $3,000 to be
used as a deposit on the
$5,000 needed to bring the
traveling Vietnam Wall to
the county.

The request was tabled
so that more information
can be obtained such as if
the effort to bring the Wall
to the county is not success-
ful, would the $3,000 be re-
funded.

Some of the big winners
from the coal severance
monies was a $50,000 allo-
cation for the county’s rec-
reational fund (purchase of
property). However, there is
a caveat to the appropriation
in that the county must
spend an additional

center, kitchen and a pavil-
ion for the Farmer’s Market
on the site across from
Lovell Lane from which the
present Farmer’s Market
operates.

 A reality show about the
project is being filmed by
NBC Universal, Hopkins
said, and will be aired by
either Spike, the History
Channel or the Discovery
Channel.

The executive director
also said the White House
Clinic had obtained the ser-
vices of a dentist and were
now a full service clinic.
They will be holding an
Open House shortly,
Hopkins said.

Preliminary plans have
been submitted to RCIDA
for a service road from the
storage building, being built
by CSEPP, to their emer-
gency operations building

Emergency personnel reminding motorists
to drive with caution in road work zones

By: Doug Ponder
A Rockcastle County na-

tive is a member of a Chris-
tian bluegrass band that was
recently nominated for a
Dove Award by the Gospel
Music Association.

Greg Bullock, 46, of
Sevierville, Tennessee, is a
Rockcastle County native
and a vocalist for the re-
nowned bluegrass gospel
band “Locust Ridge.” The
band’s latest album
“Healed” has been nomi-
nated for the “Bluegrass Al-
bum of the Year” at the 45th
annual Gospel Music Asso-
ciation Dove Awards.

The band’s “Healed” al-
bum was also produced by
the acclaimed artist and pro-
ducer Steve Gulley, who is

By: Doug Ponder
Local fire and rescue de-

partments are advising mo-
torists to drive with caution
after they had to respond to
a high volume of vehicle ac-
cidents this past week in
road construction zones.

Mt. Vernon Fire Chief
David Bales said his depart-
ment has responded to seven
serious vehicle accidents
and two vehicle fires since
last Wednesday. He said the

Rockcastle County
native member of
GMA Dove Award
nominated band

a former Renfro Valley en-
tertainer and producer of the
Curve Recording Studio in
Cumberland Gap, Tennes-
see.

The band was founded in
Locust Ridge, Tennessee by
three brothers Russell Allen
(vocals/guitar), Josh Allen
(vocals/mandolin) and
Larry Allen (vocals/bass).
Locust Ridge, Tennessee is
also the hometown of Dolly
Parton who is said to be a
huge fan of the band.

The Allen brothers later
added Andy Blalock (guitar/
banjo) and Bullock to the
band. The band has since
gone on to play at hundreds
of churches and other mu-

majority of the vehicle ac-
cidents were caused by an
increased amount of traffic
on the roadways for the La-
bor Day holiday and reck-
less driving by motorists in
road construction zones on
I-75 and Hwy 25.

Bales said that fortu-
nately no one was seriously
injured in any of the acci-
dents and that those with
minor injuries were trans-
ported to Rockcastle Re-

gional Hospital where they
were later released. He said
the only fatality in the large
number of vehicle accidents
was a Black Angus cow that
was hit head-on last Friday
around 5 a.m. by a tractor
trailer on northbound I-75
near the 69 mile marker.

“People had called
Rockcastle 911 early that
morning claiming to see a
black cow wandering
around on the roadway near

that area,” Bales said. “Po-
lice drove around the area
moments before the acci-
dent and didn’t see the cow
on the roadway at the time.
But before they could drive
through the area again, the
cow must have wandered
back onto the road and was
hit by the tractor-trailer.”

Bales said that motorists
are often in a hurry and be-
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Points
East

By Ike Adams

T.J.’s
Journal
by: Tonya J. Cook

(Cont. to A6)

Loretta and I spent Labor
Day weekend in Nashville
attending our Darling, Patty
Tarquino’s wedding.

Sometime soon, I need to
write some pieces on
Pattykin’s intervention into
our lives, but space limita-
tions restrict me right now.

Suffice to say that Patty
became a member of our
family when she was a
freshman at Berea College
in the spring of 2001 and,
more or less, moved in with
us until she graduated.  Un-
til she moved to Nashville,
a couple years ago, it was
not unusual for us to get
email or a phone call from
our Pattykins, announcing
that she was “coming home”
for the weekend, from
Whitesburg, Bowling
Green, or wherever she was
working at the time.  But, as
I said, those are other stories
for other times.

Because, right now, the
story is about “Little Ralph”,
a Garmin GPS electronic
device, that Loretta bor-
rowed from my best buddy,
Ralph King, the night before
we embarked on our road
trip to Nashville.

I had previously printed
off MapQuest driving direc-
tions to our hotel and from
the hotel  to the wedding
site, etc and felt no need for
electronics.

All my previous experi-
ence with these directional
gadgets had convinced me
that the best way to get from
point A to point B, in strange
and different places, was to
have a city map handy and
some idea about the ap-
proximate location of where
I needed to go.  Once I got
into the neighborhood. I’d
pull over, stop a cop, or
someone on the street, and
get him or her to point out
the rest of the way to wher-

ever I might be going.
Loretta’s fancy, hot-shot,
cell phone is supposed to
have a GPS unit built into it
but I have found it to be ba-
sically as useful as mam-
mary protuberances on a
boar hog unless we have a 5
year- old kid in the car to use
it.

Anyway, we stopped in
Smiths Grove, just north of
the Tennessee line, on the
way down, to give my claus-
trophobic, constant compan-
ion, Mr. Parkinson, another
break, and Loretta decided
to hook up my buddy’s hot
shot GPS device and mount
it on the windshield and type
in our destination.

I still had all the written
directions in my lap, but
Ralph’s GPS unit started
talking to us as soon as
Loretta touched the steering
wheel .  Not only that, but it
had a big 7 inch screen right
in front of our noses that sort
of made me feel like we
were at an old-time, drive-
in movie,  to show us exactly
where we were and where
we needed to go .

      Sure enough, it knew
exactly how to get us back
on I-65 south, where every
automobile in the free world
was going 50 mph over the
speed limit and, fighting for
space to switch lanes.  The
GPS  soon told us to switch
lanes and take the exit I had
written down.    Until we
took the exit, failed to im-
mediately bear left immedi-
ately enough, and wound up
on a round- about insult to
engineering that promptly
put us back on 65 north,
headed toward home, it was
doing fine.   At which point
the device started giving in-
structions that seemed to
defy our current reality and

(Cont. to A6)

The Old Bible
Many years ago, a little

over one hundred now, an
old Bible found its way into
our family and remains un-
til this day. It is a rather
unique story and has be-
come almost forgotten, at
least in part.

The story began in
Clearfield, Tennessee, a
small coal-mining town just
ever the border between
Middlesboro, Kentucky, and
Jellico, Tennesee. It was the
home of my great-grandpar-
ents, Henry Frank and Ella
Vestie Otey-Price. He
worked for the American
Association, a company out
of England that bought up
huge tracts of land and tim-
ber. He also traveled quite a
bit for the company and
oversaw several operations,

and was for the time con-
sidered "living a comfort-
able life". He often took
along his oldest child, my
grandma, Evelyn, when
she was a small girl to keep
him company. She would
often tell me of their jour-
neys traveling by train and
staying in the finest  hotels
along the way. This was
around 1905 and the years
following so every thing
was quite ornate. She
would tell of the real silver,
crystal and linen in the din-
ing rooms. The guest
rooms were decorated in
the best Victorian furniture
of the day which was the
style of the era. Grandpa
would hire one of the
maids to care for his

Dropping Knives
When I was a student at

Mt. Vernon Elementary
School, every boy I knew
carried a pocket knife. They
were considered a tool that
all boys needed, and we
used them every day. I dis-
tinctly remember my fourth
grade teacher asking if she
could use my knife to open
a package she had received.
No one ever considered us-
ing a pocket knife as a
weapon in school. As a mat-
ter of fact, we were never
concerned about anyone
having a weapon of any kind
in school. Most of us who
were squirrel hunters had a
shotgun in the trunk of our
automobiles.

During recess and at
lunch, boys compared
knives, sometimes trading
with each other. At some
point in my elementary edu-
cation, I learned about a new
fad – it was called “dropping
knives.” Two boys would
take out a knife from their
pockets and, without actu-
ally seeing the knife in the
other person’s hand, we
would “drop them” or trade
with the other student.
Sometimes you would get a
better knife than the one you
dropped – on other occa-
sions you might get a knife
that was quite worthless. It
was a chance you took. We
all had dreams of receiving
a stag-handled Case or
Boker in return, even though
that almost never happened.

I remember discussing
this process with a neighbor
of mine, Paul Hansel. He lit-
erally lived across the street
from me, and he and I were
together frequently. He ex-
plained, “David Joe, the
trick is to have a knife that
you don’t care about losing
in one pocket and your good

knife in the other pocket.
Just be careful to remember
which knife you want to
drop.” That was extremely
good advice, and I toted two
knives from that point for-
ward.

One night several senior
boys were sitting “on the
rail” watching a Mt. Vernon
High School home basket-
ball game. Jouett Kendrick
asked if I wanted to “drop
knives” and I said, yes. I
pulled my knife from my
pocket, and without think-
ing, let go of my knife. It
was a two-bladed Boker that
I had purchased about a year
before at Cox Hardware. As

(Cont. to A6)
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ObituariesObituaries

Bobby Gene
Bussell

Bobby Gene Bussell, 80,
of Brodhead, died Thursday,
August 28, 2014 at the East-
ern Kentucky Veterans Cen-

ter in Hazard. He
was born in Mt.
Vernon, on June

25, 1934 the son of Jopp and
Alta McClure Bussell. He
had been a welder for Con-
Rail Railroad and loved UK
Basketball and gardening.

He is survived by: his
wife, Wilma Cromer
Bussell; his son, David
(Terri) Woodall of Mt.
Vernon;  two step-sons, Jeff
(Angela) Harper of Warsaw,
and Charles Simpson of
Berea; a step-daughter,
Tanya Simpson of
Brodhead;  two sisters, Lois
Yerkes and Patsy Bundy;
and four grandsons, Tim
Simpson, Garrett Harper,
Mitch Harper, and Jake
Woodall. Also surviving are:
four nephews, Bob Bundy,
Jimmy Bundy, Mike Yerkes,
and Mel Yerkes;  two nieces,
Cindy Harris and Tony
Yerkes; and his special
friend, Pebbles.

Funeral services were
conducted Sunday, August
31, 2014 at the Dowell &
Martin Funeral Home
Chapel. Burial was in
Cresthaven Memorial Cem-
etery.

Pallbearers were:  Bobby
Bundy, James Bundy, Jeff
Harper, Mitchell Harper,
Charles Simpson, and
Michael Yerkes.

Please visit
www.DowellMartin.com to view

online obituary.

Bud
Shackleford

Bud Shackleford, 70, of
Eubank, died Saturday, Au-
gust 30, 2014 at the Univer-
sity of Kentucky Hospital.
He was the husband of
Brenda Elder Shackleford,
whom he married on May
13, 1972. He was born Oc-
tober 12, 1943 in Berea.  He

was the son of the
late Claude and
Ruby Irene

Shackleford. He was a
farmer and a member of Ot-
tawa Baptist Church. He
was a veteran of the United
States Army.

Survivors include: wife,
Brenda; two daughters,
Debbie (Gary) Santo, and
Kathy Pinkston (and Jamey
Waters); six grandchildren,
Amber Taylor, Kelsea
Reynolds, Takina Cottrell,
McKenzi Pinkston, Keara
and Kendall Santo; three
step grandchildren, Cody,
Kaitlynn and Savanna; five
great grandchildren,
Connor, Cameron, Raegan,
Camden and Brantlee; five
brothers, Jimmy (Allie)
Shackleford, Claude
Shackleford, Jr., Paul
Shackleford, Gary (Debbie)
Shackleford and Billy
(Norma) Shackleford; three
sisters: Donna Trussell,
Juanita (T.J.) Murphy and
Alice Bullen.

In addition to his parents,
he was preceded in death by
his Best Buddy, Benny
Hutchison and nephew, Ja-
son Andrew Shackleford.

Funeral services were
held Wednesday, September
3, 2014 at McKnight Fu-
neral Home Chapel with
Bro. Jim Craig officiating.

Burial was in Ottawa
Cemetery with Military
Honors by the  Caswell
Saufley American Legion
Post # 18 of Stanford and
the Patriot Riders.

Pallbearers were: Martin
Najarro, Danny and Nathan
Ping, Danny Dillingham,
Paul Evans,  Corey Price,
and Bo and Matt  Elder

Honorary pallbearers
were: Pam Ping, Bobby
Taylor, Anthony Philbeck,
Eric Campbell, and David
and Edna Elder.

Joyce Carol
Carpenter
Joyce Carol Carpenter,

60, died August 27, 2014 at
Jewish Hospital in Louis-
ville. She was a native of
Madison Co. and a retired
letter carrier for the United
States Postal Service.  She
was a member of the
Conway Missionary Baptist
Church and had a smile and
a kind word for everyone.
She loved horses and the UK
Wildcats.

She is survived by: her
husband,  Walter Mikel Car-
penter of Berea; her daugh-
ter, Cindie (Rod) Jackson of
Lexington; her mother,
Aileen Clark of Richmond;
her sisters, Charlotte (Dallas)
Alexander of Alexander, AL,
Janet Clark and Terrie Clark
of Madison County; her
brothers, Charles Alan Clark
and Michael Clark of Madi-
son County; and her grand-
children, Tyler Lovett,
Roderick Jackson, Jr., Cierra
Jackson, William Caleb
Jackson, and Carly Jackson,
all of Lexington. She was
preceded in death by her fa-
ther, Charles Smith Clark.

Funeral services were
held Tuesday, September 2,
2014 at the Conway Mis-
sionary Baptist Church with
Bro. Bobby Turner officiat-
ing. Burial was in the
Flatwoods Cemetery in
Waco.

Davis & Powell Funeral
Home is in charge of the ar-
rangements.
www.davisandpowellfuneralhome.com

James Elder
James Andrew Elder, 67,

of Livingston, died Wednes-
day, August 27, 2014 at his
home. He was born October
18, 1946 in Huntington,
WV, the son of the late
Howard Eugene and Ruth
Ilene Warren Elder Curtis.

He retired from
GTE, was an Air
Force Veteran of

the Vietnam War, and a
member of the Livingston
Volunteer Fire Dept. from
2001 to 2013. He enjoyed
golfing like his father before
him. He liked NASCAR and
was a fan of Dale Earnhardt
Sr. before it was "in" to be a
fan of Dale Earnhardt Sr. He
loved working on and driv-
ing anything with wheels
including motorcycles, and
cars. He enjoyed firearms,
target shooting, spending
time with and helping his
children, grandchildren,
family and many friends.

Survivors are: his wife of
46 years, Toni Hill Elder of
Livingston; two children,
Tonicia Robin Lay and hus-
band Bryan Scott Lay, and
Michael Andrew Elder; one
brother, Jerry David (Pearl)
Elder; four grandchildren,
Jessi (Matt) Tincher, Kayla
Lay, Brianna Lay, and
Walker Lay; several nieces,
nephews, and cousins; and
one aunt-in-law, and uncle-
in-law.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by:
one brother, Larry Eugene
Elder; and his step-father,
Raymond Acie Curtis.

Arrangements were by
the Cox Funeral Home. The
family has chosen cremation
services.
View the complete obituary, sign

the guest registry, or send
condolences to the family online
at www.coxfuneralhomeky.com.

Everett Allen
Thomas

Everett Allen Thomas, 92
of Brodhead, died Thursday,
August 28, 2014 at the
Rockcastle Regional Hospi-
tal. He was born in
Rockcastle County on June
20, 1922, the son of William
Elijah and Laura Allen Tho-
mas. He was a retired heat

and power super-
visor at Berea
College and was a

US Navy veteran of World
War II.  He was a member of
the Brindle Ridge Baptist
Church and enjoyed riding
horses and trading knives.

He is survived by: his
wife, Elsie Burdette Thomas;
a son, Paul Thomas of Mt.
Vernon;  two daughters, Bar-
bara Bennett and Juanita
Coleman, both of Mt.
Vernon; three step-sons,
Gary Burdette, Larry
Burdette, and Clyde
Burdette, all of Mt. Vernon;
a step-daughter, Janice
Chasteen of Richmond;
seven grandchildren, Lloyd
Bennett, George Coleman,
Carrie Adams, Jimmy Tho-
mas, Leigh Ann Mosier, Dee
Thomas, and Anna Louise
Sandlin;  11 great grandchil-
dren, Karlee Payne, Kathrin
Sandlin, Beth Coleman,
Christopher Winn, Sara
Adams, Emily Brooke
Adams, Kaleigh Mosier,
Kara Mosier, Kaleb Mosier,
Lily Thomas, and Hailey
Thomas; and three great
great grandchildren, Sadee
Payne, Mason Payne, and
Kiley Winn. Several step-
grandchildren and great
grandchildren also survive.

He was preceded in death
by: his first wife, Lillie Mae
Thomas;  a son, James Rich-
ard Thomas;  a daughter-in-
law, Sandi Thomas;  one
brother;  and three sisters.

Funeral services were
conducted September 1,
2014 at the Brindle Ridge
Baptist Church by Bro. Ron
Roberts.  Burial was in Scaf-
fold Cane Cemetery.

Pallbearers were:  Barry
Adams, Lloyd Bennett,
Mitch Fitzgerald, Blake
Mullins, Dee Thomas,
Jimmy Thomas, and Chris
Winn. Honorary pallbearer
was  George Coleman.

Arrangements were by
Dowell & Martin Funeral
Home.
Visit www.DowellMartin.com to

view online obituary.

Elma L. Clark
Elma L. "Edna" Clark, 92

of Spring Valley, OH, died
Tuesday, August 26, 2014 at
Hospice of Dayton.  She was
born in Bourbon County,
KY on June 16, 1922 the
daughter of George W. and
Addie Stella Grant.

She is survived by: two
daughters, Sharon Lee
(James) Russell and Rhonda
Hall; and three sons, John
Douglas (Donna) Clark,
Dennis (Renny) Clark and
Ricky Clark.  Nine grand-
children and eight great
grandchildren also survive.
In addition to her parents,
she was preceded in death
by: her husband, John W.
Clark; a daughter, Kathy
Lynn Johnson;  two broth-
ers, George F. and Roy
Grant;  and two sisters,
Thelma Hazelbaker and
Evelyn Compton.

Funeral services were
Friday, August 29, 2014 at
the Trinity Christian Assem-
bly in Beavercreek, OH.
Graveside services and
burial followed in Clark
Cemetery at Climax.

Donations are suggested
to Hospice of Dayton at 324
Wilmington Ave., Dayton,
OH 45420.
Visit www.DowellMartin.com, to

view online obituary.

Bobby Dee
McClure

Bobby Dee McClure, 54,
died Friday, August 29,
2014 at the University of
Kentucky Medical Center in
Lexington. He was born in
Mt. Vernon, to his father,
John William McClure and
his mother, Rena Cromer
McClure of Mt. Vernon,
who survives. He was a
1977 graduate of
Rockcastle County High
School and a 1982 graduate
of Berea College. He was a
supervisor for Hitachi and a
member of the Berea United
Methodist Church.

He is survived by: his
wife, Rebecca Gentry
McClure of Berea; his
daughters, Aimee Renee
(Adam) Sparks of Ayer,
MA, and Lyndee Carol
(Kevin) Hankins of Rich-
mond; his siblings, Gerald
McClure of Normerle, TN,
Wanda Faye (John) Mahr of
Lexington, Betty Lou Tho-
mas, Alene Doan, Wayne
(Christine) McClure, Judy
(Doug) Brock, Tim (Lisa)
McClure, Dennis (Kathy)
McClure, Roger (Linda)
McClure, Sheryl (Ben)
Richardson, and Randy
(Michelle) McClure, all of
Mt. Vernon; his father and
mother-in-law, Dr. Claude
and Shirley Gentry of
Berea; his brothers-in-law,
Glenn and Tim Gentry of
Berea; and several nieces
and nephews.

He was preceded in
death by his father, John
William McClure, and a
brother, Jerry McClure.

Memorial services were
held Wednesday, September
3, 2014 at the Davis &
Powell Funeral Home with
Rev. J. Randolph Osborne
officiating.

Expressions of sympathy
may be made to the Ameri-
can Cancer Society.
www.davisandpowellfuneralhome.com

Adam D.
Warren

Adam D. Warren, 34, of
Montezuma, OH, died
Monday, August 25, 2014 at
the St. Ritas Medical Cen-
ter.  He was born in Dayton,
OH on June 16, 1980 the
son of Alan and Debra

Mullins Warren.
He attended
Northmont High
School in Dayton

and was a US Army veteran
of the Iraq War.  He was em-
ployed at Veyance Corpora-
tion in Saint Marys.  He en-
joyed fishing and hunting,
and was an all-around
handyman who would do
anything to help a friend.

He is survived by: his
wife, Trista Scaggs Warren;
his son, "A.J." Warren;  his
parents, Alan and Debra
Warren of Saint Marys; a
sister, Rachel and Pete
Jones of Brecksville, OH;
his in-laws, Janie and Doug
Jeffery of Paintsville, and
John Scaggs of Myrtle
Beach, SC;  his paternal
grandparents, Harold and
Doris Warren of Kettering,
OH; his cousin and best
friend, Andrew and Heather
Nodzak of Kettering, OH;
his nephews, Jasper and
Sawyer Jones of
Brecksville, OH;  as well as
numerous other cousins,
aunts, and uncles.

He was preceded in
death by his maternal grand-
parents, Virgil and Florence
Mullins.

Sylvia  Lear
Sylvia Newcomb Lear,

52 of Mount Vernon, died
Sunday, August 31, 2014 at
University of Kentucky
Medical Center, in Lexing-
ton. She was born in
Lancaster, on July 6, 1962,
a daughter of the late Leslie
and Mary Margie
(Childress) Newcomb. She
was a member of the Mount
Zion Baptist Church and will
be remembered for the love
of her grandchildren, family,
taking pictures and comput-
ers.

She is survived by: her
husband, Greg Lear of
Mount Vernon; two children,
Ricky (Kenna) Agee of
Richmond, and Michael
(Ashlee) Agee of
Hustonville; seven grand-
children, Isaiah Owens,
Jesse Gabbard, Treston,
Tyler, Randy Ray, Gregory,
and Mallie Agee; two broth-
ers, Charlie Newcomb of
Richmond and Johnny
(Edna) Newcomb of Mount
Vernon; one sister, Frances
(Lige) Hensley of Orlando;
a special niece, Mary
Newcomb; a special friend,
Laura Simpson; and many
nieces, nephews, friends and
neighbors.

Besides her parents, she
is preceded in death by: one
son, Randall Agee; one
brother, Bobby Newcomb;
and one nephew, James
Hensley

Funeral services will be
conducted (today) Thursday,
September 4, 2014 at 2 p.m.
at the Brush Creek Holiness
Church with Bro. Lonnie
McGuire  officiating.  Burial
will follow in the Brairfield
Cemetery.

Casketbearers will be:
Tommy Miller, Michael and
Ricky Agee, Pete Newcomb,
Brandon Brandonburg, Dal-
las Hall, and Rob Cornett.

Condolences may be made at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Funeral services were
conducted Friday, August
29, 2014 at the Miller Fu-
neral Home in Saint Marys,
OH.  Burial was in Red Hill
Cemetery.

There were no local ser-
vices. This obituary cour-
tesy of Dowell & Martin
Funeral Home.
Visit www.DowellMartin.com, to

view online obituary.

Mike
Childress

Mike Childress, 61, of
Brodhead, died Wednesday,
September 3rd at the UK
Medical Center. Arrange-
ments are incomplete at Cox
Funeral Home.

Card of Thanks
Irene Sowder Collins

The family of the late
Irene Sowder Collins
would like to express their
heartfelt thanks and ap-
preciation to all those who
supported us in our time
of grief.

Thanks for the visits to
the hospital and visitation
at the church, for prayers,
flowers, cards, food, and
for attendance at the ser-
vice.

Special thanks to Pas-
tor Chris Davidson, Bro.
Tommy Hogue, and Bro.
Jasper Carpenter for their
support and comforting
words; to Bro. Allen
Hensley, Sister Sharon
Davidson,  Bro. Randy
Chrisman, and Sister
Regina Laws for encour-

aging us in song; and to
the Ladies of Pine Hill
Holiness Church for the
delicious dinner provided
after the service.

Thanks also to Dowell
and Martin Funeral Home
for their compassion and
understanding at this dif-
ficult time.

The Collins Family
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Brandon Gross is shown above driving his antique car in last Saturday’s Home-
coming parade.

Jailer candidate Carlos McClure waved to the crowd while riding in the Livingston
Homecoming parade last Saturday.

Gary McGuire is shown cruising through the Livingston Homecoming parade in
his ‘60 Chevy.

Magistrate-elect Michael McGuire led the pack of 4-wheelers during the parade
at Livingston last Saturday.

Family Court Judge Marcus Vanover brought his campaign to the Livingston
Homecoming and parade last weekend.

Former Mt. Vernon Mayor Clarice Kirby greeted the crowd during the Livingston
Homecoming parade. Kirby is running in November’s election for her former
position.

The Livingston Leos hitched a ride in the Homecoming parade last Saturday.

The Romp N’ Stomp cloggers were dancing a jig during the parade at the
Livingston Homecoming last Saturday.

Rockcastle County Libarian Pam Chaliff drove the bookmobile in the Home-
coming parade.

State Senator Jared Carpenter, and supporters of his campaign for re-election,
marched in the parade last Saturday

Jordan Kelley and Reagan Griffin take a ride in his antique Ford truck during
the Livingston Homecoming parade last Saturday.

The Bittersweet Cloggers performed for the crowd last Saturday at the Livingston
Homecoming.

Livingston Mayor Jason Medley and his wife Natasha waved to the crowd  dur-
ing the Homecoming parade.

Livingston Police Chief Carl Swanagin drove his cruiser in the parade.

Mt. Vernon Mayor Mike Bryant and wife Carol hitched a ride from Ronnie Owens
and Melissa Benson.

Mount Vernon Paw Spa entered a float in the Livingston Homecoming parade.

Scenes from Livingston Homecoming
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Open 7 days a week 10 a.m. to 10 p.m.
(Open later on weekends)

Located at Exit 62  • (former Rockcastle Steakhouse)

Phone 606-256-0131

Daily Specials
Thursday 9/4

Spaghetti w/ Meatballs
Side Salad

Sunday 9/7
Meatloaf

Choice of Two Sides

Friday 9/5
All you can eat Catfish

Monday 9/8
Chicken
Alfredo

Saturday 9/6
BBQ Ribs

Choice of Two Sides

Tuesday 9/9
Salmon Patties w/

Choice of Two Sides

Wednesday 9/10
White Northern Beans

cooked w/
Country Ham

Greens & Cornbread

Carry-Out Available

The RCHS JROTC batallion marched in the Livingston Homecoming parade
last Saturday.

State senate candidate Mike Cope had supporters passing out candy to children
during the parade.

The Rockcastle County Recycling Center entered a float in the Homecoming
parade.

Josh Thompson threw gobs of candy to the children while driving one of David’s
Tire Center’s roll-back tow trucks in the Homecoming parade.

Makenzie Clark, 2,
of Brodhead

stepped up to the
plate to ride the
mechanical bull

during Livingston
Homecoming last

Saturday.

Homecoming
photos

by
Doug

Ponder

At left, local fishing angler Josh Brewer
took home first place in the Livingston
Homecoming fishing tournament.
Above, Livingston resident Paul Senters
finsihed second in the fishing tourna-
ment.

Local student completes internship...
Noah Trump, a student at Rockcastle County High School, recently completed an

internship with Appalachia- Science in the Public Interest. The internship was a hands-
on, eight-week program over the course of the summer for high school students to
learn about gardening and marketing. Each week focused on a different topic such as
plant biology, preservation, farmers markets, and working in the community. His pri-
mary tasks included working in the community garden, ASPI garden, and at the Mt.
Vernon farmers market. Noah’s final project was to cook a meal using as many ingre-
dients from the garden as possible.

This is the second year that ASPI has hosted high school interns. Upon completing
the program, interns receive a scholarship funded through the Grow Appalachia grant.
Local high school students are encouraged to apply for next summer.

ASPI is a non-profit resource center located in Mt. Vernon advocating for sustain-
able development, responsible resource management, and informed personal choices
through education, research, and demonstration projects. ASPI is also a partner site
for the Grow Appalachia program which addresses issues of food security in Appala-
chia by funding garden programs. For more information, visit www.appalachia-spi.org
or call 606-256-0077.

Subscribe
to the Signal

Call
256-2244
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By: Doug Ponder
The Rockcastle Rockets

football team picked up their
first win of the season last
Friday night, beating the
West Jessamine Colts 45-6.

The Rockets forced three
turnovers on defense while
holding the Colts defense to
a measly 108 total yards
made up of 67 rushing yards
and 41 passing yards. How-
ever, the Rockets’ offense
was firing on all cylinders,
gaining a total of 401 yards
with 355 yards on the
ground and 46 yards through
the air.

In the first quarter,
sophomore tailback Dalton
Rowe got his team into the
scoring column when he
punched the ball into the end
zone on a 1 yard touchdown
run. The extra point attempt,
also by Rowe, was good giv-
ing the Rockets the early 7-
0 lead. Rowe went on in the
second quarter to score
again on a 3 yard touchdown
run. The extra point attempt
was good making the score
14-0 at the half.

After halftime, the West
Jessamine offense managed

to put a successful drive to-
gether but the extra point
attempt was no good and it
was 14-6.

The Rockets put the
game away in the third quar-
ter when they up an unan-
swered 31 points that in-
cluded a 36 yard touchdown
run by fullback Isaiah
Adams, a 45 yard touch-
down run by Rowe, a 65
yard touchdown run by
freshman tailback Brent
Lovell, a 44 yard fumble re-
covery for a touchdown by
sophomore defensive back
Isaac McClure and a 5 yard
touchdown run by freshman
fullback Holdan Barnett.

Rowe led the Rockets of-
fense with 18 carries for 101
yards and three touchdowns.
Lovell also had a big night
on offense with 15 carries
for 139 yards and one touch-
down.

Other Rockets who
picked up rushing yards
were Adams with 3 carries
for 42 yards and one touch-
down, sophomore running
back Devon Robinson had
11 carries for 39 yards,
Barnett had 2 carries for 9

yards and one touchdown,
freshman running back
Noah Prickett had one carry
for 3 yards and senior full-
back Chance Ansardi picked
up 2 yards with one carry.

Sophomore quarterback
Dakota Bishop finished the
game 6 out of 14 for 46 pass-
ing yards and one intercep-
tion. Bishop also had two
carries for two yards.

Lovell also led the re-
ceiving corps catching 3
passes for 30 yards and se-
nior wide receiver Tyler
Langford caught a pass for
6 yards. Sophomore wide
receivers Tommy Benge and
Michael Tomlinson were
both credited with catching
one pass for 5 yards.

The Rockets defense was
led by senior defensive back
Kyle Denny who had six
tackles and one interception.
Ansardi also had a good
game on defense with two
tackles and a fumble recov-
ery. The Rockets defense
also scored a touchdown
with McClure’s 44 yard
touchdown run after he re-
covered a fumble.

Other Rockets picking up
tackles and assists were
Benge with 6, Robinson and
sophomore linebacker Aus-
tin Mills both had 5 each,
and sophomore defensive
lineman Logan Coffey and
Lovell were credit with 4
each. Senior defensive line-
man Justin Hughes, Rowe
and Langford were all cred-
ited with one tackle each.

Head Coach Scott
Parkey said the offense set
the tone for the game when

they had 23 plays for a
touchdown on their first
drive that took 10 minutes
and 53 seconds off the
game clock.

“We finished that long
first drive with a touch-
down. Then our defense
went in and set them back-
wards when their offense
went three and out without
picking up a single first
down,” Parkey said. “That
really set the tone for the
rest of the game. We were
able to wear them down, al-
lowing us to pull away at
the end.”

Parkey said the Rockets
defense really had a huge
game and played outstand-
ing. He said the defense
was able to keep pressure
on the quarterback through-
out the entire game which
constantly disrupted the
Colts’ option and passing
game.

“The defense was able
to block a punt, get an in-
terception and recover two
fumbles,” Parkey said. “If
our defense will continue to
create and get those types
of big plays in games, it
will be huge for our team
heading into October and
district play.”

Parkey went on to say
that he likes the way the
team is performing at this
point in the season. He said
he is really proud of the se-
niors who are stepping up,
taking control and getting
the team over the hump in
crucial situations.

“Our team captain Kyle
Denny rarely leaves the

Rockets thump West Jessamine, 45-6, for first win

Senior defensive back Kyle Denny is shown break-
ing up a pass during the West Jessamine game.
Denny led the defense with six tackles and one in-
terception.

Freshman tailback Brent Lovell looks for running
room during last Friday night’s 45-6 win over West
Jessamine. Lovell had a big night on offense with 15
carries for 139 yards and one touchdown.

Sophomore tailback Dalton Rowe breaks free for a
touchdown druing last Friday night’s game. Rowe
led the Rocket offense with 18 carries for 101 yards
and three touchdowns.

Sophomore quarterback Dakota Bishop  drops back
in the pocket for a pass during last Friday’s 45-6
win over West Jessamine. The Rockets next game is
this Friday night at home when they take on South
Laurel in the Jamboree Bowl. Kick-off is at 7:30 p.m.

field without playing solidly
on both sides, Chance
Ansardi is putting on a
blocking clinic on offense,
Isaiah Adams is making our
offense tick with his block-
ing and timely runs, Tyler
Langford is showing his re-
ceiving ability while Levi
Coffey, Justin Hughes and
Layne Jasper have been
leaders on the line,” Parkey
said. “The best thing about
our seniors is that they are
all unselfish. They want us
to win rather than increase
their personal stats or re-
ceive an individual reward.”

The Rockets next game
is this Friday night at home
when they will take on the

South Laurel Cardinals at
7:30 p.m. in the Jamboree
Bowl.

Parkey said that his team
is looking to ride the mo-
mentum from their recent
win into this Friday’s game.
He said they are planning to
get a win over South Laurel
after traveling to London
last year and coming back
home with a disappointing
19-8 loss to the Cardinals.

“We are excited about
our first home game being
against South Laurel,”
Parkey said. “This is re-
demption time and we
aren’t planning to leave the
field without a win.”

we stopped paying attention
to it.

We finally got off the in-
terstate, ignored the
squaking GPS  that was
starting to sound  like an old
maid school marm who had
been lonely too long, , and
pulled into a church parking
lot where Loretta and two
ladies in a Cadillac SUV
compared  the amazing ac-
complishments of all their
respective grand kids, talked
about quilts, crocheting and
restoring antiques and fi-
nally determined that they
may not be related  to one
another, unless you counted
fourth cousins, even though
all three of them knew
people who used to live in
New Jersey, but may have
moved to Texas now.  Fi-
nally, Loretta’s new buddies
told her it would be easier
to just follow them to our
hotel than it would be to
give her directions.

That’s when I started
paying attention to the GPS
because it essentially con-
firmed the direction in
which Lo’s new found rela-
tives were headed even
though they seemed deter-
mined to prove their car
could leave us sitting in the
shade.   At one point I
glanced at the speedometer
and we were going 85mph
while they steadily pulled
away and a number of other
cars wove into the lane to
separate us from them.   By
the time we got to the
Opryland La Quinta, I had
determined that the gadget
was way smarter than I’d
given it credit, but I did get
out of our car, when we
pulled under the façade, to
thank our guides and give
them Dale Earnhardt,
Junior’s phone number and
suggest they call him up and
give him a few pointers.

To make a much longer
story short, we later turned
the gadget back on and let it
direct us from the hotel to
the site of our Pattykin’s
downtown wedding, some
ten miles away, in the very
heart of Nashville.  4 blocks,
on a side street, behind
Ryman Auditorium.

To be perfectly honest ,
we missed over a dozen
turns, getting there that the
GPS told us to make, be-
cause it was impossible to
get into the correct lane
without causing accidents
but it always told us how to
make the correction and fi-
nally got us to the wedding,
even though I now know
more about inner-city Nash-

“Points East”
(Cont. from A2)

ville than I ever wanted.
By the time the wedding

events were over, darkness
was upon us and Nashville
was under a torrential
downpour of rain and light-
ning and flash flood warn-
ings.  We could hardly see
fifty feet in front of us but
Loretta turned the GPS back
on and said. “Talk to me,
Little Ralph. “  And it did
just that for the next 9.7
miles that included short
stints on 2 interstates and a
major beltway around the
city.

Fifteen minutes, that felt
like 5 hours, later, Loretta
and I had both begun talk-
ing to “Little Ralph” and
soon found out that he
talked back and made way
more sense of things than
his owner.  When he an-
nounced that we were back
in the parking lot of our ho-
tel we literally rejoiced.

All I know for sure is that
I have to have me one of
these things.  Because, with-
out it, I’m pretty sure that
Loretta and I would still be
in downtown Nashville,
asking around to see if any-
one had seen Roy Acuff  or
Minnie Pearl today.

“Memories”
(Cont. from A2)

soon as it left my hand, I
thought, “Oh no! That was
my good knife!” To my sur-
prise, Jouett also dropped a
very new Case with stag
handles. We both looked at
each other with complete
satisfaction. That almost
never happened. We shook
hands and continued to
watch the basketball game.

When I left Mt. Vernon
for the University of Ken-
tucky, I took my knife col-
lection with me so that I
might advance my hobby of
locating new and vintage
pocket knives. It paid off.
Many of my friends at UK
had never heard of “drop-
ping” pocket knives, so I
was able to teach them a
thing or two from a
Rockcastle County boy. By
the end of my first year at
UK, my collection of re-
spectable knives had in-
creased considerably.

The best knife that I ever
received in a “drop” was at
Hagan Hall on UK’s cam-
pus. My roommate was
Steve Stacy, and we became
good friends. Once we were
having a discussion about
our home towns, and I told
him about the fad of “drop-
ping knives” in Rockcastle
County. He was intrigued.
The next day he suggested

that we “drop” pocket
knives. Because I consid-
ered him to be a good friend,
I dropped my best knife –
evidently he thought the
same because when I
opened my hand there was
a new Case, stag-handled,
two-bladed beauty which I
still have today.

It is funny how silly fads
of our youth linger in our
memories fifty years later.
Several of the knives in my
collection were the result of
such a craze. I never had the
heart to “drop” a really bad
knife to someone I knew
well. Even my poorest knife
was one that was decent. I
never wanted anyone to
claim that I gave them a
piece of junk. I valued their
friendship more than that.

Wanna drop knives with
me?

(You can reach me at
themtnman@att.net or you can
drop me a line at 2167 Furnace

Road – Stanton, KY 40380. I
appreciate your comments and

suggestions.)

“Journal”
(Cont. from A2)

daughter in bathing, dress-
ing and braiding waist
length hair for she was no
more than three or four
years old.

One dreadful day, there
was a mining accident and
several of the miners were
killed. This, of course, af-
fected most of the small
community. There was now
a poor widow who had sev-
eral small children with no
means of support. She had
some family who lived a
great distance away, where
she could stay, if she could
get there.

She came to my great-
grandpa for a loan in order
to have money for her move
and to get started in her new
life when she arrived. As the
years have passed, the

widow's name and the
amount of money she re-
quested have been lost to
history and there is no fam-
ily information in the Bible.
He knew the widow was a
good and honest woman
and genuinely needed the
money. She promised to re-
pay all of the loan when she
got settled in her new home
and the widow also insisted
on leaving their family
Bible as a form of collateral,
but grandpa said that wasn't
necessary. But, she was in-
sistent, and said she would
get the Bible when the loan
was paid.

The widow left in a few
days, leaving her Bible with
Grandpa. The Bible had a
copyright date in the mid-
1890s. It is bound in leather
and the covers are thick with
ornate designs. It is heavy
and is at least six to severn
inches thick. There are
many illustrations. The
Psalms are even set to mu-
sical verse in a certain sec-
tion.

The widow never came
back or sent for the Bible,
but she never repaid the
loan, either. Through the
years, Grandpa attempted to
return the Bible but wasn't
able to find her. He died in
1945 and Great-grandma
passed in 1951, and the
Bible passed to my grandma
who gave it to my mother.
She gave it to me and it has
become a treasured part of
our family. A friend of mine
who works in wood made a
stand of walnut for the Bible
to rest on and is now on dis-
play in my living room.

    The Bible has come
into our family and has be-
come a part of it now. I
sometimes wonder about
the widow and her family
and where the descendants
are today. Do they know
about the old Bible and how
it will forever connect our
families?
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sic venues across the coun-
try.

Bullock said he joined
the group almost nine years
ago after marrying the Allen
brothers’ first cousin Jan
Knight.

“We go to the same
church as the Allen broth-
ers and that is how I met
them,” Bullock said. “I have
performed in quartets for
more than twenty years and
they thought I was a right
fit for them so they asked
me to join.”

Bullock said that every-
one in the band has fulltime
jobs and that they practice
whenever they have free
time and play at different
churches and music venues
almost every weekend.

“We practice whenever
we can and play whenever
we get the chance,” Bullock
said. “We all live on the
same street so it’s not hard
for us to get together at the
spur of the moment to prac-
tice.”

Bullock said that the
band’s goal for the
“Healed” album was not to
win awards but to spread
the gospel of Jesus Christ
and bring honor to the Lord
with everything they do as
a band.

“Receiving a Dove
Award was nothing we
sought, as our focus is al-
ways on God and spreading
the message of Jesus
Christ,” Bullock said.
“None of us even knew we
were nominated for the
award until people started
telling us and it honestly
blew our socks off when we
first heard about it.”

and it was expected that
funding for this project
would come from the re-
mainder of the state trans-
portation grant.

Hopkins said the emer-
gency operations building
was expected to begin op-
erations in October, accord-
ing to CSEPP Director Hal
Holbrook.

Hopkins also told the
board that she had shown
the Anchor Packaging
building to two companies
and that one company from
Somerset was in the process
of putting together a pro-
posal to lease a portion of
the facility. Hopkins said
that proposal would be pre-
sented to the fiscal court
possibly at this month’s fis-
cal court meeting.

Upcoming trips for the
executive director include:
KY United R&D Training/
Site Consultant Reception in
Atlanta September 11-14;
the KAED Annual Confer-
ence in Louisville Novem-
ber 11-14 and the KY
United Dallas Marketing
Trip in Dallas, TX February
23-27, 2015.

The public is invited to
attend the monthly meeting
of the RCIDA, the first
Monday of each month at
11:30 a.m.

Stop by and see
Marlene Lawson

for all your life and
health insurance needs!

(606)
256-2050

Visit us on the Internet at https://www.kyfb.com/rockcastle/insurance/

Locust Ridge’s “Healed” has received a Dove Award
nomination.

Bullock went on to say
that he is excited to be re-
turning to Rockcastle
County to perform. The
band will perform at Bible
Baptist Church in Mt.
Vernon on Sunday, Septem-
ber 21st at 11 a.m.

“I look forward to return-
ing to Rockcastle with the
band,” Bullock said. “It’s
always great to play in front
of friends and family back
in my hometown.”

The GMA Awards show
is Tuesday, October 7th at
Allen Arena on the campus
of Lipscomb University in
Nashville at 6:30 p.m. Trin-
ity Broadcasting network
(TBN) will also air the
awards show on their TV
channel.

For more information
about Locust Ridge visit
www. locus t r idge .o rg"
www.locustridge.org or
w w w. f a c e b o o k . c o m /
locustridge.

Annual
Hunger

Awareness
March
is this

Thursday
The third annual Hunger

Awareness March is this
Thursday  at 10 a.m. on
Main Street in Mt. Vernon.
The march will form up in
the parking lot across from
NAPA.

The march is held to
combat world hunger and
runs in collaboration with
Hunger Action in Septem-
ber.

The registration fee for
the march is one non-perish-
able food item that will be
donated to Christian Appa-
lachian Project’s Grateful
Bread Food Pantry in Mt.
Vernon.

Registration begins at 9
a.m. on the day of the event.
Participants can pre-register
by contacting Sherri Barnett
at 606-256-3035 ext. 3 or
Carolyn Lindsey at 606-
256-5921 ext. 4. Partici-
pants can also preregister by
contacting Barnett via email
at sbarnett@chrisapp.org or
Lindsey via email at
clindsey@chrisapp.org.

The first 150 participants
to register will receive a free
t-shirt. Door prizes will also
be given out after the march.

The event is sponsored
by the Christian Appala-
chian Project. It’s also co-
sponsored by the City of Mt.
Vernon, God’s Pantry and
Walmart.

Join Arbor Day Foundation in Sept. and receive 10 trees
Everyone from Kentucky

who joins the Arbor Day
Foundation in September
will receive 10 free trees as
part of the Foundation's
Trees for America program.

Through Trees for
America, everyone is en-
couraged to plant trees that
will benefit the environment
and improve the quality-of-
life. With one million mem-

It is high season at the
Farmers Market.  Tomatoes
and peppers do not taste as
good any other time of the
year!  Think ahead and pre-
serve that taste for winter.
Buy extra and can a few jars
of sauce or freeze almost
anything.  It’s easier to stock
up now that the EBT, WIC,
and Senior Vouchers are
back on-line at the Farmers’
Market.  (The EBT machine
was broken and on special
order from Frankfurt.)

Come on down to Rich-

mond Street Tuesday and
Thursdays 10:00 – 2:00 and
Saturday 9:00 – 12:00.   At
the fairgrounds in Brodhead
find fresh produce, breads,
and other items on the first
Wednesday of the month.
What do you do with the
extra goodness coming
from the Farmers’ Market?

Freeze tomatoes whole
(in zippered plastic bags).
When you bring them out to
make chili in January, the
skins will slip right off.
Freeze grape tomatoes
whole.  When you are ready
for something hot this win-
ter, sizzle some garlic and
onion in the skillet, pop the
frozen tomatoes right in –
cook until they are hot
through.  Eat over pasta
with a little cheese!

Freeze peppers – just
wash and slice and put in
freezer bags or containers.
Fry them up with a little sau-
sage and some frozen beans
for a bit of summer on a
dark, winter evening.  Chop
frozen peppers for sloppy
joes and chili.

Put your potatoes in a
cool, dry place and enjoy all
winter!  Buying from local
farmers improves the whole
community.  Your money is
going directly to support
your neighbors – not
through middle business-
men and giant corporations.
As we work on plans to ex-
tend the growing season and
offer more produce locally,
support the farmers now and
enjoy superior food and a
healthy diet

Farmers Market

Local food is good
now and later

bers, the Arbor Day Foun-
dation is the nation's largest
nonprofit organization dedi-
cated to planting trees.

Everyone joining this
month will receive an east-
ern redbud, white pine,
sugar maple, white flower-
ing dogwood, pin oak, red
maple, river birch, silver
maple, northern red oak and
Colorado blue spruce.

"This group of trees was
carefully selected to yield
year-round benefits in Ken-
tucky, including beautiful
spring flowers, cool sum-
mer shade, spectacular au-
tumn colors and winter ber-
ries and nesting sites for
songbirds," said Matt Har-
ris, chief executive of the
Arbor Day Foundation.

"These trees will also
add to the proud heritage of
Kentucky's 32 Tree City
USA communities," Harris
continued. "For the last 38
years, Tree City USA has
supported effective urban
forest management across
Kentucky, and planting
these trees will enhance the
state's tree-planting tradi-
tion."

The trees will be shipped

postpaid at the right time for
planting between October
15 and December 10. The 6-
to 12-inch trees are guaran-
teed to grow or they will be
replaced free of charge.
Easy-to-follow planting in-
structions are enclosed with
each shipment of trees.

New members of the Ar-
bor Day Foundation will
also receive The Tree Book,
which includes information
about tree planting and care.

To receive the 10 free
trees, send a $10 member-
ship contribution to Ten
Trees, Arbor Day Founda-
tion, 100 Arbor Ave., Ne-
braska City, NE 68410, by
September 30, 2014, or join
online at arborday.org/
september.

On Saturday, Sept. 13,
the Kentucky Artisan Cen-
ter at Berea will offer visi-
tors free  guided tours
through the center’s new
gallery exhibit, “Put a Lid
On It: Containers by Ken-
tucky Artisans” and the
lobby exhibit, “Kentucky
Bourbon: Distillation and
Inspiration.”

“Put a Lid On It,” fea-
tures over 45 artists and in-
cludes works made from
clay, wood, leather, glass
beads, paper, felted wool,
alabaster, old  children’s
building blocks, cast glass,
sterling silver and recycled
materials.

The lobby exhibit covers
the history of Kentucky
bourbon and production of
this unique drink, with de-
tails showing the location of
Kentucky  distilleries with
tours and products made
from recycled bourbon bar-
rels.

These free, guided ex-
hibit tours will be led by
Kentucky Artisan Center
staff, who will talk about the
exhibit, the artists and indi-
vidual works. Staff will an-
swer questions  about the
techniques and various pro-

cesses used in the objects
featured. This tour will be
given at 11 a.m. and again
at 2 p.m.

In addition, on Sept. 13,
studio potter Melvin Rowe
will demonstrate hand
building with clay from
10:30 a.m. to 3:30 p.m.
Rowe will be using press
and sprig molds to attach
decorative imagery to his
ceramic mugs and sculp-
tures.

The Kentucky Artisan
Center at Berea is located at
200 Artisan Way, just off In-
terstate 75 at Berea, Exit 77.
The center’s exhibits, shop-
ping and travel information
areas are  open daily from 9
a.m. to 6 p.m. with the cafe
open from 9:30 a.m. to 3:30
p.m. Admission is free.

The center currently fea-
tures works by more than
700 artisans from more than
100 counties across the
Commonwealth. For more
information about the
center’s events call 859-
985-5448, visit us on
Facebook at
w w w. f a c e b o o k . c o m /
kentucky.artisan.center, or
go to the center’s website at
www.kentuckyartisancenter.ky.gov.

“Put a Lid On It”
New exhibit of containers
at Artisan Center in Berea

“Hemp”
(Cont. from front)

“Group”
(Cont. from front)

Benefit
There will be a Benefit

for the family of Amberly
Northern on Saturday, Sep-
tember 6th from 4 to 8 p.m.
at Mt. Vernon Elementary
School gymnasium. A silent
auction will also be held.
There will also be food
available and live music by:
Mercy Roadz, Hot Pursuit
and The Medley Boys.

If you would like to make
a donation for the silent auc-
tion, call 606-308-2933 or
859-302-3362. All dona-
tions greatly appreciated.
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Brodhead Volunteer Fire Department responded to a single vehicle accident
last Thursday afternoon on Spiro Road in Brodhead. Authorities say Worley
Sprinkle, 86, of Danville was traveling west on Spiro Road when he blacked-
out and ran off the roadway causing his vehicle to roll over. Sprinkle had to be
extricated from the vehicle by firefighters before he could be transported to
Rockcastle Regional hospital where he was treated and released.

come agitated when they
have to sit in traffic for a
long period of time. He said
several of the accidents they
were called to were caused
by motorists who were in a
hurry or motorists who
weren’t  aware of the
slowed or stopped traffic on
the roadways, ultimately re-
ducing their reaction time.

“These accidents could
have turned out to be a lot
worse than they were and
everyone involved in them
should consider themselves
lucky, especially those in-
volved in accidents on the
interstate,” Bales said. “We
are hoping the interstate
construction is completed
soon. But until then, we are
advising motorists to slow
down and be patient while
sitting in road construction
traffic. These two things,
along with being aware of
your surroundings, will help
prevent further accidents
from happening in these ar-
eas.”

Kentucky Transportation
Cabinet Information Officer
Amber Hale said both I-75
northbound and southbound
will be reduced to one lane
between the 58 mile marker
and 66 mile marker as state
road crews continue to
make pavement improve-
ments.

Hale said the north and
southbound lane reductions
have recently increased to a
24-hour period Monday
through Thursday and will
remain so until Thursday,
September 18th. She said
there will be no lane clo-
sures between 7 a.m. on Fri-
day and 6 p.m. on Sunday.

Hale said the road con-
struction is on schedule and
is expected to be completed
in November. She said driv-
ers should expect delays and
are encouraged to allow ex-
tra time to reach their desti-
nations.

Hale also said that recon-
struction of the Dix River
Bridge in Brodhead is near-
ing completion and is ex-
pected to be open to motor-
ists by the end of next week.
She said once the bridge is
opened for motorists, the
temporary bridge will be
torn out with large track ex-
cavators and a lot of mate-
rial will be recycled and
used on other KYTC
projects.

Hale went on to say that
she will be glad when the
Dix River Bridge is re-
opened and the I-75 road
construction is completed.

“I know the closing of
the Dix River Bridge and
the I-75 lane closures have
been a headache for a lot of
motorists,” Hale said. “Ev-
erything is on schedule to be
completed on time and ev-
erything will return to nor-
mal soon.”

Three free tire and
rim drop-off days
scheduled in October

The Rockcastle County Fiscal Court and the Ken-
tucky Division of Waste Management have scheduled
three days in October when Rockcastle Countians can
dispose of their old tires and rims for free.

Rockcastle County Solid Waste Coordinator James
Renner said the Waste and Tire Management Program
will take place at the state highway garage in Mt.
Vernon on October 2nd and 3rd from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.
and October 4th from 8 a.m. to 2 p.m.

Renner said the program accepts all tires, includ-
ing those with rims. However, he said the program
will not accept foam or calcium-filled tires, off-road
construction equipment tires with a bead greater than
1 3/4 inch and solid tires with pressed-on rims.

Renner also said that tire retailers, agriculture tire
retailers, scrap yards and junk yards are not allowed
to participate in the program. He also said that any-
one with 1,500 or more tires at one location needs to
notify them at least fourteen days in advance of the
program dates in order to arrange a special pick-up.

For more information about the program call the
Rockcastle County Solid Waste Office at 606-256-
1902.

“Traffic”
(Cont. from front)

$100,000 from occupational
tax monies for this project.

The county road depart-
ment will receive $15,000
for equipment, along with
$15,000 appropriated for
Trail Town buildings/im-
provements.

The Brodhead Depot

Park will get $10,000 for
construction on the enter-
tainment stage; Climax Vol-
unteer Fire Dept. was appro-
priated $30,000 for equip-
ment and Rockcastle E911
will get $17,500 for equip-
ment.

All seven volunteer fire
departments in the county,
including the county’s res-
cue squad housed at Mt.
Vernon Fire Department,
will receive a $5,000 appro-
priation for equipment; the
library was appropriated
$15,000 for operations; the
Music Hall of Fame got
$12,500 for a businss plan,
$12,500 for an audit and
$12,500 for operations; the
fiscal court will receive
$10,000 for water line ex-
tensions for the Hummel
and Lower River Road ar-
eas and another $12,500 to
update the courthouse park-
ing lot and building.

These appropriations are
all for the 2014-15 fiscal
year and total $247,500.

In the 2015-16 fiscal
year, the following appro-
priations were made from
the coal severance monies:

Another $50,000 for
land purchase for recre-
ation, to be used along with
$100,000 from the occupa-
tional tax fund was appro-
priate; the road department
got another $15,000 for
equipment; An additional
$15,000 was appropriated
for Trail Town buildings/
improvements; Rockcastle
E911 will get an additional
$17,500 for equipment;
$12,500 additional to the
county for the parking lot
and courthouse building;
$10,000 more for water line
extensions in the Hummel
and Lower River Road ar-
eas; $10,000 more for con-
struction of the entertain-
ment stage at Brodhead De-
pot Park; $15,000 additional
for operations at the library
and $12,500 more for op-
erations at the Music Hall of
Fame.

Appropriations for FY
2015-16 total $157,500 for
a total of $405,000 from
coal severance monies for
two years.

At their regular meeting
in August, the fiscal court
approved a list of roads to
be resurfaced from Flex
Funds. The county has
$188,000 total to be used
only on roads that have al-
ready been paved.

The list includes:
Magisterial Dist. 1:

Possum Kingdom Road,
Rev. Green Loop and Purr
Rigsby Road.

Magisterial Dist. 2: Li-
lac Circle, Freedom School
Road, Honeysuckle Lane
and Frosty Hollow Road.

Magisterial Dist. 3:
Brown Road, Tark Hill
Road, Little Brushy Branch
and Old Smokey Road.

Magisterial Dist. 4: Flat
Gap Road, Switzer Road,
Stevens Road, Azbill Road
and Pug Lane.

Magisterial Dist. 5:
Mullins Station Road,
Maple Grove Road,
Calloway Branch Road and
Stallsworth Branch Road.

Carloftis said work could
not begin on the roads until
the court receives a Memo-
randum of Agreement from
the State Dept. of Transpor-
tation but that he hopes to
begin work in early Fall

“Court”
(Cont. from front)
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Hidden Among Us

The American
Revolutionary
War Patriots
of Rockcastle
By Karen Hamm Adams

To celebrate and honor
the county’s American
Revolutionary War Patriots
and to enlighten the com-
munity about the service
and sacrifice of these brave
men, on behalf of the
Rockcastle Chapter of the
Daughters of the American
Revolution, I have complied
highlights of the service of
the known patriots living in
the county and who applied
for a pension between the
years 1818 and 1842. All
information was taken from
the patriot’s own account
from his pension applica-
tion and other historical
documents.  More informa-
tion can be found on each
patriot at the local library or
the Rockcastle Historical
Society.  (Copyright pend-
ing).  If you are interested
in joining the Daughters of
the American Revolution,
please contact Debbie
Brown (606) 758-8659 or
Iris Young (606)256-2851.

Nicholas Houk
North Carolina

Nicholas Houk was born
in 1740 Bucks County,
Pennsylvania  and died on
6 August 1841 in
Rockcastle Co. KY. Accord-
ing to his pension applica-
tion, Nicholas gave the fol-
lowing account of his ser-
vice in September 1833in
Rockcastle Co. KY at the
age of ninety four: Hewas
drafted in the Army of the
United States in the year
now forgotten in Polks
County NC for six months.
He marched to South Caro-

lina where he was dis-
charged after serving out
faithfully his term ofservice.
This was before Charleston
was taken by the British (12
May 1780).  At this and be-
fore the peace or shortly af-
ter with Great Britain, he
was drafted in Polk Co. NC
in the company commanded
by Captain Neil in the
militiaof North Carolina
and in the Regiment com-
manded by Colonel
Warford.  Nicholas was
marched to the Cherokee
Nation and after burning
their towns and after faith-
fully serving out his term of
six months; he was dis-
charged at Burke County.

Nicholas lived in Polk
County, NC during the war
and moved to Washington
County, KY, where they
lived on a farm of one hun-
dred acres, purchased in
1814.  He sold the property
in 1819, moving to
Rockcastle Co. KY where
he was living at the time of
his pension application.  He
received a pension at the
rate of twenty dollars annu-
ally commencing 4 March
1831 for his service asa pri-
vate in the North Carolina
Militia.  On 1 November
1843 in Rockcastle Co. KY,
Sally Houk, applied for her
widow’s pension and was
rejected on the basis that she
could not prove marriage.

Nicholas married Sarah
“Sally” Mouser (1751-3
April 1845 Rockcastle Co.
KY) in 1772 in Lincoln

A large crowd attended the ribbon cutting ceremony and open house of WKUR 94.9 FM last Friday. The new
FM station is located in the Renfro Valley Village and is scheduled to go on air this month in Rockcastle and
several other surroudnding counties. Shown above from left are State Senator Jared Carpenter, County Judge
Executive Buzz Carloftis, State Representative Jonathan Shell, Mt. Vernon Mayor Mike Bryant, Brodhead
Mayor Walter Cash, co-owner Destiny Kesler, co-owner Josh Kesler and Renfro Valley CEO Doris Sanders.

The Front Porch Restaurant held their ribbon cutting ceremony last Friday at their restaurant in the Renfro
Valley Village. Shown above from left are WKUR-FM owners Josh and Destiny Kesler, Renfro Valley CEO
Doris Sanders, Diane Helton, Cody Noe, Trina Nicely, Alexandra Martin, Mt. Vernon Mayor Mike Bryant,
Caitlin Mullins, County Judge Executive Buzz Carloftis, State Senator Jared Carpenter, Brodhead Mayor
Walter Cash and State Representative Jonathan Shell.

Benefit for family of Amberly Northern
There will be a Benefit

for the family of Amberly
Northern on Saturday,
September 6th from 4 to
8 p.m. at Mt. Vernon El-

ementary School gymna-
sium. A silent auction
will be held in the cafete-
ria.

There will also be food

available and live music
by: Mercy Roadz, Hot
Pursuit and The Medley
Boys.

If you would like to

make a donation for the
silent auction, call 606-
308-2933 or 859-302-
3362. All donations
greatly appreciated.(Cont. to B4)
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News from the
Rockcastle
Courthouse

District Civil
Suits

Asset Acceptance, LLC
vs. David Thomas,
$3,833.96 plus claimed due.

Valley View Apts. vs.
Melissa Bishop, forcible
detainer complaint.

Capital One Bank vs.
Cathy Shepherd, $940.53
plus claimed due.

Merchants Acceptance,
Inc. vs. Michael W. Collins,
et al, $2,455.53 plus
claimed due. C-00109

Circuit Civil
Suits

Deborah Taylor-Durham
vs. United Financial Co., et
al, complaint.

Jeffery Browning vs.
Donald Konz, complaint.

Marty Wayne Harris vs.
Rebecca Sue Harris, peti-
tion for dissolution of mar-
riage.

Midland Funding LLC
vs. John Kemper,
$11,146.73 plus claimed
due.

Vanderbilt Mortgage and
Finance, Inc. vs. Deshonna
Moore, et al, $40,150.52
plus claimed due. CI-00187

Deeds
Recorded
Dale Gregory and Jan

Knight Bullock, property in
Rockcastle County to Der-
rick McClure. Tax $20.

Ernest Lawson and Tody
Adams Whitt, property in
Brodhead, to Susan Lynn
and Paul Douglas Day. No
tax

Kevin Childress, prop-
erty in Lear Crest Subdv., to
Jacqeline Kaye Rigsby. Tax
$8.

Katherine Rae Bullock,
property on waters of Little
Negro Creek, to Kimberly
A. Gilmore. No tax

Kenneth E. and Kathy B.
Dyehouse, property in
Rockcastle County, to
Elizabeth C. Jones. Tax
$128.

Sarah Foster, property in
Rockcastle County, to
Debra Kelley, Dakota
Lashea Tillery and Robert
Austin Tillery. Tax $60

Complete Home Com-
fort, property on Wildie
Road, to The Eugene T.
Caldwell and Lori E.
Caldwell Revocable Living
Trust. Tax $5

JP Morgan Chase Bank,
property on Jim Halcomb
Road, to Gerilyn Mahaffey.
Tax $45

Charles Houston, prop-
erty in Woodland Place, to
Rocky Lee and Robin M.
Ray. Tax $104.50.

Kenneth and Ola Bul-
lock, property in Rockcastle
County, to Tammy S.
McVey. Tax $20.50

Debra Adams, Execu-
trix, property on Bowling
Ridge Road, to David An-
thony Spoonamore. Tax $7

Mildred G. Blevins,
property in Evergreen Es-
tates, to EW Todd LLC. Tax
$42

Gina McClure, Trustee,
property north of Wildie, to
Benjamin Martin Abney.
Tax $68

Wayne and Patricia Co-
rona, property in
Rockcastle County, to Den-
nis Smith. Tax $210

William J. and Tina
Hurd, property in
Rockcastle County, to  W.F.
Senter. Tax $8

Larry and Tojnia
Kidwell, property in
Rockcastle County, to
Harry Witt. Tax $50

William Terrill Chan-
dler, Jr., property in Lear
Crest Subdv., to Robert E.
and Rosalind B. Philbeck.
Tax $9

Marriage
Licenses

Jessica Ruth Garrett, 28,
Richmond, pharmacist to
Kevin Bradley Childress,
32, Mt. Vernon, railroad en-
gineer. 8/15/14

Mariah Elizaeth Topf,
19, Mt. Vernon, self-em-
ployed to Byron Curry
Quesenberry, 28, Sparta,
NC, construction. 8/15/14

Tammy Lee Watson, 37,
Danville, Ill., unemployed
to Dustin Lane Cromer, 22,
Mt. Vernon, carpenter. 8/15/
14

Jody Ann Reams, 38,
Orlando, Trane to Raymond
Clark, 53, Orlando, Trane. 8/
18/14

Katherine Lynn Dobbs,
48, Mt. Vernon, unem-
ployed, to Joseph Alexander
Dawson, 39, Berea, iron
worker.

The Rockcastle County
Conservation District is now
accepting Kentucky Soil
Erosion and Water Quality
Cost Share Applications on
a continuous basis. This
continual sign-up is de-
signed to make the program
more “landowner friendly”
and help address the needs
of a landowner at any time
during the year.  As land-
owners plan conservation
projects with the assistance
of their local conservation
district, they will be able to
apply for financial assis-
tance for those projects
without having to wait for a
designated sign up period.

Thousands of Kentucky
landowners have received
state assistance through the
Kentucky Soil Erosion and
Water Quality Cost Share

program. Known informally
as state cost share, the pro-
gram was created in 1994
and helps landowners
implement best manage-
ment practices to protect soil
and water resources on their
property. Since the
program’s inception, more
than $129 million has been
approved for use in imple-
menting best management
practices through more than
15,000 submitted applica-
tions. This money has as-
sisted landowners in all of
Kentucky’s 120 counties.

Many state cost share
practices are offered through
the state cost share program.
Some examples are: agricul-
ture and animal waste con-
trol facilities, streambank
stabilization, animal waste
utilization, vegetative filter

Cost share programs sign-up
strips, integrated crop man-
agement, pesticide contain-
ment, sinkhole protection,
pasture and hay land forage
quality and heavy use area
protection. A list of all prac-
tices is available at http://
conservation.ky.gov/Pages/
StateCostShare.aspx.

The Kentucky Soil Ero-
sion and Water Quality Cost
Share program is funded
through the Tobacco Settle-
ment Funds and the Ken-
tucky Department of Agri-
culture

For more information on
the Kentucky Soil Erosion
and Water Quality Cost
Share program, visit the
Rockcastle County Conser-
vation District located at
153 Andover Lane, Mt.
Vernon, KY 40456. You
may also call the district at
606-256-2525 ext. 3.
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Commonwealth of Kentucky
28th Judicial Circuit

Rockcastle Circuit Court • Division II
Civil Action No. 14-CI-00047

Mary Ann Bullock, widow                  Plaintiff

V.

Elizabeth B. Hahn, and husband
David Hahn                            Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a judgment and order of sale entered
in this partition action on June 12, 2014, I will offer
at public auction the hereinafter described real
property in Rockcastle County, Kentucky.

At the Courthouse on East Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

on Friday, September 19, 2014

Beginning at the Hour of 11:30 a.m.

Said property being more particularly bounded and

described as follows:

Located in Rockcastle County, Kentucky, and BEGINNING at a spring
on a line between Said Josiah Hayes and Nathan Bray with dogwood,
sourwood and maple pointers, thence with said line to a small beech,
supposed to be Bray’s line, sugar tree and dogwood pointers, said
beech standing nearly opposite the mouth of the lane leading to the
old David Bethurum house; thence about a west course to a persim-
mon tree standing nearly opposite the house; thence a straight line
northwest to a black oak and three hickories, a corner made by Will-
iam McClure and E. Bullock; thence with Bul1ock’s line to a black oak
made by Thas. Graves and E. Bullock with black oak, white oak and
ash pointers, supposed to be in or nearly in the old Moore survey, a
line of said Moore survey; thence with said line to a stone corner made
by Josiah Hayes and J. C. Watson having two chesnut and 2 sour-
wood pointers; thence a straight line about an east course to begin-
ning. The foregoing described piece of land being in the county of
Rockcastle, State of Kentucky, and on the waters of Skaggs Creek and
containing one hundred (100) acres more or less.
There is excepted from the above described property a one acre tract
of land conveyed by J.V. Bullock to J .L. Bullock by deed dated July 24,
1932, of record in Deed Book 66, page 162, in the office of the clerk of
the Rockcastle County Court, Mt. Vernon, Kentucky, described as fol-
lows:
Beginning on a Black Oak and three Hickorys, thence; 70 yds, East to
a stone, thence 70 yds. north to a stone, thence; 70 yds. West to a
stone, thence; 60 yds. South to the beginning corner, and same to
contain one acre to be the same more or less.

Plaintiff, MaryAnn Bullock and Defendant, Eliza-
beth B. Hahn are the owners in fee simple and in
possession of a one-half (1/2) undivided interest
each in and to property hereinafter described. The
Plaintiff obtained her one-half (1/2) undivided in-
terest by virtue of the Last Will and Testament of
her deceased husband, Wayne Eldon Bullock, re-
corded in the office of the clerk of the Rockcastle
County Court in Will Book 14, pages 141-145. The
Plaintiffs decedent and the Defendant, Elizabeth
B. Hahn each obtained a one-half (1/2) undivided
interest in the subject real property by deed dated
November 25, 2002, from Willis G. Coffey, Master
Commissioner of the Rockcastle Circuit Court, re-
corded in Deed Book 194, pages 7-11 in the Office
of the Rockcastle County Clerk.

The property shall be sold upon the

following terms & conditions:
1. The real property shall be sold together as a
whole and for cash or upon a credit of thirty (30)
days with the purchaser(s) required to pay a
minimum of twenty five percent (25%) of the
purchase price in cash on the date of sale and to
secure the balance with a bond approved by the
Master Commissioner.
2. The bond shall bear interest at the rate of
twelve percent (12%) per annum until paid in full.
The bond shall have the force and effect of a
judgment and shall be and remain a lien upon
the property sold as additional surety for the
payment of the purchase price.
3. Unpaid delinquent State and County ad
valorem taxes shall be paid from the sale pro-
ceeds.
4. The purchaser shall pay the 2014 local, county
and state property taxes.
5. The purchaser shall have possession of the
real property upon compliance with the terms of
the sale.
6. The sale shall be made subject to all ease-
ments, set back lines, restrictions or covenants
of record or otherwise and shall be sold “as is”.

John D. Ford
Master Commissioner

Rockcastle Circuit Clerk

Now Available
Tales of the Thunderbolt People
Traditiional Cherokee Appalachian Folktales

This is a softbound 22 page children’s book.
To order your copy, send check for $20, payable to:

David Owens
85 Chestnut Ridge Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

or call
606-386-0187

$10 of each purchase will go toward the cost of the field
study to inventory and document fish weirs in the
Rockcastle River.

M Andrew
Durant OD

• Comprehensive Eye Exams
• Contact Lenses

• Treatment of Eye Diseases
• Evening Appts. Available

116 Mini Mall Dr. • Berea
(Next to Berea Optical)

859-985-0078

Central Body Service
offers Haddix Custom Detailing.

Basic hand wash to a full
detail that is guaranteed to make

your vehicle look great!
Free pickup and delivery

Stop by Central Body Service or give us
a call today to make an appointment.

606-256-4210 or 606-308-1490

Rockcastle Community
Bulletin Board
Sponsored By

Cox Funeral Home
Family Owned & Operated Since 1907

80 Maple Drive, Mt. Vernon, Ky. Ph. 256-2345
Toll Free 1-888-825-2345 • 24 Hour Obit Line 256-5454

www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Bookmobile Schedule
Mon.,Sept. 8th: No service. Tues., Sept. 9th: Calloway,
Red Hill, Livingston, Lamero, Pine Hill and Sand Hill.
Wed., Sept. 10th: Maple Grove, Orlando and Climax.
Thurs., Sept. 11th: Day Health/Senior Citizens and
Wayne Stewart Center.

Northern Benefit
There will be a Benefit for the family of Amberly North-
ern held Saturday, September 6 from 4 to 8 p.m. at Mt.
Vernon Elementary School. There will be food and live
music by: Mercy Roadz, Hot Pursuit and the Medley
Boys. There will also be a Silent Auction held in the
school cafeteria. To make a donation for the silent auc-
tion, call 606-308-2933 or 859-302-3362. All donations
greatly appreciated.

Girl Scout Sign-Up
Girl Scout Sign-Up for girls in the Roundstone area will
be held at Roundstone Elementary School Thursday, Sept.
4th from 5:30 to 6:30 p.m. in the cafeteria. Please call
256-4817 if you have any questions.

Bittersweet Festival
The Bittersweet Festival has been scheduled for Friday,
Oct. 3rd from 4 to 11 p.m. and Saturday, Oct. 9th from 9
a.m. to 11 p.m. Applications for vendor sites can be picked
up at city Hall or call 606-256-3437 for more informa-
tion.

Climax Fire Dept. Fish Fry
Climax Volunteer Fire Dept. will hold a fish fry on Fri-
day, Sept. 12th, beginning at l6 p.m. For more info, call
256-4475 or 256-3257.

Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
The Rockcastle County Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
will be held September 19, 2014 at Roundstone Elemen-
tary School with dinner and entertainment provided. The
dinner will be at 6 p.m. and the meeting will follow at 7
p.m. All members are encouraged to join us. Call 606-
256-2050 for more info.

KPR Annual Picnic
The Cumberland Valley Chapter of the Kentucky Public
Retirees (KPR) will hold its third annual picnic, begin-
ning at noon, on Tuesday, September 9th at Thompson
Park in Barbourville. Special guest speaker will be State
Senate President Robert Stivers II.

MVFD Portrait Fundraiser
Members of the Mt. Vernon Volunteer Fire Dept. will be
going door-to-door in Mt. Vernon conducting a portrait
fundraiser. For a $20 or more contribution, you will re-
ceive  free 8x10 family portrait which will be taken at
the fire department at a later date. Authorized represen-
tatives will be: Michael Watkins, Woody Watkins, Lesley
Forster, Darrell Morgan, Doris Lamb and Lonnie. For
any questions, call city hall 256-3437 days or Chief David
Bales at night at 308-6623.

Benefit Motorcycle Ride
There will be a benefit motorcycle ride for Bud
Shackleford on Saturday, Sept. 6th, beginning at S&M
Grocery on Hwy. 39 at 11 a.m. No riders fee but dona-
tions appreciated.

Class of 1984 Reunion
RCHS Class of 1984 will hold a Reunion Saturday, Sep-
tember 13th, from 7 to 11 p.m. at Rockcastle Middle
School. Cost is $20 per person/$30 couple. Send check
to RCHS Class of 1984 Reunion, P.O. Box 1410, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456. All teachers are invited.

Livingston School Reunion
The annual Livingston School Reunion will be held Oc-
tober 4th at Livingston. All former students, teachers,
family and friends are invited to attend. This year we
will be recognizing graduates of the classes of 1954 and
1964. Registration information will be mailed to previ-
ous attendees. For info, call Barbara M. Castleberry, 256-
9188 or Doris Thompson, 256-1843.

Brodhead Lodge Meeting
The Brodhead Masonic Lodge #566 meets every third
Saturday at 7 p.m. on Main Street in Brodhead above
Brodhead Pharmacy.

Alcoholics Anonymous
Alcoholics Anonymous meets Tuesday nights at 8 p.m.
behind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St.
in Mt. Vernon.

Kiwanis Club Meetings
The Rockcastle Kiwanis Club meets every Thursday at
noon at the Limestone Grill. Everyone is invited.

Historical Society Hours
The Rockcastle Historical Society is open on Mondays
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the RTEC garage building.

American Legion Post 71
American Legion Post 71 meets the second Thursday at
6 p.m. of each month at the Limestone Grill. Commander
Tommy Hodges invites all Rockcastle veterans to join
this organization that honors American soldiers, sailors
and airmen.

Back-To-School info from Circuit Clerk York
Q. What do I need to

bring to get a State Identifi-
cation Card or Driver’s Per-
mit?

A. Under 18 - Birth Cer-
tificate (original or state cer-
tified with raised embossed
seal); Social Security card
(not laminated); parent
listed on birth certificate or
legal guardian (with guard-
ianship documents).

A parent or guardian
must be present with a valid
form of ID. If the applicant
does not live with the par-
ent or guardian, they also
will need mail addressed to
the child at their current
physical address. Mail must
be dated in the last 30 days.
Also, for a permit you must
have a School Verification
Form.

18 and Over - birth cer-
tificate (original or state cer-
tified with raised embossed
seal); Social Security card
(not laminated); mail post-
marked or dated with the
last 30 days with the
applicant’s name and cur-
rent physical address. All
names on the documenta-
tion must match. We cannot
accept anything laminated
or photocopied.

Identification cards are
good for four years and must
be issued in the county
where you reside. Name or
address changes are re-
quired by law to be made to
identification cards within
10 days. To obtain a name
change, you must show
documentation in the form
of a marriage license, di-

vorce decree or name
change order.

Test date for permits is
Fridays at noon. The road

test is given on Fridays at 8
a.m.

For a study guide go to,
www.KentuckyStatePolice.org
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Free Bible Courses
Free Bible Corres-

pondence Course. Send
your name and address to
3168 Quail Road, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456.
Let the Bible Speak

Tune in to “Let the Bible
Speak,” with Brett Hickey,
on Sunday mornings at 8:30
a.m. on WDKY Fox 56.

Singing
United Gospel of Christ

Church will have a Singing
Saturday night, Sept. 6th,
beginning at 6 o’clock fea-
turing Bro. Hobert Russell
and friends.

Bro. Buck Baker invites
everyone to come out.

In Revival
Cupps Chapel Holiness

Church will be In Revival
Thurs., Fri. and Sat. nights,
Sept. 4, 5 and 6, beginning
at 7 o’clock each night.

Bro. Claude Gilbert, Jr.
will be preaching. Pastor
Dwayne Carpenter and con-
gregation welcome you.

In Revival
West Brodhead Church

of God will be In Revival
beginning this Sunday at 6
p.m. and Monday thru
Wednesday service at 7 p.m.

with Bro. Tim Hall. Special
singing each night.

The church is located on
Hwy. 3245, 2 1/2 miles west
of Brodhead. Call 758-8216
for more info.

Benefit Singing
There will be a Benefit

Singing at Brush Creek Ho-
liness Church, to help defray
medical expenses of Linda
Smith, on Saturday, Sept.
6th, beginning at 7 p.m.

Pastor Lonnie McGuire
and congregation welcome
all to attend.

2014 Homecoming
First Christian Church in

Mt. Vernon will be celebrat-
ing their 2014 Homecoming
with a series of meetings
from Sunday morning, Sept.
14th through Wednesday
evening, Sept. 17th. Sunday
morning service is at 11
a.m., Sunday night at 6
o’clock and Monday
through Wednesday eve-
nings aat 7 o’clock.

Doug Parkey will be
bringing the message each
evening. The theme is
“What I Have Learned.”

If you have any ques-
tions, or need transportation
call us at 256-2876.

Graves, Hayes,
Owens Reunion

The Graves, Hayes,
Owens Reunion will be
held, beginning at noon, at
Blue Springs School on Sat-
urday, Sept. 6th.

Please bring a covered

dish and join us.

Rowe Reunion
The Robert and Winnie

Rowe Reunion will be held
Sunay, September 14th at
Shelter Number 4 in Logan
Huble Park, Lancaster.

Upcoming Reunions
All relatives and friends

are welcome.

Cromer/
Whitaker
Reunion

The Cromer/Whitaker
Family Reunion will be held
Saturday, Sept. 13th at
KCCA Church Camp in
Brodhead. Dinner at noon.
Please bring a covered dish
to share.

Contact Rissie Cromer at
758-9054 for questions or
directions.

Benefit
for family

There will be a Benefit
for the family of Amberly
Northern on Saturday, Sep-
tember 6th from 4 to 8 p.m.
at Mt. Vernon Elementary
School gymnasium. A silent
auction will be held in the
cafeteria.

There will also be food
available and live music by:
Mercy Roadz, Hot Pursuit
and The Medley Boys.

If you would like to make
a donation for the silent auc-
tion, call 606-308-2933 or
859-302-3362. All dona-
tions greatly appreciated.

To Be Wed...
The parents of Christina H. Pendery and Anthony D.
Prewitt announce their forthcoming marriage on Sep-
tember 20, 2014. The ceremony will be held at The
Church of the Nazarene in Mt. Vernon.

An encouraging word:

Things of Value Can Be Lost
By Howard Coop

On August 12, 1955, I
finished my work at
Emory University and
prepared to move back to
Kentucky.  A few days
later, Kathryn and I went
to see the house in Sci-
ence Hill, Kentucky
where we would live.  We
wanted to see if any work
needed to be done before
we moved.

After going through
the house, I went to a
room upstairs.  When I
got to the top of the steps,
I saw an unsightly pile of
trash with a neatly writ-
ten note prominently
placed upon it.  That note,
written by the former oc-
cupant and addressed to
the future occupant, said
that the trash had been left
for a purpose.  If the any
item of value was found,
it could be saved, other-
wise the trash should be
placed in the garbage.

When we moved into
the house, one of my first
responsibilities was to
dispose of that pile of
trash.  However, I did
look through it, and I
found two items that I
thought had some value.
Both were books, one of
which was A COM-

PLETE DICTIONARY
OF SYNONYMS AND
ANTONYMS compiled
by Samuel Fallows and
published in 1886. I saved
that old dictionary, and I
have used it regularly for
59 years.  The other book
is a facsimile edition of
Thomas Jefferson’s Bible
published in limited edi-
tion by the Fifty-seventh
Congress of the United
States.  I have kept
Jefferson’s Bible because
I think it has some value

Every time I think
about those two old books
rescued from a pile of
trash, I think of the old
adage: “One man’s trash
is another man’s trea-
sure.”  Now, value is de-
fined as “that quality of a
thing according to which
it is thought of as being
more or less desirable
useful, estimable, impor-
tant.”  Now, a “thing” can
be “thought of” differ-
ently by different persons

Value judgments are
often made.  Without
knowledge and under-
standing, it is possible
that things---both posses-
sions and ideals---of true
value are thrown away as
worthless trash.

County, NC.  She and
Nicholas had eight children,
six were living at the time
of the reading of Sally’s will
in 1845.  Five of which their
names are known.  Both
Nicholas and Sally are bur-
ied at the Hiatt Cemetery,
Renfro Valley, Rockcastle
Co. KY along with many
family members.

The known children of
Nicholas and Sally:  Mary

In Memory of My Loving
Wife,

Brenda Renner
Happy Birthday

9-9-51 - 1/13-2014
I love and miss you

very much
J.R. Renner

“Patriots”
(Cont. from B1)

“Polly” Houk (1772 Lincoln
Co. NC-November 1850
MO) married Coonrod
“Cooney” Adams (1770
NC-1835 MO).  Frederick
Houk (13 October 1776 Lin-
coln Co. NC- June 1875
Rockcastle Co. KY) married
Elizabeth (13 October 1786
NC-11 June 1843
Rockcastle Co. KY).  They
are buried at the Hiatt Cem-
etery in Rockcastle Co. KY.
According to census
records, they had at least
nine children and possibly
as many as eleven.
Catherine Houk. (2 March
1787 Washington Co. KY-
after 1850 Rockcastle Co.
KY) married Richardson
Roberts (1785VA-24 No-
vember 1854 Rockcastle
Co. KY).  Betsy Houk (1788
Washington Co. KY-After
1860 KY) married Joseph
Husbands on 3 August 1814
Washington Co. KY.  Sally
Houk married William Rob-
erts on 9 April 1806 Wash-
ington Co. KY.

Nicholas Houk is a rec-
ognized patriot by the
Daughters of the American
Revolution.
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Gospel Meeting
Church of Christ
at Chestnut Ridge
2 Miles South of Mt. Vernon on Hwy. 25

September
10th - 14th

Wed. thru Sat. Services at 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Worship Service at 10:00 a.m.

Speaker will be
Evangelist

Jerry Dickerson
Everyone is invited

to attend!

The U.S. Department of
Agriculture (USDA) is en-
couraging producers who
have suffered  eligible disas-
ter-related losses to act to
secure assistance by Sept.
30, 2014, as congressionally
mandated payment reduc-
tions will take place for pro-
ducers who have not acted
before that date. Livestock
producers that have experi-
enced grazing losses since
October 2011 and may be
eligible for benefits but have
not yet contacted their local
Farm Service Agency (FSA)
office should do so as soon
as possible.

The Budget Control Act
passed by Congress in 2011
requires USDA to imple-
ment reductions of 7.3 per-
cent to the  Livestock For-
age Disaster Program (LFP)
in the new fiscal year, which
begins Oct. 1, 2014. How-
ever, producers seeking LFP
support who have scheduled
appointments with their lo-
cal FSA office before Oct.
1, even if the appointment
occurs after Oct.1, will not
see reductions in the amount
of disaster relief they re-
ceive.

USDA is encouraging
producers to register, re-
quest an appointment or be-
gin a Livestock Forage Di-
saster Program  application

with their county FSA office
before Oct. 1, 2014, to lock
in the current zero percent
sequestration rate. As an ad-
ditional aid to qualified pro-
ducers applying for LFP, the
Farm Service's Agency has
developed an online regis-
tration that enables  farmers
and ranchers to put their
names on an electronic list
before the deadline to avoid
reductions in their disaster
assistance. This is an alter-
native to visiting or contact-
ing the county office. To
place a name on the Live-
stock Forage Disaster Pro-
gram  list online, visit http:/
/www.fsa.usda.gov/disaster-
register.

Producers who already
contacted the county office
and have an appointment
scheduled need do nothing
more.

"In just four months
since disaster assistance en-
rollments began, we've pro-
cessed 240,000 applications
to help  farmers and ranch-
ers who suffered losses,"
said Agriculture Secretary
Tom Vilsack. "Eligible pro-
ducers who have not yet
contacted their local FSA
office should stop by or call
their local FSA office, or
sign up online before Oct. 1
when congressionally man-
dated  payment reductions

take effect. This will ensure
they receive as much finan-
cial assistance as possible."

The Livestock Indemnity
Program, the Tree Assis-
tance Program and the
Noninsured Disaster Assis-
tance Program  Frost Freeze
payments will also be cut by
7.3 percent on Oct. 1, 2014.
Unlike the Livestock Forage
Disaster Program, applica-
tions for these programs
must be fully completed by
Sept. 30. FSA offices will
prioritize these applications,
but as the full application
process can take several
days or more to complete,
producers are encouraged to
begin the application pro-
cess as soon as possible.

The Livestock Forage
Disaster Program compen-
sates eligible livestock pro-
ducers who suffered grazing
losses due  to drought or fire
between Oct. 1, 2011 and
Dec. 31, 2014. Eligible live-
stock includes alpacas, beef
cattle, buffalo, beefalo, dairy
cattle, deer, elk, emus,
equine, goats, llamas, poul-
try, reindeer, sheep or swine
that have been or would
have been grazing  the eli-
gible grazing land or
pastureland. Producers
forced to liquidate their live-
stock may also be eligible
for program benefits.

Additionally, the 2014
Farm Bill eliminated the risk
management purchase re-
quirement. Livestock pro-
ducers are  no longer re-
quired to purchase coverage
under the federal crop insur-
ance program or Noninsured
Crop Disaster Assistance
Program to be eligible for
Livestock Forage Disaster
Program assistance.

To learn more about
USDA disaster relief pro-
gram, producers can review
the 2014 Farm Bill fact sheet
at www.fsa.usda.gov/
farmbill,  the LFP program
fact sheet, http://go.usa.gov/
5JTk,  or contact their local
FSA office.

The Livestock Forage
Disaster Program was made
possible through the 2014
Farm Bill, which builds on
historic  economic gains in
rural America over the past
five years, while achieving
meaningful reform and bil-
lions of dollars in savings
for the taxpayer. Since en-
actment, USDA has made
significant progress to
implement each provision of
this critical legislation, in-
cluding  providing disaster
relief to farmers and ranch-
ers; strengthening risk man-
agement tools; expanding
access to rural credit; fund-
ing critical research; estab-
lishing innovative public-
private conservation part-
nerships; developing new
markets for rural-made
products;  and investing in
infrastructure, housing and
community facilities to help
improve quality of life in
rural America. For more in-
formation, visit
www.usda.gov/farmbill.

By October 1st

Livestock producers urged to
enroll in Disaster Assistance

Jayna Elisabeth Singleton  won Class Champion in
the 4-H Junior Class-Black and White Drawing cat-
egory at the Kentucky State Fair in August. Jayna
is the daughter of Derrick and Kimberly Singleton,
also an Art student of Les Scalf.

Mamaw’s Kitchen
By Regina Poynter Hoskins

BOSTON CREAM PIE
CAKE

2 cups plus 1 tablespoon
cold milk, divided
1 box (3.4 ounce) instant
French vanilla pudding mix
1 cup hot fudge ice cream
topping
1 prepared angel food cake
Using a wire whisk, blend 2
cups milk and the dry pud-
ding mix for 2 minutes.  Set
aside. With a serrated knife
split the cake into three hori-
zontal layers.  Place the bot-
tom layer on a serving plate.
Spread half of the pudding
over that layer and repeat
with second layer.  Do not
spread any of the pudding
over the top of the cake, but
if you have extra pudding,
put it in the hole of the cake.
Heat the hot fudge with the
1 tablespoon milk in the mi-
crowave for 30 seconds or
so until a spreadable consis-
tency is reached.  Drizzle
over cake and let some
drizzle down sides.  Serve
with some extra hot fudge
topping if desired.  If there
are any leftovers, refriger-
ate.

HAWAIIAN WEDDING
CAKE

This is one of the easiest
cakes to prepare and one of
the most flavorful to eat.
With the pineapple and mac-
adamia nuts, I can almost

believe I am visiting Hawaii
when I eat this.
2 cups all-purpose flour
2 cups sugar
2 teaspoons baking soda
1 (20 ounce) can crushed
pineapple, undrained
1 cup walnuts, coarsely
chopped
2 eggs, lightly beaten
1 cup shredded coconut
Preheat oven to 325°.  Coat
a 13 x 9 x 2 baking dish with
non-stick spray.  In a large
bowl, mix ingredients in
first column.  Stir with a
wooden spoon until just
combined, and all ingredi-
ents are moist.  Spoon mix-
ture into prepared pan.  Bake
at 325° for 35 to 40 minutes
or until toothpick inserted in
center of cake comes out
clean.  Remove from oven
and cool on wire rack.
TOPPING for cake:
1/2 cup butter, softened
4 ounces cream cheese, soft-
ened
2 cups powdered sugar
1 teaspoon vanilla
Chopped macadamia nuts,
optional
In a bowl, beat butter and
cream cheese until smooth.
Gradually beat in powdered
sugar and vanilla until
smooth.  Frost cooled cake
with the cream cheese mix-
ture. Sprinkle with
macadamias if desired.



Classifieds
CLASSIFIED RATES
• Local Rates - $4 for 25 words
or less - .10 each additional word

• Display Classifieds
$5.00/Inch

Deadline for Classifieds
is 10 a.m. TUESDAY

For Rent

For Rent

Maple St. Storage

of Brodhead

256-2884 or
606-308-2491
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Property
For Sale

Make $1,000 selling your old scrap cars-trucks and farm
equipment and machinery.

Call 24 hours a day. If no answer, leave message and your call will be returned.

859-358-3560 or 606-256-3841 anytime

We also buy
batteries, converters,
aluminum wheels and

radiators, starters,
and alternators.

Used tires and parts
for sale at dirt
cheap prices.

NOTICE
NO classifieds can

be placed over
the phone without
paying at time of

placing
advertisement

CLASSIFIED
ADS NOTICE

For your  convenience,
we now  accept VISA

and Mastercard
To place your

classified, have your
credit card ready

and call
(606) 256-2244

Posted

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Help Wanted

Deliver
Phone Books

Work your own hours,
Have Insured Vehicle.

Must be at least 18
years old with valid
DL. No experience

necessary.

1-800-518-1333 x224
www.deliverthephonebook.com

Local company seeking interested
applicants for:

Maintenance Technician &
Quality Engineer Positions:

Qualifications: General maintenance with basic
electrical experience - welding & cutting required

Qualifications: Quality Engineer – daily
inspection audits, inspect and test customer
products using various gauges, computer skills
with Microsoft office & ISO knowledge
Must have own tools and transportation.

Interested applicants send resume to:
PO Box 687

Richmond, KY 40475

B.C.C. Metals
Featuring metal roofing, siding,

trim and insulation.
Same day service available on most orders.

Contact Jerry Blair
Toll Free 1-800-658-4902 • 256-4700

Located 4 miles s. of Berea, off U.S. 25 at 862 Lambert Rd.
Serving Rockcastle County & surrounding counties.

www.bccmfg.com

0 Wabd Jones Rd.
Brodhead
$39,900

GILLIAM
REAL ESTATE & AUCTION

427 Chestnut St., Berea, KY • 859-986-9797
John Gilliam • Principal Broker

Realtor Loretta Powell - 859-302-8411
www.gilliamrealestate.com

00 White Lick Rd. (25.884 Acres) - $104,900

4205 Scaffold Cane Rd. - Mt. Vernon - $85,000

2747 Gabbard Rd. (Garrard Co. near Sweetwater Rd.)

        - Doublewide & 2+/-A - $99,900

254 Sue Johnson Rd. - Singlewide & 6+/-A - $39,000

REDUCED! 258 Sue Johnson Rd. -Doublewide & 3.12 A - $36,900

341 Pleasant View Dr. - Doublewide & 1.21 A - $69,000

2800 Richmond St. - Commercial Bldg. & 1 A - $125,000

With extra 11 A - $180,000 • 11 Acres only - $55,000

2780 Richmond St. - Doublewide & 0.645 A - $75,000

 2010 Singlewide only - NO LAND.

3 Bedroom/2 Bath Mobile
Home. Sunnyside Estates.
$400 month/$400 deposit.
No pets. Call 606-308-5459
or 606-256-8603. 35xntf
Two bedroom/one bath
mobile home on Davis St.
in Mt. Vernon. Stove and
fridge furnished. Call 606-
386-3323. 36x2
“Mink” Residential Rent-
als, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
Houses and apartments.
Owners: Gary W. and
Gertha Mink. Must have
proof of income, refer-
ences, deposit. Call 606-
308-1209. 36x2p
3 BR/1 1/2 bath house, at
481 Tyree St., Brodhead.
Garage and arport. No in-
side pets - no exceptions!
Available after Sept. 1st to
show. $400 month/$400
deposit. References re-
quired. Cecil/Judy King
606-758-9683 or 606-510-
3719 or 606-510-3759.
36xntf
For Rent: Large two story
five bedroom home, 2
baths, living room, dining
room, large eat-in kitchen,
located at 212 Maple St.,
across from Baptist Church
on corner of Silver and
Maple St. in Brodhead.
Ceiling fans throughout.
Available October 1st, $585
month. Security deposit
and credit check required.
Call 706-373-6877 or 606-
758-9209.
Duplex in Brodhead. All
appliances furnished. Call
Patty, 758-9666. 17xntf
Trailers and house in
Brodhead. No pets. 758-
8922. ntf
Accepting applications at
Mt. Vernon Housing Au-
thority on Mondays 4 to 8
p.m. and Wednesdays and
Fridays, 4 to 6 p.m. Rent
based on income. 256-
4185. 14xntf
Accepting Applications:
For 2 and 3 bedroom units
at Valley View Apartments.
Rent based on income. Call
256-5912. Equal Housing
Opportunity, TDD for hear-
ing impaired only. 1-800-
247-2510. 36tfn

House on Scaffold Cane
Road, Mt. Vernon. 2 acres,
all fenced. House has
approx. 3,000 sq. ft. w/4
bedrooms, 2 1/2 baths, big
porches for easy living,
pool. Wonderful place to
raise a family. If interested,
and for more info, call 606-
308-1561. 36x4p
26 1/2 Acres w/creek. Has
field and woods, plenty of
deer and turkey. Located on
Schoolhouse Hill Road, off
Hwy. 461. $139,900. 606-
224-9740. 35x4p
2BR/2BA 1450 sq. ft. Sell-
ing for $89,900. Rick Szaks,
Broker. 859-255-7777. Lin-
coln Real Estate, Inc.
rickszaks@aol.com  18xntf
Between Mt. Vernon and
Somerset: 5.7 wooded
acres for $31,500. Near
Berea - 10.2 acres $31,900.
Owner financing available.
Call Dwight at 859-331-
4888. 8xntf
Lots in Castle Ridge Sub-
division. Use same entry
way as Bible Baptist
Church. All lots have city
sewer and underground
utilities. starting at $12,900.
606-256-5692 • 256-4504 •
308-3730. 50x1
Mobile home lots, located
in Sunnyside Mobile Home
Park. 1/2 acre lots - $500
down and $100 per month.
Call 606-256-5692 or 606-
256-5648. 50x1

Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or traveling through
land belonging to Scott
Anglin, on John Rigsby
Ridge Road, without writ-
ten permission only from
Scott Anglin. 36x4p
Posted: No trespassing on
property belonging to Crys-
tal Gail Griffin and Douglas
Paul Griffin, located on Ky.
Hwy. 1955, Red Hill Road.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted. 35x4p
Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on land belonging
to Glen Roberts at 560 Dix
River Branch Road,
Brodhead. Violators will be
prosecuted. 35xntf
Posted: No trespassing,
hunting or fishing on land
belonging to Rachel
Denney on Hwy. 3245
(former Reggie Benge prop-
erty).

Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or 4 wheelers on
property belonging to Will-
iam Johnson and Bill Parker
(formerly owned by Bar-
bara Setser) and located on
Hwy. 490, Mahaffey Hol-
low Road, Livinston. Viola-
tors will be prosecuted.
13x26
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or ATVs on land be-
longing to Jason and Sara
Coguer at Roundstone. Not
responsible for accidents.
Posted: No trespassing on
land belonging to James and
Dorothy Rash heirs on Rash
Branch Road off Chestnut
Ridge. No hunting, camp-
ing, ATVs, trespassing for
any purpose. Not respon-
sible for accidents. Violators
will be prosecuted. (1/15/
15)
Posted: No trespassing on
Crawford Place - Old
Brodhead Road. Danny
Smith. 47tfn
Posted: Absolutely no hunt-
ing, fishing or trespassing
on property belonging to
Mark and Debbie
Cummins. Violators will be
prosecuted. 9x52p
Posted: No trespassing on
property known as C.B.
Owens Farm across from
Fairgrounds in Brodhead.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted. 25tfn

Position Available: the
Cumberland Valley District
Health Department is ac-
cepting applications for a
full time Senior Spport
Services Associate I -
Home Health position for
Rockcastle County Home
Health. Starting salary:
$8.40/hr. or $630 bi-weekly
(Grade 9). Applications and
full listing of qualificatins
may be obtained at the
Cumberland Valley District
Health Department, P.O.
Box 158, 470 Manchester
Square Shopping Center,
Suite 200, Manchester, Ky.
40962 (606) 598-5564 or
line at http://chfs.ky.gov/
dph/LHD.htm. Completed
application and transcript
must be returned by close of
business September 11,
2014 to Cumberland Valley
District Health Department.
Resume will not substitute
for completed application.
Equal Opportunity Em-
ployer. Applicants and em-
ployees in this classification
may be required to submit
to a drug screening test and
background check. 37x1
Hanson Aggregate has two
job openings: Scaler Opera-
tor and a part time Rail En-
gineer. Apply 7:30 a.m. to 4
p.m., Monday through Fri-
day at office in Mt. Vernon
on Hwy. 150. EOE 36x2

Notices

Facility Manager for Hos-
pice Care Plus, Richmond.
Full time with excellent
benefits including 31 days
of paid time off per year and
benefit package. Three
years experience with facili-
ties maintenance and GED
or HS Diploma required.
Prefer healthcare experi-
ence. For more information
call 859-986-1500 Sue
Lunsford, HR Coordinator
or send resume to
sue.lunsford@hospicecp.org.
EOE 36x2
Excellent Opportunity to
advance your career!
Malone Solutions is now
hiring for manufacturing
positions with a pay rate
between $9 and $13 per
hour. Apply online at
www.malonesolutions.com.
33x8

Notice is hereby given that
Shirley Brown, 34 Elsie
Lane, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
Executrix of the Estate of
James Lester Brown. Any
person having claims
against said estate shall
present them, according to
law, to the said Shirley
Brown on or before Febru-
ary 1, 2015 at 11 a.m. 35x3
Notice is hereby given that
Peter Pavlick, 38335
Bainbridge Rd., Solon, OH
44139 has been appointed
Executor of the Estate of
Michael Paul Pavlick,
D.V.M. Any person having
claims against said estate
shall present them, accord-
ing to law, to the said Peter
Pavlick or Hon. Bobby
Amburgey, P.O. Box 3118,
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456 on
or before February 16, 2015
at 11 a.m. 35x3
Notice is hereby given that
Mayme Smallwood, 106
Rogers St., Berea, Ky.
40403 and Roxie Ambrose,
689 Scaffold Cane Road,
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456,
have been appointed co-ad-
ministrators of the estate of
Anna Lee Cope. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Mayme Smallwood and/or
Roxie Ambrose or Hon.
William D. Reynolds, 140
West Main St., P.O. Box
1250, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 on or before Mrch 2,
2015 at 11 a.m. 37x3

Miscellaneous
For Sale

Subscribe to
the Signal

Mobile Homes
For Sale

Mobile Home For Sale By
Owner. To be moved.
14x70, three bedrooms, two
full baths, fireplace. Asking
$10,500 or best offer. Call
6-6-872-1703. 37x2p

1997 27 ft. Fleetwood Wil-
derness travel trailer.
$1,800 as is, needs some re-
pair. 1998 20 ft. Bayliner
Bowrider. $1,500, needs
motor. 919-816-7902. 37x4
2 antique dressers; antique
chifferobe w/hat box; two
bed frames; entertainment
center; coffee table/2 corner
tables; stereo; floor model
TV; book case; couch; twin
bed (antique); antique re-
frigerator; stove and micro-
wave; CB radios; CB tower
and antenna. 606-453-3481
or 606-392-9103. 37x2p

Motor Vehicles
For Sale

1996 Ford Expedition,
Eddie Bauer Edition. 4
wheel drive. $2500 obo.
606-308-3670. 13xntf



Morgan Plumbing
Service & Repair

New Construction •
Commercial & Residential Service

Fully Insured • All Work Guaranteed

256-4766 • 606-232-0666

Mechanic
On Duty

All Types of Repairs
We do muffler &

exhaust replacement and
custom pipe bending

BEE Garbage
256-2334

Weekly residential
curbside pickup

$1700 per month with Curb Cart

MPL #6761

5076 S Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

David’s Tire Center
24 Hr. Towing & Recovery LLC

1431 S. Wilderness Rd. (US 25)
Mt. Vernon

Save On All Major Brand
Tires For Cars & Trucks

Farm Tractors • Lawn & More

David & Josh Thompson, Owners
Office/24 Hr. Wrecker
606-256-4606

Town & Country
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE

All Types of Mechanic Work

Call 256-9634 days or
256-4650 nights

MADISON TERMITE
and PEST CONTROL
Call Paul Burton - Day or Night

256-2318 - Mt. Vernon
-----

STOP TERMITES  ROACHES  WATERBUGS

Winstead’s
Heating & Air

Pat Winstead
606-256-1038 • 606-308-4825

HM04434

On-Site
Computer

Service
Tired of sending your
computer

away to get
it fixed?

Call and let us come to
you for all your computer

needs!

Setup, Consultation,
Software/Hardware Conflicts

Virus/Spyware Removal

Reasonable Rates
Call

Spencer Benge
606-308-5653

Caudill Dump Truck Service
Rock • Gravel
Agr. Lime
Sand

Rock & Job Quotes
Driveway Spreading
Dumping/Stockpile

Contact for competitive pricing:
Myron - (606) 308-1387

Kentucky Auto Exchange
Public Auto Auction • Dealers Welcome

Every Saturday and Tuesday at 7 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
Located on Exit 38 in London on Hwy. 1006

(606) 878-7815

Financing Available
through Wells Fargo

*w/ approved credit

Visa, Mastercard,
Discover
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John’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’s
Repair

Appliance
& Plumbing

Faucet & Toilet
308-5646

John Tyler, Owner

Rocket Carpet
Cleaners

Circular Dry Foam Cleaning

(606) 256-9870

Thinking About Cleaning Your Carpet!
Some things to think about…

What is the best way to clean my carpet, should I use the
old technology of steam cleaning or the new technology

of dry foam?

Test results from Consumer Report, 2008.

Option 1: Steam Cleaning-How does it work?
A. Steam Cleaners saturate your carpet and floor pad with hot (150*
degree) soapy water containing lye and beach to help dissolve stains.

B. After your carpet reaches its maximum saturation point the solution
is then extracted by means of a commercial shop vacuum.

The results: Removes less than 20% of the soil from the carpet driving
the remainder down deeper into the carpet fibers.  The lye/bleach

solution used by steam cleaners to dissolve stains fades carpet colors.
Drying time is 1 to 5 days depending on the carpet texture.  As a result
of the water saturation, carpet fibers harden and the floor pad remains
damp, which promotes bacteria growth and mildewing, causing carpet

threads to rot, shorting the life of your carpet.  Carpet manufactures
recommend that you do not steam clean carpets.

Option 2: Dry Foam-How does it work?
C. Carpet fibers are agitated with carpet combs to separate the fibers
loosening dirt particles, which are then dry cleaned with an industrial

strength vacuum.
D. The carpet is then shampooed with horse hair brushes using

Dry-Foam lather, a solution that contains six different cleaners and
fabric softener, color brightener, deodorizer, disinfectant, crystalline

agent, scotch guard, & degreaser. Does not contain lye or bleach.
E. Carpet fibers are then groomed to fluff up worn walk areas to give a

uniform look to the carpet.
The results: Removes over 90% of carpet soil.  Rejuvenates and

brightens colors and patterns of carpets.  Drying times is less than 2
hours.  Floor pads remain dry-Fabric Softener makes carpets soft again-

Promoting the life of the carpet.
Carpet manufacturers recommend Dry Foam to clean Carpets.

Professional
Services

Heating & Air

COMPLETE HOME
COMFORT

Locally owned and Located at:

523 West St. • Brodhead, Ky.
Rodney Smith

758-0155 • 256-1683 • 859-661-5986
We service all Brands and Models • 20+ years experience

Free Estimates - Affordable Service - Call for Rates
Expert Installation & Troubleshooting • Friendly Hometown Service

Heat Pumps and Gas Furnaces
Fully Licensed and Insured HVAC and Electrical • MO-4808 and CE63779

Now Buying Junk Cars
Hauling off appliances for free!

Call Mike
(606) 308-2487

256-0122

Gutters Cleaned and Repaired

Yard Sales

Jonathan Collins Remod-
eling and Repair Service.
Home improvements of any
kind from doors and win-
dows, painting, new floors
to roofs and decks - will do
it all. Any home, any prob-
lem, “we’re the one to call.”
606-308-3533. 37x4p
Owens Monument: Lo-
cated behind Owens Fu-
neral Home in Brodhead.
Open Mon-Fri. 8 to 5 and
Sat. 9 a.m. to noon. 606-
758-9600. 14xntf
Notice: Will haul off or buy
scrap metal, junk cars or
trucks. Metal hauled for
free. 231-6788. 14xntf
Grave Markers & Monu-
ments: In stock at all times.
McNew Monument Sales,
US 25, 4 miles north of Mt.
Vernon. Phone 256-2232.
U Call We Haul! Anything
that fits on a truck. Local or

long distance. Building -
demolition - moving -
clean-ups - bushhogging -
landscaping. No garbage.
606-256-9222 o4 308-1629.
35xntf
Gail’s Pampered Pooch
57 West Main St.,
Brodhead. For appt. call
606-758-0064
20xntf

Wanted

Huge Moving Sale: Friday,
Sept. 5th and Sat., Sept. 6th,
9 a.m. to ? One mile up Scaf-
fold Cane Road from
Roundstone - 138 Pheasant
Lane. “Low prices.” Furni-
ture,, craft supplies, home
decor, plus size women’s
clothes - 16W-26W and
1XL, 2XL, 3XL, tools, holi-
day decor.
4 Family Yard Sale: Sept.
4th and 5th, 8 a.m. to ?
Home of Joyce Holtzclaw,
100 Lovell Court, behind
Christian Church. Clothes,
sectional sofa, small table,
desk, set of antique twin
beds, all kinds of other
household items.
Garage Sake: Home of Ken
and Carolyn Holt, 4012 Cli-
max Road. Friday, 8 a.m. to
8 p.m. Saturday, 8 a.m. to ?
Tools, horseshoeing and
tack, camping supplies, liv-
ing room suite, pictues,
household items, clothes,
lots of stuff. 256-4475 for

glassware, Longabergr bas-
kets, keyboard, fans, heat-
ers, sheet sets, ironing
board, 14k gold chains and
bracelt to match, sconces,
pictures and much much
more. For more info 606-
224-0501.
Yard Sale: 10864 N. Wil-
derness Road (besider
Snyder Market). New jew-
elry, toys, books, odds and
ends, clothes, shoes, an-
tiques, curtains, Home Inte-
rior. This Saturday, 8 a.m. to
?
Yard Sale: Hilltop Market
Thursday, Friday and Satur-
day, given by the McGuire
sisters. Lots of great stuff,
come out and see us. 9 a.m.
to ? all three days.
Yard Sale: Friday, 8 to 3
and Sat., 8 to 1. Rain can-
cels. Across from Citizens
Bank in Brodhead. Lots of
clothes, from small sizes for
women - about 5, thru 3x. A
lot of nice clothes to wear
to church - skirts and
dresses, blouses. Alot of
women’s pants - small to
large. Men’s clothes in a lot
of sizes starting at 30 thru
40, name brand shoes, lots
of hospital scrubs - some
new with price tags still on
them - small to large. Some
Home Interior and house-
hold items, a few tools - too
many items to mention.

more info.
Garage Sale: Home of Tom
and Virginia Darst, 1725
Hwy. 1326. Sat., Sept. 6th,
8:30 a.m. to 2 p.m.
Longaberger baskets, pot-
tery, jewelry, clothing - sizes
10-12, household items,
decorative pieces, shoes,
etc.
Yard Sale: Sept. 5th and
6th, 8 a.m. to 4 p.m. at 147
Derby Lane, Houston Point
Subdv. Lots of items -
priced to sell. Comforter
sets, women’s clothes (plus
sizes), plus size scrubs (3X),
shoes, purses, small appli-
ances, lamps and lots more.
4 Family Garage Sale: 840
West Main St. Thurs. & Fri.,
8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m.
3 Family Yard Sale at the
home of Melvin and Lela
Mae Harrison. Sept. 6th, 9
a.m. to 5 p.m. Given by
Lela, Gayle DeBorde and
Tami Hasting. Something
for everyone. Clothes,
purses, jewelry,
Tupperware, kitchen stuff,
what-nots, scents and odds
and ends. Rain cancels.
5 Family Garage Sale:
Thursday, Friday and Satur-
day, 9 a.m. 220 Lovell Lane
(close to grade school), Mt.
Vernon. lots of me’s cloth-
ing, long sleeve ad short
sleeve shirts, pants - like
new. Women’s and
children’s clothes - all sizes;

General Construction

Tiling • Flooring859-302-0197

Will pay cash for old gas,
oil, dealerships, parts manu-
facturer signs, old gas
pumps, L&N collectibles,
anything regarding the
Cummins family from
Rockcastle County, John
Deere, International Har-
vester, antiques, etc. Com-
ing to Mt. Vernon the week
end of October 3-4, 2014.
Contact Kari Cummins
Ogle at 502-836-6922 with
any questions. 34x7

Wanted To Buy: Your an-
tiques and collectibles. An-
tique glassware, furniture,
quilts, all types of military
items, clocks, watches
(working or not), pocket
watches and wrist watch
parts, pocket knives, coins
and paper money. All types
of gold, silver scrap, cast
iron banks, toys, lighters,
crock jugs, cast iron skillets,
marbles, pocket knives,
fishing items, Indian Arrow-
heads, and much, much
more. Also buying partial
estates. Over 25 years expe-
rience. Call Clarence Reece
at 606-531-0467. 47xntf
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Rockcastle County High School senior Callie Asher, second from right, daughter of Anthony and Julie Asher
of Mt. Vernon, was crowned Renfro Valley Jamboree Bowl Queen during halftime of the Rockcastle County-
South Laurel football game last Friday night. Shown from left are runners-up Cheyenne Morgan, Chelsey
King and Kendra Dees. The Rockets won the annual bowl game 35-14.

The Dix River Bridge at Brodhead was reopened to motorists last Friday. The bridge was originally con-
demned by Kentucky Transportation Cabinet engineers last November when, during a routine inspection,
they realized the bridge’s center box beam had severely decayed and posed an immediate threat to motorists.
A temporary bridge was built in January and will now be torn out with large track excavators. A lot of the
material from the temporary bridge will be recycled and used on other KYTC projects.

Fiscal Court adds two roads in Rainbow
Ridge Subdivision to county road system

Relay For Live Event

Country Kickin’ for
a Cure at Livingston

School Board
readdresses
federal school
lunch program

At Monday night’s meet-
ing of the Livingston City
Council, Mayor Jason Med-
ley reminded members of
the Relay For Life Cancer
Benefit which will be held
at Livingston this Saturday,
September 13th from 6 to 10
p.m. It’s the third annual
“Country Kickin’ For A
Cure,” sponsored by IGA.

Entertainment will in-
clude The Medley Boys,
Motown’s Sandy Love and
other singers performing on
the firehouse stage.

There will be soup beans,
fried “taters,” cornbread,
baked and fried pies avail-
able.

Another upcoming event
in Livingston will be the
annual Alumni Banquet,
scheduled for Saturday, Oc-
tober 4th at the former
school.

Also discussed at the
meeting was the new exer-
cise facility opening soon in

the annex to the former
school in the old Homecom-
ing Committee room.  Med-
ley told the council that the
gym had all the equipment
necessary for operation of a
gym. Memberships will be
sold and the facility will be
open during daytime hours
but night time hours are de-
pendent on obtaining ad-
equate volunteers to oversee
the gym.

For more information
about the facility or to pur-
chase a membership call city
hall at 453-2061.

In other business, the
commissioners voted to not
pay a $140 bill tendered by
Eastern Water Association
Medley told the commis-
sioners that the bill stemmed
from a water main break that
he and former water super-
intendent David Blackburn
repaired recently. Medley

Two local people were
recently arrested for manu-
facturing meth after police
raided a home on North Wil-
derness Road in Mt. Vernon.

Arrested were Bobby
Lee Kirby, 32, of Mt.
Vernon and Cassandra
Renee Falin, 32, of
Brodhead.

According to state police
reports, Trooper Scottie
Pennington responded to
the residence to serve two
warrants for Kirby’s arrest

for theft by unlawful taking
and theft by extortion.

Once Pennington ar-
rived, Falin ran inside the
residence. After receiving
consent to search the resi-
dence, Pennington found
several items used to manu-
facture meth including a
HCL gas generator, coffee
filters and two plastic bags
containing an unknown liq-
uid.

By: Doug Ponder
The federal program al-

lowing students to eat free
meals during school and the
status of all-day kindergar-
ten were the main topics of
discussion at the monthly
school board meeting Tues-
day night.

The discussions sur-
rounding the possibility of
students eating free meals at
school is a result of the
Community Eligibility Pro-
vision. The CEP is a federal
program that allows both
high poverty schools to of-
fer both breakfast and lunch
to all students regardless of
their parents’ or guardians’
income.

The CEP started as a pi-
lot project in 2010 in a se-
lect few states and has now
grown to cover schools in
more states, including Ken-
tucky. The federal program
requires that at least forty
percent of the students at a
school must already be cer-
tified to receive federal
money from a government
program for free meals.

During last month’s
school board meeting, Di-
rector of Pupil Personnel
Becky Isaacs told the board
that just because a school or
district qualifies for the CEP
program doesn’t mean that
it is financially feasible for
the school district to partici-
pate in the program as each
district has to pay the dif-
ference of those students
who don’t receive money
from a federal program for
free meals. She also told the
board that the CEP Program
requires a long term com-
mitment of four years and
that if things don’t go well
school districts cannot drop
out of the program until the
end of the term limit.

Isaacs went on to say
that the district was spear-
heading a pilot program
during the 2014-2015
school year that will not
only allow students who re-
ceive free lunch to eat free
but also allow students who
qualify for reduced lunches

By: Doug Ponder
Rockcastle County Clerk

Danetta Allen has an-
nounced the order in which
the nonpartisan candidates
will appear on the ballot for
the fall general election in
November.

The nonpartisan candi-
dates recently participated
in a drawing to determine
where their name would ap-
pear.

For the Mt. Vernon
Mayor ballot, the names
will appear as follows:
Michael Bryant Sr., Harry
Potter and Clarice R. Kirby.

The Mt. Vernon Council
ballot will appear in the fol-

lowing order: Jamie
Anderkin Bryant, Sharon
Saylor, Wayne Bullock,
Clifford Mullins, Jackie
Weaver, Adam C. Bales and
Shelley Raines Lewis.

The Brodhead City
Commissioner ballot will be
in the following order: Dal-
las Todd, Ronnie Cash,
Kenneth Ray Owens, Ricky
R. Kirby and Keith D.
Graves.

The Livingston City
Commissioners will be
listed on the ballot in the
following order: Katha Car-
penter, Charlene Newcomb

Two people arrested for
manufacturing meth

Ballot positions determined
for fall general election

By: Doug Ponder
The City of Brodhead

had the first reading of a
franchise agreement ordi-
nance at their monthly
council meeting Monday
night. The ordinance allows
Kentucky Utilities to con-
tinue to supply electricity to
the city.

KU Area Retail Opera-
tions Manager Jackie
Gumm Bennett presented
the council with franchise
agreement which calls for a

At Tuesday’s regular
meeting of the Rockcastle
Fiscal Court, the court
added two roads in Rainbow
Ridge Subdvision to the
county road maintenance
system.

Added were Silver Mist
Corner and Goldenrod Av-

Brodhead Council holds
first reading of franchise
agreement with KU electric

bidding process and she said
their current agreement with
them ends in December. She
said the franchise will be let
for a twenty year period and
that the city receives 3% of
the gross sales in payment
for the franchise.

Councilman Keith
Graves also asked Bennett
if KU could organize an en-
ergy saving workshop that
Brodhead customers could

enue. The action came fol-
lowing an agreement earlier
this year between the court
and the Carter Family heirs,
owners of the property, that
if the roads were brought up
to specifications they would
be accepted in the county
road maintenance program.

Two magistrates, Lee
Earl Adams and Ralph
Allen, voted against the ac-
tion saying they were not
sure the condition of 50%
occupancy on the roads had
been met. However, Magis-
trate Bill McKinney said
that under the terms of the
agreement, the court was
required to fulfill their part
of the bargain. “If we don’t
do this, we lied to them (the
Carter family) when we
made this agreement,”
McKinney said.

Magistrates William
Denny and Gary Burdette
voted yes on the vote.

The court also voted to
donate $5,000 each to the
Little League baseball and
football programs and an
additional $1,440.50 for
one-half the cost of a new
scoreboard for the Little
League football field at
Roundstone School.

Adams questioned the
donation to the Little
League baseball program
since some of the invoices
submitted included  pay-
ment for uniforms. “Every
team there has a sponsor’s
name on the back of their
uniform and the director
told me they didn’t use the
fiscal court donation for uni-
forms. I don’t understand
why there are some invoices
in there for some uniforms.”

The court decided to
withhold payment of the in-

voices for uniforms be-
cause, County Judge/Ex-
ecutive Buzz Carloftis said,
the court is not allowed to
pay for uniforms sponsored
by others.

The court tabled a re-
quest for a donation to a 9
and under traveling baseball
team. Magistrate Bill
McKinney said that these
requests were getting out of
hand. “It doesn’t have to be
s p o r t s - c o n n e c t e d , ”
McKinney said, “It could be
for anything several people
want to gather up to do.”

Adams also pointed out
that the traveling teams
were “ruining Little League.
These (traveling) teams
don’t play Little League and
the number of teams that
participate in Little League
are dwindling,” Adams said,
“and they are not even af-
filiated with Little League.”

County Attorney Bill
Reynolds suggested the
court might want to con-
sider a Resoution requiring
that teams they donate to be
associated with Little
League.

The court also directed
Carloftis to have road de-
partment workers remove a
fence across Cass Road put
there illegally by one of the
landowners on the county
road.

The court also prioritized

(Cont. to A8)

(Cont. to A8) (Cont. to A5)

(Cont. to A5)

(Cont. to A5)

(Cont. to A5)



Pg. A2 • Mount Vernon Signal • Thursday, September 11, 2014

Discount Grocery
& More

Monday - Friday
9 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Saturday 10 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Closed Sunday

EBT Welcome
45 S. Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon

256-3106

The Way
I See it

By
Doug Ponder

Points
East

By Ike Adams

(Cont. to A4)

If Loretta is home, and
the phone rings, she will an-
swer it, almost every time,
morning, noon or dense-
dark-dead of night. Even if
the area code on caller ID
might be in Timbuktu or the
Aboriginal Outback of Aus-
tralia, my wife will respond
anytime the gossip box
beckons.

There is always an off
chance that the caller could
be a long lost fifth cousin.
And she really would like to
get to know them all and see
how they’re doing, while we
are all still living.

Not me. If you call our
home phone and I don’t rec-
ognize you or your caller ID
in that little LED box on my
handheld receiver, you are
either going to be talking to
dead air or to a machine.
And if you have sense
enough to speak the English
language and you are will-
ing to converse with an an-
swering machine, I’ll most
likely call you back if you
sound like somebody worth
knowing.

Oftentimes, I will  inter-
rupt the  conversation you
are having with my machine
and apologize, especially if
you don’t sound like some-
one running for  congress.
I almost never apologize to
politicians because I think it
should be the other way
around.

It never ceases to amaze
me that a lot of callers, who
do sometimes leave mes-
sages, are under the mis-
taken assumption that I
speak the Hindu language.
Let me simply say that my
phone rings way too much
with calls from sources that
have figured out how to
dodge the non-working, bull
-crap, telemarketing blocks
that I have signed up for
time and time again.

Our phone is not even
listed in my name but,
thanks to this column, ev-
erybody in the free world
knows that I am married to
Loretta and she is the only
person in this household
who refuses to believe that
we could do without a tele-
phone, now that the kids are
gone. One of them might
need a babysitter.   And that,
in my opinion, is even more
reason to not have a phone.

I love my grandkids, but
I’d much rather see them on
my own terms.  Loretta, on
the other hand, believes
people are doing her a favor
when they ask her to
babysit.  I’ve been told that’s
the reason she stays married
to me.

Most people, who call
here, believe me to be a
good ole friendly feller with

time on his hands who is just
dying for vocal companion-
ship and yet another chance
to shoot the bull.

Exactly the opposite is
true, because, you see,  I live
with Loretta,  and I hear  her
end of conversations and
opinions on gossip from
several, surrounding  coun-
ties before I even get out of
bed in the morning,  and,
oftentimes,  when I’m try-
ing to go to sleep at night.

We have tried to keep our
home phone number the
same, over the last 30 years
or so, because we want the
kids, our siblings, and a few
other people to be able to
reach us on speed dial if they
need to or just  memorize
our number and call  us up
the old fashioned way be-
cause they had a brain-
stored number for our name.

One of my friends was
recently bragging to me that
he had caller ID blocked on
his phone.  In other words,
when he tries to call me it
shows up, “ Unknown
Caller”. I suppose that he
and numerous telemarketing
scams, who try the same
trick, are of the opinion that
I will be unable to resist not
knowing who might be call-
ing.  However I have news
for callers who wish to be
unknown.  If they call my
home, and Loretta isn’t here,
their anonymity will remain
unscathed.

I do not talk to unknowns
nor do I wish to become ac-
quainted with any.

A couple of days last
week, I actually counted the
number of times the phone
rang while Loretta was out
tooling around the country-
side.  Twenty five calls, over
the course of fewer than a
dozen hours, from numbers
that I didn’t recognize and
not a single one of them had
anything important enough
to talk about to bother leav-
ing a message.

Half a dozen calls, that I
did take, were from numbers
where I recognized the lo-
cal office code.  925 is Paint
Lick, 256 is Mount Vernon,
625 is Richmond, 864, Lon-
don, etc.

If I suspect a call might
actually be from someone I
know, or from somebody
with an intelligent question,
I will usually take the call.
And if I miss it, the caller
will usually leave a mes-
sage.

But far more often than
not, the calls are from area
codes that I either fail to rec-

(Cont. to A4)

The K-Lair
When I was a sophomore

at Mt. Vernon High School
(MVHS), some of my close
companions were seniors
getting ready to enter the
University of Kentucky.
One was Patsy Cummins,
my first cousin.  Others were
excited about re-locating in
Lexington, and they, too,
peaked my interest in UK.

Patsy and I had a stand-
ing agreement that we
would get together when
neither of us had a previous
engagement. We usually
drove around Rockcastle
County looking for other
teenagers who also had no
plans for the evening. Most
of the time we ended up at
the Dinner Bell Restaurant
or driving to Hamm’s Drive-
In to see who else had no
specific plans.

Penny Nunnelley was
also headed to college, and
he and I double-dated on a
few occasions and became
good friends. Most of the
time, we took our dates to
the Valley Drive-In Theater.
We also attended church ser-
vices at the First Baptist
Church, where his father
was a deacon.

When I graduated from

MVHS, I immediately en
rolled at UK and moved into
Hagan Hall. Adjacent to my
dorm was one of the mos
popular grills on campus –
the K-Lair. Patsy took m
under her wings and showed
me the best places to eat on
UK’s campus. Because i
was so close and had grea
food, I began to spend an in
ordinate amount of time a
the K-Lair.

I was a freshman at UK
in 1962, and the K-Lair had
just opened the year before
I will never forget the won
derful Honey Buns that they
made. Countless times tha
was how I began my day –
Honey Bun and coffee. 
usually had my lunch ther
and often spent time in th
afternoons studying at on
of the booths. It was a grea
place to meet friends and
spend quality time with
them.

My roommate, Stev
Stacy, was also a fan of th
K-Lair, and we had a favor
ite booth that we used to
study. It was common to se
us with a stack of books
making our way to tha
booth. Steve was also a sci

A lot of Facebook users
across the country are upset
with the social media site’s
new messenger application
claiming the app invades
their privacy.

Facebook launched its
new “Facebook Messenger”
cell phone app last spring
and the social media site
also recently boasted that
over one billion people have
downloaded their messen-
ger app.

Facebook Messenger is a
free app that allows people
to make free phone calls or
send free messages to any-
one in their phone book. The
app also has several other
new features but Facebook
experts are promoting these
two as the strong points of
the app.

However, a lot of people
are upset with the “terms
and conditions” they have to
agree to before they can in-
stall Facebook Messenger.
The terms and conditions re-
quest access to the cell
phone’s location, text mes-
sages, phone call log, phone
book, photos, videos, etc.

First off, I couldn’t help
but chuckle under my breath
when I saw a promotion
from Facebook claiming
that over one billion people
have already installed
Facebook Messenger.

I believe there is a defin-
ing reason why that number
is so large and that is sim-
ply because you can no
longer send a message on
Facebook from your
Smartphone if you haven’t
installed Facebook Messen-
ger, sorta necessitating you
install the feature.

In my opinion it’s sim-
ply extortion from
Facebook against their us-
ers. It’s like Facebook is
saying “you have to install
our app and accept its con-
ditions or you will no longer
be able to send a message
with us from your phone.”
To me, that sounds like
something Al Capone
would say to one of his ri-
vals. So does this mean
Facebook is a part of the
Mafia now?

I know people can still
send Facebook messages on
their computer if they
haven’t installed the app on
their smartphones. But who
wants to deal with the in-
convenience of using a
computer when you can use
your Smartphone? There’s
the catch!

I also understand
people’s complaints about
Facebook Messenger in-
vading their privacy. I know
a lot of my Facebook
friends recently posted sta-
tuses telling their friends
that they deleted the Mes-
senger app because it in-
vades their privacy and to
leave a post on their wall if
someone wants to get hold
of them.

Facebook has retaliated
by saying they need permis-
sion to access those things
and that the same permis-
sions are required with the
majority of other
Smartphone apps. Actually,
the majority of other apps
require the same permis-
sions, if not more.

Facebook claims the per-

(Cont. to A4)
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ObituariesObituaries

Mike
Childress

Mike Childress, 61, of
Brodhead, died Wednesday,
September 3, 2014 at the
U.K. Medical Center in
Lexington after a long ill-
ness. He was born June 6,
1953 in Rockcastle County,
the son of the late Cecil
“Pete” and Tessie Hansel
Childress. He was a project
manager at Kentucky Pow-
der Company for 37 years,
and a grounds keeper at
Rockcastle County Schools.
He was an avid collector of
antiques, enjoyed reading
canning, cooking, cross-
word puzzles, the
Rockcastle Rockets, U.K.
Basketball, spending time in
his garage, and spending
time with family and friends
and grandchildren. He was
a member of the Brodhead
Baptist Church.

Survivors are: his wife of
39 years of whom he mar-
ried August 30, 1975;
Myrna Lambert Childress
of Brodhead; two sons,
Kyle (Melanie) Childress of
Brodhead, and Neil
(Ashley) Childress of
Georgetown; four brothers,
Lee (Glorie) Childress of
Louisville, Cecil “Cork”
(Teresa) Childress of
Mt.Vernon, Quentin “Pete”
(Tracey) Childress of
Renfro Valley, and Steve
Childress of Berea; two sis-
ters, Irene (John) Mabry of
Sterling Heights, MI, and
Shanda (J.C.) Barnett of
Mt.Vernon; four grandchil-
dren, Jack, Camden, Gray,
and Layla; and several
nieces and nephews.

Besides his parents he
was preceded in death by
three brothers, Bobby, Jeff
and Phil Childress.

Funeral services were
conducted Saturday, Sep-
tember 6, 2014 at the Cox
Funeral Home with Bro.
Ralph Baker and Bro.
Buford Parkerson officiat-
ing. Burial was in the Oak
Hill Cemetery.

Pallbears were: Brent,
Brian, Coty, Tanner, Adam,
Kevin, and Josh Childress,
and Jordan Barnett

Honorary pallbearers
were: Jesse, Benny, Kenny,
Jerry, Bo, Ricky, Donnie,
Danny, and David Perkins

Memorials are suggested
to: The American Cancer
Society.

Send condolences online at
www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Harrel Phillips
Harrel Lenard “Len”

Phillips, 75, the widower of
Diane Clay Phillips, died
Tuesday, August 26, 2014.
He was born in Murray, on
May 6, 1939 the son of the
late Estus and Lois Rowlett
Phillips. He was a retired
truck driver and was a mem-
ber of The Red House Bap-
tist Church. He was a U.S.
Army Veteran of the Viet-

nam War.  For his
honorable ser-
vice, he received

two medals, the Vietnam
Medal and the Joint Service
Commendation Medal.

Survivors include: two
sons, Daniel J. Phillips of
Mt. Vernon and David M.
Phillips of Marietta, GA; his
step children, Margaret
(Frank) Fitzpatrick,
Michael Flynn, Maureen
(Bill) Friend and Marrianne
(Stan) Slonina; his grand-
children, Hailey Rose
Phillips, Aubrey Danielle
Phillips and Abby Labrey
Phillips;  his step grandchil-
dren, Patrick Friend,
Amanda Friend, Matthew
Black, Hudson Flynn,
Delaney Flynn, Aaron
(Madeline) Flynn, Adison
Flynn, Abby (Branden)
Brinegar,  Alex Slonina and
Brandon Slonina; and two
great grandchildren,
Zachary Friend and Ryann
Moore.

In addition to his parents
and wife, he was also pre-
ceded in death by his broth-
ers, Wildie, Ronald, John
and James Phillips.

A Committal Service
was conducted Saturday,
September 6, 2014 at the
Madison County Memorial
Gardens Mausoleum with
Rev. Rand McPheron offi-
ciating.

The Combs, Parsons &
Collins Funeral Home is in
charge of arrangements.

www.cpcfh.com

Helen B.
Anderson
Helen B. Anderson, 86,

wife of the late Henry
Clayton Anderson, died at
Essex Nursing and Rehab
Center September 7, 2014.
She was born to the late Ri-
chard and Flora Fain Mason
in Livingston, on May 17,
1928.  She was also pre-
ceded in death by brothers,
Lloyd, Richard, Donald,
Marvin and Paul Mason and
sister Dorothy Rust.

She was a member of
Ashby Lane Baptist Church.

She is survived by: her
two sons, Clayton “Eddie”
(Candy) Anderson and Dou-
glas (Inez) Anderson;
grandchildren, John
(Heather) and Norman
(Melanie) Anderson; and
great grandchildren, Robert,
Mason, Ashton, Madalyn,
and Landon. She will also
be missed by siblings, Earl
(Freda) Mason, Fleeda
Carter and Joy (Pat) Goben.

Funeral services will be
held Friday, September 12,
2014 at 1 p.m. at Louisville
Memorial Gardens Funeral
Home, 4400 Dixie High-
way.  Visitation will be (to-
day) Thursday, September
11 from 2-7:30 p.m. at the
funeral home.

In lieu of flowers, the
family request donations to
Ashby Lane Baptist Church,
6617 Ashby Lane, Valley
Station, KY 40272.

Ricky
Woodall

Ricky Woodall, 61, of
Brodhead, died Friday, Sep-
tember 5, 2014 at Baptist
Health Lexington. He was
born in Possum Kingdom,
on March, 26 1953, a son of
the late Leonard and Martha
Elizabeth Northern
Woodall. He was a member
of the Baptist Faith and he
will be remembered for the
love of carpentry and 1955
Chevy’s.

He is survived by: his
wife of 37 years, Debbie
Benoit Woodall of
Brodhead; his mother,
Martha Elizabeth Northern
Woodall; six brothers,
Benny, Donnie and
Carolyn, Henry and Nadine,
Jerry and Verva, Teddy and
Kim, and Danny, all of
Brodhead; four sisters, Glyn
Rose Lakes of Cincinnati,
OH, Betty Lou Renner of
Mt. Vernon, Brenda
Woodall of Brodhead, and
Patsy (Wayne) Schumacher
of Fairfield, OH; and a host
of nieces/nephews, friends
and neighbors.

Besides his dad Leonard
Other Woodall, he was pre-
ceded in death by: three
brothers, Charles
“Chunky”, Leslie, and
Jimmy Woodall; one sister,
Jenny Woodall.

Funeral services were
conducted Wednesday, Sep-
tember 10, 2014 at the
Marvin E. Owens Home for
Funerals Chapel with Bro.
Ralph Baker officiating.
Burial was in the Piney
Grove Cemetery.

Expressions of sympathy
may take with form of con-
tributions to the Crohn’s
Foundation

Casketbearers were:
Kelly Cauldwell, Adam
Woodall, Ryan Bradley,
Shane Adams, Josh Hayes
and Jeff.

Condolences may be made at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Jim Bussell
Jim Bussell, 63, husband

of Nancy, of Brodhead, died
Tuesday, September 9,
2014.

Visitation will be (today)
Thursday, September 11th,
at Brodhead Baptist Church
from 6-9 p.m.

Funeral will be con-
ducted Friday, September
12, 2014 at 1 p.m. at
Brodhead Baptist Church
with burial at Piney Grove
Cemetery.

Condolences may be made at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Earnest
Sturgill

Earnest Sturgill, 84, of
Louisville, and formerly of
Rockcastle County, died Sep-
tember 8, 2014.

Visitation will be Satur-
day, September 13th, from 12
-2 p.m. at the Marvin E.
Owens Home for Funerals.

Funeral services will be
conducted Saturday, Septem-
ber 13, 2014 at 2 p.m. at the
Marvin E. Owens Home for
Funerals with Bro. Allen
Hensley officiating. Burial
will follow in the Mahaffey
Cemetery at Livingston.

Condolences may be made at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Megan Gray
Megan Gray, 22, of

Mt.Vernon, died Tuesday,
September 9, 2014 at the
Baptist Health Hospital in
Corbin. She was born Au-
gust 19, 1992 in London, the
daughter of Jessie R. Gray
of Annville, and Mrs. An-
gela Hayes Sowder of
Mt.Vernon. She was a stu-
dent who enjoyed music,
band, spending time with
family and friends, and was
a member of the Calvary
Apostolic Church in Berea.

Survivors besides her
parents are: one sister,
Allison Gray of Annville;
her grandparents, Ralph and
Mary Lou Gray of
Boonville; boyfriend,
Marion Barnett; and many
aunts, uncles, cousins, and
other family members. She
was preceded in death by
her step-father, James
“Duke” Sowder.

Funeral services will be
conducted at 2 p.m. Satur-
day, September 13,  2014 at
the Cox Funeral Home with
Bro. Josh Hampton officiat-
ing. Burial will follow in the
Gray Family Cemetery in
Jackson County.

Arrangements are by the
Cox Funeral Home where
friends may visit from 6 to
9 p.m. Friday.

Send condolences online at
www.coxfuneralhomeky.com.

Card of
Thanks

Sherman Denny
The family of Sherman

Denny would like to express
their sincere appreciation
that was shown us during
the passing of our loved
one.

Thank you all for your
prayers and kind words and
the many phone calls and
gifts received. A special
thank you to Rockcastle
Health and Rehab for the
special care they gave to
him, Rockcastle Hospital
staff, Bro. John Gross, Cox
Funeral Home, James Dean
Carpenter for a wonderful
service, Herchel Williams
for the special and uplifting
songs and to Citizens Bank
and all others.

We will ever be grateful
for your goodness.

Thank you and may God
bless you all.

The Denny Family

In Memory of
Christine and

Sherman Allen
You never said “I’m leav-

ing”
You never said goodbye,
You were gone before I

knew it
and only God knows why
A million times I needed

you
A million tears I’ve had to

cry
If love alone could have

saved you
You never would have died.
In life I loved you dearly,
In death I love you still,
In my heart you hold a place
That no one could ever fill.
It broke my heart to lose

you,
but you din’t go alone,
For a part of me went with

you,
The day God took you

home.
Love You,

Lorna Durham (Sissy)

An encouraging word:

A Time To Remember
By Howard Coop

It was an unforgettable Tuesday morning. Early that morn-
ing, I casually walked up the drive and across the front lawn.
My neighbor, who lived across the street, motioned to me,
and I met him in the street. With a disturbed look on his face,
he said, “Have you heard what just happened in New York?”

I had not heard.  So, I went into the house, turned on the
television, and for the next few hours, listened intently as the
horrible event of September 11, 2001 unfolded.

An Islamic terror group had hijacked four planes. At 8:46
AM EDT, one of those planes was flown into the World Trade
Center, and at 10:28 AM, a second plane was flown into that
building. Within two hours both towers of the World Trade
Center collapsed. A third plane was flown into the Pentagon
in Washington, and the fourth plane crashed near Shanksville,
Pennsylvania when passengers tried to overcome the hijack-
ers.

The damage of that terrorist attack was extensive. It is
recorded that 2,977 persons were killed, and over 6,000 had
non-fatal injuries. Property damage has been estimated at
about $10 billion.

Immediately, action was taken to remember that fateful
day. On October 25, 2001, Rep. Vito Fossella, with 22 co-
sponsors, introduced a Resolution to designate September
11 as Patriot Day. With 25 members of Congress not voting,
the Resolution passed by a vote 407-0, and the Senate unani-
mously passed it on November 30, 2001. President George
W. Bush signed it on December 18, 2001, and it became Pub-
lic Law No. 107-89.

Patriot Day, also known as a National Day of Service and
Remembrance, is not a legal holiday. Businesses and schools
do not close, but flags are to be flown at half-staff.  At 8:46
A.M. EDT, the time the first plane struck the North Tower of
the World Trade Center, a moment of silence is to be ob-
served. It is a time for every American citizen to pause and
remember that tragic event and all of those who were hurt or
lost their lives as a result of it.
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Bookmobile Schedule
Mon.,Sept. 15th: Spiro, Level Green, Willailla. Tues.,
Sept. 16th: Ottawa and Bee Lick.

Mt. Vernon Council Meeting
The regular meeting of the Mt. Vernon City Council will
be held Monday, Sept. 15th at 7 p.m.

CCFFG Meeting
Concerned Citizens for Fair Government will hold their
regular monthly meeting on Thursday, September 18th
at 6 p.m. on the third floor of the courthouse. Please use
back door.

No Permit/Driver Testing
There will be be permit testing on Friday, October 3rd.
There will not be driver testing or permit testing on Fri-
day, October 31st.

Bittersweet Festival
The Bittersweet Festival has been scheduled for Friday,
Oct. 3rd from 4 to 11 p.m. and Saturday, Oct. 9th from 9
a.m. to 11 p.m. Applications for vendor sites can be picked
up at city Hall or call 606-256-3437 for more informa-
tion.

Climax Fire Dept. Fish Fry
Climax Volunteer Fire Dept. will hold a fish fry on Fri-
day, Sept. 12th, beginning at 6 p.m. For more info, call
256-4475 or 256-3257.

Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
The Rockcastle County Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
will be held September 19, 2014 at Roundstone Elemen-
tary School with dinner and entertainment provided. The
dinner will be at 6 p.m. and the meeting will follow at 7
p.m. All members are encouraged to join us. Call 606-
256-2050 for more info.

Applications for Grandparent Program
The Cumberland Valley Area Agency on Aging will be
taking applications for the Kentucky Grandparent Pro-
gram on September l7th from 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. at the
Rockcastle Senior Center. Interested grandparents must
bring the following: proof of all household income, so-
cial security cards for all persons living in the home,
birthdates, picture ID and custody papers. For more info,
contact Kyle Swafford at 1-800-795-7654.

MVFD Portrait Fundraiser
Members of the Mt. Vernon Volunteer Fire Dept. will be
going door-to-door in Mt. Vernon conducting a portrait
fundraiser. For a $20 or more contribution, you will re-
ceive  free 8x10 family portrait which will be taken at
the fire department at a later date. Authorized represen-
tatives will be: Michael Watkins, Woody Watkins, Lesley
Forster, Darrell Morgan, Doris Lamb and Lonnie. For
any questions, call city hall 256-3437 days or Chief David
Bales at night at 308-6623.

Tools for Growing Your Business
Are you making the best use of Social Media? Should
you update your marketing plan? EKU and the World
Trade Center of KY are bringing you FREE training op-
portunities! There will be a presentation at 9 a.m., one-
on-one consultations to address your needs begin at 10
a.m. every Monday in September at the Rockcastle Adult
Education Center. For more information, call 859-622-
7996 or email Yvonne.harrison@eku.edu.

Class of 1984 Reunion
RCHS Class of 1984 will hold a Reunion Saturday, Sep-
tember 13th, from 7 to 11 p.m. at Rockcastle Middle
School. Cost is $20 per person/$30 couple. Send check
to RCHS Class of 1984 Reunion, P.O. Box 1410, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456. All teachers are invited.

Livingston School Reunion
The annual Livingston School Reunion will be held Oc-
tober 4th at Livingston. All former students, teachers,
family and friends are invited to attend. This year we
will be recognizing graduates of the classes of 1954 and
1964. Registration information will be mailed to previ-
ous attendees. For info, call Barbara M. Castleberry, 256-
9188 or Doris Thompson, 256-1843.

DAR Meetings
The Rockcastle Chapter of the Daughters of the Ameri-
can Revolution meet the first Monday of each month,
September-May at 6 p.m. at the First Christian Church
in Mt. Vernon. All prospective members are welcome to
attend.

Brodhead Lodge Meeting
The Brodhead Masonic Lodge #566 meets every third
Saturday at 7 p.m. on Main Street in Brodhead above
Brodhead Pharmacy.

Alcoholics Anonymous
Alcoholics Anonymous meets Tuesday nights at 8 p.m.
behind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St.
in Mt. Vernon.

Kiwanis Club Meetings
The Rockcastle Kiwanis Club meets every Thursday at
noon at the Limestone Grill. Everyone is invited.

Historical Society Hours
The Rockcastle Historical Society is open on Mondays
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the RTEC garage building.

American Legion Post 71
American Legion Post 71 meets the second Thursday at
6 p.m. of each month at the Limestone Grill. Commander
Tommy Hodges invites all Rockcastle veterans to join
this organization that honors American soldiers, sailors
and airmen.

ence major, and he helped
me to form good study hab-
its. We spent countless
hours working Chemistry
problems while sampling
the K-Lair snacks.

I was sad to learn that the
K-Lair closed its doors in
May of 2013. Because of its
popularity, UK decided to
open a new K-Lair as part
of the construction of the
new Haggin Hall dormitory.
The grill opened on Septem-
ber 2 with 230 seats. The
original sign was re-condi-
tioned, and the new facility
will boast a nine-TV media
wall that can display nine
different channels.

President Capilouto ex-
plained, “…We are reopen-
ing an icon that served the
UK campus for more than

50 years.”
    Inside the new grill,

modern accommodations
will include 14-foot ceil-
ings, a more robust kitchen,
and a new menu – featuring
Kentucky Proud products.
For sentimental reasons, I
was glad that the University
was able to bring back a
popular icon for the next
generation of students. I
hope that many of them will
develop a sense of owner-
ship of the new facility. It
certainly holds a warm spot

in my heart because of the
memories that I have from
my early years at UK. They
are even going to offer their
special honey buns from the
1961 days. I just might have
to go there soon in order to
see if they are as good as
they were in 1962.

    Anyone want to meet
me there?

(You can reach me at
themtnman@att.net or you can
drop me a line at 2167 Furnace

Road – Stanton, KY 40380. I
appreciate your suggestions and

comments.)

“Memories”
(Cont. from A2)

ognize or from big cities
where I no longer know a
living soul.

 If I’m watching an old
episode of Gunsmoke or
Bonanza on TVLand, I sim-
ply hit the off button on the
receiver to shut the racket up
because I don’t want to miss
a single word of whatever
wisdom  Miss Kitty or Hoss
Cartwright might be ready
to impart.

“Points East”
(Cont. from A2)

missions are needed for the
app to function properly.
For example, access to your
photos is required so you
can send a photo message
with the app.

This is true, a lot of
Smartphone apps actually
require certain permissions
from the user in order for
them to function properly.
But I agree it is important
to always be cautious of
what the permissions are for
the app. For example, the
Candy Crush game app
shouldn’t require permis-
sion to access your photos
or text messages.

I’m ashamed to admit
that Facebook’s extortion
attempt to force the use of
their messenger app was
successful on me. I use the

ment charged him with  vio-
lating the espionage act and
theft of government prop-
erty. Snowden’s alleged
crimes include prison terms
of up to 30 years.

The issue of whether
Snowden should be consid-
ered a hero or traitor is a
topic for another editorial.
My point is that Snowden’s
revelations bluntly revealed
that the NSA has been ac-
cessing ordinary Ameri-
cans’ phones, social media
accounts and other personal
information.

According to a recent re-
port by the Washington
Post,  Snowden’s leaks re-
vealed that around ninety
percent of Americans,
placed under surveillance
by the NSA, are ordinary
people. Not only people
with terroristic backgrounds
or people who are members
of terrorist groups, but also
normal people like you and
me!

Snowden’s revelations
determined that these things
can happen and are actually
happening. Also, I believe if
the NSA can access such
things then hackers or con
artists can also find ways to
access them.

What I am saying is a
Smartphone user’s photos,
text messages and call logs
can already be accessed in
a variety of ways even if you
don’t have Facebook Mes-
senger installed on your
Smartphone. It’s scary but
true, just look at the recent
Hollywood stars’ explicit
photos scandal!

I believe we live in a
crazy world where more
things go on and more per-
sonal information is avail-
able than we realize. I will
even go as far as claiming
that the NSA actually has
access to continuous satel-
lite video footage that cov-
ers the entire world. I also
believe they previously had
access to zoomed in satel-
lite pictures that covered the
world with what eventually
became available to the
public with Google Earth.

In my opinion, if Google
Earth exists than the likeli-
hood of continuous zoomed
in satellite video footage can
also exist and the NSA

“I See It”
(Cont. from A2)

message feature a lot on
Facebook, especially for
work. But I am still ex-
tremely cautious when it
comes to the permissions
required to install an app.

Anyone close to me
knows that I am a con-
spiracy theorist. Actually, in
today’s world I believe we
all need to be conspiracy
theorists because a lot of
conspiracies are being ex-
posed as realities!

In June 2013, former
U.S. National Security
Agency contractor Edward
Snowden released thou-
sands of classified docu-
ments to the media that re-
vealed several of NSA’s glo-
bal surveillance programs.
Some of the programs re-
portedly accessed “ordi-
nary” Americans’ Google
accounts, Yahoo accounts,
Facebook accounts, etc.

Snowden has since been
on the run after our govern-

would no doubt have access
to it.

As far as the identity
theft issue goes, I never pay
for anything using my
Smartphone. I have one per-
sonal computer I use for
work, internet surfing,
games, etc. Then I have an-
other personal computer
with up to date antivirus that
I only use for online shop-
ping, paying bills online,
etc.

The computer I use for
online shopping or paying
bills online is the only com-
puter I use to enter any of
my account or personal in-
formation whenever it is re-
quired. I admit it probably
still could be hacked some-
how, but I feel safer know-
ing I have the most recent
antivirus installed and the
only websites I have visited
are for online shopping or
paying online bills which
decreases the chances of
catching viruses or
malware.

In a nutshell, I think be-
ing cyber or privacy  safe
goes a lot farther than a
measly Facebook app that is
only requiring access to
things that can already be
accessed in a variety of dif-
ferent ways. So go ahead
and install it because you
actually have nothing to
lose and a lot to gain as it’s
actually a neat app.

Oh and P.S. Don’t forget
to wave, wink or make
funny faces while looking
up toward the sky whenever
you are outside. That way it
gives the NSA employees
something to laugh at when-
ever they review the video
footage on their computer
screen. Their job has to be
boring so they need some-
thing to entertain them.
Those poor entertainment
deprived folks, bless their
hearts.

Climax Fire Dept.

Fish Fry
Friday, Sept. 12th,

6 p.m.
For more information, call

256-4475 or 256-3257.

Join the Rockcastle Republican
Party to celebrate

The U.S. Constitution
for Constitution Day 2014

Limestone Grille
September 17th

12 Noon
A Conversation About the Constitution
Special Guest Speaker Jeffrey T. Burdette

Chief Regional Circuit Judge
Cumberland Region

Chief Judge 28th Judicial Court
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Pennington also found a
small door on the outside of
the residence that led to a
crawl space under the home.
Upon further investigation,
Pennington found Kirby
hiding in the crawl space
and ordered him to come
out. When Kirby refused to
come out he was subdued
with a Tazer gun.

Kirby told Pennington
that the items used to manu-
facture meth belonged to
him and not Falin. Falin was
not arrested at the same time

said that an employee of
ERWA, who had several
customers affected by the
break, was present and fur-
nished a pump, some tools
and a phone call for a
needed part but that the help
was not solicited by either
he or Blackburn and was
furnished with the em-
ployee saying “we’re all in
this together.”

The mayor said that ev-
erything the employee fur-
nished was available for the
job through the city but that
having the items in the
ERWA employee’s truck did
save time. He also said that
while the help was appreci-
ated he did not feel it would
be right for the city to pay
for unsolicited help that he
thought when it was offered
was being freely given. “I’m
not bitter” about this inci-
dent, Medley told the com-
missioners and reiterated
that the city’s backhoe was
available to ERWA anytime
they needed it which would
save them the cost of rent-
ing the equipment.

Connie Hunt from Corbin Arena was the guest speaker at the September 4th
Rockcastle Kiwanis meeting. Connie shared upcoming show information, includ-
ing the October 3rd “We Believe Tour” with NewsBoys, Family Force 5 and our
very own 7eventh Time Down.

attend to help them save
money on their monthly
electric bills.

Bennett said that they re-
cently had a KU represen-
tative make an energy sav-
ing presentation at the
Rockcastle County Cham-
ber of Commerce meeting
in Mt. Vernon and that she
would be glad to schedule
a similar presentation in
Brodhead.

The council unani-
mously approved the first
reading of the KU franchise
agreement and they all
agreed to allow Bennett to
research the possibility of
KU holding an energy sav-
ing workshop for their
Brodhead customers.

Mayor Walter Cash also
told the council that con-
tractors had completed the
city’s blacktopping project.
The $20,800 project in-
cluded repaving areas of:
West Street, Albright Street,
Sycamore Street, Smith
Street, Cass Street and
Castle Village Drive.

Now Available
Tales of the Thunderbolt People
Traditiional Cherokee Appalachian Folktales

This is a softbound 22 page children’s book.
To order your copy, send check for $20, payable to:

David Owens
85 Chestnut Ridge Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

or call
606-386-0187

$10 of each purchase will go toward the cost of the field
study to inventory and document fish weirs in the
Rockcastle River.

as Kirby.
Kirby was charged with

manufacturing metham-
phetamine, drug parapher-
nalia, resisting arrest, theft
by unlawful taking and theft
by extortion. He remains
lodged in the Rockcastle
County Detention Center on
a $20,000 cash/property
bond.

Last Wednesday, Falin
went to the Rockcastle
County Detention Center to
ask about an inmate.
Pennington was at the de-
tention center working an-
other case when Falin ar-
rived at the facility.

Pennington noticed that
Falin’s pupils were dilated

and that she was unsteady
on her feet. He also ob-
served that Falin’s speech
was rapid and slurred.

Upon further investiga-
tion, Pennington noticed
that Falin appeared intoxi-
cated while performing
field sobriety tests.

After receiving consent
to search Falin’s purse,
Pennington found 9
Suboxone pills and one
Hydrocodone pill.

Pennington also found
evidence that connected
Falin to the manufacturing
meth items that was discov-
ered when Kirby was ar-
rested including Falin’s re-
cent purchase of pseu-
doephedrine tablets.

Falin was charged with
manufacturing meth, pos-
session of a controlled sub-
stance, prescription con-
trolled substance not in a
proper container, drug para-
phernalia and public intoxi-
cation. She was lodged in
the Rockcastle County De-
tention Center where she
was later released on a
$1,500 cash/property bond.

“Brodhead”
(Cont. from front)

“Meth”
(Cont. from front)

“Livingston”
(Cont. from front)

Birth announced
Tubby and Lorna

Durham announce the birth
of their grandchild, Eliza-
beth Jean, born August 16,
2014 and weighed in at 5
lbs.

She was welcomed
home by half brother and
sister, Jacob Edward and
Trinity Durham and another
half sister, Haley Bullock.

and Leroy Lamb.
Incumbent Brodhead

Mayor Walter Lee Cash
and incumbent
Livingston Mayor Jason
Medley are both unop-
posed in their respective
races.

Allen said the remain-
ing races in November’s
general election have
candidates who are either
unopposed or have one
republican candidate and
one democrat candidate
running for the position.

Those who missed the
filing deadline in August
but still want to run for
local office have until
October 24th to file as a
write-in candidate in the
County Clerk’s Office.

Allen went on to say
that the same require-
ments and fees still apply
for write-in candidates
and that their names will
not appear on the ballot.
She also said that any
misspelled names of
write-in candidates or
any names of write-in
candidates who have not
filed will not be counted.

For voters, the last day
to register to vote in
November’s general
election is Monday, Oc-
tober 6th.

The federal government
may forgive all or part of
your student loans if you
meet certain requirements.
The forgiveness options for
federal student loans, ac-
cording to the Kentucky
Higher Education Assis-
tance Authority (KHEAA),
include:

•Teacher loan forgive-
ness. To qualify, you must
teach at least five full years
in a low-income school in an
eligible district. Depending
on your field, you may have
up to $17,500  in student
loans forgiven.

•Public service loan for-
giveness. You must work
full time in a public service
job and make 120 monthly
payments to qualify. You
also have to be working in
public service when  you
make the 120 payments and
when you apply for loan for-
giveness. All of your re-
maining loan balance may
be forgiven.

•Nursing loan forgive-
ness. You must be at least a
registered nurse and agree to
work two years in a critical
shortage facility at least 32
hours per week. If you ful-
fill your  agreement, 60 per-
cent of your loan balance
will be forgiven. Another 25
percent will be forgiven if
you work a third year.

For complete details on
these and other programs,
visit www.ed.gov.

One thing to remember is
that the Internal Revenue
Service counts the amount
forgiven as income. You
should talk with a tax pro-
fessional to understand the
impact that may have on
your taxes.

KHEAA is the state
agency that administers
Kentucky’s grant and schol-
arship programs, including
the Kentucky Educational
Excellence Scholarship
(KEES). It provides finan-
cial literacy videos at http://
i t s m o n e y. k h e a a . c o m .
KHEAA  also provides free

copies of “It’s Money,
Baby,” a guide to financial
literacy, to Kentucky
schools and residents upon
request at
publications@kheaa.com.

To learn how to plan and
prepare for higher educa-
tion, go to
www.gotocollege.ky.gov.
For more information about
Kentucky scholarships and
grants, visit
www.kheaa.com; write
KHEAA, P.O.  Box 798,
Frankfort, KY 40602; or
call 800-928-8926, ext. 6-
7372.

Money Tips for Students
Federal government offers
student loan forgiveness

“Election”
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By: Doug Ponder
The Rockcastle County

Rockets football team beat
South Laurel Cardinals last
Friday night 35-14 in the
annual Jamboree Bowl.

Last Friday night’s win
broke a two year losing
streak for the Rockets in the
Jamboree Bowl and are now
21-3 in the Jamboree Bowl’s
24 year history.

The Rockets scored first
on a 5 yard touchdown run
by sophomore tailback

Dalton Rowe. The extra
point attempt by Rowe was
no good giving the Rockets
the early 6-0 lead.

South Laurel answered
on their next drive with a 5
yard touchdown run by their
senior quarterback Jonathan
Jenkins. The extra point was
good giving the Cardinals
the 7-6 lead.

In the second quarter,
freshman tailback Brent
Lovell broke free for a 72
yard touchdown run. The

extra point attempt by Rowe
was again no good making
the score 12-7.

However, the Cardinals
answered once again with a
37 yard touchdown pass
from Jenkins to senior wide
receiver Taylor Morris. The
extra point attempt was
good putting the Cardinals
back on top 14-12.

Rowe went on to answer
South Laurel’s touchdown
with an 89 yard kickoff re-
turn for a touchdown. Lovell
ran the ball into the end zone
for the two-point conversion
making the score 20-14.

The Rockets managed to
score again before halftime
on an 8 yard touchdown
strike from sophomore quar-
terback Dakota Bishop to
sophomore wide receiver
Tommy Benge. Senior full-
back Chance Ansardi
punched the ball into the end
zone to complete the two-
point conversion making the
halftime score 28-14.

The third quarter proved
to be a defensive battle with
neither team putting any
points on the scoreboard.

The Rockets put the
game away in the fourth
quarter when Rowe scored
on a 7 yard touchdown run.
The extra point by Rowe
was good making the final
score 35-14.

The Rockets were led on
offense by Lovell who had
14 carries for 121 yards and
one touchdown. Lovell was
also the Jamboree Bowl Of-
fensive MVP of the game.

Other Rockets picking up
rushing yards were Rowe
with 16 carries for 81 yards
and two touchdowns,
sophomore running back
Devon Robinson had 45
yards on 8 carries and senior
fullback Isaiah Adams had
one carry for 16 yards.

Bishop was 7 out of 11
in passing for 79 yards and
one touchdown. Bishop also
had two carries for 10 yards.

Adams led the receiving
corps with two catches for
30 yards. Other Rockets
catching passes were senior
wide receiver Kyle Denny
with two catches for 26
yards, senior wide receiver
Tyler Langford one for 10
yards, Benge one for 8 yards
with one touchdown and
sophomore wide receiver
Michael Tomlinson had one
catch for 5 yards.

The Rocket defense was
led by Robinson with 11
tackles and four sacks.
Robinson was also the Jam-
boree Bowl Defensive MVP
of the game.

Other Rockets with tack-
les and assists were sopho-
more linebacker Austin
Mills with 10 and one sack,
Ansardi with six and one
sack, sophomore defensive
lineman Logan Coffey with
4, Rowe had 4, sophomore
defensive end Lucas Jones
got 3 including one and a
half sacks, Lovell with 3,
Adams with two and a half
sack and senior defensive
lineman Justin Hughes and
Denny both had two sacks.
Benge, Langford, sopho-
more defensive back Isaac

Rockets beat South Laurel, 35-14, in Jamboree Bowl

Sophomore tailback Dalton Rowe stiff arms a Cardinal defender during the Rock-
ets 35-14 win over South Laurel last Friday night in the annual Jamboree Bowl.
Rowe had 16 carries for 81 yards and two touchdowns. Rowe also returned an 89
yard kickoff for a touchdown.

The Rockcastle County Rockets beat the South Laurel Cardinals 35-14 last Fri-
day night in the annual Jamboree Bowl. Shown above is senior defensive end
Chance Ansardi sacking South Laurel’s quarterback.

Sophomore linebacker Devon Robinson makes a shoe-string tackle during the
35-14 Jamboree Bowl win against South Laurel last Friday night. Robinson was
the Jamboree Bowl Defensive MVP of the game with 11 tackles and 4 sacks.

Junior Rachael Davis gets a hit during the 3-1 win
against Casey County Tuesday night. The Lady
Rockets are now 6-6 on the season.

Sara Clark hits the ball during the Lady Rockeys 3-
1 win over Casey County Tuesday night. The Lady
Rockets next match is this Thursday when they
travel to Corbin to take on the Corbin Lady
Redhounds at 5:30 p.m.

Sophomore Abby Bray serves the ball during the
varsity game against Casey County. The Lady Rock-
ets won the match 3-1.

Sophomore Arie-Anna Lawson serves during the win
against Casey County Tuesday night. The Lady
Rockets won 3-1.

McClure and sophomore
defensive lineman Austin
Saylor were all credited
with one tackle each.

Head Coach Scott
Parkey said he thought  of-
fense did a good job adjust-
ing to the Cardinals’ defense
during the game.

“Our young players
learned a lot about picking
up the blitz and our offen-
sive line did well against a
much larger defensive line,”
Parkey said. “I also thought
Bishop did great with our
play action passing. That

will be a bigger part of our
offense in future games as
more teams begin to scheme
against our running game.”

Parkey said he was ex-
tremely pleased with the
level of play from the
Rocket defense and how
they constantly disrupted
the Cardinals offense
throughout the game.

“Our defense kept con-
stant pressure on their quar-
terback. They had several
sacks and tackles for a loss,”
Parkey said. “Our defensive
guys played hard all night

and did a great job tackling.
Robinson and Mills were
always in the backfield.”

Parkey went on to say
that the special teams
played their best game of
the year and scored on a
kickoff return.

“Rowe’s kickoff return
for a touchdown was the
first one we’ve had in
around eight or nine years,”
Parkey said. “Rowe is one
of those rare players who
has quickness to make play-
ers miss, power to break

(Cont. to A7)
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John Cornelius played very well over the weekend
at the Montgomery County Invitational. Cornelius
fired a 76 leading the way for the Rockets. Cornelius,
Sam Pensol, and Cade Burdette are considered to
be three of the top golfers in the conference.  Scores
from the tournament were: Cornelius 76, Pensol 77,
Burdette 79, Carson Noble 92, and Thomas Burdette
92. The boy’s golf team wrapped up conference play
Monday night with a win v.s. Casey County. With
the win the team officially won the CKBC South
Division for the regular Season. This is the second
year in a row the team has won the conference. Scores
from the match were: Cornelius 36, Burdette 38,
Pensol 40, Noble 43, Baker 44, Gentry 46, Burdette
49, and Isaacs 51.

The Rockets played over the weekend at Mt. Sterling Country Club. The team
placed 12th out of 24 teams at the tournament. This was considered one of the
strongest tournaments the Rockets have participated in this year. Scores from the
tournament  were: John Cornelius 76, Sam Pensol 77, Cade Burdette 79, Carson
Noble 92, and Thomas Burdette 92.

T.J.’s
Journal
by: Tonya J. Cook

The Mystery of Uncle
Earl's White Shirts

It seems that some large
group of people are getting
into our house, dirtying
most of our clothes, towels,
and bed linens. This is the
only explanation I have for
having to do at least two or
three loads of laundry about
every other day. I never see

them about, but the laundry
hamper magically fills to
capacity by invisible hands.
Actually, the truth be
known, I guess Stanley and
I must be just too messy, and
use too many clothes and
linens.

When you get to think-
ing about it, the jobs of a
housewife are usually mun-

dane and quite repetitive,
never really "finishing" any-
thing. There is never a sense
of completion, as when, for
instance, a man builds a
house or repairs a car.

Just think about how
many times in a week the
same old dishes are washed,
the same old clothes are
washed, the same old furni-
ture is dusted, the same old
floors are swept and/or
mopped. The list goes on
and on. However, we house-
wives should be thankful. In
years past, the same chores
had to be done without any
modern conveniences or air
conditioning to keep us
comfortable.

This takes us to my Aunt
Lucille Price. She married
Earl Broughton and lived in
a little white frame house
just out of Middlesboro in a
coal-mining community
called "Big Nickel" in Ten-
nessee. There were other
little coal-mining towns
along the L&N route:
Clearfield, Eagan, Black
Diamond, Valley Creek, and
a few others along a twenty-
to thirty-mile route. Each
had a mine and loaded their
coal on the L&N every day.
My Uncle Earl was a book-
keeper for the L&N, a very
good job for the day, and
was said to be a whiz with
numbers and had such
beautiful penmanship it
would put any lady's to
shame. He wore a suit and
tie to work every day, and
insisted on white, white
shirts.

Here is where the mys-
tery begins. The era was the
1930s. Life was hard for
most, and most had few
luxuries. My Aunt Lucille
was a typical housewife
staying at  home, raising
their three children, and do-
ing the mundane daily
chores, except she didn't
have automatic dishwash-
ers, vacuum cleaners,
washer-and-dryers, and all
we take for granted now. If
she wanted to wash clothes,
she had to heat a huge
amount of water, which
meant chopping wood for
the fire.

Uncle Earl would come

home each evening and it
wouldn't be long before his
big bass voice would echo
off the walls, "Lucille, do I
have any clean white
shirts?", knowing or at least
assuming he did, as he had
never run out. It was his
habit to change out of his
white, white office shirts to
another older shirt that was
just plain white when he got
home. He believed in being
well-attired at all times.

One of poor old Aunt
Lucille's missions in life
was to have plenty of the
whitest shirts she could pro-
duce on standby at all times,
folded in drawers. In order
to have these shirts, she
chopped wood, washed on
washboards, used bleach or
"bluing", something
younger generations
wouldn't know about, and
then there was the starching
and ironing to do.

One hot summer
evening, Uncle Earl came
home, inquiring of his white
shirts. Evidently, Aunt
Lucille had a particularly
trying day and his inquiry
didn't meet with her  ap-
proval. She bided her time
and formulated a plan, say-
ing nothing as a good wife
of that era wouldn't.

The next day as she hoed
the garden, opportunity
presenteed itself. She de-
cided the fate of Earl's white
shirts and even some of the
white, white shirts. She be-
gan to dig a hole about the
size of a basket full of dirty
shirts and somehow those
shirts and basket found their
way into that hole and got
covered by dirt. Imagine!
However, Earl had to do
some shirt shopping later.

Poor Earl went to his
grave many years later,
wearing a white, white shirt,
I'm sure, never knowing the
cruel fate of his dear shirts.
It's a mystery he never
solved. As for Aunt Lucille,
well, I guess she had a story
and stuck with it. We don't
have a garden. Pity.

through arm tackles and
speed to outrun defenders.
Without that combination
it’s hard to get those big
plays.”

The Rockets next game
is at home this Friday night
when they take on the Whit-
ley County Colonels. Kick-
off is at 7:30 p.m.

“Rockets”
(Cont. from A6)

Yards to Paradise
By Max Phelps
White Spaces

Have you ever seen a
billboard or a full-page ad
with just one, or perhaps just
a few words? You read it.
You probably wondered
why they paid for such a big
ad and used so little of the
available space. But you did
read it. The same thing can
be done successfully in
landscaping (as well as in
our lives in general)--putting
in some white space, some
blank space, helps hi-lite the
main point. Putting too
many words into an ad, put-
ting too many things into our
minds at once, and putting
too many things into the
landscape so that all our fa-
vorite plants become a
jumbled jungle--some un-
cluttered areas which accen-
tuate or frame the main
event are more productive or
effective. A lovely land-
scape design includes 'white
space' that helps the eye fo-
cus on the good, the pretty,
the exceptional, with so
much more clarity.

Inspiration for this topic
came partly from a yard
landscaped by a garden cen-
ter slightly south of Lexing-
ton, Kentucky where about
8 to 10 one-of-a-kind 'speci-
men quality' plants had been
planted at the end of a home.
The resultant expensive
jumble looked like a jungle.
Just one of those quality
plants, flanked by a dozen
cheap and non-attention-
stealing plants would have
framed the end of this home
so much better. (And for far
less money!) And the other
part of what inspired me was
a sermon I heard on how we
need some 'down time' so
that we can reflect on the
important things in life, and
not let the TV, social media
or the telephone keep us
from the blank time we need
to relax and refresh from the
busy lives most of us lead.
The two are actually con-
nected as we shall see.

Like the ad with 40
words you're supposed to
read while doing 70, the
landscape with lots of high
value plants is a waste.
Three words on a sign will

probably be read. One very
special tree in the yard will
get the attention of everyone
that passes. We need some
white space to be the frame
that showcases the main
thing. For our yards, the
main thing is to catch the eye
of the beholder, and then
have the impression be a
good one.

Part of my focus over the
years has been to help the
homeowner create that va-
cation spot in the backyard,
that sanctuary where they
can safely and peacefully
escape the hustle for a little
bit and enjoy the beauty of
their little paradise. You
know, the paradise with the
cozy seating and the birds
chirping and the butterflies
fluttering and the waterfall
splashing.

There needs to be a little
occasional separation be-
tween plants in the land-
scape, just like there needs
to be a little downtime in
one's life. (But don't let the
blank spaces monopolize
things, or you'll have a land-
scape with one tree, or on
the personal level you'll be-
come a couch potato.)

A lovely landscape de-
sign will be simple, yet still
contain the elements that
will make it succeed. A few
plants, a special plant, a few
plants repeated--that's how
to improve your landscape's
look. And if you like flow-
ers, go ahead and create a
sweep or a  splotch of them
instead of just one. The ef-
fect will be more relaxing
while at the same time more
noticeable and nice.

If your life consists of
multi-tasking all the time,
and always on the go or late
for everything, may I sug-
gest you leave part of it out,
put in some clean white
space, and make the main
things count for more in life,
and in the landscape make
the investment impress one
and all without overkill?
The author, Max Phelps, is

a landscaper. Feedback
welcome. Email:

pondbuilder@hushmail.com
Visit website:

www.rockcastles.net

Email the Signal office at
mvsignal@windstream.net
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Mount Vernon Fire Department held a traffic inci-
dent management class at their firehouse Monday
night. The class was taught by state fire instructor
Greg Reams.

to eat free as well. She said
they will not participate in
the CEP program for the
2014-2015 school year and
that they will use this school
year to determine the finan-
cial commitment that is
needed for the district to
participate in the program.

However, Board Mem-
ber Angela Stallsworth
Mink said people are still
coming up to her asking
why their children aren’t
eating free meals at school.

Superintendent David
Pensol once again ad-
dressed the reasons why the
district wasn’t participating
in the CEP program this
school year.

Pensol gave four reasons
for the non-participation.
The first reason he said just
because the district or a
school qualifies for the pro-
gram doesn’t mean it is fi-
nancially feasible for the
district, the second reason
he said they want to make
sure it is feasible because of
the four year binding agree-
ment with the program, the
third reason he said is be-
cause they want all schools
to participate in the program
and not just a couple of
schools and the fourth rea-
son was because they need
to “evaluate all the different
angles” before agreeing to
participate in the four year
program.

“We need to use this
school year to evaluate ev-
erything such as meal costs,
menus, how much food is
wasted, what is the amount
of federal/state reimburse-
ment we get for free meal
programs, inventory of
equipment, etc. The num-
bers used for the program
are based on the numbers of
the prior school year so we
are going to use this year to
gather the numbers,” Pensol
said. “We are trying to make
a wise decision and will
come back to the issue
sometime at the beginning
of 2015. Throughout my ca-
reer I have always heard that
food services was self-sus-
taining but if we have to pay
the difference of those not
qualified for free meals then
that won’t be the case any-
more. The money will have
to come from somewhere.”

Board Member Tina
Hasty said she understood
the reasons why the district
wasn’t participating in the
CEP program this school
year. However, she said she
didn’t know what exactly to
tell people when they asked
her how many Rockcastle
County students were
signed up for free and re-
duced meals.

Isaacs said that approxi-
mately seventy-one percent
of Rockcastle County stu-
dents receive free or re-
duced price meals from a
federal government pro-
gram. She said the three el-
ementary schools in the dis-
trict were around eighty per-
cent while the middle
school and high school had

the projects to be funded
with coal severance funds
but had to move one item to
the bottom of the list. The
Rockcastle Rescue Squad
was slated, along with all
other fire departments in the
county except for the
Brodhead city department,
to receive $5,000 in coal
severance money for equip-
ment. However, the proper
paperwork by local fire de-
partment and emergency of-
ficials was not filed timely
and the rescue squad is, at
present, not recognized by
the state and thereby not eli-
gible for grants. Carloftis
said Wednesday that as soon
as the proper paperwork is
filed the funding will be re-
stored.

Magistrate Bill
McKinney told the court
that he had gotten more in-
formation on the traveling
Vietnam Wall from local
American Legion Com-
mander Tommy Hodges.

Last month, Hodges had
requested a $3,000 donation
from the court to be used as
a deposit on the Wall being
brought to Rockcastle
County. The court tabled the
request, at that time, mainly
because they wanted to
know if the deposit would
be refunded if Rockcastle
County was not chosen to
host the monument.

McKinney said that ac-
tually, Hodges wanted a
commitment from the court
for the $3,000 to be paid
only if the county were cho-
sen to host the Wall and that
it could possibly take up to
two years for that decision
to be made.

The court approved mak-
ing the commitment.

The court also had to
make substantial transfers
from the occupational tax
fund and the road depart-
ment fund to the general
fund to cover current ex-
penses.

A total of $275,000 --
$125,000 from the occupa-
tional tax fund and
$150,000 from the road
fund -- was transferred to
the general fund. Of that
amount, $1,000 will be
transferred to the Fair-
grounds Fund, $20,000 to
LGEA and $50,000 to the
jail fund with the remainder
being used in the general
fund.

Carloftis said the
$150,000 must be repaid to
the road fund by June 30,
2015.

In other action, the court:
*approved payment of

$3,778 to Western Volunteer
Fire Department for ten
months of utility bills
through May of 2014;

*approved a payment of
$3,500 for the new stage at
the Brodhead Park and
$2,369.45 for repair of an 8”
water line break which oc-
curred when the new fence
around the ballpark was be-
ing installed. The $3,500
will be reimbursed through
a grant Brodhead received
for the park;

*approved payment of
28.9c each for postage for
the approximately 10,000
2014 tax bills, and

*approved payment to
Kenneth Dyehouse for
$1,910 on construction of

the concession stand at the
ballpark at Brodhead,
$2,045 for a water line to the
concession stand at the t-
ball field and repair of a leak
and $ 975 to extend the
wash rack at the fair-
grounds.

slightly lower percentages.
The board meeting was

held at the Brodhead El-
ementary School and BES
kindergarten teachers at-
tended the meeting to pro-
vide an update about all-day
kindergarten that began this
school year.

BES Kindergarten
Teacher Sharon Ponder said
having her kindergarten stu-
dents for an entire school
day helped her teach each
subject more thoroughly.

“With a half-day I was
struggling to get everything
in to teach them what they
needed to know at that
level,” Ponder said. “Now I
can look at other resources
and find more things to help
them comprehend each sub-
ject better.”

Ponder went on to say
that the challenge of all-day
kindergarten is keeping
them engaged socially and
keeping them focused on an
all-day schedule.

“Trying to keep kinder-
gartners sitting and focused
for several hours at a time
can be difficult for that age.
But we got together and de-
veloped a social room for
kindergarten students that
allows them to go to centers

for 30 minutes each day,”
Ponder said. “This lets them
interact socially and learn
how to get along with each
other, share, take turns with
things, etc. It helps them
develop life skills at that
age.”

BES Kindergarten
Teacher Angie Adams said
they also purchased a com-
puter reading program for
kindergarten students and
that the challenge has been
scheduling for the computer
lab.

“The reading program
allows students to go at their
own pace. Students that are
struggling can stay with
something longer and stu-
dents that are excelling can
move up,” Adams said. “We
are having trouble schedul-
ing for the computer lab.
But before, when we had
them a half-day, if we
scheduled in the computer
lab we had to cut something
else out. Now the all-day
schedule has helped us fit
that in the schedule.”

BES Principal Caroline
Graves said one of their
goals is to create another
desktop computer lab for
kindergarten through sec-
ond grade. She said their

local PTA is also
fundraising for the com-
puter lab.

“One of the PTA’s goals
is to have another computer
lab because all-day kinder-
garten has overcrowded our
current computer labs,”
Graves said. “Another goal
they have is to purchase
schools supplies for all stu-
dents next year. They are
currently fundraising to try
and meet both goals.”

The Superintendent’s
personnel action report
showed twelve certified
hirings of Starla Benge as a
BES elementary school
teacher. The other eleven
certified hirings were sub-
stitute teachers who were:
Chris Kirby, Casey Hunt,
Andrea Owens, Dana Bul-
lock, Heather Pendery,
Chelsey Bray, Juetta Potter,
Brittany Boreing, Stephen
Gadwah, Dustin Bullock
and Ainsley Bussell.

Seventeen classified
hirings included: Carri Hunt
as an RCMS Instructional
Assistant, Jennifer Carpen-
ter as an RCMS Secretary,
Cristi Bradley as a substi-
tute instructional assistant,
Janet Robinson as BES
cook/baker, Wanda Burdine

as a RCMS instructional as-
sistant, Marion Barnett as a
substitute bus monitor,
Ainsley Bussell as an
RCMS Assistant Girls Bas-
ketball Coach, Kelley
Hughes as a substitute
teacher, Gerald Alexander
as RCMS Archery Coach,
John Chadwell as RCHS
Archery Coach, Marsha
Caudill as RCHS Instruc-
tional Assistant, Janetta
Begley as RCHS Archery
Coach, Doug Clements as
RCHS Bass Fishing Coach,
Monica Decker as an
RCMS instructional assis-
tant, Tammy Gibbons as a
substitute bus monitor,
Michael Hamilton as
RCMS assistant football
coach and Johnna Abney as
RCHS instructional assis-
tant.

Resignations were
Kelley Hughes as an RCHS
instructional assistant and
Marcella Lovell as alterna-
tive school instructional as-
sistant.
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Rockcastle
Republicans to
host Constitution
Day event

The Rockcastle
County Republican Party
will host an event to mark
Constitution Day 2014.
The luncheon will take
place at Limestone Grille
on Wednesday, Septem-
ber 17 starting at noon.

Constitution Day is an
observance of the day
that the U.S. Constitu-
tional Convention signed
the United States Consti-
tution.

The event will feature
a special presentation by
Chief Circuit Court
Judge, Jeffrey T.
Burdette.

The public is invited to
attend.

For more information
contact Republican Party
Chairman Travis T. Bur-
ton at 606-308-1204.

September 17, 2014, be-
gins the national celebra-
tion of Constitution Week.
The weeklong commemo-
ration of America’s most
important document is one
of our country’s least
known official obser-
vances. Our Constitution
stands as a testament to the
tenacity of Americans
throughout history to main-
tain their liberties and free-
dom, and to ensure those
inalienable rights to every
American.

The tradition of celebrat-
ing the Constitution was
started many years ago by
the Daughters of the Ameri-
can Revolution (DAR). In
1955, the Daughters peti-
tioned Congress to set aside
September 17-23 annually
to be dedicated for the ob-
servance of Constitution
Week. The resolution was
later adopted by the U.S.
Congress and signed into
Public Law #915 on August
2, 1956 by President
Dwight D. Eisenhower. The
aims of the celebration are
to (1) emphasize citizens’
responsibilities for protect-
ing and defending the Con-
stitution, preserving it for
posterity; (2) inform the
people that the Constitution
is the basis for America’s
great heritage and the foun-
dation for our way of life;
and (3) encourage the study
of the historical events
which led to the framing of
the Constitution in Septem-
ber 1787.

The United States of
America functions as a Re-
public under the Constitu-
tion, which is the oldest
document still in active use
that outlines the self-gov-
ernment of a people. This
landmark idea that men had
the inalienable right as in-

dividuals to be free and live
their lives under their own
governance was the impe-
tus of the American Revo-
lution.  Today, the Consti-
tution stands as an icon of
freedom for people around
the world.

“Constitution Week is
the perfect opportunity to
read and study this great
document which is the safe-
guard of our American lib-
erties,” states DAR Presi-
dent General, Lynn Forney
Young. “We encourage all
citizens across the country
to take time this week to re-
flect on our heritage of free-
dom and come together to
Celebrate America!”

DAR has served
America for 124 years as its
foremost cheerleader.  In
1928, the Daughters began
work on a building as a me-
morial to the Constitution.
John Russell Pope, archi-
tect of the Jefferson Memo-
rial, was commissioned to
design the performing arts
center, known as DAR
Constitution Hall. Today,
DAR Constitution Hall is
one of the only structures
erected in tribute to the
Constitution of the United
States of America.

Known as the largest
women’s patriotic organi-
zation in the world, DAR
has over 175,000 members
with approximately 3,000
chapters in all 50 states and
13 foreign countries. The
DAR has long promoted
patriotism through com-
memorative celebrations,
memorials, scholarships
and activities for children,
and programs for new im-
migrants.

For more information
about DAR and its pro-
grams visit www.dar.org or
call (202) 628-1776.

DAR promotes U.S.
Constitution Week

The Bittersweet
Rockcastle Pageant will be
held at the RCHS audito-
rium on September 30th, at
7 p.m.

The pageant will be for
ages 15 - 18.

Contestants will partici-
pate in the interview and
evening gown competition.
For interview, the commit-
tee is suggesting that a nice
church dress, pantsuit or
business suit is proper. Con-
testants will meet with the
judges for five minutes and
then rotate to another judge.
The evening gown is to be
non revealing and in good
taste.

Each contestant is re-
quired to get sponsors at the
cost of $25.00 per sponsor.
If you choose, you can have
more than one sponsor.
Sponsorship can be from
family members and or
businesses.  The checks are
to be made out to the City
of Mount Vernon and

Kiwanis Club, since this is
a joint effort.

Cash prizes will be
awarded at the pageant for
Miss Bittersweet 2014 and
the first runner up.  Miss
Congeniality and Miss Pho-
togenic will also be
awarded.  Each contestant
shall choose three photos for
the judges to view, prior to
the interview session.

The City of Mount
Vernon and the Rockcastle
Kiwanis are very proud to
co-sponsor this event.  The
admission for the event shall
be a non-perishable food
item or $1.00 for every per-
son entering the event.  The
Christian Appalachian
Project Food Pantry will be
the recipient of the dona-
tions.

Any questions concern-
ing the pageant or applica-
tions, then give Karen King
a call at home 606-256-3976
or cell phone is 606-308-
9246.

Miss Bittersweet Rockcastle
scheduled for September 30th

A large crowd came out for the third annual Hunger Awareness March in downtown Mt. Vernon last Thurs-
day. The march is held annually to combat world hunger. Registration fee for the march was one non-perish-
able food item that was donated to Christian Appalachian Project’s Grateful Bread Food Pantry in Mt. Vernon.
The event was sponsored by the Christian Appalachian Project and co-sponsored by the City of Mt. Vernon,
God’s Food Pantry and Wal-Mart.

Mt. Vernon Fire Department and Rockcastle EMS responded to a two vehicle collision last Wednesday after-
noon on Hwy 25 near the I-75 Exit 62 on-ramp in Mt. Vernon. Authorities say Four Aces Transportation
driver William Davis of Findley, Ohio was traveling south on Hwy 25 and attempted to turn onto the I-75
southbound on-ramp at Exit 62 and turned into the path of a car driven by Lisa Fisher, 20, of Brodhead who
was traveling north on Hwy 25. Fisher slid into the semi while braking and trying to stop her vehicle. Fisher
and another passenger Trish Bishop, 43, of Brodhead were transported to Rockcastle Regional Hospital where
they were both treated and later released. Fisher’s other passenger Barbara Barger, 64, of Brodhead was
airlifted to UK Medical Center where she is being treated for non-life threatening injuries and is listed in
stable condition.
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News from the
Rockcastle Courthouse

Circuit Civil
Suits

Harry Potter
for Mayor

Hi, I am Harry Potter and I
would like to
be your next
Mayor of Mt.
Vernon so I
can work
hard for you.

Thank You

Your vote and support
is greatly appreciated!

Paid for by Harry Potter

District Civil
Suits

Matthew Green, et al vs.
Kentucky Surveys, Inc.,
complaint.

JP Morgan Chase Bank
vs. Travis Wynn, et al,
$114,365.77 plus claimed
due.

Holly Lynn Marcum
Kirby vs. Steven Ray Kirby,
petition for dissolution of
marriage.

Lisa Carol Farmer vs.
Nicole Blair, order on dam-
ages.

Erica Carol Isaacs vs.
Jeffrey Dwayne Isaacs, pe-
tition for dissolution of mar-
riage.

Jerry Slate vs. Courtney
Simmons, petition for dis-
solution of marriage.

UK Federal Credit
Union vs. Melinda Lainhart,
$6,019,59 plus claimed due.

Citizens Bank vs. Carl
Wayne Sowder, et al,
$177,438.80 plus claimed
due.

Paula Ann Russell vs.
Davey Franklin Russell, pe-
tition for dissolution of mar-
riage.

Jennifer Kimsey vs.
James Kimsey, petition for
dissolution of marriage.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Erica Oakes, com-
plaint for child support and
medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. John Kuhn, com-
plaint for child support and
medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Jerri Reynolds,
complaint for child support
and medical support.

Nationstar Mortgage
LLC vs. Virginia Adams, et
al, $49,473.28 plus claimed
due.

Vanderbilt Mortgage vs.
Thomas Gregg, et al,
$65,631.28 plus claimed
due.

Scott B.F. Payne vs.
Dana L. Payne, petition for
dissolution of marriage.

Deeds
Recorded

Heights Finance Corp.
vs. April L. Rudie,
$1,920.74 plus claimed due.

Baptist Healthcare Sys-
tem, Inc. vs. John W.
Lunsford, Sr., $3,456.11
plus claimed due.

CACH LLC vs. Mat-
thew Wilder, $2,435.88 plus
claimed due.

Castle Village Apts.
LLC vs. April Bentley, forc-
ible detainer complaint.

CACH LLC vs. Mat-
thew Wilder, $3,001.56 plus
claimed due.

Castle Village Apts.
LLC vs. Melissa Carmen,
forcible detainer complaint.

Portfolio Recovery
Asso. LLC vs. Angela
Seaberg, $3,577.34 plus
claimed due. C-00116

Marriage
Licenses

Cody Clayton Sutton
and Torre Renita Sutton,
property on Deep Hollow
Road, to Robert and Ashley
Thomas. Tax $82.50

Carter Family Trust,
property in Rainbow Ridge
Subdv., to Cletis R. and
Kaci Brown. Tax $12.50

William and Kathy
Barker, property in
Rockcastle County, to Vicki
Manning and Rockcastle
County, Ky. Tax $12

Brenda Houk, property
north of Mt. Vernon, to
Darrell Griffin. No tax

Robert and Rosalind
Philbeck, property in Lear
Crest Subdv., to Michael
and Victoria Bradley. Tax
$9

Stephen C. Bullen, prop-
erty in Rockcastle County,
to Terry and Marlene
Lawson. Tax $300

Michael D, and Victoria
Bradley, property in
Rockcastle County, to

Jessie D. Hamm. Tax $89
Bernice Adams, property

in Rockcastle County, to
Shana Followells. No tax

Flossie Jones, property in
Rockcastle County, to
Jeffery Jones. No tax

Carlos and Tara
McClure, property in
Rockcastle County, to John
Howard and Kathy Lynn
Bryant. Tax $130

Florence and C. Emery
Martin, property in
Rockcastle County, to Eric
W. and Pamela M. Shafer.
Tax $216

Jackie VanWinkle, prop-
erty on Little Clear Creek,
to Morris and Joyce
Mullins. Tax $70

Vernie Decker, property
in Mt. Vernon, to Steven
Cameron. Tax $8.50

Jack R. and Karen R.
Clontz, property in
Rockcastle County, to David
Maloy and Kerry Compton.
Tax $68.

David Maloy and Kerry
Compton, property in
Rockcastle County, to Timo-
thy Alan Young. Tax $159

Indian Branch Ranch,
Inc., property in Rockcastle
County, to Jan and Marjorie
June Stevens and Jan Ivan
and Tammy Jean Stevens.
Tax $65

Gerald Miller, Barbara
Miller and Steven and Angie
Miller, property on Cove
Branch Road, to Gerald
Miller. No tax

Melanie Ann Abbott,
property on Wildie Road, to
Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky. Tax $4.50

Melanie Ann Abbott,
property on Wildie Road, to
Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky. Tax $4.50

Larry L. Cope, property
on Wildie Road, to Com-
monwealth of Kentucky.
Tax $2

Wallace and Minnie Lee
Stamper, property in
Rockcastle County, to Mat-
thew and Kayla Stamper. No
tax

District
Court

Anjelica Rae Craig, 22,
Brodhead, sales associate to
Jeffrey Bradford Johnson,
Jr., 26, Stanford, Mason. 8/
21/14

Bonnie Jean Elam, 36,
Brodhead, CMA to James
Cliston Harris, 36,
Brodhead, unemployed. 8/
23/14

Aug. 25-Sept. 3
Hon. Jeffrey S. Lawless
Hon. Kathryn G. Wood
Mishari K. Aldiab: no/

expired registration plates,
bench warrant (bw) issued
for failure to appear (fta).

Speeding: Carl L. Bullis,
Nicholas R. Fitch, Rondel C.
Root, Matthew A. Bode,
Steven Rutherford, Sara L.
Shaunfield, Alec S. Johnson,
Brandon K. Peters, David B.

Castle, David E. Jones, Ri-
chard R. Todd, Michael J.
Vitek, John E. Wynn, Jr,  li-
cense suspended for fta;
Grady L. Bryant III, paid;
Tima M. Henkel, $12 fine
and costs;

David M. Piercy: failure
to wear seat belts, Pt 393,
Federal safety Regs, Parts
Needed for Safe Operation
(two counts), bw issued for
fta.

Lauralee M. Sizemore:
failure to wear seat belts, li-
cense suspended for fta.

Amy M. Bingham: pub-
lic intoxication controlled
substance, $50 fine and
costs.

Melissa G. Blackburn:
operating on suspended/re-
voked operator’s license,
$100 fine and costs.

Connie F. Blevins: no/
expired registration plates,
$25 fine; no/expired Ken-
tucky registration receipt,
$25 fine (suspended), fail-
ure of owner to maintain re-
quired insurance, $500 fine
($400 suspended).

William Henry Brock:
fines/fees due ($233), bw
issued for fta/5 days in jail
or payment in full.

Curtis L. Broughton:
criminal trespassing, drug
paraphernalia, buy/possess,
bw issued for fta.

Jarrad R. Burdette: fines/
fees due ($733), 15 days in
jail or payment in full.

Jeremy D. Caldwell:
fines/fees due ($301), 7 days
in jail or payment in full.

Levi D. Johnson: driving
motor vehicle using hand-
held mobile telephone, li-
cense suspended for fta.

Tracey M. Slusher: oper-
ating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
sentencing order entered.

Maranda N. Smith:
TBUT or disp shoplifting,
sentencing order entered.

Pamela Smith: alcohol
intoxication in public place,
$50 fine and costs.

Adam J. Walker: driving
on DUI suspended license,
$100 fine, 30 days in jail/
probated 12 months.

Christian M. Koehler:
permitting, unlawful opera-
tion of motor vehicle, li-
cense suspended for fta.

Daniel Lamb: operating
on suspended/revoked op-
erators license, failure to
wear seat belts, bw issued
for fta.

Russell Little: fleeing or
evading police, reckless
driving, resisting arrest, bw
issued for fta.

Dereck R. Kenzer: pos-
session of marijuana, bw is-
sued for fta.

Tiffany A. Keshta:
speeding, no/expired regis-
tration plates - receipt, fail-
ure of owner to maintain re-
quired insurance/security,
failure to produce insurance
card, rear license not illumi-
nated, no tail lamps, bw is-
sued for fta.

Angela M. Hopkins:

TBUT or disp shoplifting,
sentencing order entered.

Stormy D. Bullock: theft
by unlawful taking and drug
paraphernalia - buy/possess,
sentencing orders entered.

Jarred A. Davidson: op-
erating vehicle w/expired
operators license and oper-
ating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
bw issued for fta.

Elliott J. Dooley: failure
to wear seat belts, operating
on suspended/revoked op-
erators license, failure to
produce insurance card, fail-
ure of non-owner operator
to maintain req. insurance,
no/expired registration
plates, no/expired registra-
tion plates, no/expired Ken-
tucky registration receipt
and obstructed vision and/or
windshield, be issued for fta.

Christopher W. Evans:
operating motor vehicle un-
der influence of alcohol/
drugs (under 21), $100 fine
and costs and 30 days opera-
tor license suspension.

Raymond Carpenter:
fines/fees due ($233), 5 days
in jail or payment in full.

Jeffery E. Conn: fines/
fees due ($733),  15 days in
jail or payment/bw issued
for fta.

Maranda P. Didonato:
no/expired registration
plates - receipt, failure of
non-owner operator to
maintain req. insurance, li-
cense suspended for fta.

Michael Douglas: no/ex-
pired registration plates -
receipt, failure of owner to
to maintain required insur-
ance, bw issued for fta.

Gerald S. Eaton: fines/
fees due ($4-7), bw issued
for fta/7 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Jamuari W. Gibson: im-
proper registration plates,
improper lane usage, oper-
ating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
failure to produce insurance
card, possession of mari-
juana, drug paraphernalia -
buy/possess, operating on
suspended/revoked opera-
tors license, failure to sur-
render revoked operators li-
cense, bw issued for fta.

Mary Ann Hellard: drug
paraphernalia - buy/possess,
60 days i jail (to serve), costs
waived.

Jennifer M. House: no/
expired registration plates -
receipt, bw issued for fta.

Ashley L. Jasper: operat-
ing on suspended/revoked
operators license, bw issued
for fta.

Kayla Johnson: public
intoxication controlled sub-
stance, possessio of con-
trolled substance, promot-
ing contraband, theft by un-
lawful taking, bw issued for
fta.

Jeffery L. Mullins: fines/
fees due ($133), bw issued
for fta/3 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Danny W. Reed: fines/
fees due ($143), bw issued

for fta/3 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Michael Sanchez: fines/
fees due ($188), bw issued
for fta/4 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Chastity P. Sexton: cul-
tivating marijuana, sentenc-
ing order entered.

Johnny W. Smith: failure
to add taxable unit to taxable
inventory, operate w/inac-
tive/cancelled/revoked
weight distance tax lic., fail-
ure to wear seat belts, bw
issued for fta.

Joshua R. Sowder: fines/
fees due ($158), bw issued
for fta/4 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Hubert Thomas: fines/
fees due ($260), bw issued
for fta/6 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Vernon L. Thomas: fines/
fees due ($133), bw issued
for fta/3 days i jail or pay-
ment in full.

Christopher Thompson:
operating on suspended/re-
voked operators license, $50
fine.

Halona L. Wynn: failure
of owner to maintain re-
quired insurance/security,
$500 fine (suspend $400 on
condition), failure to regis-
ter transfer of motor vehicle,
$100 fine.

Robert R, Cavanah:
booster seat violations, $25
fine/costs waived.

Charles A. Clark: failure
to wear seat belts, license
suspended for fta.

Randhiraj S. Gill: com-
munication device violation,
paid.

Jerry E. Morris: posses-
sion of marijuana, 10 days/
to serve, credit time served.

William J. Fletcher: pos-
session of marijuana, $100
fine and costs.

Joseph M. Hatterman:
failure to wear seat belts,
operating on suspended/re-
voked operators license,
failure to surrender revoked
operators license, posses-
sion of marijuana drug para-
phernalia - buy/possess, bw
issued for fta/license sus-
pended.

Bennett Ellis Hines: as-
sault and terroristic threat-
ening, bw issued for fta.

Phillip Glenn Johnson:
regulations necessary to
implement KRS 150 pur-
pose, $50 fine and costs.

Krise R. Mullins: public
intoxication, $50 fine and
costs; drug paraphernalia -
buy/possess, 90 days/pro-
bated 12 months on condi-
tion.

Brittany Ramsey: proba-
tion violation, bw issued for
fta/ 4 days in lieu of fine and
costs or payment in full.

Timothy W. Smith, Jr: no
operators/moped license, 30
days in jail/probated 24
months on condition plus
costs.

Jennifer L. Walden: drug
paraphernalia-buy/possess,
possession of marijuana, bw
issued for fta.
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Commonwealth of Kentucky
28th Judicial Circuit

Rockcastle Circuit Court • Division II
Civil Action No. 14-CI-00047

Mary Ann Bullock, widow                  Plaintiff

V.

Elizabeth B. Hahn, and husband
David Hahn                            Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a judgment and order of sale entered
in this partition action on June 12, 2014, I will offer
at public auction the hereinafter described real
property in Rockcastle County, Kentucky.

At the Courthouse on East Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

on Friday, September 19, 2014

Beginning at the Hour of 11:30 a.m.

Said property being more particularly bounded and

described as follows:

Located in Rockcastle County, Kentucky, and BEGINNING at a spring
on a line between Said Josiah Hayes and Nathan Bray with dogwood,
sourwood and maple pointers, thence with said line to a small beech,
supposed to be Bray’s line, sugar tree and dogwood pointers, said
beech standing nearly opposite the mouth of the lane leading to the
old David Bethurum house; thence about a west course to a persim-
mon tree standing nearly opposite the house; thence a straight line
northwest to a black oak and three hickories, a corner made by Will-
iam McClure and E. Bullock; thence with Bul1ock’s line to a black oak
made by Thas. Graves and E. Bullock with black oak, white oak and
ash pointers, supposed to be in or nearly in the old Moore survey, a
line of said Moore survey; thence with said line to a stone corner made
by Josiah Hayes and J. C. Watson having two chesnut and 2 sour-
wood pointers; thence a straight line about an east course to begin-
ning. The foregoing described piece of land being in the county of
Rockcastle, State of Kentucky, and on the waters of Skaggs Creek and
containing one hundred (100) acres more or less.
There is excepted from the above described property a one acre tract
of land conveyed by J.V. Bullock to J .L. Bullock by deed dated July 24,
1932, of record in Deed Book 66, page 162, in the office of the clerk of
the Rockcastle County Court, Mt. Vernon, Kentucky, described as fol-
lows:
Beginning on a Black Oak and three Hickorys, thence; 70 yds, East to
a stone, thence 70 yds. north to a stone, thence; 70 yds. West to a
stone, thence; 60 yds. South to the beginning corner, and same to
contain one acre to be the same more or less.

Plaintiff, MaryAnn Bullock and Defendant, Eliza-
beth B. Hahn are the owners in fee simple and in
possession of a one-half (1/2) undivided interest
each in and to property hereinafter described. The
Plaintiff obtained her one-half (1/2) undivided in-
terest by virtue of the Last Will and Testament of
her deceased husband, Wayne Eldon Bullock, re-
corded in the office of the clerk of the Rockcastle
County Court in Will Book 14, pages 141-145. The
Plaintiffs decedent and the Defendant, Elizabeth
B. Hahn each obtained a one-half (1/2) undivided
interest in the subject real property by deed dated
November 25, 2002, from Willis G. Coffey, Master
Commissioner of the Rockcastle Circuit Court, re-
corded in Deed Book 194, pages 7-11 in the Office
of the Rockcastle County Clerk.

The property shall be sold upon the

following terms & conditions:
1. The real property shall be sold together as a
whole and for cash or upon a credit of thirty (30)
days with the purchaser(s) required to pay a
minimum of twenty five percent (25%) of the
purchase price in cash on the date of sale and to
secure the balance with a bond approved by the
Master Commissioner.
2. The bond shall bear interest at the rate of
twelve percent (12%) per annum until paid in full.
The bond shall have the force and effect of a
judgment and shall be and remain a lien upon
the property sold as additional surety for the
payment of the purchase price.
3. Unpaid delinquent State and County ad
valorem taxes shall be paid from the sale pro-
ceeds.
4. The purchaser shall pay the 2014 local, county
and state property taxes.
5. The purchaser shall have possession of the
real property upon compliance with the terms of
the sale.
6. The sale shall be made subject to all ease-
ments, set back lines, restrictions or covenants
of record or otherwise and shall be sold “as is”.

John D. Ford
Master Commissioner

Rockcastle Circuit Clerk

DBCAA is accepting applications for its Weatheriza-
tion Assistance Program September 15, 2014. The
mission of the program is to improve energy efficiency,
household safety and to educate the public about
maintaining energy efficiency. To be eligible, your
family’s income must fall below 200% of federal pov-
erty guidelines (maximum income limit for a family
of 4 is $47,700) and your home cannot have been
weatherized since October 1, 1994.

Following are the services of the Weatherization Program:
  • Educate clients in safety & energy efficiency
  • Professionally evaluates single family dwellings,
    multifamily dwellings & mobile homes for safety
    & energy efficiency
  • Repairs or replaces existing heating systems as needed
  • Insulates homes as needed
  • Makes minor repairs to homes for health & safety
    reasons
  • Installs smoke & carbon monoxide detectors
Please contact Daniel Boone Community Ac-
tion Agency, Inc. at (606) 256-5315 for eligibil-
ity requirements, income limits per family size,
and additional program information.
Daniel Boone Community Action Agency, Inc. is an equal
housing opportunity provider.

Legal Notice
In accordance with Chapter 65 and 424 of the Kentucky Re-

vised Statutes the following information and supporting data
may be inspected by the general public at Rockcastle County
Extension Office, 1050 West Main St., Mt. Vernon, KY on Sep-
tember 26, 2014 between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 9:00 a.m.

Rockcastle County Extension District Board
Board Members: Name Address
Chairman Noreitta Thompson 896 E. Level Green Rd., Brodhead, KY 40409
Vice Chairman Jeff Hayes PO Box 1442, Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Secretary Janice Hager 265 Emerick Lane, Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Treasurer Virginia Hansel 4802 Willailla Rd., Brodhead, Ky. 40409

Zack Gentry PO Box 61, Brodhead, KY 40409
Jamie Ponder 1177 Scaffold Cane Rd., Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Phil Thompson 896 E. Level Green Rd., Brodhead, KY 40456

County Judge Executive Buzz Carloftis PO Box 755, Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Summary Financial Statement

For Fiscal Period 7-1-13 to 6-30-14
Revenues

Taxes (All categories)  $180,831.13
Other Revenues $2,842,37
Interest Earned $1,571.81

Receipts and Cash
Carryover from Prior Fiscal Year $330,121.53
Total Receipts, Cash & Revenues $515,166.84

Expenditures
Personnel $75,192.25
Operations $67,988.38
Administration $6,706.35
Total Appropriations $149,886.98

I, the undersigned, Treasurer of Rockcastle County District Coopera-
tive Extension Education Fund, hereby certify that the above is a true and
correct record of the accounts of the Rockcastle County District Coop-
erative Extension Education Fund, Mt. Vernon, Kentucky, as of Septem-
ber 8, 2014.

Virginia Hansel, Treasurer
Rockcastle County District Cooperative Education Fund

Subscribed and sworn to before me by the foregoing Affiant, Virginia
Hansel, this 8th day of September, 2014.

Saron Baldwin, Notary Public, State of Kentucky at large. My commission
expires: 8-14-15

October 1st thru
October 31st is

Rockcastle Roadside
PRIDE Month

To volunteer, call
James Renner,

Rockcastle County
PRIDE Coordinator
at 606-256-1902

An Appreciation Dinner
for all fall volunteers

will be November 8th at the
Rockcastle County

Recycling Center at Noon.

• Lunch Provided • Games and Prizes
• Fun For The Whole Family •

@mvsignal
By Karen Hamm Adams

To celebrate and honor
the county’s American
Revolutionary War Patriots
and to enlighten the commu-
nity about the service and
sacrifice of these brave men,
on behalf of the Rockcastle
Chapter of the Daughters of
the American Revolution, I
have complied highlights of
the service of the known
patriots living in the county
and who applied for a pen-
sion between the years 1818
and 1842. All information
was taken from the patriot’s
own account from his pen-
sion application and other
historical documents.  More
information can be found on
each patriot at the local li-
brary or the Rockcastle His-
torical Society.  (Copyright
pending).  If you are inter-
ested in joining the Daugh-
ters of the American Revo-
lution, please contact
Debbie Brown (606) 758-
8659 or Iris Young
(606)256-2851.

Thomas Johnson
Virginia

Thomas Johnson was
born in 28 February 1764 in
Albermarle County on
Carter’s Low Brown in Vir-
ginia  and died in 1834 in
Caldwell Co. KY. Accord-
ing to his pension applica-
tion, Thomas gave the fol-
lowing account of his ser-
vice in 9 June 1834
Rockcastle Co. KY:  He en-
tered the service as a substi-
tute for John Scott in
Amherst Co. VA in 1778 to
guard the prisoners taken by
General Gates in the North.
He marched from Amherst
down to Albemarle Barracks
and served for five weeks in
guarding the prisoners there.
He served under Captain
Younger Landrum.  He re-
ceived a written discharge

from his Sergeant.  He was
very young in his fifteenth
year as well as he remem-
bered when he served this
tour.  John Scott gave him
one hundred dollars in con-
tinental money to take his
place.

In March 1781 Thomas
was drafted by the method
that drewlots which fell
upon him to go a tour of six
weeks against the British
under Captain John Jacobs.
He was then living in
Amherst Co. VA and
marched from there under
Captain Jacobs, Colonel
Gabriel Penn, Major James
Franklin and Colonel Hugh
Rose.  He joined the Army
of Nathaniel Greene on the
16th March 1781,the day
after the battle of Guilford
Courthouse.  His officers
who had come down with
him resigned and went
home.  He was then placed
under Captain Lewis of
Mecklenburg and Colonel
Holman.  He marched with
Greene’s Army to the Dan
River where the Virginia
Militia separated with
Greene and marched up to
Staunton River where he
was discharged.

In 9 July 1781, he was
drafted for a tour of three
months in Amherst Co. VA
under Captain John Loving.
He was marched through
Richmond, VA, and
Williamsburg until he
reached York.  He stated that
upon the route down,he
joined the main army under
General Washington.  He
continued with Washington
until 9 October 1781 when
he received his discharge.

In the year 1783, he vol-
unteered to go a tour against
the Indians in Lincoln
County now the state of
Kentucky where his father

had removed under Captain
George Murrel and was en-
gaged in this service not less
than ten days.  Thomas
stated that he was in no en-
gagements but drawn up in
line of battle several times.
He also stated he was among
the first who aided in con-
structing what was called
the Poplar Fort at the Siege
of Cornwallis (Yorktown).

Thomas lived in Amherst
Co. VA during the war until
his last tour which was from
Lincoln Co. KY and moved
to Knox County KY and
later moved to Caldwell Co.
KY where he was living at
the time of his pension ap-
plication.  He stated that he
applied for his pension in
Rockcastle County because
he was better known in that
part of the country than in
Caldwell County.  Thomas
received a pension at the rate
of twenty dollars annually
commencing 4 March 1831
for his service as a private
in the Virginia militia.  There
is no mention of a spouse or
children in Thomas’ pension

Hidden Among Us

The American Revolutionary
War Patriots of Rockcastle

application.  It is thought
that he married Melinda
Jane Perry.  The probable
Child of Thomas and
Melinda: Melvina Johnson
(23 September 1824 KY-7
January 1889 Hendricks
Co. IN) married George W.
Merritt (1820-1908) on 26
December 1843 Hendricks
Co. IN.  George Merritt was
known to be one of the most
prominent farmers in Wash-
ington Township,
Hendricks Co. IN.  They
were also known to have the
finest orchard in the state.
They are buried at
AbnerCreek Cemetery in
Hendricks Co. IN.  George
and Melvina had the follow-
ing children: George, John,
James, William, Melinda,
Reuben, Simeon, Marry and
Sylvester.

As to date, no descen-
dant has joined the Daugh-
ters of the American Revo-
lution under Thomas
Johnson, who would be
considered at new patriot
for the society.
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Gospel Meeting
Church of Christ
at Chestnut Ridge
2 Miles South of Mt. Vernon on Hwy. 25

September
10th - 14th

Wed. thru Sat. Services at 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Worship Service at 10:00 a.m.

Speaker will be
Evangelist

Jerry Dickerson
Everyone is invited

to attend!

Free Bible Courses
Free Bible Corres-

pondence Course. Send
your name and address to
3168 Quail Road, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456.
Let the Bible Speak

Tune in to “Let the Bible
Speak,” with Brett Hickey,
on Sunday mornings at 8:30
a.m. on WDKY Fox 56.

Gospel Singing
Lighthouse Baptist

Church will hold a Gospel
Singing on Sat., September
13th, beginning at 6 p.m.
and featuring Proverbs 31
from Wilmore. The church
is located at 1391
Gabbardtown Road, Berea.

Homecoming
Homecoming will be

held at Scaffold Cane Bap-
tist Church on Sunday, Sep-
tember 21st with a meal
served after morning wor-
ship. Special singers will be
Bobby and Brenda Fugate.
Evangelist will be Bro. Ed
Cortey. Pastor Chris Cobb
and congregation welcome
everyone.

Yard/Bake Sale
Mt. Vernon Church of

God will have a yard and
bake sale Friday, September
12th, 8 a.m. to 5 p.m Lots
of goods and lots of baked
stuff.

Homecoming
Clear Creek Baptist

Church will celebrate

Homecoming Sunday, Sept.
21st. Lunch will be served
following the morning ser-
vice. Special music will be
provided by Joe and Stacy
Isaacs.

2014 Homecoming
First Christian Church in

Mt. Vernon will be celebrat-
ing their 2014 Homecoming
with a series of meetings
from Sunday morning, Sept.
14th through Wednesday
evening, Sept. 17th. Sunday
morning service is at 11
a.m., Sunday night at 6
o’clock and Monday
through Wednesday eve-
nings at 7 o’clock. Doug
Parkey will be bringing the
message each evening. The
theme is “What I Have
Learned.”

If you have any ques-
tions, or need transportation
call us at 256-2876.

Special Service
Berea Gospel Taber-

nacle, 231 Hwy. 25 in
Berea, will have a Saturday
Night Service at 7 o’clock
on Septemer 13th will Rev.
Alvie Robinson. Pastor
Ralph Chasteen and congre-
gation invite everyone to at-
tend.

Homecoming
Sand Hill Baptist Church

will be having their Home-
coming on Sunday, Sept.
21st. Sounds of Glory will
be singing. Pastor Tommy
Miller and congregation in-
vite everyone to attend.

Revival
The church will also be

In Revival September 25, 26
and 27, beginning at 7
o’clock each night. Bro.
Marlow Napier will be
preaching.

Pastor Tommy Miller
and congregation invite ev-
eryone to attend.
Horse & Wagon Ride

Climax Holiness Church

will hold their annual Horse
and Wagon Ride on Satur-
day, Sept. 13th, beginning at
10 a.m. Please bring a cov-
ered dish for dinner at 1 p.m.
with a gospel singing to fol-
lows.

The church invites ev-
eryone to attend the horse
ride.

Homecoming
New Hope Baptist

Church Homecoming will
be held Sunday, Sept. 14th,
beginning at 11 a.m. There
will not be a service that
evening.

Bro. David Carpenter
and congregation welcome
everyone.

In Revival
Roundstone Baptist

Church will be In Revival
September 14-17 at 7
o’clock each evening.

Evangelist will be Bro.
Steve Sutton and there will
be special singing nightly.

Pastor Rick Reynolds
and congregation invite ev-
eryone to attend.

Homecoming
Flat Rock Baptist

Church will hold Home-
coming Services Sunday,
September 21st at 11 a.m.

The Allen Family from
Branson, Missouri will be
the featured group.

All former church mem-
bers, pastors and whosoever
are invited to come and be
a part of this great day.

Special Service
Cupps Chapel Holiness

Church will hold a Special
Service on Sunday, Sept.
14th, beginning at 6 p.m.

The Turner Family will
be singing and Bro. Marvin
will preach.

Pastor Dwayne Carpen-
ter and congregation wel-
come everyone to attend.

Homecoming
Homecoming Services

will be held at Philadelphia
United Baptist Church, be-
ginning at 11 a.m., on Sun-
day, Sept. 21st. The Praise
Singers will bring special
music and there will be
food.

The church will also hold
a yard sale on Oct. 3 and 4
at Hwy. 39/150. Donations
can be left at the church or
at 205 J. Shelton Road (on
the porch) or call Bro. Gor-
don at 308-5368.

Upcoming Reunions
Carpenter & Phillips

The Carpenter and
Phillips Reunion will be held
at the Lawrence Phillips
Place on Horselick Creek in
Jackson Co. on Sat., Sept. 27,
beginning at 11 a.m. with
lunch served at noon. All
family and friends are wel-
come. Bring a covered dish
and lawn chair.

For more information, call
606-453-2181.

McClure Reunion
The Johnny and Joe

McClure Reunion will be
held Sat., Sept. 20th at KCA
Church Camp beginning at
noon. All family members are
expected and friends wel-
come. Please bring a covered
dish and join us for a day of
fellowship and fun.

Contact Sheary McClure
Caldwell at 606-758-8617 or
606-308-1886 for questions

or more info.
Rowe Reunion

The Robert and Winnie
Rowe Reunion will be held
Sunday, September 14th at
Shelter Number 4 in Logan
Hubble Park, Lancaster.

All relatives and friends
are welcome.

Cromer/Whitaker
The Cromer/Whitaker Fam-

ily Reunion will be held Sat-
urday, Sept. 13th at KCCA
Church Camp in Brodhead.
Dinner at noon. Please bring
a covered dish to share. Con-
tact Rissie Cromer at 758-
9054 for questions or direc-
tions.

Laws, McAnally,
Brockman, Crain

The Laws, McAnally
(McNally), Brockman, Crain
Reunion will be held Sat.,
Sept. 13th at Berea Memorial

Park from 11 a.m. to ? Bring
food, drinks, pictures, etc. For
more info, call Gwendolyn at
606-965-2874.

Barnett Reunion
The Barnett Reunion will

be held on Wolfe Creek this
Sunday at noon. Family and
friends welcome. Bring a
covered dish.

Cromer Reunion
The families of John and

Arlie Cromer will hold their
annual reunion Saturday,
September 14th. The event
will begin at noon and will be
held at the home of Bentley
Cromer. All family and
friends are welcome to at-
tend.

Please bring a covered
dish or dessert if you wish.
For more information, call
Bentley Cromer at 606-521-
7061 or Jeanne Cromer at
606-256-2704.



1st Sunday in Month Church at
2 p.m. at Rockcastle

Respiratory Care
Bro. Gary Bowling, Pastor

Poplar Grove
Baptist

145 Richlands Rd. •
Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Providence

church of Christ
1 mile off Hwy. 70

on Hwy. 618
Dan McKibben, Minister

758-8524 or 758-9316
Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.

Sunday Morning Worship
10:30 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

email:
dan.mckibben@juno.com

www.WhatSaithTheScriptures.com
Roundstone

Baptist
Rick Reynolds, Pastor

606-256-0306
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Sand Hill Baptist
Church

Sand Hill Rd.
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Night 5:00 p.m.
Thursday Night 6 p.m.
Pastor Tommy Miller

Sand Springs
Baptist

Directions: Take Hwy 1249, go
exactly 5 miles, church on right

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 6 p.m.
Pastor:

Bro. Eugene Gentry
Scaffold Cane

Baptist
Chris Cobb, Pastor

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.

Sunday Night 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Union Chapel
Pentecostal

1505 Union Chapel Rd.
Brodhead, Ky.

Letcher Napier, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.

Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.
United Gospel of Christ

4 miles off US 25 on Wildie Rd.
Church welcomes everyone
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.
Wildie Christian

Church
1478 Wildie Rd.  • Wildie

606-256-4494
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 10:55 a.m.
Family Fellowship 6 p.m.

Bible Study 6 p.m.
Bro. Gary Pettyjohn, Pastor

Mount Vernon
606-256-2500

McKee
606-287-8390

Somerset
606-451-2274

24 Hour Information Line 1-800-530-8561

Brodhead
606-758-8212

Rockcastle Professional
Pharmacy

Newcomb Ave. • Mt. Vernon
606-256-4613

Open Monday - Friday 8:30 a.m. to 7 p.m.
Sat., 8:30 a.m. to 1 p.m.

“Free Delivery”

Believers House of Prayer
156 Scenic View Lane

U.S. 25 N, left at 18 mile marker
Renfro Valley, Ky.

Sabbath School Sat. 10 -11 a.m.
Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Evening Worship 7 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Pastor: Bill Davis
bhop@ymail.com

Berea Gospel Tabernacle
131 US 25 South

Berea, KY
Tuesday Night 7 p.m.
Sunday Night 6 p.m.

Pastor: Ralph Chasteen
Bible Baptist Church

100 Higher Ground (off US 25)
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Church Phone 606-256-5913
e-mail: www.biblebaptist.org

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship/Children’s

Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Night Worship 6 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Video services Tues., Thurs., &
Sat. at 11 a.m., 4 p.m. & 9 p.m.

Channel 3 - New Wave
Cable Channel 5 in Berea and
Richmond 1 p.m. Wednesdays

Pastor: Don Stayton
Associate Pastor/Youth:

Bro. Jeremy Ellis
Kids for Christ

Children’s Ministry:
Bro. Jarrod Amyx

Secretary: Jo Roberts
Music Director: Dan Dull

Blue Springs
Church of Christ

7 miles south of Mt. Vernon on
Hwy. 1249 (Sand Springs Rd)

Services:
Sundays 10 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Preaching Brethren
Zade McClure, Gary Reppert,

Marcus Reppert
Contact Info:

Marcus Reppert
104 Byrda Way • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

606-308-2794
marcusreppert24@hotmail.com
Bride of Christ Church
100 High St. Mt. Vernon

Sundays 6:00 p.m.
Thursdays 7:00 p.m.

Pastor Darlisa Holder
606-416-7136
606-379-6335

Brodhead Baptist Church
Corner of Silver & Maple St.

Brodhead, Ky. 40409
606-758-8316

Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m. &

7 p.m.
(Nursery Provided)

Sunday Youth Bible Study
5 p.m.

Wednesday Adult & Youth
Worship/Bible Study 7 p.m.

Children’s Programs:
RAs & GAs

Mission Friends and
Creative Ministry

Ralph Baker, Pastor
Brodhead Christian

Church
237 W. Main St. Brodhead

606-758-8721
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

Tracy Valentine, Preacher
606-758-8662

Cell 606-305-8980

Church Directory
Brodhead Church of God

Hwy. 3245 • Brodhead
758-8216

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday evening 7 p.m.
Terry Orcutt, Pastor

Brush Creek
Holiness Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Tuesday Prayer Meeting 7 p.m.
Lonnie R. McGuire,

Pastor
Buffalo Baptist Church
Located 15 miles south of
Mt. Vernon on Hwy. 1249

(Sand Springs Rd.)
606-256-4988

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:15 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Tim Owens, Pastor

Calloway Baptist Church
76 Calloway Branch Rd.
(Off US 25) • Calloway
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 6 p.m.
George Renner, Pastor

606-224-4641
Central Baptist Church

86 Maintenance Rd.
Mt. Vernon, KY 40456

606-256-2988
centralbaptistky.org
Pastor: Mark Eaton

Home of “Central Baptist
Christian Academy”
K-12 Private School

“Central Time” Radio
Broadcast

WRVK 1460AM
Monday -Friday 11:15 a.m.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning and

Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study,

Prayer Meeting and “Patch
the Pirate Club”  7 p.m.

Transportation and Nursery
provided for all services

Mark Eaton, Pastor
Church of Christ at

Chestnut Ridge
2 miles south of Mt. Vernon

Turn left off US Hwy 25
Sundays 10:00 a.m.

Wednesdays 7:30 p.m.
Bro. Ova Baker

Bro. Dale McNew
Bro. Philip Scott

Church of Christ on
Fairground Hill

Sunday Worship 10 a.m.
Different speaker each

Sunday
Climax Christian Church

Hwy. 1912
308-2806 - 256-4138 - 256-5977

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Terry Thornton, Minister
Climax Holiness Church
Sunday Night Worship 6 p.m.

Thursday Nights 7 p.m.
3rd Sat. of every month at

7 p.m.
Conway Missionary

Baptist
U.S. 25 between

Mount Vernon and Berea

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6 p.m.
Wed. Prayer Service and

Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Meetings:
Sunday 5 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Bobby Turner, Pastor

606-758-4007
Crab Orchard Pentecostal

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Tuesday Evening 7 p.m.
Pastor: Donald King

606-355-7595
Crossroads

Assembly of God
Hwy. 150 • Brodhead

Bro. Steven Vanhook, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Dixie Park Cornerstone
700 N. Powell St. Berea, Ky.

859-623-8292 • 859-985-
2484

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6
p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Gene Smith, Pastor

Fairview Baptist Church
520 Fairview Loop Road

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday Services

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Choir 6 p.m.

Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Sunday Adult Choir 8 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Creative Ministry 6 p.m.

Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Ministry QUEST 7 p.m.

RAs and GAs 7 p.m.
Mission Friends 6 p.m.
Vaughn Rasor, Pastor

606-256-3722
email: fairviewbapt@aol.com
Faith Chapel Pentecostal

S. Wilderness Road
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.
Jack Carpenter, Pastor
First Baptist Church

340 West Main Street
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 606-256-2922

Neal Thornton, Pastor
Jesse Wright,

Assoc. Pastor/Youth
website: www.fbcmvkyorg

email:fbcmtvernon@newwave.net
Sunday Services: 8:20 a.m.,

10:45 a.m. and 6 p.m.
Wednesdays: AWANA and

Adult Bible Study 6:30 p.m.
Live Broadcast WRVK 1460AM

Sundays at 11 a.m.
Broadcast on New Wave Cable
Channel 3 Tues., Thurs. & Sun-
day at 10 a.m., 3 p.m. & 8 p.m.

First Christian
Church

West Main St. Mt. Vernon
606-256-2876

Bro. Bruce Ross, Pastor
Sunday School: 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship
11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
Flat Rock Missionary

Baptist
504 Maple Grove Rd. Hwy. 1004

Orlando, Ky.
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Fellowship Hour 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

Jack Stallsworth, Pastor
Contact: 606-308-0124

Freedom Baptist Church
Freedom School Rd.

Mt. Vernon
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 6 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

7 p.m.
Wednesday Evening Prayer
Meeting & Youth/Children

Classes 7 p.m.
www.freedomsbc.com

email:
pastor@freedomsbc.com
Pastor: David Sargent

606-256-2968
Hickory Grove

Pentecostal Church
Hwy. 1505 (6 miles from Brodhead)

Brodhead,Ky.
Randal Adams, Pastor

Youth Pastor, Scott Adams
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sun. & Wed. Evening 7 p.m.
Lighthouse Assembly of

God
Hwy. 1004 • Orlando, Ky.

Tim Hampton, Pastor
606-256-4884 • 606308-2342

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Tues. Night Intercessory Prayer
7 p.m.

Wednesday Night Bible Study
7 p.m.

Little Country Church
Jarber Rd.

Turn left off Rev. Green Loop
onto Jarber Rd.

Jack Weaver, Pastor
Sunday 6 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Livingston Baptist
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Adult Classes Available

Worship Service 11 a.m.
Bro. Steve McKinney, Pastor

606-758-4097
email: stevemc1964@gmail.com

Livingston Christian
Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Arthur Hunt, Minister

Livingston Pentecostal
Holiness Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Jim Miller, Pastor
606-256-1709

Macedonia Baptist
Scaffold Cane Road
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Bro. Barry Hurst, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Maple Grove Baptist

Hwy. 1004 (Big Cave Road)
Orlando, Ky. • 606-256-1873

Bro. Jerry Owens, Pastor
 Home Phone 606-256-3075

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
WRVK Broadcast 2 p.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Maretburg Baptist

Church
2617 New Brodhead Rd.
Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Wayne Harding, Pastor

 Phone: 256-8844
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sun. Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Sun. Discipleship Training/

Sunday Youth Missions
6 p.m.

Sunday Worship 7 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
www.maretburgbaptist.org

maretburgchurch@yahoo.com
McNew Chapel

Baptist
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Jerry Ballinger, Pastor

Mt. Vernon
Church of God
1025 W Main St.

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Bobby Owens, Pastor
859-986-1317

Mt. Vernon Church of
the Nazarene

40 Fair Street • Mt. Vernon
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
David Smith, Pastor

Mt. Zion Baptist Church
606-308-3293

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 5 p.m.

New Hope Baptist Church
Jct. 1797 New Hope Tower Rd.

Orlando
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Bro. David Carpenter, Pastor

Northside Baptist Church
777 Faith Mountain Rd.

(Off 461 bypass) Mt. Vernon
606-256-5577

Sunday
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Hispanic Services 6 p.m.
Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Wednesday
Adult & Youth Worship 7 p.m.
New Wave Cable (KET2 ch. 3)

Tues., Thurs., Sun.
9 a.m., 2 p.m., 7 p.m.

Ottawa Baptist Church
1074 Ottawa Rd. • Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Discipleship

Training/Youth Mission
Groups 6 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Youth Choir 6 p.m.

Children’s & Youth Bible Study
6:45 p.m. • Service 7 p.m.

Jim Craig, Pastor • 758-8453
ottawabaptist@windstream.net
Our Lady of Mt. Vernon

Catholic Church
515 Williams St (across from MVES)

Mount Vernon, Ky.
606-256-4170
Mass Times:

Tuesdays at 5 p.m.
Sabbath Mass: Sat., 5 p.m.

Holy Days 5 p.m.
Fr. Michael Flanagan, Pastor

Sister Joyce Moeller,
Pastoral Associate

Jack Lawless, Groundskeeper
Tom Darst, Maintenance
Philadelphia United

Baptist
834 Bryant Ridge Rd. Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.
Gordon Mink, Pastor

606-256-9724
Pine Hill Holiness

5216 S. Wilderness Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456
Chris Davidson, Pastor

256-5955
www.pinehillholiness.com

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sun. Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Thursday Night Worship
7:00 p.m.

WRVK (1460 AM) Broadcast
Noon Sundays

Pine Hill Missionary
Baptist Church

81 Limeplant Hollow Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

Bro. Clyde Miller, Pastor
859-986-1579

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 5:30 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Prayer Meeting &

Youth Service at 7:00 p.m.
Prayer Partners Ladies Meeting
monthly every 2nd Tues. at 6:30 p.m.
Pleasant Run Missionary

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 5 p.m.

Open:
10 a.m. to 10 p.m.

7 Days a Week

U.S. 25 N - Mt. Vernon

606-256-4910

Brodhead Pharmacy
Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-4373
Howard Saylor

Pharmacist
David Collins

Owner

Open:
9:30 to 6:30
Mon. - Fri.

“We Deliver County Wide”

Collins Respiratory
Care

Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-9333
Home Health Equipment & Supplies

Insurance & Medicare Accepted
Owners: David Collins & Shelly Clements

Call changes to
Church  Directory

to 256-2244

Church News
Deadline

is Noon Tuesday

The Mt. Vernon Signal • Thursday, September 11, 2014 • Pg. B5

10 Piece Meal
$5 Fill-Up Box

For your family reunion or church
gathering -- we offer catering!

2 Sides *
4 Biscuits



Classifieds
CLASSIFIED RATES
• Local Rates - $4 for 25 words
or less - .10 each additional word

• Display Classifieds
$5.00/Inch

Deadline for Classifieds
is 10 a.m. TUESDAY

For Rent

For Rent

Maple St. Storage

of Brodhead

256-2884 or
606-308-2491
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Property
For Sale

Make $1,000 selling your old scrap cars-trucks and farm
equipment and machinery.

Call 24 hours a day. If no answer, leave message and your call will be returned.

859-358-3560 or 606-256-3841 anytime

We also buy
batteries, converters,
aluminum wheels and

radiators, starters,
and alternators.

Used tires and parts
for sale at dirt
cheap prices.

NOTICE
NO classifieds can

be placed over
the phone without
paying at time of

placing
advertisement

CLASSIFIED
ADS NOTICE

For your  convenience,
we now  accept VISA

and Mastercard
To place your

classified, have your
credit card ready

and call
(606) 256-2244

Posted

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Help Wanted

Deliver
Phone Books

Work your own hours,
Have Insured Vehicle.

Must be at least 18
years old with valid
DL. No experience

necessary.

1-800-518-1333 x224
www.deliverthephonebook.com

Local company seeking interested
applicants for:

Maintenance Technician &
Quality Engineer Positions:

Qualifications: General maintenance with basic
electrical experience - welding & cutting required

Qualifications: Quality Engineer – daily
inspection audits, inspect and test customer
products using various gauges, computer skills
with Microsoft office & ISO knowledge
Must have own tools and transportation.

Interested applicants send resume to:
PO Box 687

Richmond, KY 40475

B.C.C. Metals
Featuring metal roofing, siding,

trim and insulation.
Same day service available on most orders.

Contact Jerry Blair
Toll Free 1-800-658-4902 • 256-4700

Located 4 miles s. of Berea, off U.S. 25 at 862 Lambert Rd.
Serving Rockcastle County & surrounding counties.

www.bccmfg.com

Notices

Miscellaneous
For Sale

Mobile Homes
For Sale

The Terrace
Nursing & Rehabilitation Facility

Now Hiring

Cook
5:00A—1:30P • Full-Time

Full Benefit Package Available
Apply at: 1043 Brooklyn Blvd., Berea. Ky.
The Terrace is non-discriminatory in admissions

& employment, EOE

Mobile Home on Lake.
$425 month/$450 deposit.
Reference required. 606-
392-1774. 38xntf
Large 2 story five bed-
room home, 2 baths, living
room, dining room, large
eat-in kitchen, located at
212 Maple St., across from
Baptist Church on corner of
Silver and Maple St. in
Brodhead. Available Octo-
ber 1st. $585 month. Secu-
rity deposit and credit check
required. Call 706-373-
6877 or 606-758-9209.
38xntf
2 Bedroom Trailer. No
pets. Security deposit re-
quired. 859-358-3560.
20xntf
Duplex in Brodhead. All
appliances furnished. Call
Patty, 758-9666. 17xntf
Trailers and house in
Brodhead. No pets. 758-
8922. ntf
Accepting applications at
Mt. Vernon Housing Au-
thority on Mondays 4 to 8
p.m. and Wednesdays and
Fridays, 4 to 6 p.m. Rent
based on income. 256-4185.
14xntf
Accepting Applications:
For 2 and 3 bedroom units
at Valley View Apartments.
Rent based on income. Call
256-5912. Equal Housing
Opportunity, TDD for hear-
ing impaired only. 1-800-
247-2510. 36tfn

House on Scaffold Cane
Road, Mt. Vernon. 2 acres,
all fenced. House has
approx. 3,000 sq. ft. w/4
bedrooms, 2 1/2 baths, big
porches for easy living,
pool. Wonderful place to
raise a family. If interested,
and for more info, call 606-
308-1561. 36x4p
House and 11.5 acres more
or less. Large shed, two
small out buildings, pond
with dock, creek. 1,440 sq.
ft., two story, 3 bedroom, 2
full b ath, utility room with
deep sink, gas fireplace, all
hardwood and laminate
flooring. $150,000. No rent.
606-308-4759.
16 1/2 Acres, m/l,  with
24x60 mobile home, 20x20
attached garage, 2 large
barns, 2 large outbuildings
and carport. Blacktop drive-
way. $69,000. Call 606-
386-1470. 38x4p
Price Reduced! 26 1/2
Acres w/creek. Has field
and woods, plenty of deer
and turkey. Located on
Schoolhouse Hill Road, off
Hwy. 461. Asking $135,900
OBO. 606-224-9740. 35x4p
2BR/2BA 1450 sq. ft. Sell-
ing for $89,900. Rick Szaks,
Broker. 859-255-7777. Lin-
coln Real Estate, Inc.
rickszaks@aol.com  18xntf
Between Mt. Vernon and
Somerset: 5.7 wooded
acres for $31,500. Near
Berea - 10.2 acres $31,900.
Owner financing available.
Call Dwight at 859-331-
4888. 8xntf
Lots in Castle Ridge Sub-

division. Use same entry
way as Bible Baptist
Church. All lots have city
sewer and underground
utilities. starting at $12,900.
606-256-5692 • 256-4504 •
308-3730. 50x1
Mobile home lots, located
in Sunnyside Mobile Home
Park. 1/2 acre lots - $500
down and $100 per month.
Call 606-256-5692 or 606-
256-5648. 50x1

Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or traveling through
land belonging to Scott
Anglin, on John Rigsby
Ridge Road, without writ-
ten permission only from
Scott Anglin. 36x4p
Posted: No trespassing on
property belonging to Crys-
tal Gail Griffin and Douglas
Paul Griffin, located on Ky.
Hwy. 1955, Red Hill Road.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted. 35x4p
Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on land belonging
to Glen Roberts at 560 Dix
River Branch Road,
Brodhead. Violators will be
prosecuted. 35xntf
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or 4 wheelers on
property belonging to Will-
iam Johnson and Bill Parker
(formerly owned by Bar-
bara Setser) and located on
Hwy. 490, Mahaffey Hol-
low Road, Livinston. Viola-
tors will be prosecuted.
Posted: No trespassing on
land belonging to James and
Dorothy Rash heirs on Rash
Branch Road off Chestnut
Ridge. No hunting, camp-
ing, ATVs, trespassing for
any purpose. Not respon-
sible for accidents. Violators
will be prosecuted. (1/15/
15)
Posted: No trespassing on
Crawford Place - Old
Brodhead Road. Danny
Smith. 47tfn
Posted: Absolutely no hunt-
ing, fishing or trespassing
on property belonging to
Mark and Debbie
Cummins. Violators will be
prosecuted. 9x52p
Posted: No trespassing,
hunting or fishing on land
belonging to Rachel
Denney on Hwy. 3245
(former Reggie Benge prop-
erty).
Posted: No trespassing on
property known as C.B.
Owens Farm across from
Fairgrounds in Brodhead.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted.

Single Sealy Ergomotion
bed - similar to hospital bed.
Cost $1500, asking $500.
Like new - barely used. Call
758-4236, leave message.
38x2p
Camper For Sale. $650.
Call 256-0655. 38x1p
1997 27 ft. Fleetwood Wil-
derness travel trailer.
$1,800 as is, needs some re-
pair. 1998 20 ft. Bayliner
Bowrider. $1,500, needs
motor. 919-816-7902. 37x4
2 antique dressers; antique
chifferobe w/hat box; two
bed frames; entertainment
center; coffee table/2 corner
tables; stereo; floor model
TV; book case; couch; twin
bed (antique); antique re-
frigerator; stove and micro-
wave; CB radios; CB tower
and antenna. 606-453-3481
or 606-392-9103. 37x2p

Will do housecleaning,
wall papering and painting.
Call 606-308-0453. 38x1p
Notice: On September l20,
2014, at the hour of 9 a.m.,
I will sell the contents of
Unit #19 on the premises of
Perry and Amy Mink Prop-
erties, LLC, 110 Old
Somerset Road, Mt. Vernon,
Ky. All purchases shall be in
cash and the property shall
be removed on the date of
sale. 38x1
Notice to Wayne Burns.
You need to pick up your
van. We will no longer be
able to store. Must be moved
in 30 days from September
11, 2014. 38x1p
Notice of Bid: The
Rockcastle County Fiscal
Court/CSEPP will receive
sealed bids for a 7’x18’ ani-
mal shelter trailer. Bid speci-
fications must be picked up
at the office of the
Rockcastle County Judge/
Executive Buzz Carloftis,
205 E. Main St., Mt. Vernon,
Ky. 40456. Sealed bids will
be accepted, at the Judge/
Executive’s office until
Monday, October 13th at 2
lp.m. and opened on Octo-
ber 14th at 1 p.m. in the
regular-scheduled fiscal
court meeting. The fiscal
court reserves the right to
reject any and all bids. 38x1
Notice is hereby given that
Gail Kirby, 675 West Main
Street, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
lguardian of Jonathon Lee
Durham, a minor. Any per-
son having claims against
said appointment shall
present them, according to
law, to the said Gail Kirby
or to Hon. J erome S. Fish,
P.O. Box 1850, Mt. Vernon,
Ky. 40456 on or before
March 4, 2015 at 9:30 a.m.
38x2
Notice is hereby given that
Mayme Smallwood, 106
Rogers St., Berea, Ky.
40403 and Roxie Ambrose,
689 Scaffold Cane Road,
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456,
have been appointed co-ad-
ministrators of the estate of
Anna Lee Cope. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Mayme Smallwood and/or
Roxie Ambrose or Hon.
William D. Reynolds, 140
West Main St., P.O. Box
1250, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 on or before Mrch 2,
2015 at 11 a.m. 37x3
Notice is given that Mattie
Miller, 1709 Dry Fork Road,
Orlando, Ky. 40460 has
filed a final settlement of her
accounts as Executrix of the
estate of Chester Rose, de-
ceased. A hearing on said
settlement will be held Oc-
tober 1, 2014 at 11 a.m. Any

exceptions to said settle-
ment must be filed before
said date. 38x1
Notice is hereby given that
Peggy S. Falin, 75 West
Main St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
executrix of the estate of
Freda Alcorn. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Peggy S. Falin or Hon. John
D. Ford, Coffey & Ford,
PSC, P.O, Box 247, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456 by
March 4, 2015 at 9:30 a.m.
38x3

Mobile Home For Sale By
Owner. To be moved.
14x70, three bedrooms, two
full baths, fireplace. Asking
$10,500 or best offer. Call
6-6-872-1703. 37x2p

The Cumberland Valley
District Health Depart-
ment is accepting applica-
tions for a full time Local
Health Nurse 1-Home
Health position for
Rockcastle County Home
Health. Starting Salary:
$15.74/hr. or $1180.50 bi-
weekly (Grade 16). Appli-
cations and full listing of
qualifications may be ob-
tained at the Cumberlad
Valley District Health De-
partment, P.O. Box 158, 470
Manchester Square Shop-
ping Center, Suite 200,
Manchester, Ky 40962
(606) 598-5564 or online at
http://chfs.ky.gov/dph/
LHD.htm. Completed ap-
plication and transcript must
be returned by close of busi-
ness September 22, 2014 to
Cumberland Valley District
Health Department. Re-
sume will not substitute
for completed application.
Equal Opportunity Em-
ployer. Applicants and em-
ployees in this classification
may be required to submit
to a drug screening test and
background check. 38x1
Excellent Opportunity to
advance your career!
Malone Solutions is now
hiring for manufacturing
positions with a pay rate
between $9 and $13 per
hour. Apply online at
www.malonesolutions.com.

Brodhead Fire Department
is currently accepting BIDS
for fire fighting equipment.

For details, please contact
Brodhead City Hall

606-758-8635
7 West Main St.

Brodhead, Ky. 40409
All Bids should be turned back into City Hall by

2 p.m. September 29, 2014

Bids will be opened at 2:30 p.m.
September 29th at City Hall.



Morgan Plumbing
Service & Repair

New Construction •
Commercial & Residential Service

Fully Insured • All Work Guaranteed

256-4766 • 606-232-0666

Mechanic
On Duty

All Types of Repairs
We do muffler &

exhaust replacement and
custom pipe bending

BEE Garbage
256-2334

Weekly residential
curbside pickup

$1700 per month with Curb Cart

MPL #6761

5076 S Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

David’s Tire Center
24 Hr. Towing & Recovery LLC

1431 S. Wilderness Rd. (US 25)
Mt. Vernon

Save On All Major Brand
Tires For Cars & Trucks

Farm Tractors • Lawn & More

David & Josh Thompson, Owners
Office/24 Hr. Wrecker
606-256-4606

Town & Country
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE

All Types of Mechanic Work

Call 256-9634 days or
256-4650 nights

MADISON TERMITE
and PEST CONTROL
Call Paul Burton - Day or Night

256-2318 - Mt. Vernon
-----

STOP TERMITES  ROACHES  WATERBUGS

Winstead’s
Heating & Air

Pat Winstead
606-256-1038 • 606-308-4825

HM04434

On-Site
Computer

Service
Tired of sending your
computer

away to get
it fixed?

Call and let us come to
you for all your computer

needs!

Setup, Consultation,
Software/Hardware Conflicts

Virus/Spyware Removal

Reasonable Rates
Call

Spencer Benge
606-308-5653

Caudill Dump Truck Service
Rock • Gravel
Agr. Lime
Sand

Rock & Job Quotes
Driveway Spreading
Dumping/Stockpile

Contact for competitive pricing:
Myron - (606) 308-1387

Kentucky Auto Exchange
Public Auto Auction • Dealers Welcome

Every Saturday and Tuesday at 7 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
Located on Exit 38 in London on Hwy. 1006

(606) 878-7815

Financing Available
through Wells Fargo

*w/ approved credit

Visa, Mastercard,
Discover
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John’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’s
Repair

Appliance
& Plumbing

Faucet & Toilet
308-5646

John Tyler, Owner

Rocket Carpet
Cleaners

Circular Dry Foam Cleaning

(606) 256-9870

Thinking About Cleaning Your Carpet!
Some things to think about…

What is the best way to clean my carpet, should I use the
old technology of steam cleaning or the new technology

of dry foam?

Test results from Consumer Report, 2008.

Option 1: Steam Cleaning-How does it work?
A. Steam Cleaners saturate your carpet and floor pad with hot (150*
degree) soapy water containing lye and beach to help dissolve stains.

B. After your carpet reaches its maximum saturation point the solution
is then extracted by means of a commercial shop vacuum.

The results: Removes less than 20% of the soil from the carpet driving
the remainder down deeper into the carpet fibers.  The lye/bleach

solution used by steam cleaners to dissolve stains fades carpet colors.
Drying time is 1 to 5 days depending on the carpet texture.  As a result
of the water saturation, carpet fibers harden and the floor pad remains
damp, which promotes bacteria growth and mildewing, causing carpet

threads to rot, shorting the life of your carpet.  Carpet manufactures
recommend that you do not steam clean carpets.

Option 2: Dry Foam-How does it work?
C. Carpet fibers are agitated with carpet combs to separate the fibers
loosening dirt particles, which are then dry cleaned with an industrial

strength vacuum.
D. The carpet is then shampooed with horse hair brushes using

Dry-Foam lather, a solution that contains six different cleaners and
fabric softener, color brightener, deodorizer, disinfectant, crystalline

agent, scotch guard, & degreaser. Does not contain lye or bleach.
E. Carpet fibers are then groomed to fluff up worn walk areas to give a

uniform look to the carpet.
The results: Removes over 90% of carpet soil.  Rejuvenates and

brightens colors and patterns of carpets.  Drying times is less than 2
hours.  Floor pads remain dry-Fabric Softener makes carpets soft again-

Promoting the life of the carpet.
Carpet manufacturers recommend Dry Foam to clean Carpets.

Professional
Services

Heating & Air

COMPLETE HOME
COMFORT

Locally owned and Located at:

523 West St. • Brodhead, Ky.
Rodney Smith

758-0155 • 256-1683 • 859-661-5986
We service all Brands and Models • 20+ years experience

Free Estimates - Affordable Service - Call for Rates
Expert Installation & Troubleshooting • Friendly Hometown Service

Heat Pumps and Gas Furnaces
Fully Licensed and Insured HVAC and Electrical • MO-4808 and CE63779

Now Buying Junk Cars
Hauling off appliances for free!

Call Mike
(606) 308-2487

256-0122

Gutters Cleaned and Repaired

Yard Sales

Wanted

General Construction

Tiling • Flooring859-302-0197

PERRY’S Autobody &
Auto Rental Service

24/7 Wrecker Service Available
PERRY & AMY MINK PROPERTIES, LLC
Storage and Rental Units • 12x20 units fully lined floor to

ceiling & fenced for your security
Fairground Hill off Hwy. 150 • 110 Old Somerset Rd. Mt. Vernon

606-256-5198 or 606-308-1008

Jonathan Collins Remod-
eling and Repair Service.
Home improvements of any
kind from doors and win-
dows, painting, new floors
to roofs and decks - will do
it all. Any home, any prob-
lem, “we’re the one to call.”
606-308-3533. 37x4p
Owens Monument: Lo-
cated behind Owens Fu-
neral Home in Brodhead.
Open Mon-Fri. 8 to 5 and
Sat. 9 a.m. to noon. 606-
758-9600. 14xntf
Notice: Will haul off or buy
scrap metal, junk cars or
trucks. Metal hauled for
free. 231-6788. 14xntf
Grave Markers & Monu-
ments: In stock at all times.
McNew Monument Sales,
US 25, 4 miles north of Mt.
Vernon. Phone 256-2232.
U Call We Haul! Anything
that fits on a truck. Local or

long distance. Building -
demolition - moving -
clean-ups - bushhogging -
landscaping. No garbage.
606-256-9222 o4 308-1629.
35xntf
Gail’s Pampered Pooch
57 West Main St.,
Brodhead. For appt. call
606-758-0064

Yard Sale: Friday and Sat-
urday, 9 to 2 at 145 Joyce
St., home of Earl and Wanda
Cromer. Christmas tree and
decorations, Disney movies,
purses, bedspread and cur-
tains, golf clubs, luggage,
leaf blowers, cake pans.
Multi-Family Yard Sale:
Friday, Sept. 12th, 8:30 a.m.
to 4 p.m. and Sat., Sept.
13th, 8:30 a.m. to 2 p.m. at
2867 Spiro Road, Hwy.
1250. In the barn and yard
beside the home of Wayne
and Marie Bullock. Furni-
ture, old clocks, books,
glassware, trunks, tools and
lots of misc. items. Rain or
shine.
Moving Sale: Home of
Rissie Gentry Ballinger, 385
Floyd St., Mt. Vernon. An-
tique walnut buffet table and
chairs - good shape, baker’s
rack, antique bread pans,
some dishes, lots of men’s
and women’s clothes,
women’s jeans of all sizes.
Friday and Saturday, 9 to 5.

Two Family Sale: Sat.,
Sept. 13, 9 to 5, 170 Fair St.
Lots of winter things - kids,
women’s and men’s clothes.
Household items, pictures,
new stove door. Rain can-
cels.
4 Family Yard Sale: This
Saturday, 8 to 2 on
Maretburg Road. John
Deere riding mower, shoes,
clothes, purses and other
miscellaneous items includ-
ing three baby strollers and
much more.

Wanted to rent or lese pas-
ture ground for livestock.
859-329-8651. 38x2p
Will pay cash for old gas,
oil, dealerships, parts manu-
facturer signs, old gas
pumps, L&N collectibles,
anything regarding the

Cummins family from
Rockcastle County, John
Deere, International Har-
vester, antiques, etc. Com-
ing to Mt. Vernon the week
end of October 3-4, 2014.
Contact Kari Cummins
Ogle at 502-836-6922 with
any questions. 34x7
Wanted To Buy: Your an-
tiques and collectibles. An-
tique glassware, furniture,
quilts, all types of military
items, clocks, watches
(working or not), pocket
watches and wrist watch
parts, pocket knives, coins
and paper money. All types
of gold, silver scrap, cast
iron banks, toys, lighters,
crock jugs, cast iron skillets,
marbles, pocket knives,
fishing items, Indian Arrow-
heads, and much, much
more. Also buying partial
estates. Over 25 years expe-
rience. Call Clarence Reece
at 606-531-0467. 47xntf

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net
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Call today
for an

appointment
with

Dr. Jamie
Settles
Carter

Suffering From Foot
or Ankle Pain?

DIAGNOSIS & TREATMENT OF:
Diabetic Foot Care, Ingrown & Discolored Toenails,

Heel Pain, Corns & Calluses, Bunions
& Hammertoes,

Fractures & Sprains, Nerve Problens
(burning and tingling feet), Wound Care.

ALSO OFFERING:
Full Service Diabetic/Therapeutic Shoe Program

and Custom Made Insoles

929 N. Main St.
London, KY 40741
(606) 862-0956
(606) 864-0488

1007 Cumberland Falls Hwy.
Corbin, KY 40701
(606) 258-8637
(606) 258-8640

Monday - Friday 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Stop by and see
Marlene Lawson

for all your life and
health insurance needs!

(606)
256-2050

Visit us on the Internet at https://www.kyfb.com/rockcastle/insurance/

To Be Wed...
The parents of Christina A. Pendery and Anthony D.
Prewitt announce their forthcoming marriage on Sep-
tember 20, 2014. The ceremony will be held at The
Church of the Nazarene in Mt. Vernon.

30th Wedding Anniversary
The family of Johnny and Melinda Rader would like to
wish them a happy belated 30th Wedding Anniversary!
Love, Amanda, Johnathon, Melissa, and family!

One in eight women will
be diagnosed with breast
cancer in their lifetime, but
with early detection, the
five-year survival rate is up
to 98 percent.
Mammograms are an impor-
tant tool in early detection.
For women 40 and older
who are uninsured, Saint
Joseph Berea, part of
KentuckyOne Health, offers
Yes, Mamm, a program that
provides free or reduced
cost mammography screen-
ings for those who are eli-
gible.

The overall goal of the
Yes, Mamm Program is to
increase awareness of breast
health in the community and
to provide educational out-
reach to low income/
underserved population of
women.

“Annual mammograms
can be the difference be-
tween life and death,” said
Katie Heckman, Commu-
nity Relations Manager,
Saint Joseph Berea. “Re-

gardless of insurance cover-
age or ability to pay, we
want women in our commu-
nity to receive the screen-
ings they need to help them
lead long and healthy lives.”

Early detection by
mammograms leads to a
greater range in treatment
options, including less-ex-
tensive surgery and the use
of chemotherapy with fewer
side effects.

As of September 23,
2010, under the Affordable
Care Act, all new health in-
surance plans are required to
cover mammography with
no co-payment for women
ages 40 and older. For
women who are uninsured,
the Yes, Mamm Program
can help with out-of-pocket
costs.

“We do not want unin-
sured women to be left be-
hind,” said Heckman. “We
want all women to receive
the screenings they need. It’s
part of our mission to bring
wellness, healing and hope

“Yes, Mamm Program”
Free or reduced cost mammography screenings

Free to a good home:
Small to mid-sized male
mixed breed. (25 to 30
lbs) Part beagle - part ?.
Yellow/tan with white
blaze on face. Very
friendly. Good with other
dogs. This little guy
"found" us, but unfortu-
nately, we can't keep him.
Please help us find him a
good forever home. Call
256-9750.

to all.”
Saint Joseph Berea re-

cently opened a new, state-
of-the-art digital mammog-
raphy suite thanks to a gift
from the Saint Joseph Berea
Foundation. The Foundation
received a generous gift
from the family of Merle M.
Davis, who was a beloved
nurse, to create the Merle M.
Davis Digital Mammogra-
phy Suite at the hospital.

“I have had cancer, breast
surgery and radiation, so
you can be sure I have an-
nual mammograms and ad-
vise others to have annual
mammograms,” said Joyce
Henderson of Berea. “I am
delighted that Saint Joseph
Berea has the latest and most
discerning type of mammo-
gram machinery.”

For more information
about the Yes, Mamm Pro-
gram or to schedule a mam-
mogram, call 859.986.6587.
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By: Doug Ponder
A native Florida couple

recently opened an or-
ganic food and livestock
feed store on Main Street
in downtown Livingston.

Matthew and Noelle
Green of Tallahassee,
Florida bought a farm near
Livingston and moved
there in 2013. The couple
opened their store “The
Feed Store by Green
Acres” located at the
former Livingston
Motor’s building on Main
Street in Livingston.

The store officially
opened on Monday and
currently has several va-
rieties of Nutrena brand
organic livestock feed and
pet food for sale such as
horse feed, chicken feed,
deer corn, dog food, etc.
Matthew Green said they
will also start selling a va-
riety of organic foods in
the spring such as beef,
poultry, etc.

Green said he and his
wife came up with the idea
to open the store after
spending the last five
years researching about all
the harmful ingredients
that being introduced into
processed and genetically
modified foods.

“Our country can’t
even export our corn to

“The Feed Store by Green Acres” is now open on Main Street in downtown
Livingston at the former Livingston Motors building. Matthew and Noelle Green
officially opened the store on Monday. The store currentlly has several varieties
of organic livestock feed and pet food for sale such as horse feed, chicken feed,
deer corn, dog food, etc. The couple also plan to start selling a variety of organic
foods in the spring such as beef, poultry, etc.

Native Florida couple opens
organic food and livestock
feed store in Livingston

any other country because
they banned it due to it be-
ing genetically modified.
Then there are things being
fed to cattle and chickens to
increases their weight right
before they are slaughtered
because more weight means
more money. However, a lot
of these things that are fed
to these animals are not
meant for human consump-
tion,” Green said. “We have
always raised our own live-
stock and grown our own
produce so we got the idea
to open an organic food and
feed store. We want to help
give everyone the chance to
eat as healthy as we do and
show people where their
food comes from.”

Green said they started
researching online for a
place that would be best
suited for their store. He
said they looked at places in
Tennessee, Alabama,
Florida, Georgia and Ken-
tucky before finally discov-
ering Livingston.

“We saw the Livingston
Trail Town information on
the internet and decided to
come here to visit. Everyone
we met here was really nice
and gave us a sense of com-
munity feeling,” Green said.
“We also discovered that
they wanted better food for
themselves but that there

wasn’t an outlet for them.
So we decided this was the
place we wanted to start our
operation and raise our chil-
dren.”

Green said their family’s
motto is “happy animals
make happy meat.” He said
all their livestock is “free
range” and not cramped into
tight spaces.

“What the USDA con-
siders free range is having
livestock outside on a con-
crete floor for only one hour
a week. For the majority of
the time large numbers of
them are cramped into small
spaces which causes them to
be stressed,” Green said. “If
we are stressed it puts a lot
of toxins in our bodies. It is
no different for livestock
and when that happens to
them we are eating that.”

Green also said he is dis-
gusted with the fact of cor-
porations hiking the prices
on organic food as they are
trying to make it a commod-
ity. “Food prices have gone
up more than half of what it
should be and we will have
everything available here,
organically, at lower prices.
Organic isn’t a pricy com-
modity like they are making
it today. Actually steak
should be cheaper than

Mount Vernon Fire Department responded to a trailer fire last Thursday morning on Pine Hill Circle in Mt.
Vernon. The trailer, considered a total loss, was reportedly abandoned. No one was injured in the fire.

27 indicted; seven for
promoting contraband
into detention center

BES student seriously injured last Saturday

Illegally placed on state right of way

KYTC announces
removal of yard signs

By: Doug Ponder
A Brodhead Elementary

School student was seri-
ously injured last Saturday
after getting struck by a ve-
hicle while attempting to
cross a busy roadway.

Lucas Messer, 10, of

By: Doug Ponder
The Kentucky Transpor-

tation Cabinet recently an-
nounced that they will be
removing campaign signs
and other yard signs that are
illegally placed on state
highways in Rockcastle
County.

KYTC Information Of-
ficer Amber Hale said a
large number of campaign
and other yard signs have
recently been placed on
state right of ways in the
county. She said those yard
signs include anything from
campaign signs, yard sale
signs, advertising signs, etc.

Hale said that state law
and KYTC policy prohibits

Mt. Vernon council
sets tax rates for 2014

County Attorney’s
Office cracks down
on those behind
on child support

Brodhead was attempting to
cross the Cumberland Falls
highway in Corbin last Sat-
urday around 4 p.m. when
he was hit by a passing mo-
torist.

According to Corbin Po-
lice reports, Messer was try-

ing to cross both lanes of the
Cumberland Falls highway
to join another juvenile who
had already made it across
the busy roadway.

However, when Messer
attempted to cross the road
he was hit by a 2002 Nissan
Maxima driven by Jeannette
Butler of Covington. Wit-
nesses told officers that
Messer ran out into traffic
and that the driver didn’t
have time to respond.

Messer was transported
by ambulance to the Corbin
Arena parking lot where he
was then airlifted to the UK
Medical Center. Messer is

still being treated at the hos-
pital and sis currently listed
in stable condition. His in-
juries were unknown at the
time of publication.

The incident is still un-
der investigation by the
Corbin Police Department
and officer Steve Meadors
is in charge of the investi-
gation.

BES Principal Caroline
Graves said that BES staff
and students are also col-
lecting different items such
as get-well cards, snacks,
books, money and games tothe placement of any signs

on state right of way along
state highways. She said the
prohibition also includes
signs attached to utility
poles or fences.

Hale went on to say that
state highway crews are be-
ginning their fall mowing
operations and that the signs
delay the crews. She also
said the signs pose a poten-
tial hazard to motorists as
they distract drivers and also
restrict their sight distance
in certain areas.

KYTC policy calls for
the removed signs in
Rockcastle County to be

At Monday night’s regu-
lar meeting of the Mt.
Vernon City Council,
councilmembers approved
the first readings of ordi-
nances which set the tax rate
for real property and motor
vehicles for 2014.

This year’s rate will be
16.9 cents per $100 assess-
ment for real property and
16.7 cents per $100 assess-
ment for motor vehicles.

By: Doug Ponder
Rockcastle County At-

torney Billy Reynolds re-
cently announced that his
office recently issued 21 ar-
rest warrants for flagrant
non-support.

According to  KRS
530.050, flagrant non-sup-
port is a Class D felony
charge that means a person
is behind  in their court-or-
dered payments in an
amount over $1,000 or they
have gone six consecutive
months without any pay-
ment of support to an indi-
gent spouse, indigent parent,

a minor child or a child who
is declared mentally dis-
abled.

Reynolds said the total
amount of support  unpaid
by the twenty-one charged
with flagrant non-support
was over $275,000, which
is an average of approxi-
mately $13,095 each.

“These people could
have reasonably provided
the financial support that is
required of them but they
simply chose not to do it
and in these cases it’s the

27 people were indicted
by a Rockcastle County
Grand Jury last Friday,
seven of them for promot-
ing contraband (controlled
substance) into the
Rockcastle County jail.

Most of the other indict-
ment were for a variety of
charges, including eight on
drug charges.

Indicted for the offense
of promoting contraband
(controlled substance) into
the Rockcastle County De-
tention Center were:

Willliam Brandon
Cromer, 25, of Sand Springs
Road, Mt. Vernon. His bond
was set at $20,000 cash/
property;

Maranda Richard, 32 of
Sand Springs Road, Mt.
Vernon. Her bond was also
set at $20,000 cash/prop-
erty; and

James Willis, 25, Elliott
Dooley, 35 and Mitchel

Mayor Mike Bryant told
the council the rate was the
lowest it could be without
losing revenue. Last year’s
rate was 16.6 cents per $100
assessment but, Bryant said,
the city’s property value as-
sessment decreased. “We
are trying to think about tax-
payers but we obviously
can’t go backwards,”

Dooley, 30, all of Mt.
Vernon, along with Robert
Tillery, 32 and Jacquelyn
Allen-Dees, 36, both of
Berea were named in a joint
lindictment.

Willis, whose bond was
set at $25,000 cash/prop-
erty, was indicted for pro-
moting contraband into the
detention center.

Both Dooley men,
Tillery and Allen-Dees were
indicted for complicity to
promote contraband and
their bond was set at
$10,000 cash/property
each.

Others indicted in-
cluded:

Linda R. Gadd, 44 and
Brittany J. Cope, 26, both
of Berea were named in the
same indictment on two
counts. They were indicted
for possession of a con-

(Cont. to A8)
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Points
East

By Ike Adams

(Cont. to A4)

The Thin Thirty
When my grandfather

(Pop) purchased his first
television set in 1953, I in-
stantly became a fan of foot-
ball on the small black and
white screen. Pop and I
loved to watch the Cleve-
land Browns and especially
running back, Jim Brown.
Brown is best known for his
record-setting nine-year ca-
reer for the NFL. He is
widely considered to be one
of the greatest professional
athletes in the history of
football.

With high school in the
rear-view mirror, I drove off
to college ready to begin my
next adventure. My love of
football continued in 1962
when I enrolled as a fresh-
man at the University of
Kentucky. I remember well
receiving my UK student
identification card, which
allowed me to attend all UK
football and basketball
games simply by showing
my ID to the ticket takers at
the front gate. It was a huge
thrill to have “season tick-
ets” to all home games. I
could hardly wait for Satur-
day to roll around. Sitting in
the student section of Stoll
Field was something that
this former student could
never forget. Instead of
watching football on televi-
sion, I was able to be a part
of the excitement of actual
game-day activities.

The 1962 UK football
team was called The Thin
Thirty. The new football
coach, Charlie Bradshaw,
believed in brutal condition-
ing; he had a practice regi-
ment that thinned the squad
of eighty-eight players to
only thirty. Even though the
team’s record was 3-5-2, it
included a dramatic victory
in the season finale against
Tennessee in Knoxville, 12-
10.

The first game that I ac-
tually saw as a freshman
was against Florida State,
which ended in a tie (0-0).
The game was extremely
exciting because UK was
expected to lose. I had
never been part of a student
body with that many fans
in the stands. When the fi-
nal horn signaled the end of
the game, the student body
was on their feet glad that
we had not been dealt a
loss.

In Lexington, the Cats
lost the next two home
games to Auburn and LSU
before defeating the
Vanderbilt Commodores
by a score of 7-0. You
would have thought that we
had won the SEC by the re-
action of the fans in Stoll
Field. We were defeated by
Xavier by a score of 9-14
in front of a sold-out crowd
in the next game.

The final game was
against the Volunteers of
Tennessee, and the Cats
were successful with a
score of 12-10. As those of
you who are UK fans
know, wins against Tennes-
see in football are ex-
tremely rare, and it was a
topic of student discussion
for several weeks. The win
was the result of a field
goal by Clarkie Mayfield,
who was declared the hero
of the game. (Mayfield
later died in the Beverly
Hills Supper Club fire on
May 28, 1977.) Other play-
ers on that team included
Tom Hutchinson, Dale
Lindsey, and Herschel
Turner – all of whom later
played in the NFL.

I will never forget the
antics of the home fans in
Stoll Field. One game in
particular stands out in my
mind. Several of the stu-

T.J.’s
Journal
by: Tonya J. Cook

Remembering
"Uncle" Paul

Dear Journal,
Isn't it funny how some-

times you'll be sitting
around and the thought of
somone from long ago, from
your childhood, will come
to mind. Oh, how I wish I
could see some of them
again! We'd have so much
to catch up on and things to
talk about. A lot of things
can happen in forty or fifty
years.

Just the other day I re-
called an elderly gentleman
who lived across the road
from us there in the Swiss
Colony, west of London. It
was a small, tight-knit com-
munity where most people
were related or it seemed
that we were. I suppose ev-
ery little rural hamlet is the
same. All had a few elderly
couples who, over the years,
had endeared themselves to
everybody  in the commu-
nity. This is the case of
"Uncle" Paul and his wife,
"Aunt" Minnie, as they were
known. Today, I'll just focus
on "Uncle" Paul.

I never knew him when
he was young, but to me he
had been old all of my life.
He was tall, probably a little
over six feet, but due to age
he was slightly slumped and
walked with a shuffling
motion.

Now, Uncle Paul and
Aunt Minnie had a big farm
with several cows, hogs,
chickens, and various crops.
I liked to visit them and go
to milk with them in their
barn in the late evening.
They had two or three barn
cats that ate mice and drank
fresh milk. I petted the cats
as Uncle Paul and Aunt
Minnie milked.

Then would come the
best part. We all would go
back to their house and I ate
all of the cookies and milk I
could hold. Aunt Minnie al-
ways had plenty of cookies
and homemade cheese.

Uncle Paul was a quiet
man who spoke in a reverant
tone, always ready to break
out in prayer at the drop of
a hat. He often spoke with
his eyes closed as if envi-
sioning something heavenly
or receiving devine mes-
sages not of this world.
They were religious to a
fault, attending every ser-
vice at the local Baptist
church. Uncle Paul always
sat on the left side near the
aisle, about the second pew
back. He was hard of hear-
ing, so he always sat on the
edge of his seat with one
hand cupped over his ear,
always smiling with his gold

tooth gleaming and nodding
in agreement as the preacher
spoke. Not another word
was ever spoken except for
Uncle Paul's periodic
"Amen". He invented the
"Amen corner".

I accompanied this old
couple to church services
many times if no one in our
family was attending that
day. They always doted on
the neighborhood children,
usually giving them candy,
gum, or a little loose change.
They loved Halloween more
than the children, always
making a big deal over their
costume. Uncle Paul even
drove me around one Hal-
loween to trick-or-treat
when I didn't have a ride.
This act of kindness was
nothing unusual as they
were often the first to re-
spond in the event of sick-
ness or death in a family or
when a house burned and a
family lost every thing they
had. The list could go on and
on.They were always good
to give little kids like me
gifts for their birthday and
Christmas, too.I still have
many things they gave me.

Uncle Paul had a late
1950s or early 1960s black
Ford Fairlane that he
drove...at no more than 30
or 40 miles per hour at any
given time. It had a red and
white interior. I can still see
it going up the road at a
snail's pace.

One summer evening at
dusk I went outside to get in
a little more play time. I was
about six or seven years old.
I looked over toward Uncle
Paul's and Aunt Minnie's
house and their son, who
was known to drink, was
beating them unmercifully
in their yard. I ran inside to
tell my mother. She called
the police and then she
called the little local general
store about a half mile away.
She told them what was go-
ing on and to send any able
bodied men to come quick.
The store was a hang out for
locals to talk, play cards or
checkers. Well, aunt and
uncle had managed to get
away and drove to our
house. They were covered in
mud, dirt and grass. Their
clothes were tattered and
torn. They were covered in
blood and their eyes black.
Aunt Minnie's waist length
hair she always wore in a
bun on top of her head was
bloody and hanging in
pieces. Uncle was put to bed
as he was almost dead. The
ambulances, police and
neighbor men all arived
about the same time. The

(Cont. to A4)

About mid summer, just
over a year ago, I got an en-
velope in the mail with a
little packet of tomato seed
my pal, Fred Beste, had sent
me, along with a heads up
on the notion that he might
have recently discovered the
world’s greatest tomato
there in Wind Gap, Pennsyl-
vania.

Anyway, I dutifully
planted a few seeds, then
and there, in peat pots, and
poured on the MiraclegGro,
morning noon and night.
But I’d shot up all my left-
over firecrackers running
rabbits off the place and ir-
ritating neighbors  before I
actually got any “Giant Syr-
ians” set out the garden and
the bunnies love nothing
better than late green toma-
toes..

And, in case you all don’t
remember, winter started
here, right after the first of
October last year.  Fred’s
maters didn’t have a fight-
ing chance to prove them-
selves, red, last fall, but they
made a wonderful mess in
the skillet when I sliced
them up, smothered them in
yellow corn meal and fried
them, green,  with a handful
of basil  leaves and, olive oil,
so hot you could light a
match on the fumes, in a cast
iron skillet.

Or I could pour some
wine in the skillet and strike
a match to it if I wanted to-
mato flambeau’.   Next time
I am at the Wind Gap Diner
I intend to order ” tomatoe
flambeau a’la scrappele”,
which, loosely translated,
means,  “ bad lard gone
badder with fried tomato”  I
figure they will give ne an
extra helping  of sausage
gravy and an extra biscuit
with my eggs if I tell them I
know Fred, who is actually
better known to them as,
“that scrapple guy who
leaves big tips”.

As it happened, I only
used about half the seed in
2013 and kept plenty for
starting early this past April.
By the time they were big
enough to put in the garden
in late May, I had already
purchased and transplanted
several  nursery plants in the
garden.  One or more of the
“brought on” plants carried
a fast acting blight which
spread like cholera on an
18th century sailing ship, to
all the other plants.  My
baby Giant Syrians were
particularly susceptible to
the disease and all 8 of them,
along with several other
heirlooms, died during the
first night of the epidemic.

I discovered that I still
had three seeds left in Fred’s
envelope.  To make a long
story short, I didn’t get them
planted until about the end
of May, nor did I get them
into 10-gallon planters, well
away from all others,  until
the first of July, at which
point we already had
Burpee’s Big Boys getting
ripe.

If all you have, in the way
of maters, are Big Boys, you
soon come to realize that
they are way better than hav-
ing no maters at all.  Still,
during July and August we
have enjoyed a variety of
maters, including West Vir-
ginia Hillbillies, Indiana
Heartthrobs, Brandywines,
Pineapples, Big Beef and
Mortgage Lifters along with
the Big Boys.

Loretta and my kids have
told me several times this
summer that Mortgage
Lifters are the best tomato
they have ever tasted and I
can tell you, for sure, that
not a single one has gone to
waste.

Of course that was all
before I picked the first ripe
Giant Syrian on Labor Day.
It may well have been the
ugliest tomato I have ever
seen.  Its face looked a lot
like that of Winston
Churchill’s bull dog and its
wrinkled shoulders refused
to ripen beyond dark green.
It also lived up to the “Gi-
ant” part if its name.  I didn’t
weigh it but I do know a two
pound tomato when I see
one and this one was larger
than that.

Loretta sliced off its ugly
face, dumped it in the gar-
bage, and proceeded to ren-
der the rest if it, down to its
ugly, withered, shoulders
into slabs that would nearly
cover the surface of a din-
ner plate.  We each took big

(Cont. to A4)
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Jr.
Middleton
Jr. Middleton, 66, of Mt.

Vernon, died Monday, Sep-
tember 15, 2014 at his resi-
dence. He was born in Mt.
Vernon, on August 28,
1947, a son of the late Wil-
liam Robert and Geneva
Bell Middleton. He was a
member of the Baptist Faith
and the Mt. Vernon VFW.
He was a Supervisor at
Parker Seals with 20+ years
of service. He retired from
driving the Rockcastle Co.
school bus after 16 years of
service, most notably he
was the driver to escort the

Rockcastle Co.
girls basketball
team to the state
championship in

2011. He served his coun-
try in the Air Force during
the Vietnam Era. He will be
remembered for the love of
4-wheeling, mowing,
Rockcastle sports, and most
of all riding around with his
granddaughter, Lacey.

He is survived by: his
children, Shanda (Bobby)
Hayes of Mt. Vernon and
his son, Brian (Ashley)
Middleton of Berea; two
grandchildren, Lacey
Michelle Hayes and Casey
Hayes; one brother, Cledith
Ray (Barbara) Thacker of
Roundstone; four sisters,
Brenda (Gary) Smith of Mt.
Vernon, Joyce Dorsey of El
Paso, TX, Georgia Faye
(Bobby) Blanton of Rich-
mond, and Lucy (Mark)
Taylor of Burlington; and a
host of nieces/nephews,
friends and neighbors.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by:
one sister, Dessie Lynn
Bullock.

Funeral services will be
held at 1 p.m. (today)
Thursday, September 18,
2014 at the Marvin E.
Owens Home for Funerals
Chapel with Bro. Jack
Stallsworth and Danny
McKibben officiating.
Burial will follow in the
Meret Cemetery.

Casketbearers will in-
clude: Glenn Smith, Darrell
Collins, Casey Hayes, J.C.
Harris, Jeremy Bullock,
Leo Hayes, Kevin Bradley
and Jerry Reynolds.

Honorary bearers will
be: Gary Smith, Chris
Blanton, Darrin Blanton,
Mark Taylor, Bobby
Blanton, Darrell Allen, and
Chris Cornelius.
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.comwww.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Ray Mack
Lunceford
Ray Mack Lunceford,

72, of Brodhead, died
Wednesday, September 3,
2014 at University of Ken-
tucky Medical Center in
Lexington. He was born in
Brodhead, on November 3,
1941, a son  of the late
Cossie Sutton Lunceford
and Bessie Loraine
Reynolds Lunceford.  He
was a member of the Shep-
herd s Church and he will
be remembered for his love
fishing, baseball, basketball,
farming, cattle and bird
watching.

He is survived by: his
wife of 51 years, Pamela
Petrey Lunceford of
Brodhead; his son, Danny
Lunceford of Brodhead; a
daughter, Barbara
Lunceford of Brodhead; a
grandchild, Alisa
Lunceford; a brother, John
(Caroline) Lunceford of
Evansville, IN; two sisters,
Ella Mae DeBoard of
Brodhead, and Lucinda
(Jim) Hohimer of Beaver
Dam; a sister-in-law, Wanda
Lunceford of Brodhead; and
a host of nieces/nephews,
friends and neighbors.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by: a
brother, Gilbert Lunceford;
and three sisters, Evelyn
Kennedy, Ina Grace and
Loretta Bowling.

Funeral services were
conducted Saturday, Sep-
tember 6, 2014 at the
Marvin E. Owens Home for
Funerals Chapel with
Bros.Randal Adams and
Jim Hohimer  officiating.
Burial was in the Piney
Grove          Cemetery.

Expressions of sympathy
may take with form of con-
tributions to the Ray Mack
Lunceford Burial Fund, P.O.
Box 658, Brodhead, KY.
40409
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Betty Moore
Betty Moore, 80, of

Brodhead, died Tuesday,
September 16, 2014 at her
residence.

Funeral services will be
conducted Friday, Septem-
ber 19, 2014 at 12 noon at
the Marvin E. Owens Home
for Funerals Chapel. Burial
will follow in the Debord
Cemetery.

Visitation will be (today)
Thursday, September 18,
from 6-9 p.m. at the Marvin
E. Owens Home for Funer-
als Chapel.
Condolences to the family may be

made to her online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Jim Bussell
Jim Bussell, 63, of

Brodhead, died Tuesday,
September 9, 2014. He was
born January 16, 1951 in
Cincinnati, OH, a son of the
late Dealva and Mary
Helton Bussell. He was a 28
year  Regional Administra-
tor  of the  Department of
Natural Resources. He was
a member of the Baptist
faith, and the Rockcastle
Football Hall of Fame. He
played softball with the Wa-
ter Dogs for 15 years. He
found great joy in hunting,
fishing, yard sales,
Rockcastle County Rockets
sports and Eastern Ken-
tucky University baseball.

On May 27, 1972 he was
united in holy matrimony to
Nancy Ackerman and from
that union came three chil-
dren, Angie , J.D. and Der-
rick .

He will be lovingly re-
membered by: his wife of
42 years, Nancy Bussell of
Brodhead;  his children,
Angie Hendrickson of Mt.
Vernon, J.D. (Gina) Bussell
of Brodhead, and Derrick
(Leslie) Bussell of Rich-
mond; his grandchildren,
Ainsley Bussell, Evan
Hendrickson, Alexa
Bussell, Ella Bussell and
Adeline Bussell; his broth-
ers, Rick Bussell of
Brodhead and Barry Bussell
of Lexington; his sisters,
Teresa Bussell, and Mary
Ann Childress, both of
Brodhead; and a host of
nieces/nephews, friends and
neighbors.

Funeral services were
conducted Friday, Septem-
ber 12, 2014 at Brodhead
Baptist Church. Burial was
in Piney Grove Cemetery.

Those acting as
casketbearers were: Mark
Bray, Spencer Childress, Bo
Lykins, Vince Gohs, Brian
McKinley, Tony Ackerman,
Mike Wilson, Church
Frank, Dustin Gohs, Aron
Cash, Andrew Cash and
Colby Brown.

Honorary casketbearers
were: Lee Earl Adams,
George Bishop, James
"Bear" Bradley, Ronnie
Brown, Clayton Cash, Bill
Lykins, Charlie Norris,
Howard Saylor, Johnny
Boon Saylor, Kerry Smith,
Jeff Taylor, Wayne Todd,
Dan Walters, and all the
friends at the Dari Delite in
Brodhead.

The family ask in lieu of
flowers, donations can be
given to the National Kid-
ney Foundation.
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Earnest E.
Sturgill

Earnest E. Sturgill, 84, of
Louisville, died Monday,
September 8, 2014. He was
born in Orlando, on Septem-
ber 18, 1929, a son of the
late William and Della
Rader Sturgill. He was a 36
year employee at LGE in
Louisville, and was a mem-
ber of the Hillview Baptist
Church.  He found great joy
in gardening and fishing.
On August 5, 1950 he was
united in holy matrimony to
Emma Jean Kirby and from
that union came two chil-
dren-Diana and Tina.

Those left to cherish his
memory include: his wife of
64 years, Emma Jean
Sturgill of Louisville; his
daughters, Diana (Roger)
Pierce of Mt. Vernon and
Tina Milam of Louisville;
his grandchildren, Brian
Napier, Christie Brown,
Stephanie Cummings,
Kristin Bramer and Mikayla
Smith; his great grandchil-
dren, Savanah Cummings,
Addison Bramer,  Ashley
Napier, and Callie and
Mathew Wallin; his brother,
Charley (Willa) Sturgill of
Mt. Vernon; his sisters,

Maudie Mae Thomas and
Alice Pauline (Leonard)
Eversole, all of East
Bernstadt; and a host of
nieces/nephews, friends and
neighbors.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by a
sister, Dorothy Singleton.

Funeral services were
held September 13, 2014
with Bro. Allen Hensley of-
ficiating. Burial was in the
Mafaffey Cemetery in
Livingston.

Those acting as
casketbearers were: Mat-
thew Wallin, Brian Napier,
Steven Cummings, Roger
L. Pierce, Bill Shackelford,
and Jason Bramer.
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Denver
Phelps

Denver Phelps, 78, of
Mt. Vernon, died Thursday,
September 11, 2014 at the
Rockcastle Health & Reha-
bilitation Facility in
Brodhead after a brief ill-
ness. He was born March 1,
1936 in Mt. Vernon, a son
of the late George and
Martha Kirby Phelps. He
was a member of the Church

Michael Childress
Words cannot begin to

express our sincere thanks
to everyone during the re-
cent illness and death of our
loved one, Michael
Childress.  Mike found out
he had stage four lung can-
cer in May and almost im-
mediately help starting
pouring in.  From “Cold
Water” challenges to
prayers we were blessed.
Mike was humbled by all
the attention given to him.
Your prayers meant so
much to him and prayers
were all he ever asked for.

We want to thank every-
one who prayed, gave
money, brought food, sent
cards and flowers. Thanks
to Rockcastle Regional
Hospital for the good care
he received. Thanks to Bro.
Ralph Baker for his com-
forting words spoken at the
funeral. Thanks to Brooke
Bishop for singing Mike’s
favorite songs. Thanks to
Cox Funeral home for see-

of Christ and found great
joy in visiting with friends
and being with people. He
was affectionately known as
the “Mayor of Pongo”.

He will be lovingly re-
membered by: his brother,
Conley (Zona) Phelps of
Lebanon, IN; his sister,
Doris Palmer of Mason,
OH; as well as a host of
nieces/nephews, friends and
neighbors; and a special
niece, Sheary Caldwell of
Brodhead.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by:
four brothers, William E.
Phelps, James T.Phelps,
Charles E. Phelps, and Rob-
ert E. Phelps; and two sis-
ters, Mildred Childress and
Arlene Bean.

Funeral services were
held Sunday, September 14,
2014 at the Marvin E.
Owens Home for Funerals
Chapel with Bro. Gary
Reppert officiating. Burial
was in the Phelps Cemetery.

Casketbearers were:
Michael Phelps, James
"Lawrence" Greg Phelps,
Randy Palmer, Steve
Phelps, Dale Childress, Jus-
tin Phelps and Jeffrey
Palmer.

Honorary casketbearers
were: Buzz Carloftis,
Bobbie Saylor, Opia Wynn,
and Kevin Roberts.

Condolences  to the family may
be made to his online registry at

www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

ing that our wishes were
granted. Thanks to Amy
Hopkins, and Shay Barnett
for taken over and seeing
that everyone was fed and
cared for. We can’t thank
everyone individually be-
cause there’s not enough
room in this newspaper for
that.

We love this community
and wouldn’t want to live
anywhere else.  We can rest
at ease knowing Mike is in
a better place and also
knowing that if we need
anything, someone will
hurry to assist.  Whenever
anyone asked Mike if they
could help, he would say, “If
you have time, just say a
little prayer for us.”  We
know that hundreds of you
did just that. Again, thank
you to everyone. We are
truly blessed.

Myrna, Kyle, Melanie,
Neil and Ashley Childress
along with the rest of the

family of Michael
Childress

Card of Thanks
Local Leo Club
collecting printer
cartridges/old
cell phones

The Leo Club’s project
for October and November
is to collect used printer car-
tridges and old cell phones
for Camp Crescendo, lo-
cated in Lebanon Junction.

The camp is for the
blind, hearing impaired and
other disabled childred.

The Lions Club of Ken-
tucky sponsors disabled
youth for this camp every
summer. In May of this
year, the Livingston Leo
Club went to Camp Cre-
scendo for a weekend to do
volunteer work to get the
camp ready for the summer

All proceeds from the
recycling project will go to-
ward operation of Camp
Crescendo. There are three
drop-off locations: D&S
Computers, the Sheriff’s
Dept. at the courthouse and
Happy Trails Diner in
Livingston.
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Dear Editor,
My grandson bought an

Aussie-Dale puppy from
Adventure Pets in Berea on
Sept. 3, just last Wed.

The little pup was fine
until the weekend when it
started showing signs of
Parvo and died on Monday
morning before he had time
to take it to the vet.

A sign at the store states
that the dogs have already
been given their first shots

Be careful when
buying pets from
pet store...

Our Readers Write

and have been dewormed.
This particular puppy

was not treated for worms
or given its first shots until
my grandson made the pay-
ment.

After speaking with
someone from PETA, we
were advised to make the
public aware of this by use
of the media. Please print
this so others will not go
through what we have. This
puppy did not deserve this,
and no other pet should ei-
ther.
Heartbroken in Brodhead,
Kathleen Bretz and family

Fall Color in the Forest
Kentucky’s forests are

home to one of the most di-
verse hardwood species
mixes in the United States,
second only to Florida. With
more than 12 million acres
of forests, a rainbow of color
is on display in Kentucky
almost every fall.

The intensity of fall color
and time of peak color vary
and depend upon complex
environmental factors, as
well as the genetic makeup
of the plants themselves.
What happens to leaves in
the fall that produces the
colors we love so much? In
summer, leaves are green
because of a group of pig-
ments known as
chlorophylls. Chlorophylls
are vital to the tree's food-
making process, called pho-
tosynthesis. Leaves manu-
facture simple sugars from
water and carbon dioxide,
using energy captured from
the sun by chlorophylls.
These sugars are the sole
source of carbohydrates
needed for the tree's growth
and development.

In the food-making pro-
cess, chlorophylls break
down and are continually
"used-up." The tree, how-

ever, replenishes them all
through the growing season.
As long as replacement re-
mains high, the leaves stay
green. As fall approaches,
influences inside and out-
side the plant cause chloro-
phyll to be replaced at a
slower rate.

Shorter days cause a
layer of cork cells to form
at the base of each leaf,
gradually closing off the
flow of water and minerals
into the leaf. This is the lo-
cation where the leaf will
eventually separate from the
tree and fall to the ground.
As the supply of chlorophyll
dwindles, other pigments
that may have been present
in the leaf all along are
slowly unmasked and begin
to show through.

Unmasked pigments in-
clude the carotenoids, which
result in brilliant yellows
and oranges. Some trees
where carotenoids are con-
spicuous include ash, maple,
aspen, birch, black cherry,
cottonwood, tulip tree and
sycamore.

Another group of pig-
ments, called anthocyanins,
are responsible for the reds,
purples and blended combi-
nations of these colors. Un-

like the carotenoids, these
pigments have not been
present in the leaf all season.
Instead, they develop in late
summer in the sap of the leaf
cells. Their formation de-
pends on the breakdown of
sugars in the presence of
bright light while the level
of phosphate in the leaf is
reduced.

Phosphate is at a high
level during the growing
season, but in autumn it
moves out of the leaf and
into the stem of the plant.
When this happens, the
sugar breakdown process
changes and that leads to the
production of anthocyanin
pigments. The brighter the
light, the more anthocyanins
are produced and the more
brilliant the color. The
brightest colors develop
when autumn days are
sunny and cool, along with
cool, frost-free nights. Col-
ors may be less vibrant af-
ter an early frost.

Leaf color can also be a
helpful way to identify trees.
Here’s a legend for a few of
your favorites:

•Blackgum – bright red,
orange or purple

•Birch – bright yellow
•Black Walnut – yellow,

yellow-brown
•Scarlet Oak – scarlet red
•White Oak – yellow,

yellow-brown, red, red-
brown

•Hickory – golden
bronze

•Poplar – gold, yellow
•Red Maple – scarlet red
•Sugar Maple – orange-

red, yellow
•Sourwood – deep crim-

son red
•Dogwood – red, bur-

gundy, purple
•Sassafras – yellow, or-

ange, pink, red
•Winged Sumac – Red,

maroon, purple
A fun site on which to

follow fall foliage reports is
www.kentuckytourism.com/
seasons/reports/.

Farm and Home News

Tom Mills
Rockcastle County Extension Office

Fall color in the forest

PEACH COBBLER
This is one of Will’s fa-

vorites. Whenever Judy
knows that he will be com-
ing to Mt. Vernon with me,
she usually makes this for
him.  Don’t tell her, but, it is
one of my favorites also.
3 cups canned peaches,
sliced, undrained
1 cup milk
1 cup sugar
1 stick butter or margarine
1 cup self-rising flour
Pour peaches in medium
saucepan.  Heat until
bubbles form around edges
of pan.  Do not boil.  Turn
off heat.  Preheat oven to
350°.  Put butter into a 9 x
13 cake pan.  Put in oven
until butter melts.  In a bowl,
mix sugar, milk, and flour
together until smooth.
Slowly pour batter over
melted butter.  Spoon
peaches on top of batter and
gently pour juice over
peaches.  Do not stir.  Bake
for 30 to 35 minutes.  As it
bakes, batter will rise to top
and fruit will be on the bot-
tom and peeking up through
the batter.
NOTE:  Can also use fresh
peaches, hot sweetened
blackberries, blueberries, or
cherries.

STRAWBERRY CAKE
For most of my young

life, Mum bought my birth-

day cake from Burke’s Bak-
ery in Danville, Kentucky.
After we moved away from
Danville, I started asking
Mum to fix this cake as my
birthday cake.
1 box white cake mix
1 box (10 ounce) frozen
strawberries, thawed
1/2 cup vegetable oil
1/2 cup water
2 eggs
1 box (3 ounce) strawberry
Jello®
1 teaspoon vanilla
Preheat oven to 350°.  Pour
cake mix in large bowl.
Chop strawberries, measure
out 3/4 cup, add to cake mix
along with oil and water,
mixwell.  Set aside remain-
ing strawberries to use in
frosting.  Add eggs, one at a
time, beating well after
each.  Add dry Jello® and
vanilla; beat well.  Pour into
greased and floured 13 x 9
cake pan.  Bake about 40
minutes at 350°.  Cool.
FROSTING:
1 teaspoon vanilla
1 box (1 pound) powdered
sugar
1 stick butter, room tem-
perature
Combine confectionery
sugar, butter and remaining
strawberries in mixing bowl
until well blended.  Spread
over warm cake.

Mamaw’s Kitchen
By Regina Poynter Hoskins

“Journal”
(Cont. from A2)

couple were taken to the
hospital and were alright in
a few days. The police had
a lot of questions for me. I
guess I can remember a lot

dents at Hagan Hall decided
to take bags of oranges to eat
during the game. After suck-
ing the juice out of the or-
anges, we responded to a
bad call by the referees by
tossing the fruit onto the
field, directly in his direc-
tion. The game was stopped
immediately, and we heard
the announcement that any-
one throwing debris on the
field would be promptly re-
moved from the premises.
Of course, I refrained from
those pranks after that.

I was excited to be a Cat
fan during the season of the
Thin Thirty. It was a vast
difference from watching
the Mt. Vernon Red Devils
to witnessing the Cats at
Stoll Field. Those were the
days of students being the
prime supporters of UK
football. I was there, and the
memory will be forever
etched in my mind.

And, as always, Go Cats!

bites out of it and simply
stared at each other until my
wife finally exclaimed,
“Now that’s  what you call
a real tomato”!

So, over the last couple
of weeks, we have let a
bushel or more of all the
other varieties rot there in
the garden, or we have given
them to friends and family
while we wait for the next
Giant Syrian to ripen.

I have promised Fred that
I will get one to our mutual
friend, colleague and tomato
gourmet, Tom Miller, there
in Berea before they are all
gone and I certainly intend
to let one over-ripen so that
I can save a bunch of seed.

In the meantime, if any-
one had told me, before this
year, that I could be out-
tomatoed by a yankee, I
would have laughed in his
face.  But I’m here to fess
up.  My buddy’s Giant Syr-
ian has pulled it off. I still
find it hard to believe that
anything so ugly can taste so
good.

I’ve looked on the
internet for Giant Syrian to-
mato seed and found nearly
a dozen listings, ten of
which do not closely re-
semble the one Fred sent
me.  If you do your own
search, you will get the same
result.  Only the biggest,
ugliest, ones with green
shoulders are apt to be the
real McCoy.  I will find out
where Fred found his and
pass the word before next
year.

of bad with the good.
Uncle Paul was truly a

good man. I've never known
but very, very few  people
of his character. He had
even earned the title of
"Apostle"Paul by many
who knew him.

Uncle Paul had a bad
heart and one day in my
sophomore year of high
school, his heart gave out
and he died. I still regret not
attending his funeral. There
was an important test that
day at school. There have
been many important tests
since, but only one "Uncle
Paul".

“Points East”
(Cont. from A2)

“Memories”
(Cont. from A2)

Commemorating 9/11...
Each year, Cash Express commemorates 9/11 by hon-
oring those who died and to thank those first respond-
ers -- police officers, firefighters and emergency medi-
cal personnel who continue to protect our communi-
ties. Personnel from the company delivers cakes and
cupcakes to all first responders on the anniversary of
that fateful day. Shown in the above photo are, from
left: Emily Cromer, asst. manager Cash Express, Mt.
Vernon Fire Chief David Bales, Mt. Vernon firefighter
Brian Wynn and Cash Express Manager Jessica
Southard.

2014 Corolla prize available

September blood donors
can save lives, win big

Donors who save a
Kentuckian’s life in Sep-
tember are eligible to win
a 2014 Toyota Corolla!

The Toyota giveaway,
provided with help by
Toyota on Nicholasville,
runs through Sept. 30th
and everyone who regis-
ters to give blood is auto-
matically entered to win
(must be 18 or older to
win).

Area donors are invited
to give so others may live
at the upcoming blood
drive to be held at Mt.
Vernon First Baptist
Church in the gym on
Tuesday, Sept. 23rd from
1:30 to 6:30 p.m.

To schedule a donation,
visit kybloodcenter.org or
call 800-775-2522.

Blood donors must be
17 years old (16 with pa-

Shown above are Ruby Deloris Marler Alcorn and
Orville Alcorn in a picture taken in Mt. Vernon over
65 years ago. Mrs. Alcorn was known as Texas Ruby
and Orville as Texas Tex. The couple is still happily
married and reside in Mt. Vernon. Love, your daugh-
ter, Cynthia.

rental concent), weigh at
least 110 pounds, be in
general good health, show
a photo ID and meet addi-
tional requirements. 16-
year-old donors must have
a signed parental permis-
sion slip, which can be
obtained at the above
website.

Birth announced
Tubby and Lorna

Durham announce the
birth of their grandchild,
Elizabeth Jean, born Au-
gust 16, 2014 and
weighed in at 5 lbs.

She was welcomed
home by half brother and
sister, Jacob Edward and
Trinity Durham and an-
other half sister, Haley
Bullock.
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New House • Castlewood Subdivision • 55 Ruby Ln.
Large 2,044 sq. ft., 1,614 living space, 3 BR, 2 BA, kitchen/dining combo with
stove, microwave, dishwasher, energy efficient 15 Ceer heat/air pump, 2 car
garage, city water/sewer, concrete driveway, on large lot. Asking $138,000.

859-582-6469 • 859-200-2057 • 606-965-3263
Call anytime - shown by appointment

Open 7 days a week 10 a.m. to 10 p.m.
(Open later on weekends)

Located at Exit 62
(former Rockcastle Steakhouse)

Phone 606-256-0131

Daily Specials
Thursday 9/18

Chicken Tenders
Two Sides

Sunday 9/21
Meatloaf

Choice of Two Sides

Friday 9/19
All you can eat Catfish

Monday 9/22
1/2 Price Apps. or

Bowl of Soup of Day
w/ 1/2 Stacker

Saturday 9/20
BBQ Ribs

Tuesday 9/23
Alecia’s All New
Salmon Patty w/

Choice of Two Sides

Wednesday 9/24
Italian Day

Carry-Out Available

Sigmon Farm Pumpkin Patch
open to the public starting
September 20th at 10 a.m.

Come out and pick your pumpkin!

children of our county that
suffer as a result,” Reynolds
said. “I couldn’t be more
proud of Assistant County
Attorney William Leger
who spearheaded the effort
and my staff who also
worked tirelessly on these
cases.”

However, Reynolds said
he is displeased that all the
bonds on the twenty-one
felony warrants were issued
as unsecured bonds, mean-
ing the defendant can bail
out of jail by signing a con-
tract agreeing to appear be-
fore the court and agreeing
that they will pay the bond
amount if they break the
bond’s conditions.

“These twenty-one
people that were arrested on
these warrants can simply
sign themselves out of jail,”
Reynolds said. “We worked
hard on these cases and to
simply have these people
sign themselves out of jail
is disheartening to us and to
those who haven’t been re-
ceiving the required sup-
port.”

Reynolds went on to say
that his office will continue
to do their part in investigat-
ing flagrant nonsupport
cases and issuing arrest war-

“Suppport”
(Cont. from front)

Renner Family Reunion
Worship Concert
Grand Finale to area-wide

21 day revival

Sat., Sept. 27th * 6 p.m.
Northside Baptist Church

The Renner Family invites you to a night of worship
and celebration! Come and worship as we sing current
worship songs, bluegrass music, southern gospel and
more! The Renner Family sang gospel music for over
20 years and traveled all over the U.S. Now, they only
get together to sing ONE time a year and this is it! This
year’s reunion will be extra special since it will be the
grand finale for a 21 day revival of all the area churches.
Make plans now and show up early!

Members of the 2014 Hot Rods are shown above, front row from left: Tlen Delph, Trevor Conner, Josiah
Rodriguez, Reagan Alexander, Stormy Jones, Carson Neely, Hailey Mize, Logan Rogers, Jasper Reynolds,
Beckham Smith, Stephanie Proctor, Mary Ann Cope, tyson Cain, Harrison Craig, Grace :Lambert, Ethan
Stallsworth Jaxon Cromer. Second row: alexis Phelps, Landon Navarre, Gaddon Reese, Jacob Dobbs, Ella
Williams, Logan Fry, Brian Lovell, A.J. Martin, Braydon Jones, Jasper Rogers, Andrew Abney, Bristol Abney,
Emma Hensley, Amberly Northern, Josiah McClure. Third row: Cayden Reams, Jackson Reams, Lane Wilder,
Micheal Hargis Caleb Crouch, Christopher Tomlinson, Trace Cain, Ethan Kidwell, Senthia  Sagraves, Jayden
Burton, Caden Barnett, Blake Mullins, Bailey Adams, Hayden Deatherage. Fourth row: Coaches: Josh Mar-
tin, T. Douglas Proctor, Josie Adams, Edie Sagraves, Holding Dawsann Santo, Isaiah Bowles. Not pictured:
Lily Childress, Josiah Robidoux, Alyssa Wagers, Davin Barnes, Harley Newcomb.

Congratulations, Nelson,
on your first day of school.
We hope you have a suc-
cessful and great year.

We love you.
Mamaw, Papaw, Mommy
(Rhonda Bryant), David,
Mike, Janice and Paul

Hot Rods season ends
On July 12th, the Hot

Rods T-Ball Team closed
out their 2014 season with
our annual picnic.

Everyone enjoyed ham-
burgers, hot dogs, side
dishes and dessert. Thanks
to Delbert Crutcher for be-
ing in charge of the grilling.

Every Hot Rod received
a trophy and a toy of their
choice. Our wonderful
sponsors donated funds and
every child got to go home
with a toy. Choice is deter-
mined by attendance, with
the children who didn’t
miss a practice getting to
choose first.

Sponsors for this year’s
picnic were: Dari Delite,
Best Little Hair House in
Town, Lone Star Farm &
Home, Richmond Street
Eyecare, Hilltop Produce,
Marlene Lawson, Kwik
Mart, County Attorney
Billy Reynolds, Debra
Hembree Lambert Law Of-
fice, Jack’s Pro Hardware,

New Vision Hair Studio,
Marvin E. Owens Home for
Funerals, Roberts Barber
Shop, Bradley’s Barber
Shop, Complete Home
Comfort, Danetta Allen,
Citizens Bank, Teresa Jack-
son, Cash Express, Mark’s
Hardware and Cox Funeral
Home. If I’ve forgotten any-
one, I apologize.

I would also like to thank
our season sponsors:

Rockcastle Professional
Pharmacy, James E. Miller,
Mt. Vernon Drug, Wendy’s,
Marathon, KFC, Foster Tro-
phies, Galaxy Bowling,
Godfather’s Pizza, Subway,
Tobacco Barn, Mt. Vernon
Signal and Barbara Ann
Photography.

The Hot Rods and myself
are very grateful for our
sponsors, without whom we
could not operate.

I would also like to thank
my fellow coaches for all
their support; Josie Adams,
Christian Sagraves; Josh

Hannabeth Owens finished tied for third place at
the Bunny Daugherty Invitational at Hurstbourne
Country Club in Louisville this past Saturday.
Hannabeth shot a 3 over par 76 at the very difficult
par 73 course.

Martin and Isaiah Bowles.
We wouldn’t have been able
to have the program with-
out your help. Also thanks
to our announcer this sea-
son, Edie Sagraves, for all
your help.

I appreciate you all.
Doug Proctor

Hot Rods Coach

rants to those in violation.
“We are always going to

do our part to see that jus-
tice is brought to those who
are not paying the required
support,” Reynolds said.
“My only hope is that the re-
volving door culture of low
bonds comes to an end.”

Happy
Birthday Tim

Your family
loves you!!!



Pg. A6 • Mount Vernon Signal • Thursday, September 18, 2014

By Doug Ponder
The Rockcastle County

Rockets are now 3-1 on the
season after beating the
Whitley County Colonels
35-28 last Friday night.

Last Friday night’s game
proved to be an offensive
shootout as both teams com-
bined had over 800 yards on
offense in the game.

The Rockets amassed an
impressive 431 total yards
of offense in the game with
377 yards rushing and 54
yards passing. The Colonels
gained a total of 345 yards
on offense with 137 yards on
the ground and 208 yards
through the air.

The Rockets were first to
get on the scoreboard when
sophomore quarterback Da-

kota Bishop connected with
senior wide receiver Kyle
Denny for a 21 yard touch-
down pass. The extra point
attempt by sophomore
Dalton Rowe was no good
giving the Rockets the early
6-0 lead.

In the second quarter,
Rowe broke free for a 62
yard touchdown run. Senior
fullback Chance Ansardi
punched the ball into the end
zone for the two point con-
version making the score
14-0.

The Colonels finally got
on the board late in the sec-
ond quarter with a 7 yard
touchdown pass from junior
quarterback Luke Woods to
senior wide receiver Chris-
tian Hamilton. The extra

point attempt by senior
kicker Alex Conlin was
good cutting the Rockets
lead to 14-7.

After halftime, the Rock-
ets offense came out firing
on all cylinders as Ansardi
ran the ball into the end zone
for a 1 yard touchdown run.
The extra point attempt by
Rowe was good to cushion
the Rockets lead to 21-7.

The Rockets struck again
on their next possession
with a 3 yard touchdown run
by Rowe. The extra point at-
tempt by Rowe was no good
extending the Rockets lead
to 27-7.

The Colonels offense an-
swered late in the third quar-
ter when sophomore run-
ning back Sean Hickey
jumped over the goal line for
a one yard touchdown run.
The extra point attempt by
Conlin was good cutting the
Rockets lead to 27-14.

The Colonels got within
a touchdown at the begin-
ning of the fourth quarter
when Woods scrambled into
the end zone for a 2 yard
touchdown run. The extra
point attempt by Conlin was
good making the score 27-
21.

The Rockets attempted to
put the game away when
senior fullback Isaiah
Adams scored on a 6 yard
touchdown run. Freshman
tailback Brent Lovell found
his way into the end zone to
complete the two point con-
version extending the lead to
35-21.

In an attempt to make a
comeback, Colonels quar-
terback Luke Woods con-
nected with junior wide re-
ceiver Cameron Johnson on
a five yard touchdown pass.

The extra point attempt by
Conlin was good bringing
them back to within a touch-
down of the Rockets. How-
ever, the Colonels failed to
make it back into the end
zone making the final score
35-28.

The Rockets offense was
led by Rowe who picked up
an impressive 216 yards on
20 carries for two touch-
downs. Lovell also had a big
night offensively with 113
yards on 17 carries.

Other Rockets picking
up rushing yards were
Adams with 6 carries for 21
yards and one touchdown,
sophomore running back
Devon Robinson had 6 car-
ries for 19 yards, sophomore
wide receiver Michael
Tomlinson had one carry for
4 yards and Ansardi had two
carries for 4 yards and one
touchdown.

Bishop was 5 out of 7
passing for 54 yards and one
touchdown.

Senior wide receiver
Kyle Denny led the Rock-
ets in receiving, catching
two passes for 33 yards and
one touchdown. Adams also
caught two passes for 21
yards.

Defensively, the Rockets
were led by sophomore de-
fensive lineman Logan
Coffey who had 7 tackles
and two fumble recoveries.
Sophomore linebacker Aus-
tin Mills also had a big night
on offense with 10 tackles.

Other Rockets picking
up tackles and assists were
Denny with 6, Ansardi and
Rowe with 4 each; Adams,
Robinson, sophomore de-
fensive back Isaac McClure
and senior defensive line-
man Justin Hughes were all
credited with 3 each; sopho-
more defensive back
Tommy Benge, sophomore
defensive back Lucas Jones
and sophomore defensive
lineman Austin Saylor all
had 2 each and Lovell was
credited with one.

Head Coach Scott
Parkey said he was proud of
his team for overcoming ad-
versity and showing a sign
of maturity that he had been
looking for from everyone
as a team.

“Our players overcame
adversity as a team and an-
swered Whitley County’s
touchdowns to always stay
ahead in the game,” Parkey
said. “This team has tons of
fight and they have a hate-
to-lose attitude that is evi-
dent when times get hard on
the field.”

Parkey went on to say
that he was pleased with
how the Rockets played on
both offense and defense.
However, he said that sev-
eral mistakes are being
made on both sides of the
ball.

“We have players lining
up wrong, players jumping
offside and some problems
with the center to quarter-
back exchange,” Parkey
said. “We are going to fo-
cus in practice and perfect
those issues. Things like
that will improve as we go
through the season and

Rockets get third consecutive win over Whitley, 35-28

Sophomore linebacker Austin Mills chases down a
Whitley County running back during the 35-28 win
last Friday night. Mills had a big night on defense
with 10 tackles.

Sophomore quarterback Dakota Bishop looks for a
Rocket receiver during the Whitley County game.
Bishop was 5 for 7 passing for 54 yards and one
touchdown.

Brooklyn Bishop sets the ball for a teammate during
the Lady Rockets win over Somerset. The Lady
Rockets next match is this Thursday when they travel
to Danville to take on the Lady Admirals at 5:30 p.m.

Emily Childress serves the ball during the Somerset
game Tuesday night. The Lady Rockets won and are
now 6-9 on the season.

The RCHS marching band provided musical entertainment during the Rockets
football game last Friday night. The Rockets next game is this Friday night when
they travel to Somerset to take on the Pulaski County Maroons at 7:30.

Rachael Davis sets up to spike the ball during Tues-
day night’s win over Somerset.

Katie Adams hits the ball back over the net during
the Lady Rockets win over Somerset Tuesday night.
The Lady Rockets won 3-0.

Senior fullback Isaiah Adams turns the corner during the Rockets 35-28 win over
Whitley County last Friday night. The Rockets had 431 total yards on offense in
the game with 377 yards rushing and 54 yards passing.

bring our A game to prac-
tice every day.”

The Rockets next game
is this Friday night when
they travel to Somerset to
take on the Pulaski County
Maroons. Kick-off is at 7:30
p.m.

Parkey said the Maroons
are a fundamentally good
team on both offense and
defense.

“They have a lot of good
athletes on offense making

(Cont. to A7)
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The Rocket golf JV team recently participated in the Lincoln County Shootout.
The boys played good and had a lot of fun. They placed third in this event. Par-
ticipants were Grant Isaacs, Joseph Coffey, Jesse Smith, Aidan Cain, Joseph
Cowan, Will Isaacs, and Jackson Cromer.

The Rockcastle Rockets boys golf team won a major
match at Hickory Hills Tuesday night over the Clay
County Tigers by 4 strokes. Scores from the match
were: Sam Pensol 36, John Cornelius 36, Lucas Gen-
try 38, Cade Burdette 43, Thomas Burdette 45,
Carson Noble 46, Grant Isaacs 52, and Zach Baker
55. Pictured above is the lone senior on the squad,
Sam Pensol.

The RCHS girls’ cross-country team placed a close 2nd at the Southern Harrier
Classic in Somerset this past Saturday, losing by only 2 points to Green County,
a team ranked 3rd in the state in Class A.  Team members are from left: Sierra
Mercer, Lanna Prewitt, Tanika Chasteen, Taylor Bullock, Kensie Sheffield and
Tori Dotson.

The Rockcastle girls’ 6th grade and under team dominated the competition at
the Southern Harrier Classic in Somerset, defeating their nearest opponent by
an impressive 27 points. The team placed six girls in the top 11.  Team members
are front from left: Lila Holt, Kylie Martin and Lexi Dotson. Back from left:
Hannah Davis, Gracie Spoonamore, Allie Martin, Karalinn Loudermilk, Callie
Delph.

RCMS 7th grader Tori Dotson won the varsity race
at the Southern Harrier Classic this past Saturday
in Somerset.  In her first-ever 5,000-meter race, Tori’s
time of 20:54 was the third fastest ever ran by an
RCHS girl in the 17 years they’ve had the Southern
Harrier Classic and should rank her 11th in the state
in high school Class 2A. She was only eight seconds
away from equaling Kayla Hayes’ RCHS all-time
best mark of 20:47 on the G.E. course.

At the Southern Harrier Classic in Somerset, RCMS
8th grader Kensie Sheffield placed 7th overall in the
varsity race with a new personal best time of 23:54.
This was her first-ever 5,000-meter cross-country
race.

Rockcastle 3rd grader
Lexi Dotson led the way
for the girls’ 6th grade
and under team with a
3rd place finish overall
at the Southern Harrier
Classic in Somerset.

RCMS 7th grader Alex-
andria Blair led the
RCMS girls’ team at
the Southern Harrier
Classic in Somerset
with a 9th place finish
overall.

RCHS sophomore Sierra Mercer placed 5th for the
varsity team with a great time of 23:34 at the South-
ern Harrier Classic this past Saturday in Somerset.

Rockcastle 5th grader Allie Martin (right) placed 5th
and 5th grader Karalinn Loudermilk placed 10th in
the 6th grade and under girls’ race at the Southern
Harrier Classic in Somerset.

Rockcastle 5th grader
Gracie Spoonamore
placed 4th overall in the
6th grade and under
girls’ race at the South-
ern Harrier Classic in
Somerset.

it a necessity to cover the
entire field on defense.
Their quarterback is also
good at spreading the ball
around and making the de-
cision to run after being
flushed out of the pocket,”
Parkey said. “Their defense
is just as talented. They are
disciplined and fast at every
position as well as really
strong up front on the line.”

However, Parkey said
that the Maroons don’t play
many physical and strategic
teams like the Rockets.

“Our physical, right at
you, running game will
cause them some problems
both in preparation and
game play,” Parkey said.
“Our pressure defense will
also force them to make
quick throws. Because of
this, we will be focusing on
the fundamentals of block-
ing and tackling this week.”

“Rockets”
(Cont. from A6)

Hunters may apply
throughout September for a
variety of quota hunts in
Kentucky.

Quota hunts help manage
hunting pressure on popular
public areas by limiting num-
bers. The deadline to apply
for these opportunities is
midnight (Central time) Sept.
30.

Applications for quota
deer, small game and water-
fowl hunts at state wildlife
management areas and other
public lands may be submit-
ted online at fw.ky.gov or by
calling 1-877-598-2401. Ap-

plications and lists of avail-
able quota hunts are available
on the Kentucky Department
of Fish and Wildlife Re-
sources’ website by clicking
the “hunt” tab.

Bear hunters must apply
online for the quota hunt with
dogs held in the Western,
Central and Eastern chase
areas.

Approximately 70 percent
of hunters who applied for a
quota hunt last year utilized
the online application sys-
tem.

“It’s easy to use,” said
Chip Quarles, information

systems manager with the
Kentucky Department of
Fish and Wildlife Resources.
“By applying online and pro-
viding an email address,
hunters will receive a confir-
mation email. That’s an ad-
vantage, as well as having ac-
cess to all of our public lands
information on the website.”

There are 30 quota deer
hunts to consider this season,
including a new opportunity
Dec. 6-7 at Dewey Lake
Wildlife Management Area
(WMA) in Floyd County
with 150 slots available. For
this area’s hunt, there is a one
deer limit and a 15-inch mini-
mum outside antler restric-
tion for bucks.

Also different this year,
the quota deer hunt on Nov.
1 and 2 at Beaver Creek
WMA is for antlered deer
only with a one buck limit.
At Big Rivers WMA, the
quota deer hunt has been
moved to the first weekend
in November. The hunt dates
are Nov. 1 and 2.

When applying for a
WMA quota deer hunt, hunt-
ers may pick a first and sec-
ond hunt choice, but can only
be drawn to participate in
one. Antlered deer harvested
during WMA quota hunts
count toward the statewide
bag limit.

Small game hunters may
apply for pheasant quota
hunts scheduled Nov. 21, 22
and 23 at Green River Lake
WMA, Dec. 5, 6 and 7 at
Clay WMA and Dec. 12, 13
and 14 at Yellowbank WMA.

Bobwhite quail quota
hunts on the Ken Unit of
Peabody WMA are sched-
uled Nov. 25 and Dec. 23,
2014 and Jan. 3, 10 and 20,
2015. A mentor hunt is
scheduled Nov. 22.

Upland bird quota hunts
at Clay WMA are scheduled
Nov. 5, Nov. 16, Dec. 14 and
Dec. 16. Hunters may take
bobwhite quail, ruffed grouse
and woodcock during the
upland bird quota hunts,
when the seasons for all three
species are open. Woodcock
season opens Nov. 1 and ends
Dec. 15.

Waterfowl hunters may
apply for quota hunts at
Ballard WMA and the
Sauerheber Unit of Sloughs
WMA. The hunts at Ballard
WMA are held Wednesdays
through Sundays (excluding
Christmas and New Year’s
Day) from Dec. 3, 2014 to
Jan. 25, 2015. Waterfowl
quota hunts are held daily at
Sloughs WMA from Nov. 27,
2014 through Jan. 25, 2015,
but hunters must apply for a
block of dates.

The bear quota hunt with

Apply now for quota deer, small game, waterfowl and bear hunts
dogs season is Dec. 22-26.
Hunters must have a bear
chase permit before apply-
ing. Applicants may apply as
a hunt party of no more than
five people. All persons
drawn for this hunt must also
obtain a bear permit to take
a bear. An individual hunter
or hunt party drawn for the
bear quota hunt with dogs
season can take no more than
one bear in a license year.

The statewide harvest quota
for this hunt is five bears of
either sex. If the limit is
reached, the season will
close 30 minutes after sun-
set that day.

Results of the drawings
will be posted on Kentucky

Fish and Wildlife’s website
by Oct. 8. Applicants may
also call the department at 1-
800-858-1549 and provide
either their confirmation
number, order number, or
Social Security number to
find out if they were selected.
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“Indicted”
(Cont. from front)

Hundreds of students and staff at the Mt. Vernon Elementary School raised money for a former student who
was recently diagnosed with cancer. MVES students and staff raised $427 for Abby Langford and her family.
Several students and staff members also wore purple t-shirts in honor of Langford. Students and staff could
pay $1 to wear a hat or blue jeans during school last Friday. Shown above are all the students and staff who
participated in the event. Langford is a sixth grader at Rockcastle County Middle School.

hamburger because not as
much work goes into pro-
cessing it but over the years
steak just simply became a
commodity,” Green said.
“Fruit and vegetables aren’t
vine ripe as they have to be
gassed so they can be main-
tained while traveling to the
store. Peaches are like a
rock and have to set out a
few days before they ripen
because of the chemicals on
them. It’s a shame.”

Green said that every-
thing sold in his store will
be organic without the high
prices that are inflated by
corporations. He said that he
also is looking to partner
with local farmers in the
area that will agree to use
organic feeds, raise organic
livestock and grow organic
produce.

“Our prices will only be
around one dollar more a
pound than the cost of rais-
ing and processing a live-
stock animal. Corporations
charge $3, $4 or even $5
more a pound than what it
cost to raise and process
them. That’s outrageous and
unnecessary. To us, it is not
about making as much
money as possible, it’s
about being as healthy as
possible,” Green said. “We
are also looking for other
farmers to join us in the fu-
ture. We want to make it to
where you don’t have to go
far to get healthy food. We
want to bring it back local
where farmers care enough
about their neighbors to not
feed them all the trash that
goes into processed foods.”

Green went on to say that
they also plan on establish-
ing a farmer’s market on the
store property where people
can set up and sell their

take to Messer and his fam-
ily so they can use the items
during their stay at the hos-
pital. She said they will col-
lect the items until tomor-
row and take it to them on
Friday.

stored at the local state high-
way garage on State Garage
Road in Mt. Vernon. Sign
owners can reclaim the
signs by showing proper
identification and complet-
ing a claim form.

Signs will be kept at the
state highway garage for
two weeks after they have
been removed by state high-
way crews. After two
weeks, all unclaimed signs
will be discarded.

County Judge Executive
Buzz Carloftis said country
road crews also remove
signs that pose a potential
hazard to motorists or inter-
fere with their fall mowing
operations along the right of
way on country roads.
Those signs can also be re-
claimed at the county high-
way garage on Hwy 25 in
Mt. Vernon.

Officials with all three
city governments in

Bryant said.
The 16.7 cents rate for

motor vehicles is the same
as last year’s.

During the meeting,
Bryant brought the council
up-to-date on construction
of the new bait/tackle shop
at Lake Linville Boat Dock.

The shop, located across
from the restaurant, will
stock basic camping sup-
plies, drinks and snacks be-
sides bait. “It won’t be Bass
Pro but will accommodate
the basic needs of fishermen
and campers,” the mayor
said.

Bryant said plans were to
open the shop by October

trolled substace and tamper-
ing with physical evidence.

Bond for each was set at
$20,000 cash/property.

Andrew T. Ruhe, 34 of
Castle Village in Brodhead,
was indicted for unlawful
taking and his bond was set
at $10,000 cash/property.

Jason D. Bullock, 41, of
Kincer Lane, Brodhead was
indicted for manufacture of
methamphetamine and his
bond was set at $40,000
cash/property.

Aaron R. French, 36,
Mary J. Carter, 38 and Dana
G. Elllison, 39, all of Cop-
per Creek Road, Crab Or-
chard, were named in a joint
indictment on two counts.

The first count charges
the three with possession of
a controlled substance
(methamphetamine) and the
second  with tampering with
physical evidence.

Bond for all three was set
at $20,000 cash/property.

Billy J. Deborde, 34 of
Dorman Creek Road,
Brodhead and Jonathan G.
Osborne, 35, of Bowling
Green were also charged in
a joint indictment.

Deborde was indicted for
burglary and theft by unlaw-
ful taking. Osborne was in-
dicted for complicity to bur-
glary and complicity to theft
by unlawful taking.

Deborde’s bond was set
at $20,000 cash/property
and Osborne’s at $10,000
cash/property.

Cassie L. Powell, 28 of
Flat Gap Road, Berea, was
indicted for the offense of
complicity to theft by un-
lawful taking. Her bond was
set at $20,000 cash/prop-
erty.

Carl C. Stewart, 49,
Diana Tolson, 43 and Phillip
Falin, 39, all of Mt. Vernon
were named in a joint indict-
ment.

Stewart and Tolson were
indicted for the offenses of
theft by failure to make re-
quired disposition of prop-
erty and tampering with
physical evidence. Falin
was indicted for the offense
of receiving stolen property.

All three defendants’
bond was set at $10,000
cash/property.

In a separate joint indict-
ment, Tolson and Falin were
charged with the offense of
receiving stolen property.
and their bond was set at
$10,000 cash/property each.

Walter B. Price, 62 of
Oriole Lane, Mt. Vernon
was indicted on two counts,
one for cultivating mari-
juana (over five plants) and
one for possession of a fire-
arm by a convicted felon.

His bond was set at
$20,000 cash/property.

Justin Riddle, 32 of
Maple Street Brodhead and
Jamie R. Tuttle, 26 of
Harmons Lick Road, Crab
Orchard were named in a
joint indictment.

Riddle and Tuttle were
indicted for the offense of

assault and Riddle was also
indicted for the offense of
persistent felony offender.

Riddle’s bond was set at
$50,000 cash/property and
Tuttle’s at $20,000 cash/
property.

Brian A. Jones, 31 of
Cardinal Hollow Road, Mt.
Vernon was indicted on two
counts, one for possession
of a controlled substance
(methamphetamine) and the
other for tampering with
physical evidence.

His bond was set at
$20,000 cash/property.

William M. Pigg, 51 of
Old Brodhead Road,
Brodhead was indicted for
the offense of receiving sto-
len property.

His bond was set at
$10,000 cash/property.

Thomas Daugherty, 32
of Tee Street, Mt. Vernon
was indicted on five counts.

Two of the counts in-
volve burglary charges in
incidents at Kwik Mart in
Mt. Vernon in August of this
year. He was also indicted
for the offenses of theft by
unlawful taking, criminal
mischief and theft of lottery
tickets.

His bond was set at
$50,000 cash/property.

Kenneth W. Couch, 33 of
Cynthiana was indicted for
flagrant non-support in the
amount of $3,362.

His bond was set at
$3,500 full cash.

Nathan Brummett, 30 of
Bowling Ridge Road,
Brodhead was also indicted
on a flagrant non-support
charge in the amount of
$1,931.

His bond was set at
$2,000 full cash

Rockcastle County said
they also follow the state
law prohibiting signs from
being placed along the right
of way on city roads. How-
ever, all three city road
crews noted that they rarely
have any problems but if a
sign is placed in a city right
of way, they will contact the
candidate or yard sign
owner in order to resolve the
problem.

homegrown produce free of
charge.

“We won’t charge them
anything to set up and sell
their produce and that way
they can have a supplemen-
tal income for selling the
extra produce they have,”
Green said. “A lot of people
around here grows a garden
and they often end up with
more than they can eat. Now
they have a centralized
place where they can sell
their extra produce for free.
It’s our way to give back to
the community.”

The store’s hours are
Monday through Friday 9
a.m. to 6 p.m., Saturday
from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. and
Sunday noon to 5 p.m. For
more information about the
store call 606-453-0011.

1st but the hours of opera-
tion would be experimented
with to provide the most ser-
vice for customers.

The mayor said that
Randy Mullins, marina
manager, was presently col-
lecting launch, dock and
camping fees and selling
bait.

Bryant also said that bids
for the water tanks and
booster pump and water
system improvements were
presently being reviewed by
Kentucky Infrastructure Au-
thority (KIA) and
Cumberland Valley ADD
board. He said he expected
recommendations as to
awarding the bids to be
brought to the council at
their October meeting.

Police Chief Brian
Carter presented the coun-
cil with his department’s
report for August.

The report showed:
631 total calls for ser-

vice; 12 non-injury acci-
dents; one injury accident;
52 total arrests; 16 drug

charges; 57 traffic viola-
tions; 28 other criminal
charges; 33 warrants served;
one criminal summons
served; 3 D.U.I . charges
and two grand jury indict-
ments.

Fire Chief David Bales
also presented his report to
the council, listing:

Two accidents with en-
trapment; four accidents
with injuries; seven non-in-
jury accidents; two non-in-
jury tractor/trailer acci-
dents; one tractor/trailer ac-
cident w/injury; three ve-
hicle fires; two fire alarm
activitatiions; three smoke
investigations; one brush
fire; one storm damage in-
cident (tree across power
lines); four traffic control;
one rescue (subject fell from
horse); one search and res-
cue; two special details; one
odor (propane) investiga-
tion; one request from KFC
to use department apparatus
to open gun safe and one
mutual aid to Brindle Ridge
for structure fire.“Injured”

(Cont. from front)

“Signs”
(Cont. from front)

“Store”
(Cont. from front)

“Tax Rate”
(Cont. from front)

Central Body Service
offers Haddix Custom Detailing.

Basic hand wash to a full
detail that is guaranteed to make

your vehicle look great!
Free pickup and delivery

Stop by Central Body Service or give us
a call today to make an appointment.

606-256-4210 or 606-308-1490
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Giving Thanks
to our family, friends and customers for making it possible for

us to be back home!
We are honored to be a part of the growing community of Rockcastle!

September 25th

Pulled Pork,
Fries w/ Drink

$4.99

Door Prizes • Music Outside
Everyone please come out and enjoy the day with us!

Barbara M. Castleberry,
PhD., will be inducted into
the Livingston School Hall
of Fame at the annual school
reunion on October 4, in
Livingston. Dr. Castleberry
is being recognized for her
distinguished career in pa-
thology and laboratory
medicine.

Registration for the Re-
union will open at 3 p.m. in
the Livingston Trail Town
Visitor Center at the school
building. The Livingston
Fire Department will have
food available for purchase
beginning at 4 p.m.  Hall of
Fame Ceremonies begin at
6 p.m. and will be followed
by a memory lantern cer-
emony and entertainment.

Livingston Mayor Jason
Medley will conduct the
memory lantern ceremony.
Proceeds from the purchase
of the memory lanterns will
used in the Livingston
School Revitalization

Castleberry selected
for LHS Hall of Fame

Project. For a $10 contribu-
tion individuals will be able
to designate students, teach-
ers, classmates, businesses
or others they wish to have
honored in the ceremony.

All former students,
teachers and friends of the
grade or high school are en-
couraged to attend.  Mem-
bers of the classes of 1954
and 1964 will be recognized
during the alumni celebra-
tions.

Barbara M. Castleberry, PhD

Last Wednesday, Sep-
tember 17th, Rockcastle
Regional Hospital and Res-
piratory Care Center and
members from several
county emergency re-
sponse agencies, took part
in the annual emergency
drill as part of the Chemi-
cal Stockpile Emergency
Preparedness Program
(CSEPP) Community Ex-
ercise.

The mock scenario was
based on the hypothetical
effects occurring where
toxic chemicals, stored at
the U.S. Army Blue Grass
Depot in Madison County,
are potentially exposed to
the region. During the ex-
ercise process, agencies
participating in the mock
drill will each demonstrate
their particular role should
an emergency occur.

Other agencies partici-
pating in the drill repre-
sented all areas of the
county, including city and
county officials, fire de-
partments, law enforce-
ment, the health depart-
ment, Christian Appala-
chian Project (CAP),
Rockcastle County
Schools, as well as several
others.

The exercises were con-
ducted at Rockcastle Re-
gional Hospital and in-
cluded those to demon-
strate the effectiveness to
receive and triage patients
and to set up and manage a
decontamination post and
team – all while maintain-
ing effective communica-

tion with other emergency
response agencies through-
out the entire drill process.

“The CSEPP Commu-
nity Exercise is extremely
beneficial to the hospital,
our staff, and our patients,”
said Patti Halcomb,
Rockcastle Regional Hos-
pital emergency depart-
ment coordinator. “Patient
safety is our top priority.
Conducting these drills al-
low us to test our chemical
emergency procedures so if
an event like this should
occur, we are more than
prepared to handle it.”

“The proper plans and
procedures are in place
should a chemical emer-
gency occur,” said
Rockcastle Regional Hos-
pital facilities and environ-
ment of care director, Gary
Asher. “The likelihood of
an emergency like this to
occur is slim; however,
these drills help us to en-
sure our preparedness and
readiness should we be
faced with that situation.”

In 1985, Rockcastle
County was grouped with
nine other Kentucky coun-
ties to form CSEPP. The
U.S. Congress passed a law
to create CSEPP in order to
dispose of the country’s ag-
ing chemical weapons in-
ventory with public and en-
vironmental safety as its
first priority.  These com-
munity exercises for pre-
paredness started in
Rockcastle County in 1985
and have continued annu-
ally since.

At Rockcastle Regional Hospital

Emergency responders
perform mock drill

Mayor Mike Bryant signs
Constitution Week

Proclamation
September 17, 2014 marks the 227th Anniversary of the

drafting of the Constitution of the United States of America
and Monday night, Mt. Vernon Mayor Mike Bryant signed
a proclamation declaring the week of September 17-23 as
Constitution Week in Mt. Vernon.

Proclamation
Whereas: September 17, 2014 marks the two hundred
twenty-seventh anniversary of the drafting of the Constitu-
tion of the United States if America by the Constitutional
Convention; and
Whereas: It is fitting and proper to accord official recog-
nition to this magnificent document and its memorable an-
niversary; and to the patriotic celebrations which will com-
memorate the occasion; and
Whereas: Public Law 915 guarantees the issuing of a proc-
lamation each year by the President of the United States of
America designating September l7th through 23rd as Con-
stitution Week,
Now, Therefore, I, Mike Bryant, by virtue of the authority
vested in me as Mayor of Mt. Vernon, do hereby proclaim
the week of September 17th through the 23rd as

Constitution Week
And ask our citizens to reaffirm the ideals the framers of
the constitution had in 1787 by vigilantly protecting the
freedoms guaranteed to us through this guardian of our lib-
erties, remembering that lost rights may never be regained.
In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and
caused the Seal of Mt. Vernon to be affixed this 15th day of
September of the year of our Lord two thousand and four-
teen.

/s/ Michael Bryant
Mayor of Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

Members of the Mt. Vernon Chapter of the Daughters of the American Revolution (DAR) present for the
signing of a Constitution Week Proclamation by Mt. Vernon Mayor Mike Bryant were, from left: Kayla Bryant,
Carol Pybas, Tonya Cook and Jamie Bryant.

Hidden Among Us

The American Revolutionary
War Patriots of Rockcastle
By Karen Hamm Adams

To celebrate and honor
the county’s American
Revolutionary War Patriots
and to enlighten the commu-
nity about the service and
sacrifice of these brave men,
on behalf of the Rockcastle
Chapter of the Daughters of
the American Revolution, I
have complied highlights of
the service of the known
patriots living in the county
and who applied for a pen-
sion between the years 1818
and 1842. All information
was taken from the patriot’s
own account from his pen-
sion application and other
historical documents.  More
information can be found on
each patriot at the local li-
brary or the Rockcastle His-
torical Society.  (Copyright
pending).  If you are inter-
ested in joining the Daugh-
ters of the American Revo-
lution, please contact
Debbie Brown (606) 758-
8659 or Iris Young
(606)256-2851.

Henry Kilburn
Virginia

Henry Kilburn was born
10 November 1763 in Or-
ange Co. Virginia  and died
8 July 1852 Pulaski Co. KY.
According to his pension
application, Henry gave the
following account of his ser-
vice in 17 November 1842
Rockcastle Co. KY:  In the
month of January 1781 in
Montgomery Co. VA, he
enlisted as a private during
the Revolutionary War and
servedunder Captain James
Newell, who was appointed
to recruit men for the Con-
tinental service.  He enlisted
in Virginia on Continental
establishment.  He was sta-
tioned about five miles from
Fort Chiswell in said county.
He remained there in com-
pany with the balance and
one time on duty in search
of Tories and under the or-
ders of Captain Newell un-
til the month of November
after the surrender of Lord
Cornwallis.  He was dis-
charged by Captain Newell
and received ten dollars.  He
was promised two hundred
acres of land and two hun-
dred dollars in money when
he enlisted.  During the time,
he remained at the station
with Captain Newell.  At
this point, a section of
Henry’s pension is missing.

    In 1785, Henry came
to Kentucky and settled near
Danville and served in Gen-
eral Clark’s campaign in
1786 as a volunteer in Cap-
tain Nathan McClure’s
Company. (Captain
McClure was later killed on
Rockcastle River by the In-
dians, serving in Colonel
Benjamin Logan’s Regi-
ment but who relinquished
his command to Colonel
William Barnett). Henry
was marched to Louisville
in Kentucky when Logan
was to raise troops to go

against the Shawnees. This
expedition was marched un-
der General George Rogers
Clark up the Wabash River
above Vincennes (now In-
diana).  The next fall, Henry
went on an expedition un-
der Colonel Logan to Nash-
ville in TN and after march-
ing three or four days, the
detachment was ordered to
return. He was discharged
the same year that Logan
went to the Shawnee towns
(about 1786).  He also stated
that he was in no battles.

At the close of the Revo-
lution, Henry moved to
Greenbrier, VA and then to
Kentucky residing in
Pulaski County.  The reason
why he applied for pension
in Rockcastle was that he
was crippled and lived
twelve miles from the
county seat of Rockcastle
and eighteen miles to
Somerset, the county seat of
Pulaski County.  Henry’s
pension application was re-

jected on the grounds that he
did not serve in a regularly
organized corps.  He did re-
ceived land grants on 12
February 1825 of fifty acres
on Buck Creek in Pulaski
Co. KY and on 21 Septem-
ber 1836 of twenty four
acres on Barney’s Ridge,
Pulaski Co. KY.

There is no mention of a
spouse or children in
Henry’s pension applica-
tion.  He married Charity
Pointer (1772-1840) on 19
August 1788 in Lincoln
Co.KY.  They had at least
eight children.  He later
married Elizabeth Hughes
(1795-1860) on 27 July
1840 Pulaski Co. KY.  Their
burial place is unknown.
The known children of
Henry and Charity are:
Elisha Kilburn (1789-1845)
Married Alcey Walker.  Wil-
liam Kilburn (1790-1850)
married Hulda Estes on 26
May 1814 Pulaski Co. KY.
Their children were: Serena,

Elisha, James, Elizabeth,
Henry, Keziah and David.
John Kilburn (6 November
1792 KY- 2 January 1868
MO) married Nancy Griffin
(1800-1850) on 24 August
1818 Pulaski Co. KY.  Their
children were: Henry,
Solomon, Thomas, Hiram,
Margaret, William and
Nancy.  Catherine “Caty”
Kilburn (1794) Married
John Fisher on 3 May 1813
Pulaski Co. KY.  Sarah
Kilburn (1796) Married
Thomas McWilliams.  Mary
Polly Kilburn (1798-1874
Rockcastle Co. KY) mar-
ried Allen Owens (24 De-
cember 1793NC-28 Sep-
tember 18947IN) on 9 No-
vember 1815 Pulaski Co.
KY.  Allen served as a pri-
vate in the 11thRegiment of
the KY Mtd. Volunteers un-
der Captain Johnston Dysart
in the War of 1812.  Mary is
supposedly buried at Pine

(Cont. to B4)
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News from the
Rockcastle Courthouse

Circuit Civil
Suits

District Civil
Suits

Marriage
Licenses

District
Court

Rebecca H. Sturgill vs.
Danny Sowder, et al, forc-
ible detainer complaint.

Rebecca H. Sturgill vs.
Amanda Kates Bullen, forc-
ible detainer complaint.

Progressive Northern
Ins. Co. vs. Cruisers Motor-
cycle Sales LLC, $3,635.57
plus claimed due. C-00119

Sueann Shiloh Houp vs.
Kevin Thomas Houp, peti-
tion for dissolution of mar-
riage.

Jennifer Cameron vs.
Billy Cameron, petition for
dissolution of marriage.

Cabinet for Health and
Family Services, ex rel
Fannie Lamb vs. Tina
Barrett, complaint for child
support and medical sup-
port.

Cabinet for Health and
Family Services ex rel
Fannie Lamb vs. Vincent
Barrett, complaint for child
support and medical sup-
port. CI-00207

Christina Ann Pendery,
22, Mt. Vernon, Rockcastle
Hospital to Anthony Dou-
glas Prewitt, 22, Mt. Vernon,
Save-A-Lot. 9/2/14

Katelynn Janelle
Thacker, 22, Crab Orchard,
dental assist. to William
Ethan McClure, operator. 9/
3/14

Jessica Elaine Bledsoe,
18, Mt. Vernon, student to
Joshua Scott Lowery, 24,
Berea, minister. 9/4/14

Amber Leann Day, 18,
Brodhead, student to Cody

Lee Warner, 20, Brodhead,
mechanic. 9/5/14

Hon. Kathryn G. Wood
Sept. 8-10, 2014

Dominique K. Barnett:
fines/fees due ($173),
bench warrant (bw) issued
for failure to appear (fta), 4
days in jail or payment in
full.

Brenda J. Bellach: fines/
fees due ($188), bw issued
for fta/4 days in jail or pay-
ment.

William H. Brock: fines/
fees due ($183), bw issued
for fta/4 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Deana N. Childress:
fines/fees due ($61), bw is-
sued for fta/2 days in jail or
payment in full.

Brian T. Davidson: drug
paraphernalia - buy/pos-
sess, bw issued for fta.

Vernon E. Denney: cul-
tivating marijuana, $500
fine plus costs.

Keith Juan Douglas:
public intoxication con-
trolled substance, bw issued
for fta.

Kevin P. Fisher: no tail
lamps, no/expired Ken-
tucky registration receipt -
plates, failure of non-owner
operator to maintain req. in-
surance, operating on sus-
pended/revoked operators
license, bw issued for fta/10
days in jail or payment in
full.

John P. Hackworth: part
395/Fed Safety Regs -
Hours of Service, $25 fine
and costs.

Ronnie L. Maples: Part
391 Fed Safety Regs -
Qualification of Drivers,
bw issued for fta.

Bradley B. McClure:
speeding no/expired Ken-
tucky registration receipt -
plates, failure to produce
insurance card, bw issued
for fta/license suspended.

Earl M. Miller: fines/fees
due ($188), bw issued for
fta/4 days in jail or payment
in full.

William Pace, Jr: fines/
fees due ($38), bw issued for
fta/1 days in jail or payment.

Jose A. Pineda: no opera-
tors/moped license, $100
fine and costs.

Gary R. Ramsey: fines/
fees due ($483), bw issued
for fta/12 days in jail or pay-
ment in full.

Speeding: Ravon L.
Russell, paid; Christopher S.
Davidson, $20 fine and
costs; Tammy K. Lawwill,
Keith P. Morgan, license
suspended for fta.

Michael S. Howard: fail-
ure to wear seat belts, paid.

Shawn K. Settle: Part
391 of Fed Safety Regs -
Qualification of Drivers, bw
issued for fta.

Gregory E. Sherk: driv-
ing motor vehicle using
hand-held mobile telephone,
license suspended for fta.

David E. Smith: part 395/
Fed Safety Regs - Hours of
Service for Drivers, bw is-
sued for fta.

William N. Wilson:
fines/fees due ($188), con-
verted to 4 days/concurrent.

Donald J. Callahan: fail-
ure to wear seat belts, li-
cense suspended for fta.

Jason Durham: theft by
unlawful taking, 30 days/to
serve plus costs.

Derrick J. Newell: traf-
ficking in controlled sub-
stance, 3rd degree, 365
days/probated 24 months on
condition plus costs.

Justin N. Riddle: failure
to wear seat belts, 5 days in
jail; failure to use child re-
straint device in vehicle, 5
days/concurrent, costs
merged.

Heather B. Bradley:
fraudulent use of credit card,
theft of stolen credit/debit
crd, persistent felony of-
fender, bw issued for fta.

Curtis L. Broughton:
criminal trespassing and
drug paraphernalia - buy/

possess, bw issued for fta.
Carter E. Durham: no/

expired registration plates,
$25 fine and costs; no/ex-
pired registration receipt,
$25 fine and costs.

Jamauri W. Gibson: im-
proper registration plates,
improper lane usage, oper-
ating motor vehicle under
influence of alcohol/drugs,
failure to produce insurance
card, possession of mari-
juana, drug paraphernalia -
buy/possess, operating on
suspended/revoked opera-
tors license, failure to sur-
render revoked operators li-
cense, bw issued for fta.

Tabitha J. Halcomb: ob-
structed vision and/or wind-
shield, $25 fine; no seat belt,
$25 fine; failure to produce
insurance card, $50 fine and

costs.
Randall Hasty: failure to

produce insurance card, $50
fine and costs/fine sus-
pended.

Joseph S. Holsing: pos-
session of marijuana, $100
fine; drug paraphernalia -
buy/possess, $100 fine and
costs.

Connie L. Jones: posses-
sion controlled substance,
possession of marijuana, bw
issued for fta.

Shelley E. Looney: pub-
lic intoxication, bw issued
for fta.

Cassie L. Powell: theft
by unlawful taking or disp.
auto, bw issued for fta.

Jon W. Sanders: no/ex-
pired registration plates -
receipt, bw issued for fta.

Joshua R. Spoonamore:
no license in possession,
$25 fine and costs; failure
to wear seat belts, $25 fine.
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City of Mount Vernon’s Annual

Bittersweet
Festival

October 3rd & 4th
Downtown Mount Vernon

• Bittersweet Pageant • September 30th
• Bittersweet Cruise-In • October 2nd

• Bittersweet 5K Run/2 Mile Walk • October 4th
Join in a fun-filled weekend of free entertainment!

• Vendors  • Crafts • Cloggers • Parade
Inflatables • Karate • Food • Music

Applications for Vendors are being taken and can be picked up at City Hall

For more information call 606-256-3437

Stop by and see
Marlene Lawson

for all your life and
health insurance needs!

(606)
256-2050

Visit us on the Internet at https://www.kyfb.com/rockcastle/insurance/

Free Bible Courses
Free Bible Corres-

pondence Course. Send
your name and address to
3168 Quail Road, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456.
Let the Bible Speak

Tune in to “Let the Bible
Speak,” with Brett Hickey,
on Sunday mornings at 8:30
a.m. on WDKY Fox 56.

Homecoming
Homecoming will be

held at Clear Creek Baptist
Church on Sunday, Sept.
21st, beginning at 11 a.m.
Bro. Billy Long will deliver
the message. Everyone Wel-
come.

Homecoming
Homecoming will be

held at Scaffold Cane Bap-
tist Church on Sunday, Sep-
tember 21st with a meal
served after morning wor-
ship. Special singers will be
Bobby and Brenda Fugate.
Evalist will be Bro. Ed
Cortey. Pastor Chris Cobb
and congregation welcome
everyone.

Fall Revival
Fall Revival at Maple

Grove Baptist Church will
be held Sept. 28th through
Oct. 3rd at 7 o’clock nightly
with Bro. Everett Vanzant
officiating. Call 859-779-
4635 for transportation. Ev-
eryone welcome.

The church is located at
1148 Big Cave Road, Or-
lando.

Homecoming
Clear Creek Baptist

Church will celebrate
Homecoming Sunday, Sept.
21st. Lunch will be served
following the morning ser-
vice.

Special music will be
provided by Joe and Stacy
Isaacs.

Homecoming
Homecoming will be

held at Valley Baptist
Church on Sunday, Septem-
ber 21st with Bro. Evean
Eckler bringing the message
at 11 a.m. Lunch will follow
the morning service and 29
Strings will bring special
music in the afternoon.
Services to Resume

at Union Baptist
Union Baptist Church, in

the Red Hill section of
Rockcastle County out of
Livingston, will resume
church services on Thursday
night, beginning September
25th at 7 o’clock. Bro. Jack
Stallsworth, pastor of Flat
Rock Baptist Church will be
conducting the Thursday
night services.

Come and help us reopen
the doors at Union Baptist
Church that many souls will
be saved and Jesus Christ
will be lifted up.

Homecoming
Sand Hill Baptist Church

will be having their Home-
coming on Sunday, Sept.
21st. Sounds of Glory will
be singing. Pastor Tommy
Miller and congregation in-
vite everyone to attend.

Revival
The church will also be

In Revival September 25, 26
and 27, beginning at 7
o’clock each night. Bro.
Marlow Napier will be
preaching.

Pastor Tommy Miller
and congregation invite ev-
eryone to attend.

Homecoming
Fat Rock Baptist Church

will have Homecoming Ser-
vices this Sunday, Sept. 21st
at 11 a.m. Special guest
singers will be the Allen
Family from Missouri.

There will be good sing-
ing and lots of food so
please come and be a part of
this special service.

Pastor Jack Stallsworth
and congregation invite all
to attend.

Homecoming
Homecoming Services

will be held at Philadelphia
United Baptist Church, be-
ginning at 11 a.m., on Sun-
day, Sept. 21st. The Praise
Singers will bring special
music and there will be
food.

The church will also hold
a yard sale on Oct. 3 and 4
at Hwy. 39/150. Donations
can be left at the church or
at 205 J. Shelton Road (on
the porch) or call Bro. Gor-
don at 308-5368.

Hummel Homecoming
It was another great day

recently at the Hummel
Homecoming with over 100
coming to Hummel Hollow
for food, fellowship and
meeting friends.

Some came from as far
away as South Carolina, In-
diana, Tennessee, Ohio and
Virginia.

Those attending were:
Jesse and Sharon Thacker,
Tommy Bussell, Lonnie
Clark, Charlie Abney, Steve
Thompson, Donnie and
Brenda Abney, Muriel
Durham, Louella Bussell,
Robert Rodgers, Jason
Puckett, Tina Durham,
Gladys Adams, Janet
McClure, Randy Reynolds,
Matthew Reynolds, Bob and
Darlene Baker, Roy M.
Allen, Carol Kirby, Fred
McClure, Stacy Thacker,
Mike and Wanda Bussell,
Aiden and Ashton
Daughtery, Jake Bussell,
April Mason, Savannah
Hammons and Madison
Laswell, all from Mt.
Vernon;

Fred Rigsby of Wildie;
Kay Bullock of Orlando;
Wanda McCracken
Johnson, Donna McCracken
Weaver, Marilyn
McCracken Dewitt and
Lawrence and Rhonda
Miller, all from Berea;
Emily Reynolds, Lydia
Blunk and Adrian Lowe, all
from Indiana; Lloyd and
Ruby F. Bellamy Grimes of
Kingsport, Tenn.; Debra and
Irene Duncan and Kathy and
Allen Tucker, all of Amelia,

Ohio; Bobby and Linda
Baker, Hamilton, Ohio;

Ashlee and Blake Lee
Jones, Eddie, Nancy and
Blaze Reams, Tony,
Michelle, Allison and Emily
Clark, Allie Clark and
Debbie Clark Gilbert and
her triplet granddaughters,
Glenna Clark Collins and
Brent and Sandy Jones, all
of London;

Trula Fay Searcy and
Edna Burton, both of
Danville; Kim Abney of
Ludlow; Larry Reynolds of
Nashville, Tenn; Rick
McGuire of Richmond, Ind;
David and Christina
McGuire of Bishopville,
South Carolina; Charles
Lucas of Newport, Ohio;
Bob McGuire of Fountain
City, Ind; Jim and Cindy
Bennett of Williamsburg,
Ind., Lisa Abney Gregory of
Union, Ky, Tiffany McClure
of Louisville and Vickie
Duncan of Ohio.

Thanks to everyone who
helped in any way and, God
willing, we will see you next
year.

Carpenter &
Phillips Reunion

The Carpenter and
Phillips Reunion will be
held at the Lawrence
Phillips Place on Horselick
Creek in Jackson Co. on
Sat., Sept. 27, beginning at
11 a.m. with lunch served at
noon.

All family and friends are
welcome. Bring a covered
dish and lawn cxhair.

For more information,
call 606-453-2181.

McClure Reunion
The Johnny and Joe

McClure Reunion will be
held Sat., Sept. 20th at KCA
Church Camp beginning at
noon.

Contact Sheary McClure
Caldwell at 606-758-8617
or 606-308-1886 for ques-
tions or more info.

Cromer Reunion
The families of John and

Arlie Cromer will hold their
annual reunion Saturday,
September 20th. The event
will begin at noon and will
be held at the home of
Bentley Cromer. All family
and friends are welcome to
attend.

Please bring a covered
dish or dessert if you wish.
For more information, call
Bentley Cromer at 606-521-
7061 or Jeanne Cromer at
606-256-2704.

Cancelled

Reunions
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Commonwealth of Kentucky
28th Judicial Circuit

Rockcastle Circuit Court • Division II
Civil Action No. 14-CI-00047

Mary Ann Bullock, widow                  Plaintiff

V.

Elizabeth B. Hahn, and husband
David Hahn                            Defendants

NOTICE OF SALE

Pursuant to a judgment and order of sale entered
in this partition action on June 12, 2014, I will offer
at public auction the hereinafter described real
property in Rockcastle County, Kentucky.

At the Courthouse on East Main Street

Mt. Vernon, Kentucky

on Friday, September 19, 2014

Beginning at the Hour of 11:30 a.m.

Said property being more particularly bounded and

described as follows:

Located in Rockcastle County, Kentucky, and BEGINNING at a spring
on a line between Said Josiah Hayes and Nathan Bray with dogwood,
sourwood and maple pointers, thence with said line to a small beech,
supposed to be Bray’s line, sugar tree and dogwood pointers, said
beech standing nearly opposite the mouth of the lane leading to the
old David Bethurum house; thence about a west course to a persim-
mon tree standing nearly opposite the house; thence a straight line
northwest to a black oak and three hickories, a corner made by Will-
iam McClure and E. Bullock; thence with Bul1ock’s line to a black oak
made by Thas. Graves and E. Bullock with black oak, white oak and
ash pointers, supposed to be in or nearly in the old Moore survey, a
line of said Moore survey; thence with said line to a stone corner made
by Josiah Hayes and J. C. Watson having two chesnut and 2 sour-
wood pointers; thence a straight line about an east course to begin-
ning. The foregoing described piece of land being in the county of
Rockcastle, State of Kentucky, and on the waters of Skaggs Creek and
containing one hundred (100) acres more or less.
There is excepted from the above described property a one acre tract
of land conveyed by J.V. Bullock to J .L. Bullock by deed dated July 24,
1932, of record in Deed Book 66, page 162, in the office of the clerk of
the Rockcastle County Court, Mt. Vernon, Kentucky, described as fol-
lows:
Beginning on a Black Oak and three Hickorys, thence; 70 yds, East to
a stone, thence 70 yds. north to a stone, thence; 70 yds. West to a
stone, thence; 60 yds. South to the beginning corner, and same to
contain one acre to be the same more or less.

Plaintiff, MaryAnn Bullock and Defendant, Eliza-
beth B. Hahn are the owners in fee simple and in
possession of a one-half (1/2) undivided interest
each in and to property hereinafter described. The
Plaintiff obtained her one-half (1/2) undivided in-
terest by virtue of the Last Will and Testament of
her deceased husband, Wayne Eldon Bullock, re-
corded in the office of the clerk of the Rockcastle
County Court in Will Book 14, pages 141-145. The
Plaintiffs decedent and the Defendant, Elizabeth
B. Hahn each obtained a one-half (1/2) undivided
interest in the subject real property by deed dated
November 25, 2002, from Willis G. Coffey, Master
Commissioner of the Rockcastle Circuit Court, re-
corded in Deed Book 194, pages 7-11 in the Office
of the Rockcastle County Clerk.

The property shall be sold upon the

following terms & conditions:
1. The real property shall be sold together as a
whole and for cash or upon a credit of thirty (30)
days with the purchaser(s) required to pay a
minimum of twenty five percent (25%) of the
purchase price in cash on the date of sale and to
secure the balance with a bond approved by the
Master Commissioner.
2. The bond shall bear interest at the rate of
twelve percent (12%) per annum until paid in full.
The bond shall have the force and effect of a
judgment and shall be and remain a lien upon
the property sold as additional surety for the
payment of the purchase price.
3. Unpaid delinquent State and County ad
valorem taxes shall be paid from the sale pro-
ceeds.
4. The purchaser shall pay the 2014 local, county
and state property taxes.
5. The purchaser shall have possession of the
real property upon compliance with the terms of
the sale.
6. The sale shall be made subject to all ease-
ments, set back lines, restrictions or covenants
of record or otherwise and shall be sold “as is”.

John D. Ford
Master Commissioner

Rockcastle Circuit Clerk

DBCAA is accepting applications for its Weatheriza-
tion Assistance Program September 15, 2014. The
mission of the program is to improve energy efficiency,
household safety and to educate the public about
maintaining energy efficiency. To be eligible, your
family’s income must fall below 200% of federal pov-
erty guidelines (maximum income limit for a family
of 4 is $47,700) and your home cannot have been
weatherized since October 1, 1994.

Following are the services of the Weatherization Program:
  • Educate clients in safety & energy efficiency
  • Professionally evaluates single family dwellings,
    multifamily dwellings & mobile homes for safety
    & energy efficiency
  • Repairs or replaces existing heating systems as needed
  • Insulates homes as needed
  • Makes minor repairs to homes for health & safety
    reasons
  • Installs smoke & carbon monoxide detectors
Please contact Daniel Boone Community Ac-
tion Agency, Inc. at (606) 256-5315 for eligibil-
ity requirements, income limits per family size,
and additional program information.
Daniel Boone Community Action Agency, Inc. is an equal
housing opportunity provider.

Attention
Heat Vendors
The Daniel Boone Community Action Agency
will again be administering the Home Energy
Assistance Program (HEAP) for low-income

people in Clay, Laurel, Jackson and Rockcastle
Counties beginning November 3, 2014. Anyone
wanting to be a vendor in this year’s program
will need to attend a vendor meeting in their

perspective county.
The meeting for Rockcastle Co. will be held on

September 24, 2014 at 10 a.m.
The office in Rockcastle is located at

105 East Main St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
Phone 606-256-5315

Now Available
Tales of the Thunderbolt People
Traditiional Cherokee Appalachian Folktales

This is a softbound 22 page children’s book.
To order your copy, send check for $20, payable to:

David Owens
85 Chestnut Ridge Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

or call
606-386-0187

$10 of each purchase will go toward the cost of the field
study to inventory and document fish weirs in the
Rockcastle River.

October 1st thru
October 31st is

Rockcastle Roadside
PRIDE Month

To volunteer, call
James Renner,

Rockcastle County
PRIDE Coordinator
at 606-256-1902

An Appreciation Dinner
for all fall volunteers

will be November 8th at the
Rockcastle County

Recycling Center at Noon.

• Lunch Provided • Games and Prizes
• Fun For The Whole Family •

Hill Cemetery in Rockcastle
Co. KY and Allen is buried
at the Boatman Cemetery in
Parke Co. IN.  Their chil-
dren were: Nancy, Ashley,
Jennie, Martin, Henry,
Mahala, John, Allen Jr.,
Mary, Charity and
Wilmouth.   Thomas
Kilburn (3 January
1800KY-7 July 1855MO)
married Nancy Burton
(1804-1866) on 7 October
1829 Pulaski Co. KY.  They
are buried at the Stucker
Cemetery in Grudy Co.
MO.  Their children were:
Samuel, James, Charity,
Charlotte, Susan, Henry,
John, William, Martha and
Serena.  Hiram Kilburn
(1802- 18 September
1842IN) married Martha
Williams (1804-1872) on 14
March 1822 Pulaski Co.
KY.    They are buried at the
Boatman Cemetery in Parke
Co. IN.  Their children
were: Sarah, Nancy and
John.  Henry Kilburn (1805-
27 March1863IN) married
Elizabeth Ball on 5 Septem-
ber 1825 Lincoln Co. KY.
They are buried at the Boat-

man Cemetery in Parke Co.
IN.  Their children were:
Lewis, William, Sarah,
Serena, Charity, Nancy,
Matilda, Emily, Elizabeth
and Louisa.

To date, no descendant as
joined the Daughters of the
American Revolution under
Henry Kilburn.

“Patriots”
(Cont. from B1)

Students in Mrs. Sara Coguer's and Mrs. Wendy
King's fifth grade classes at Mt. Vernon Elementary
celebrated Patriot's Day last Thursday by making a
"We Remember" Twin Towers Memorial depicting
symbols of America that inspire them.

School News
LMC videos go home

each Friday and are to be re-
turned each Monday for stu-
dents whose names have
been drawn for having per-
fect attendance and/or on
track behavior.

FRC Enrichment classes
are each Monday from 3:00
until 4:25.  Parents must be
here promptly at 4:25.

There will be a Spirit
Card Fundraiser for MVES
PTG.  The fundraiser begins
on

October 2 and ends on
October 8.  Please check
your child’s folder for more
information.

Mt. Vernon Message
MVES UNITE Club News

UNITE Club registra-
tions and first meeting will
be held this week, Septem-
ber 15-19.

“Wipe Out Drugs” toilet
paper drive is scheduled for
September 25-October 16.
Students may bring in a 4
roll or larger pack or pennies
for toilet paper to be pur-
chased.  All contributions go
to local drug rehabilitation
centers.

UNITE Elementary
Clubs Poster Contest is for
all 4th and 5th graders.  The
deadline for entries is Sep-
tember 30th.  Detailed fly-
ers have been sent home
with students.

4-H Poster Contest Rules
Rules for this year’s

Rockcastle 4-H Poster Con-
test have been announced by
the County Cooperative Ex-
tension Service.

Deadline for submission
is October 9th.

First and second place
winners will receive a
plaque and third place win-
ners will receive a blue rib-
bon.

Rules for the contest are:
Well-known cartoon fig-

ures cannot be used because
they are copyrighted. For
example: Looney Tunes,
Sponge Bob-Square Pants,
Blues Clues, Mickey
Mouse, Star Wars,
Spiderman, Charlie Brown,
Pooh, etc.

All posters must be de-
signed on, or affixed to, .016
ply construction paper,

poster board (solid fiber
board) of 14x22 dimensions
(one-half a standard poster
board size). They may be
horizontal or verticle. Post-
ers may be produced by any
medium... watercolor, ink,
crayon, acrylic, charcoal,
oils or collage, so long as
they are not three dimen-
sional.

4-H is to be the topic for
the poster. You can show
what you think 4-H is, what
you do in 4-H, what you
think 4-H does for young
people.

The 4-H’ers name, age,
full mailing address, county,
area, teacher, school and
grade must be affixed to the
back of the poster board in
the upper left-hand corner.

Winners will be chosen
by grades 4, 5, 6, 7 and 8.
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Rockcastle Community
Bulletin Board
Sponsored By

Cox Funeral Home
Family Owned & Operated Since 1907

80 Maple Drive, Mt. Vernon, Ky. Ph. 256-2345
Toll Free 1-888-825-2345 • 24 Hour Obit Line 256-5454

www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Bookmobile Schedule
Mon.,Sept. 22nd: Scaffold Cane, Disputanta, Clear
Creek, Wildie. Tues., Sept. 23rd: Pongo, Ky. Hwy. 3245
and Bryant Ridge. Wed., Sept. 24th: Child Development,
Seek ‘n Learn, Tick Tock Pre School.

Bittersweet Festival
The Bittersweet Festival will be held in Mt. Vernon Fri-
day, Oct. 3rd from 4 to 11 p.m. and Saturday, Oct. 4th
from 9 a.m. to 11 p.m.

CCFFG Meeting
Concerned Citizens for Fair Government will hold their
regular monthly meeting on Thursday, September 18th
at 6 p.m. on the third floor of the courthouse. Please use
back door.

No Permit/Driver Testing
There will be be permit testing on Friday, October 3rd.
There will not be driver testing or permit testing on Fri-
day, October 31st.

Bittersweet Festival
The Bittersweet Festival has been scheduled for Friday,
Oct. 3rd from 4 to 11 p.m. and Saturday, Oct. 9th from 9
a.m. to 11 p.m. Applications for vendor sites can be picked
up at city Hall or call 606-256-3437 for more informa-
tion.

Parker Seal Picnic
The annual Parker Seal Picnic will be lheld Sat., Sept.
27th from 11 a.m. to 3 lp.m. at the Woodman of the World
Lodge on Haiti Road in Berea. Chicken will be furnished.
Please bring a covered dish and drinks. All former em-
ployees and their families are welcome. There will be an
auction, if you would like to bring an item. All proceeds
will go toward next year’s picnic. Please come and bring
your family. Let’s make this one a big one. For more
information, call Ruth Holman at 606-758-8544.

Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
The Rockcastle County Farm Bureau Annual Meeting
will be held September 19, 2014 at Roundstone Elemen-
tary School with dinner and entertainment provided. The
dinner will be at 6 p.m. and the meeting will follow at 7
p.m. All members are encouraged to join us. Call 606-
256-2050 for more info.

Florida Fruit/Nut Orders
The Rockcastle County Kentucky Farm Bureau 2014
Florida Citrus Fruit and Nut orders are being taken from
Monday, September 15, 2014 to Friday, October l27, 2014
during regular business hours. Please call 606-256-2050.

Tools for Growing Your Business
Are you making the best use of Social Media? Should
you update your marketing plan? EKU and the World
Trade Center of KY are bringing you FREE training op-
portunities! There will be a presentation at 9 a.m., one-
on-one consultations to address your needs begin at 10
a.m. every Monday in September at the Rockcastle Adult
Education Center. For more information, call 859-622-
7996 or email Yvonne.harrison@eku.edu.

Class of 1994 Reunion
RCHS Class of 1994 will hold a Reunion Saturday, Oc-
tober 11th from 7 to 11 p.m. at the Western Rockcastle
Fire Dept. A potluck meal will be served. Bring a dish
and drinks and celebrate our 20 year reunion. For more
info, call Sharon Tompkins at 606-256-3496 or  Shanna
Lawson at 606-7578-0050. No charge. Donations for the
fire department will be appreciated.

Livingston School Reunion
The annual Livingston School Reunion will be held Oc-
tober 4th at Livingston. All former students, teachers,
family and friends are invited to attend. This year we
will be recognizing graduates of the classes of 1954 and
1964. Registration information will be mailed to previ-
ous attendees. For info, call Barbara M. Castleberry, 256-
9188 or Doris Thompson, 256-1843.

DAR Meetings
The Rockcastle Chapter of the Daughters of the Ameri-
can Revolution meet the first Monday of each month,
September-May at 6 p.m. at First Christian Church in
Mt. Vernon. All prospective members are welcome to
attend.

Brodhead Lodge Meeting
The Brodhead Masonic Lodge #566 meets every third
Saturday at 7 p.m. on Main Street in Brodhead above
Brodhead Pharmacy.

Alcoholics Anonymous
Alcoholics Anonymous meets Tuesday nights at 8 p.m.
behind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St.
in Mt. Vernon.

Kiwanis Club Meetings
The Rockcastle Kiwanis Club meets every Thursday at
noon at the Limestone Grill. Everyone is invited.

Historical Society Hours
The Rockcastle Historical Society is open on Mondays
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the RTEC garage building.

American Legion Post 71
American Legion Post 71 meets the second Thursday at
6 p.m. of each month at the Limestone Grill. Commander
Tommy Hodges invites all Rockcastle veterans to join
this organization that honors American soldiers, sailors
and airmen.

Stratmann - Durham
Shawn and Patricia Stratmann of Science Hill and Brian
and Kelley Durham of Brodhead announce lthe forth-
coming marriage of their children, Rebecca Stratmann
and Walter “Ben” Durham. The wedding will be an event
of Saturday, October 4th at 4:30 p.m. and will be held at
the late Walter and Ida Durham home on Dysart Way,
Mt. Vernon. All friends and family are invited.

Hopkins - Hancock
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Hopkins and Mr. and Mrs. Troy
Hancock are pleased to announce the forthcoming mar-
riage of their children, Heather Hopkins and Joshua
Hancock. The wedding will be held Saturday, Septem-
ber 27th at 5:30 p.m. at the Craig-Elder Barn, Jasmine
Lane, Brodhead with a reception immediately follow-
ing. All family and friends are invited. The couple cur-
rently reside in Mt. Vernon with their children, Rayleigh
Brooke and Trevor Lee.



Classifieds
CLASSIFIED RATES
• Local Rates - $4 for 25 words
or less - .10 each additional word

• Display Classifieds
$5.00/Inch

Deadline for Classifieds
is 10 a.m. TUESDAY

For Rent

For Rent

Maple St. Storage

of Brodhead

256-2884 or
606-308-2491
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Property
For Sale

NOTICE
NO classifieds can

be placed over
the phone without
paying at time of

placing
advertisement

CLASSIFIED
ADS NOTICE

For your  convenience,
we now  accept VISA

and Mastercard
To place your

classified, have your
credit card ready

and call
(606) 256-2244

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Help Wanted

B.C.C. Metals
Featuring metal roofing, siding,

trim and insulation.
Same day service available on most orders.

Contact Jerry Blair
Toll Free 1-800-658-4902 • 256-4700

Located 4 miles s. of Berea, off U.S. 25 at 862 Lambert Rd.
Serving Rockcastle County & surrounding counties.

www.bccmfg.com

Notices

Mobile Homes
For Sale

0 Wabd Jones Rd.
Brodhead
$39,900

GILLIAM
REAL ESTATE & AUCTION

427 Chestnut St., Berea, KY • 859-986-9797
John Gilliam • Principal Broker

Realtor Loretta Powell - 859-302-8411
www.gilliamrealestate.com

3528 White Lick Rd. - 182.47 Acres - $475,000

00 White Lick Rd. (25.884 Acres) - $104,900

REDUCED! 4205 Scaffold Cane Rd. - Mt. Vernon - $75,000

254 Sue Johnson Rd. - Singlewide & 6+/-A - $39,000

REDUCED! 258 Sue Johnson Rd. -Doublewide & 3.12 A - $36,900

341 Pleasant View Dr. - Doublewide & 1.21 A - $69,000

2800 Richmond St. - Commercial Bldg. & 1 A - $125,000

With extra 11 A - $180,000 • 11 Acres only - $55,000

2780 Richmond St. - Doublewide & 0.645 A - $75,000

 2010 Singlewide only - NO LAND.

Rockcastle Health
& Rehabilitation Center

371 West Main Street • Brodhead, Ky  40409

Employment Opportunities
Physical Therapist; Night Shift-RN & LPN;

Day Shift-SRNA’s; Dietary-Full time and PRN;
Housekeeping-Full time and PRN

Please apply at our facility or call 606-758-8711
Signature HealthCARE is an Equal Opportunity Employer - EOE M/F/D/V

Local company seeking interested
applicants for:

Maintenance Technician &
Quality Engineer Positions:

Qualifications: General maintenance with basic
electrical experience - welding & cutting required

Qualifications: Quality Engineer – daily
inspection audits, inspect and test customer
products using various gauges, computer skills
with Microsoft office & ISO knowledge
Must have own tools and transportation.

Interested applicants send resume to:
PO Box 687

Richmond, KY 40475

Mobile Home on Lake.
$425 month/$450 deposit.
Reference required. 606-
392-1774. 38xntf
Large 2 story five bed-
room home, 2 baths, living
room, dining room, large
eat-in kitchen, located at
212 Maple St., across from
Baptist Church on corner of
Silver and Maple St. in
Brodhead. Available Octo-
ber 1st. $585 month. Secu-
rity deposit and credit check
required. Call 706-373-
6877 or 606-758-9209.
38xntf
2 Bedroom Trailer. No
pets. Security deposit re-
quired. 859-358-3560.
Duplex in Brodhead. All
appliances furnished. Call
Patty, 758-9666. 17xntf
Duplex in Brodhead. Call
Amy Nicely 256-8700.
Trailers and house in
Brodhead. No pets. 758-
8922. ntf
Accepting applications at
Mt. Vernon Housing Au-
thority on Mondays 4 to 8
p.m. and Wednesdays and
Fridays, 4 to 6 p.m. Rent
based on income. 256-4185.
14xntf
Accepting Applications:
For 2 and 3 bedroom units
at Valley View Apartments.
Rent based on income. Call
256-5912. Equal Housing
Opportunity, TDD for hear-
ing impaired only. 1-800-
247-2510. 36tfn

Posted

House on Scaffold Cane
Road, Mt. Vernon. 2 acres,
all fenced. House has
approx. 3,000 sq. ft. w/4
bedrooms, 2 1/2 baths, big
porches for easy living,
pool. Wonderful place to
raise a family. If interested,
and for more info, call 606-
308-1561. 36x4p
16 1/2 Acres, m/l,  with
24x60 mobile home, 20x20
attached garage, 2 large
barns, 2 large outbuildings
and carport. Blacktop drive-
way. $69,000. Call 606-
386-1470. 38x4p

2BR/2BA 1450 sq. ft. Sell-
ing for $89,900. Rick Szaks,
Broker. 859-255-7777. Lin-
coln Real Estate, Inc.
rickszaks@aol.com  18xntf
Between Mt. Vernon and
Somerset: 5.7 wooded
acres for $31,500. Near
Berea - 10.2 acres $31,900.
Owner financing available.
Call Dwight at 859-331-
4888. 8xntf
Lots in Castle Ridge Sub-
division. Use same entry
way as Bible Baptist
Church. All lots have city
sewer and underground
utilities. starting at $12,900.
606-256-5692 • 256-4504 •
308-3730. 50x1
Mobile home lots, located
in Sunnyside Mobile Home
Park. 1/2 acre lots - $500
down and $100 per month.
Call 606-256-5692 or 606-
256-5648. 50x1

Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or traveling through
land belonging to Scott
Anglin, on John Rigsby
Ridge Road, without writ-
ten permission only from
Scott Anglin. 36x4p
Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on land belonging
to Glen Roberts at 560 Dix
River Branch Road,
Brodhead. Violators will be
prosecuted. 35xntf
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or 4 wheelers on
property belonging to Will-
iam Johnson and Bill Parker
(formerly owned by Bar-
bara Setser) and located on
Hwy. 490, Mahaffey Hol-
low Road, Livinston. Viola-
tors will be prosecuted.
13x26
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or ATVs on land be-
longing to Jason and Sara
Coguer at Roundstone. Not
responsible for accidents.
Posted: No trespassing on
land belonging to James and
Dorothy Rash heirs on Rash
Branch Road off Chestnut
Ridge. No hunting, camp-
ing, ATVs, trespassing for
any purpose. Not respon-
sible for accidents. Violators
will be prosecuted. (1/15/
15)
Posted: No trespassing on
Crawford Place - Old
Brodhead Road. Danny
Smith. 47tfn
Posted: Absolutely no hunt-
ing, fishing or trespassing
on property belonging to
Mark and Debbie
Cummins. Violators will be
prosecuted. 9x52p

Posted: No trespassing,
hunting or fishing on land
belonging to Rachel
Denney on Hwy. 3245
(former Reggie Benge prop-
erty).
Posted: No trespassing on
property known as C.B.
Owens Farm across from
Fairgrounds in Brodhead.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted. 25tfn

Large 4 bedroom double-
wide with 4.69 acres in Lin-
coln Co. Bank foreclosure,
will finance. Price $64,900.
Ready to move into. Have
several repos without land.
Call Jim 859-985-0344. D&
D Transport. 39x1

Excellent Opportunity to
advance your career!
Malone Solutions is now
hiring for manufacturing
positions with a pay rate
between $9 and $13 per
hour. Apply online at
www.malonesolutions.com.
33x8
Truck Driving Position/
Local Milk Hauling. Must
have tanker endorsement
with CDL or willing to get
it, 3-5 days a week. Caudill
Trucking. Call Myron 606-
308-1387.

Please be advised that the
mobile home, on lots 24, 25
and 26 in Dusty Trails Sub-
division, will be considered
abandoned if no claims are
made within 30 days. To
make a claim, contact
Benton or Theresa Bullock.
39x3
The property left at 285
South Main St. in
Brodhead must be moved by
September 27th or will be
removed at owner’s discre-
tion. 39x1
Bids will be accepted for
catering service for the
Rockcastle County Senior
Citizens Adult Day Health
Care Center, located in
Rockcastle County, Ken-
tucky, to provide 50 hot
lunches per day (excluding
weekends). Caterers must
be registered with the Ken-
tucky Department of Educa-
tion, Division of School and
Community Nutrition, prior
to submitting bids. Call 502-
564-5625 for more informa-
tion. Bid packets may be ob-
tained at the center, located
at 1260 South Wilderness
Road, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456. Bids will be ac-
cepted at the above address
on September 29, 2014 at 10
a.m. 39x2
The following units, be-
longing to Rocket Storage,
will be sold to the highest
bidder on Saturday, Septem-
ber 27th. Units on
Crawford Street, #26, #27,
#49, #50, #51, #58 and #61,
beginning at 8 a.m. Rich-
mond Street Unit: #69 at
8:15 a.m. Williams St.
Unit: #5 at 8:30 a.m. West
Main St. Units: #25 and
#35 at 8:45 a.m. Highway
150 Unit: #41. Cash only
will be accepted. 39x1
Notice is hereby given that
Gail Kirby, 675 West Main
Street, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
lguardian of Jonathon Lee
Durham, a minor. Any per-

son having claims against
said appointment shall
present them, according to
law, to the said Gail Kirby
or to Hon. J erome S. Fish,
P.O. Box 1850, Mt. Vernon,
Ky. 40456 on or before
March 4, 2015 at 9:30 a.m.
38x2
Notice is hereby given that
Mayme Smallwood, 106
Rogers St., Berea, Ky.
40403 and Roxie Ambrose,
689 Scaffold Cane Road,
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456,
have been appointed co-ad-
ministrators of the estate of
Anna Lee Cope. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Mayme Smallwood and/or
Roxie Ambrose or Hon.
William D. Reynolds, 140
West Main St., P.O. Box
1250, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 on or before Mrch 2,
2015 at 11 a.m. 37x3
Notice is hereby given that
Timothy J. Reynolds, 235
Joyce St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
Executor of the estate of
Billy R. Reynolds. Any per-
son having claims against
said estate shall present

them, according to law, to
the said timothy J. Reynolds
or Hon. John D. Ford, P.O.
Box 247, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 by March 9, 2015 at
9:30 a.m. 39x3
Notice is hereby given that
Peggy S. Falin, 75 West
Main St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
executrix of the estate of
Freda Alcorn. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Peggy S. Falin or Hon. John
D. Ford, Coffey & Ford,
PSC, P.O, Box 247, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456 by
March 4, 2015 at 9:30 a.m.
38x3



Morgan Plumbing
Service & Repair

New Construction •
Commercial & Residential Service

Fully Insured • All Work Guaranteed

256-4766 • 606-232-0666

Mechanic
On Duty

All Types of Repairs
We do muffler &

exhaust replacement and
custom pipe bending

BEE Garbage
256-2334

Weekly residential
curbside pickup

$1700 per month with Curb Cart

MPL #6761

5076 S Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

David’s Tire Center
24 Hr. Towing & Recovery LLC

1431 S. Wilderness Rd. (US 25)
Mt. Vernon

Save On All Major Brand
Tires For Cars & Trucks

Farm Tractors • Lawn & More

David & Josh Thompson, Owners
Office/24 Hr. Wrecker
606-256-4606

Town & Country
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE

All Types of Mechanic Work

Call 256-9634 days or
256-4650 nights

MADISON TERMITE
and PEST CONTROL
Call Paul Burton - Day or Night

256-2318 - Mt. Vernon
-----

STOP TERMITES  ROACHES  WATERBUGS

Winstead’s
Heating & Air

Pat Winstead
606-256-1038 • 606-308-4825

HM04434

On-Site
Computer

Service
Tired of sending your
computer

away to get
it fixed?

Call and let us come to
you for all your computer

needs!

Setup, Consultation,
Software/Hardware Conflicts

Virus/Spyware Removal

Reasonable Rates
Call

Spencer Benge
606-308-5653

Caudill Dump Truck Service
Rock • Gravel
Agr. Lime
Sand

Rock & Job Quotes
Driveway Spreading
Dumping/Stockpile

Contact for competitive pricing:
Myron - (606) 308-1387

Kentucky Auto Exchange
Public Auto Auction • Dealers Welcome

Every Saturday and Tuesday at 7 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
Located on Exit 38 in London on Hwy. 1006

(606) 878-7815

Financing Available
through Wells Fargo

*w/ approved credit

Visa, Mastercard,
Discover
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John’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’s
Repair

Appliance
& Plumbing

Faucet & Toilet
308-5646

John Tyler, Owner

Rocket Carpet
Cleaners

Circular Dry Foam Cleaning

(606) 256-9870

Thinking About Cleaning Your Carpet!
Some things to think about…

What is the best way to clean my carpet, should I use the
old technology of steam cleaning or the new technology

of dry foam?

Test results from Consumer Report, 2008.

Option 1: Steam Cleaning-How does it work?
A. Steam Cleaners saturate your carpet and floor pad with hot (150*
degree) soapy water containing lye and beach to help dissolve stains.

B. After your carpet reaches its maximum saturation point the solution
is then extracted by means of a commercial shop vacuum.

The results: Removes less than 20% of the soil from the carpet driving
the remainder down deeper into the carpet fibers.  The lye/bleach

solution used by steam cleaners to dissolve stains fades carpet colors.
Drying time is 1 to 5 days depending on the carpet texture.  As a result
of the water saturation, carpet fibers harden and the floor pad remains
damp, which promotes bacteria growth and mildewing, causing carpet

threads to rot, shorting the life of your carpet.  Carpet manufactures
recommend that you do not steam clean carpets.

Option 2: Dry Foam-How does it work?
C. Carpet fibers are agitated with carpet combs to separate the fibers
loosening dirt particles, which are then dry cleaned with an industrial

strength vacuum.
D. The carpet is then shampooed with horse hair brushes using

Dry-Foam lather, a solution that contains six different cleaners and
fabric softener, color brightener, deodorizer, disinfectant, crystalline

agent, scotch guard, & degreaser. Does not contain lye or bleach.
E. Carpet fibers are then groomed to fluff up worn walk areas to give a

uniform look to the carpet.
The results: Removes over 90% of carpet soil.  Rejuvenates and

brightens colors and patterns of carpets.  Drying times is less than 2
hours.  Floor pads remain dry-Fabric Softener makes carpets soft again-

Promoting the life of the carpet.
Carpet manufacturers recommend Dry Foam to clean Carpets.

Professional
Services

Heating & Air

COMPLETE HOME
COMFORT

Locally owned and Located at:

523 West St. • Brodhead, Ky.
Rodney Smith

758-0155 • 256-1683 • 859-661-5986
We service all Brands and Models • 20+ years experience

Free Estimates - Affordable Service - Call for Rates
Expert Installation & Troubleshooting • Friendly Hometown Service

Heat Pumps and Gas Furnaces
Fully Licensed and Insured HVAC and Electrical • MO-4808 and CE63779

Now Buying Junk Cars
Hauling off appliances for free!

Call Mike
(606) 308-2487

256-0122

Gutters Cleaned and Repaired

General Construction

Tiling • Flooring859-302-0197

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Wanted

Jonathan Collins Remod-
eling and Repair Service.
Home improvements of any
kind from doors and win-
dows, painting, new floors
to roofs and decks - will do
it all. Any home, any prob-
lem, “we’re the one to call.”
606-308-3533. 37x4p
Owens Monument: Lo-
cated behind Owens Fu-
neral Home in Brodhead.
Open Mon-Fri. 8 to 5 and
Sat. 9 a.m. to noon. 606-
758-9600. 14xntf
Notice: Will haul off or buy
scrap metal, junk cars or
trucks. Metal hauled for
free. 231-6788. 14xntf
Grave Markers & Monu-
ments: In stock at all times.
McNew Monument Sales,
US 25, 4 miles north of Mt.
Vernon. Phone 256-2232.
U Call We Haul! Anything
that fits on a truck. Local or

long distance. Building -
demolition - moving -
clean-ups - bushhogging -
landscaping. No garbage.
606-256-9222 o4 308-1629.
35xntf
Gail’s Pampered Pooch
57 West Main St.,
Brodhead. For appt. call
606-758-0064
20xntf

Wanted to rent or lease
pasture ground for live-
stock. 859-329-8651. 38x2p
Will pay cash for old gas,
oil, dealerships, parts manu-
facturer signs, old gas
pumps, L&N collectibles,
anything regarding the
Cummins family from
Rockcastle County, John
Deere, International Har-
vester, antiques, etc. Com-
ing to Mt. Vernon the week
end of October 3-4, 2014.
Contact Kari Cummins
Ogle at 502-836-6922 with
any questions. 34x7
Wanted To Buy: Your an-
tiques and collectibles. An-
tique glassware, furniture,
quilts, all types of military
items, clocks, watches
(working or not), pocket
watches and wrist watch
parts, pocket knives, coins
and paper money. All types
of gold, silver scrap, cast
iron banks, toys, lighters,

crock jugs, cast iron skillets,
marbles, pocket knives,
fishing items, Indian Arrow-
heads, and much, much
more. Also buying partial
estates. Over 25 years expe-
rience. Call Clarence Reece
at 606-531-0467. 47xntf

Miscellaneous
For Sale

Make $1,000 selling your old scrap cars-trucks and farm
equipment and machinery.

Call 24 hours a day. If no answer, leave message and your call will be returned.

859-358-3560 or 606-256-3841 anytime

We also buy
batteries, converters,
aluminum wheels and

radiators, starters,
and alternators.

Used tires and parts
for sale at dirt
cheap prices.

Sigmon Farm now has
Kennebec Potatoes and red
sweet potatoes for sale. 256-
2781. 39x2
425 gallon water tank. Fits
in the bed of a truck. $225.
Four new Goodyear Integ-
rity tires. 225-60/16. Still
has stickers on them.
$325.Poulan Leaf Blower
and vacuum. 210 h.p. New.
$100. 4x8 - 1 1/2” pool
table. Beautiful wood, yel-
low felt with all the balls
and racks. 22 pool sticks.

Also 8 & 9 ball racks. Table
is only four years old. Gave
$2,800, asking $1,700 for
table and Budweiser helmet
pool table light. For more
information, call 606-308-
1025.
Single Sealy Ergomotion
bed - similar to hospital bed.
Cost $1500, asking $500.
Like new l- barely used.
Call l758-4236, leave mes-
sage. 38x2p
1997 27 ft. Fleetwood Wil-
derness travel trailer.
$1,800 as is, needs some re-
pair. 1998 20 ft. Bayliner
Bowrider. $1,500, needs
motor. 919-816-7902. 37x4

Yard Sales
Yard Sale: 4 miles from 150
on Hwy. 70, across from fire
dept. Thursday and Friday,
8 to 6. Lots of men’s clothes,
misc., dress shirts, cook-
books. Rain cancels.
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Each year, students at Rockcastle County High School have the opportunity to
enroll in Advanced Placement Courses in order to better prepare themselves for
college and to get a jump start on college credits. Students can take A.P. Courses
which are quite rigorous in content in social studies, English, math, and science.
Each A.P. course concludes with a college-level exam developed and scored by
college and university faculty members as well as experienced A.P. teachers. If
students earn a 3 or higher on the exams, they can earn college credit at colleges
and universities across the country. Rockcastle County High School continues to
increase the number of A.P. courses offered to students, and many students have
reaped the rewards of their hard work. Last year, R.C.H.S. had a total of 49
students who passed their A.P. exams, and seven who scored at the highest level
on the exams. We are very proud of their accomplishments. Pictured are five of
the students who earned a score of 5. Front row: Amelia Eversole and Rachel
Blair. Back row: Ethan Mattingly, Ryan Martin, and Alex Spragens. Not pic-
tured are Alyssa Allen and Madisan Miller, who graduated in May, 2014.

RCMS receives donation to help those in need...
Rockcastle County Middle School Youth Service Center recently accepted a large

donation of food from the Richmond Centre's JCPenny's. The donation was made to
the school's snack bag program that provides weekend meals for students and families
in need. Amber Cruery, pictured second from left, decides what local charity the asso-
ciates at JCP will donate to each month.  Because two of the RCMS's own, Cassandra
Smith and Lilly Rader, work part time at this JCP, Ms. Cruery asked them if the
Rockcastle County Middle School could benefit from one of these months of charity.

Ms. Smith and Ms. Rader responded with an ecstatic "yes!"  Ms. Cruery then de-
cided that some of the charity months the store participates in throughout the year will
benefit the middle school directly.  The associates at JCP brought in over four hundred
food items throughout the month of August to donate to the school.

Adoptable Shelter Dogs

Hello. My name is Scout and I am a male, 2 year old
Golden Retriever/ Yellow Lab mix. I was an owner
surrender to the shelter and I am now looking for a
new home. I would make a great pet as long as I
could be the only dog. I am very friendly with every-
one I meet and I would really like to be a part of a
family that would love me forever. If you have room
in your family for a companion like me then call the
shelter @ 256-1833. (kennel #3)

Hey! My name is Chief and I am a one year old Boxer/
German Shepherd mix. I was surrendered to the shel-
ter by my owner because I like to play too rough with
chickens and housecats, (if you know what I mean).
I am a fairly large dog, about 75 lbs. and I am very
energetic so I would need a home where I could get
plenty of exercise. If you are looking for a superb
watchdog and a loving companion then I am the dog
for you! If you are interested in adopting me then
call the shelter @ 256-1833. (kennel #4)

Yards to Paradise
 By Max Phelps

Landscape Solutions
Berming up a spot or a

whole section of a property
can offer lots of potential
options just not available
with a flat yard. Many of my
customers live in hilly ter-
rain, but for those with flat
yards, installing some
humps or little hills in the
yard can allow for more cre-
ative landscaping possibili-
ties. Other benefits can be
obtained with a berm. For
instance, lines of sight can
be obstructed for privacy,
winds can be blocked,
sounds can be blocked off,
or on the other side of that
equation sounds can be en-
hanced by doing something
like putting a waterfall on
the side of a berm facing the

home or porch or patio or
other resting spot. Berms
offer many creative possi-
bilities for some lovely land-
scaping.

A simple definition of a
berm is a raised dirt mound.
It may be at the crest of a hill,
at the foot of a slope, or off
to the side of the middle in
an otherwise flat yard.
Though a berm would not
have to be created from soil,
one would be unable to plant
the berm with lovely trees
and shrubs or flowers with-
out the berm being soil cov-
ered.

Berms are thought of by
industry and perhaps by mu-
nicipalities as containment
facilities quite often. Created
to contain run-off water, or
to contain a spill in the event

of a ruptured storage tank or
something. And berms may
act as a dike or diversion
barrier to keep water out of
an area (I can imagine a
berm on a slope just above
your home to deflect water
in a heavy rain for instance).

Berms can simply be a
raised planting bed, with
good soil aiding in the estab-
lishment of new plantings.
Such raised beds in a yard
planted in suitable plants are
lovely creations. But taller
berms can not only be
planted with hedges, trees
and shrubs for a buffer from
wind and noises, but the
raised area itself can be a
barrier to noise and winds.
(Such a large berm will take
more soil or other materials
than you may imagine
though, making it quite
costly.)

Traffic can be steered by
the use of berms. A short cut
through the grass to the shed
or mailbox may be handy,
but may look unattractive, or
even wear a path into an oth-
erwise lovely lawn. Crossing
a hill and dodging bushes
makes cut-throughs less
likely to happen.

Raised areas offer teriffic
opportunity for the land-
scaper to put in a focal point.
A “specimen” tree, a large
boulder, anything you'd like
to raise up and show off.
Flagpoles, treehouses, big
rock outcropping could be
things one might put on dis-
play.

Substantial sized berms
can create little microcli-
mates, places you can put in
a shade loving item on the
side of the berm facing north
or in the shadow of a tree
that's on top of the berm.
From the sun-loving plants
to those needing protection
from strong winds, there
may be ideal nooks created
in a berm to use rare or un-
usual plants and have them
thrive in just that specific
spot. I love the possibilities;
thinking about it gets me to
dreaming of trying a plant or

two that normally isn't found
in my area.

Especially on level lots,
adding some raised areas
with irregular sweeping
edges allows for added in-
terest, and for changes in
line of sight without neces-
sarily having to use tall
plants to accomplish the
changes in height. A layered
landscape planting may
more easily be obtained with
the background plants put
on a pedestal, so to speak.
Tallest landscape plants
would be placed on the back
of a berm usually, but for the
best landscaped look from
the other direction, the back
side, it might be that you'd
want the tallest plants to be
right on top of the berm. The
conclusion we can reach is
that many interesting things
can be done with a berm in
the yard.

There are no hard and
fast rules, but you'd want a
berm to be 4 or 5 times as
wide as high to keep it from
lookng too artificial. Also,
flowing edges rather than
straight or angular edges
will look much more natu-
ral in most cases. No rules,
but be mindful you don't
want to create an eyesore
either.

A berm, or series of
berms, can divide or parti-
tion a landscape. Maybe the
veggie garden and outbuild-
ing can be screened with a
berm rather than a hedge or
fence. A quiet seating area
can be created by putting the
berm so as to keep others
from watching your every
move.

Whether your berm is a
rolling raised area you can
drive the mower over, is
planted in pretty flowers and
shrubbery, is the stage from
which to show off your rock
garden or waterfall, or pos-
sibly you want to create a
forested berm, my hope is
you've gotten a new idea or
two for your landscape. If
you decide to build a berm,
try to make it informal, off-
set from the center of any-
thing, and don't make the
tallest part of it be right in
the middle. And for those
not sold on a major berm,

perhaps a little one just at
one corner of the home ex-
tending out a little and
planted in some lovely new
plantings would be a fit for

your home.
The author is a landscaper

specializing in waterfeatures.
Contact via

www.rockcastles.net

Pictured above is a plaster cast mold of a 435 lb. Blue
Marlin, caught by Cynthia Alcorn Harms off the
coast of Cona in Hawaii. Mrs. Harms has caught sev-
eral other big fish on two other Hawaiian vacations
and said it is a thrill each and every time.
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The 2014 Rockcastle County High School football homecoming is this Friday night during halftime of the
Rockets vs. Perry Central football game. In the photo above are the Queen candidates shown front row from
left: Allison Renner, Sarah Roberts, Emily Deubel, Sierra Mercer, Ashley McKinney and Kali Lay. Middle
row: Hannah Sowder, Cheyenne Morgan, Rachel Cain, Hannah Whitaker and Brooklyn Bishop. Back row
from left: Jahrisa York, Amelia Eversole and Caroline Coguer.

RCHS King candidates are shown above, front row from left: Aaron McNabb, Hunter Rigsby, Duncan Stanford,
Paul Holbrook and Cameron Brown. Middle row from left: Lucas Gentry, Carson Noble, Justice Masters and
Erik Durham. Back row: Avery Bradshaw, Tate Clements and Sam Pensol.

A Georgia man was killed in a motorcycle accident Monday afternoon on I-75 northbound at the 67 mile
marker in Rockcastle County. Authorities say Joseph Carpenter, 62, of Columbus, Georgia, was traveling
northbound on I-75 in the left lane when he lost control of his motorcycle and struck the barrier cables before
landing in the median. Carpenter was airlifted from the scene to the UK Medical Center where he was later
pronounced dead by the Fayette County Coroner’s Office.

Former Mt. Vernon
police officer arrested
for assaulting elderly
patients in his care

Senator McConnell
scheduled to appear
at Kiwanis meeting

By: Doug Ponder
A former Mt. Vernon po-

lice officer, who is accused
of assault and neglect, is
now in custody.

Arrested was Brian K.
Doan, 35, of Somerset.

According to Somerset
Police reports, the incident
began on September 11th
when Doan severely as-
saulted two residents who
were under his care at a
mental and physical treat-
ment facility in Somerset.
Doan was noted as an em-
ployee of the facility at the
time of the assaults.

During the investigation,
officers received informa-
tion that Doan grabbed a
resident by the throat and
choked him unconscious.
Once the resident fell to the
floor unconscious, Doan al-
legedly jumped on them
several times.

After jumping on the
resident, Doan allegedly
picked the resident up and
placed him in a shower/
bathtub full of cold water.
Doan then reportedly held
the resident’s head under

Blood Drive is
next Tuesday

The Kentucky Blood
Center is hosting a blood
drive in Brodhead next
Tuesday. Those wishing to
donate can do so at the
Brodhead Baptist Church
from 3 to 6:30 p.m.

Everyone who registers
to give blood through Sep-
tember 30th is eligible to
win a 2014 Toyota Corolla.

To schedule a donation
visit kybloodcenter.org or
call 1-800-775-2522. Blood
donors must have a photo
ID, be seventeen-years-old
weigh at least 110 pounds
be in good health and meet
other requirements. Sixteen-
year-old donors must have
a signed parental permission
slip.

U.S. Senate Republican
Minority Leader Mitch
McConnell will visit
Rockcastle County to take
questions and give an up-
date on current legislation in
Washington.

McConnell is scheduled
to visit on Thursday, Octo-
ber 9th at noon at the Lime-
stone Grill in Mt. Vernon.

The event is sponsored
by the Mt. Vernon Kiwanis
Club and the Rockcastle
Chamber of Commerce.
Those wishing to attend are
being asked to RSVP to

McConnell’s office by call-
ing 606-864-2026.

McConnell is facing op-
position from current Ken-
tucky Secretary of State
Allison Grimes for his U.S.
senate seat in the fall gen-
eral election in November.

According to the latest
poll by SurveyUSA,
McConnell leads Grimes 46
percent to 42 percent of
likely voters. Libertarian
David Patterson received 5
percent in the survey and 8
percent remain undecided.

By: Doug Ponder
A Georgia man was

killed in a motorcycle acci-
dent Monday afternoon on
I-75 at the 67 mile marker
in Rockcastle County.

According to the
Rockcastle County Sheriff’s
Department, Joseph Carpen-
ter, 62, of Columbus, Geor-
gia was travelling north-
bound on I-75 in the left lane
when he lost control of his
motorcycle and struck the
barrier cables before landing
in the median.

Carpenter was airlifted
from the scene to the UK
Medical Center where he
was later pronounced dead
by the Fayette County
Coroner’s Office.

The accident is under in-
vestigation by the
Rockcastle County Sheriff’s
Department and Deputy
Sheriff Shannon Franklin is
in charge of the investiga-
tion.

The cause of the accident

Georgia an killed in
motorcycle accident

remains unknown at this
time. However, no drugs or
alcohol are suspected as
factors in the accident.

Bittersweet Festival is October 2nd - 4th

7eventh Time Down scheduled
to play at Corbin in October

The City of Mt. Vernon’s
annual Bittersweet Festival
is scheduled for Thursday
October 2nd through Satur-
day October 4th.

The festival will kick off
Thursday, October 2nd with
the Bittersweet Cruise-In on
Main Street from 5 to 8 p.m.
Registration begins at 5
p.m. and dash plates will be
awarded to the first 65 en-

tries.
On Friday, October 4th,

events will begin at 4 p.m.
with a performance by the
Romp n’ Stomp cloggers.
Ruby Powell will perform
from 5 to 5:45 p.m., Coun-
try Wide from 6 to 7:45 p.m.
and the Medley Boys  from
8 to 11 p.m.

On Saturday, the day will
start with the Bittersweet
5K run/2 mile walk at 7:30
a.m. with registration begin-
ning at 6:30 p.m.

The Bittersweet
Cloggers will perform from
11 a.m. to noon.

The parade will be from
noon to 1 p.m. and Mercy
Roadz will perform from 1
to 1:45 p.m.

Wilderness Road will
perform from 2:15 to 3 p.m.,
followed by Jake and
Courtney who will take the
stage from 3:15 to 3:45 p.m.
Blind Ricky is scheduled to
perform from 4 to 5:45

Rockcastle Shaolin Do
will hold demonstartions on
Friday, October 4th and Sat-
urday October 5th at 6 p.m.

Level Green will per-
form from 6 to 7:45 and The
Wild River Band from 8 to
11 p.m.

Entertainment during the
festival will also include
free inflatables for the chil-
dren and vendor booths.

The Miss Bittersweet
Pageant was cancelled this
year due to the lack of par-
ticipants.

Local man
charged with
child porn
exploitation

By: Doug Ponder
A local man was arrested

last Friday for possession
and distribution of matter
portraying sexual perfor-
mances by minors.

Arrested was Troy Lester
Durham, 39, of Mt. Vernon.

According to state police
reports, detectives used law
enforcement systems in July
to query IP addresses from
computers that had been
sharing child pornography
files on the internet.
Durham’s IP address to his
computer was identified
during the investigation.

Detectives obtained a
search warrant last Wednes-
day for Durham’s residence
on Silver Mist Corner in Mt.
Vernon. Once detectives ar-

However, Pageant Di-
rector Karen King said they
plan on sanctioning a Miss
Rockcastle Pageant for next
year to generate more inter-

est and give the pageant
winner more opportunities
to participate in other state

A local Christian Rock
band is scheduled to play at
The Arena in Corbin next
month as part of the “We
Believe Tour.”

7eventh Time Down will
be part of a concert at The
Arena on Friday, October
3rd at 7:30 p.m. The band

is currently touring with the
Christian rock band Family
Force 5 and the well-known
Christian pop-rock band
Newsboys.

7eventh Time Down
band members Mikey

(Cont. to A10)

(Cont. to A10)

(Cont. to A10)

(Cont. to A10)
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A local woman was seriously injured Tuesday afternoon at Mahaffey’s Quick Lube on Jerri Lane in Mt.
Vernon. Authorities say Diane Fain, 72, of Mt. Vernon slipped and accidentally fell into one of the oil chang-
ing pits. Fain was caught by the safety net but hit her head on the concrete floor. She was airlifted to the UK
Medical Center where her injuries and condition were unknown at the time of publication.

water for an extended period
of time. Afterwards, Doan
took the resident out of the
cold bathtub and placed him
in front of an open hot oven
while holding him at
knifepoint.

Doan went on to tell the
resident that if he told any-
one about the incident that
he would kill him. Several
other residents later told of-
ficers that they had also been
assaulted or choked by Doan
in the past.

The resident who was se-
verely beaten by Doan was
admitted and treated at a lo-
cal hospital for several “se-
rious physical injuries.” An-
other resident was treated at
the hospital for broken ribs
as a result of a prior assault
by Doan.

Based on information
gathered by detectives dur-
ing the investigation, an ar-
rest warrant was issued for
Doan on Monday for two
counts of first degree assault,
two counts of knowingly
abuse/neglect of an adult and
two counts of intimidating a
participant in the legal pro-
cess.

However, when police
searched for Doan he was
nowhere to be found until
they received a report of a
domestic violence incident,
on Tuesday morning, at
Doan’s residence in
Somerset.

When officers arrived,
they learned that Doan had
been at the residence and al-
ready left on foot. Doan’s
wife told officers that he
kicked the back door open
and forced his way into the
residence.

Once inside the home,
Doan grabbed his wife by
the mouth to keep her from
yelling for help before sud-
denly leaving the residence
on foot. Officers also noticed
a large red mark above
Doan’s wife’s mouth.

A Pulaski County
Sheriff ’s deputy spotted
Doan on Hwy 39 around 1
p.m. Tuesday and arrested
him.

Doan is charged with two
counts of first degree assault,

rived, they seized several
pieces of electronic equip-
ment and electronic storage
devices that are still pend-
ing a full forensic evalua-
tion.

Detectives also noted
that Durham’s arrest is a
part of the ongoing task
force program for Internet
Crimes Against Children.

Durham is charged with
distribution of matter por-
traying sexual performances
by a minor and possession
of matter portraying sexual
performances by a minor.
He was lodged in the
Rockcastle County Deten-
tion Center where he was
later released on a $50,000
cash/property bond.

Howard (vocals and rhythm
guitar), Eric Vanzant (lead
guitar), Austin Miller (drums)
and Cliff Williams (bass) are
all graduates of Rockcastle
County High School. The
band released their first al-
bum “Alive in You” in 2011.
The album included hit
singles “Alive in You,”
“What About Tonight” and
“Jesus Machine.” They re-
leased their second album
“Just Say Jesus” in Septem-
ber 2011 which includes hit
singles “Just Say Jesus” and
“The One I Am Running To.”

For more information
about ticket availability and
prices, visit
www.ticketmaster.com or
call 1-800-745-3000.

two counts of intimidating a
participant in the legal pro-
cess, two counts of abuse/
neglect of an adult and one
count of assault fourth de-
gree. He remains lodged in
the Pulaski County Deten-
tion Center on a $75,000
cash/property bond.

“Officer”
(Cont. from front)

“Band”
(Cont. from front)

pageants.
For more information

about the festival contact
City Hall at 606-256-3437.

“Exploit”
(Cont. from front)

“Festival”
(Cont. from front)

September is National
Preparedness Month, and
Kentucky Utilities Com-
pany offers four proactive
steps to take in advance of
and following severe
weather.

•Make a kit — Having
an emergency prepared-
ness kit ready in advance
for each member of the
family can help make re-
sponding to an emergency
less stressful and more or-
ganized. In addition, con-
sider carrying a kit in the
trunk of a vehicle for emer-
gencies. Visit ready.gov to
find a list of suggested
items to include, such as a
first-aid kit, crank-powered
flashlights, whistles, batter-
ies, prescription medicines,
blankets, bottled water, a
can opener, cash and a
weather radio.  (Editor’s
Note: A one-minute video,
“Packing Your Emergency
Kit,” was created to show
viewers how to make an
emergency  preparedness
kit.  Media are invited to in-
clude this video as part of
any coverage.)

•Stay informed — Dur-
ing outage situations, KU
provides near real-time
outage information
through the utilities’ auto-
mated phone system,
online outage map and out-
age map app offered on a
variety of mobile devices.

• Tell KU about it — Re-
porting downed power
lines, hazardous conditions
and power outages  imme-
diately can help the utilities
more quickly isolate areas
impacted during severe
weather. KU customers
should call 1-800-981-
0600. Speed dial "1-1-2" to
quickly navigate through
the automated phone sys-
tem and report the situa-
tion. Follow us on Twitter
and Facebook for informa-
tion updates.

•Safety comes first —
Always assume any
downed wire is an ener-

gized power line. Stay
away  from the area and
report it immediately.

Visit lge-ku.com/storm
for additional preparedness
tips and safety information.

How to handle outage recovery
following severe weather
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Customer Appreciation Day
September 25th

Pulled Pork, Fries
w/ Drink
$4.99

Door Prizes • Music Outside
Everyone please come out and enjoy the day with us!

ramblings...
by: perlina m. anderkin

Getting ready to take a
week’s vacation with daugh-
ter, Allison, her husband,
Daniel and daughter, Celia.

Although I’m not a big
vacation person, I am look-
ing forward to getting away
-- the pressure of constant
care of two dogs, and my
stressful job, is getting to
me, jk.

The main thing I stress
out over is the logistics of
getting ready. I’m not a good
planner. I invariably go on
vacation and find that I have
packed too much of what I
don’t need, not enough of
what I do and forgotten
something essential.

I also find myself remi-
niscing about past vacations.
We had some good (hectic)
ones with our first five -- I
was usually the one causing
the hectic part by way of the
aforementioned lousy logis-
tics. But, in my defense, it
was quite a challenge to get
together enough clothing,
etc. to last seven people for
a week.

There were some scary
times. Once in Georgia, I
was carrying all our vaca-
tion money and we had
stopped for breakfast. When
we were leaving the parking
lot, a man in another car
started waving frantically to
get Jim’s attention. I was sit-
ting there imploring Jim to
ignore the “crazy man” who
only wanted to kill us and
take our children. Thank
goodness, Jim was a little
more sensible and pulled
over whereupon the gentle-
man told us there was a
purse sitting on top of our
car. Needless to say, Jim and
I then split up the vacation
cash.

The same thing hap-
pened at Disney World on
another vacation. The girls
and I were waiting outside
the ladies room for our turn.
Jim and Rick had gone to the
men’s room. When we met
afterwards, Jim’s first ques-
tion was “where’s your
purse?” Thank goodness, it
was still sitting on the bench
where I had left it when we
went into the ladies room.
God protects....

During that same trip,
Jane rode the roller coaster
which looped several times
and her glasses, which we
had picked up a week before
we left, fell off and were
never recovered from be-
neath the ride.

Jim had a great sense of
direction while I have
trouble finding Brodhead,
especially with the new 150.
But there were occasions
when he would take a wrong
term and, with his refusal to
ask directions, we would
find ourselves in a parking
lot, in the middle of the
night, trying to figure out
where we went wrong. The
older children threatened to
write their school paper on
“How I spent my vacation”
detailing our parking lot vis-
its.

But, I will be glad to get
away and do not intend to
read one newspaper, listen
to TV or check facebook.
For one week I intend to for-
get about ISIS, the myriad
problems facing our nation,
the upcoming election any-
thing that depresses me and
enjoy Celia.

The Way
I See it

By
Doug Ponder

The Trophy Generation
I had an intriguing con-

versation with a friend over
the weekend about the
amount of experience and
quality of candidates during
interviews for jobs.

Our conversation came
down to a single scenario
where there was two equally
qualified candidates who
were interviewed and being
considered for a job. Both
candidates had a related col-
lege degree for the job and
both candidates didn’t have
any required work experi-
ence for the job (due to their
being recent college gradu-
ates.)

The difference between
the two candidates was
“Candidate A” had just
graduated from college in
May. They had received a
“full-ride” to college
through scholarships and
they had excelled academi-
cally throughout their col-

lege career.
Although Candidate A

had no work experience on
their resume, they had an
extensive list of school and
career-related organizations
where they held an office in
almost every organization.

However, “Candidate B”
graduated from college in
May 2013 and has been un-
employed since graduation,
applying for numerous jobs
without even getting a
single interview. They re-
ceived some small scholar-
ships while they were a stu-
dent in college and they
struggled academically be-
cause of having to work full
time to pay their tuition as
they also had no financial
support from their family.

Candidate B’s resume
wasn’t “bedazzled” with
memberships or offices held
in any organizations simply
because they had to spend
their time away from school
either working or studying.
However, Candidate B had
developed a large amount of
work experience due to hav-
ing to work throughout their
college career to pay their
tuition.

So after describing both
candidates, my friend im-
mediately said they would
choose Candidate A for the
job. Their reasoning was
Candidate A had excelled
academically, was heavily
involved in several organi-
zations and was also an of-
ficer in the majority of those
organizations.

Also, my friend said
Candidate A was successful
in practically every one of
their endeavors and they
knew what it took to be suc-
cessful in life. My friend
went on to say that Candi-
date A would be the obvi-
ous choice for the job as
they would bring their “suc-
cess” mindset to the job.

However, I said I would
choose Candidate B. My
friend thought I was crazy
and immediately asked me
why I would want to pick
Candidate B over Candidate
A? My friend went on to say
Candidate B wasn’t a suc-
cessful person.

My reason for hiring
Candidate B over Candidate
A was simple. Candidate B
had experienced failure and
overcome adversity to
“earn” a degree despite
many hardships experi-
enced during their college
career. Candidate A appar-
ently had no failures in life
and the only thing they
knew about adversity was
how to spell it or how to use

Points
East

By Ike Adams

(Cont. to A6)

(Cont. to A4)

(Cont. to A6)

I grew it, over the last 9
weeks, and picked over 100
ears of bodacious sweet corn
late last Sunday evening.
Loretta worked it up and put
about 3 gallons in the
freezer. Over the last 25
years we have come to be-
lieve that it tastes as good for
Christmas and Easter din-
ners as it did when it came
out of the garden.

Normally I grow the
main crop for harvest in July
but last year we discovered
that it grows much faster if
you plant it about the same
time as the first crop is com-
ing in.  It also seems to taste
much better in late season.

The first two crops,

planted in late April and late
May, respectively, required
over 80 days from planting
until harvesting in the heat
of summer.   This late crop,
planted from the same 2-
pound bag of seed that I pur-
chased back in April, was
ready to harvest in 65 days.

We also grew Ambrosia
and Kandy Corn this year.
We either purchased or had
friends and family share 5 or
6 other varieties with us so
that we could compare their
taste and tenderness to
bodacious when cooked and
served at the same time.

As far as Loretta and the
rest of my immediate fam-
ily is concerned, all other
varieties are better than hav-
ing no sweet corn at all, but
nothing else comes close to
bodacious in meeting our
personal standards for the
perfect sweet corn.

My brother, Keeter, says
sweet corn should either be
golden yellow or snow
white.  He swears by Kandy
Corn and super sweet silver
queen.  Bodacious is neither
golden yellow nor white and
Keeter says it just doesn’t
look like corn oughta look
to him.

I suppose you could call
it cream colored or maybe
it looks like a lemon that is
about half ripe.  As far as I’m
concerned the color, itself,
should be called bodacious
because it is unique to the
corn. At least I have never
seen anything else quite that
same color.

So I told my kid brother

And Then It Was Winter
This week I received an

email from Bobby Harper
discussing the winter of our
lives: how well we are ag-
ing? It touched a nerve,
prompting me to think about
the effect that this period is
having on my life. (Thanks
to Bobby and those of you
who read my column
weekly and let me know
what you think. I appreciate
every connection you make
with me.)

I remember being quite
a young boy when my
grandfather (Pop) told me
that he was about to turn 63,
and I started to cry. He
asked, “What is wrong,
David Joe?” My reply made
him chuckle. I said, “Pop, I
don’t want you to die!” With
a smile on his face, he ex-
plained that being 63 was
not a fatal stage in one’s life,
but just a period when a per-
son is “slowing down.” At
that time, he may as well
have told me that he was 100
– it seemed all the same to
me. He was extremely old.

Now that I am entering
my 70’s, Pop’s age of 63
actually seems pretty young.
Perspective can be every-
thing.

Bobby’s email begins as
follows:

“It seems just yesterday
that I was young, just mar-
ried and embarking on my
new life with my mate. Yet
in a way, it seems like eons
ago, and I wonder where all
the years went. I know that
I lived them all. I have
glimpses of how it was back
then and of all my hopes and
dreams. But, here it is... the
winter of my life and it
catches me by
surprise...How did I get here
so fast? Where did the years
go and where did my youth
go?”

My wife, Kathy, and I
have just celebrated our 35th

wedding anniversary, and
we remarked how quickly
we have moved into retire-
ment age. Kathy will retire
from her position with the
Kentucky Court of Appeals
shortly, and we both are
shocked at how quickly the
past 21 years have flown by.
She observed, “Do you re-
alize that in two weeks we
will no longer have to get up
at a certain time? We can
sleep as long as we like, and
it will not matter to anyone.”

Bobby’s message
touched on how we re-
sponded to seeing our par-
ents and grandparents as
they were making it through
the aging process.

“I remember well seeing
older people through the
years and thinking that those
older people were years
away from me and that win-
ter was so far off that I could
not fathom it or imagine
fully what it would be like.
But, here it is...my friends
are retired and getting
grey...they move slower and
I see an older person now.
Some are in better and some
worse shape than me...but, I
see the great change...Not
like the ones that I remem-
ber who were young and
vibrant...but, like me, their
age is beginning to show
and we are now those older
folks that we used to see and
never thought we'd be.”

I watched my own par-
ents and grandparents as
they gradually aged and be-
gan to have health issues. It
was so hard to witness their
moving into nursing homes
and seeing how quickly they
developed illnesses from
which they could not re-
cover. Mommie Katie lived
to be 100 years old, and my
mother (Bee) was 91 when
she passed away. After my
parents and grandparents
were gone, my brother Al
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This year’s inductees are residents Peggy Bowling,
Kenneth Leach, David Brock, shareholder Vicki McClure

and community leader Danny Ford.

Special Guest Speaker: Judge Buzz Carloftis

James B.
Lunsford

James B. Lunsford, 80,
of Nicholasville, and for-
merly of Brodhead, died
Tuesday, September 16,
2014 at his residence. He
was born June 6, 1934 in
Brodhead, a son of the late
James Bennett Lunsford and
Elizabeth Delaney
Lunsford. He was past Wa-
ter Superintendent for the
City of Brodhead, and secu-
rity guard for a Textile Co.
He was a member of Sul-
phur Wells Christian Church
in Nicholasville, and was a
long time Deacon at
Brodhead Christian Church.
His hobbies and interest
were computers.

He will be lovingly re-
membered by: his wife of
36 years, Dorothy Lunsford
of Nicholasville; sons,
Donald Ray (Debbie)
Lunsford and Randal Lee
(Brenda), all of
Nicholasville; grandchil-
dren, Vernon Bennett
Lunsford of Tulsa, OK,
Brandy Lee Rivera  of
Nicholasville, Rebecca
(Clifton) Taylor of Wilmore,
and Christopher (Jessica)
Thompson of Nicholasville;
two great grandchildren:
Leela Rivera and Tiffany
Brooke Rivera; and a host of
nieces/nephews, friends and
neighbors.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by a
sister, Hazel Ruth Lunsford
Wren and infants William
Richard Lunsford and Bar-
bara Jean Lunsford.

Funeral  services were
conducted Sunday, Septem-
ber 21, 2014 at the Marvin
E. Owens Home for Funer-
als Chapel with Bro. Tyson
Cummings officiating.
Burial was in the Methodist
Church Cemetery in
Brodhead.

Casketbearers were:
Frankie Reynolds, John
Howard, Jimmy Peel, Mike
Grubb, Shorty Willis and
Vernon Lunsford.
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Betty Moore
Betty Moore, 80, of

Brodhead, died Tuesday,
September 16, 2014 at her
residence. She was born
April 28, 1934, a daughter
of the late Charles C. and
Birdie B. Brummett
DeBoard. She was a 35 year
employee at Parker Seal.
She found great joy in sew-
ing, quilting, NASCAR,
cooking, grandchildren and
great grandchildren. She
was a loving and devoted
mother, grandmother and
great grandmother. She was
a member of Brodhead Bap-
tist Church and the NOAH
Club.

She will be lovingly re-
membered by: her daughter,
Sue (Gary Cromer) Moore
of Brodhead; grandchildren,
Angela (Jackie) Woodall,
Scotty (Mandi) Hopkins,
Jason (Kayla) Moore, Ricky
Dale (Alice) Moore and
Kristi Moore; great grand-
children, Amber, Kenzie,
Cindy, Chris, Dalton, Haley,
Addison, Eli, Kelsey and
Ally; brothers, Johnny
(Carol) DeBoard of
Brodhead, and Al (Hazel)
DeBoard and Sam (Betty)
DeBoard, all of Mt. Orab,
OH;  sisters,  Jewel (John)
Haarman of Brodhead,
Birdie DeBoard of Mt.
Vernon, and Marie (Carl)
Alsip of Cincinnati, OH;
and a host of nieces/neph-
ews, friends and neighbors.

Besides her parents, she
was preceded in death by:
her long time companion
Wm. Gene Phelps “Cisco”
and her former husband
Howard Moore, Sr.; sons,
Ricky Dale Moore, Sr. and
Howard “Tom” Moore, Jr.;
brothers, Delbert Lee,
Arthur Lee and Felix “Teek”
DeBoard; and sisters, Lou
Ann Wallin, Myrtle
Howard, Pearlie DeBoard,
and Rena Osbourne.

Funeral services were
conducted Friday  Septem-
ber 19, 2014 at the Marvin
E. Owens Home for Funer-
als Chapel, with Bro. Ralph
Baker officiating. Burial
was in the Debord Cem-
etery.

Casketbearers include:
Jason Moore, Scotty
Hopkins, Ricky D. Moore
Jr, Jackie Woodall, Gary
Cromer and Jacob
Mckinney.
Condolences to the family may be

made to his online registry at
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Danny
Stevens

Danny Stevens, 53, of
Brodhead, died Friday,
September 19, 2014 at his
home.  He was the husband
of Teresa (Brown) Stevens,
whom he married October
4, 1980. He was born
March 30, 1961 in Spring-
field, OH to Helen
(Broughton) Petrey and the
late Orville D. Stevens.  He
had worked as a foreman
for Wehr Construction
Company for 24 years.  He
was a very faithful and
dedicated member of the
Liberty Baptist Church and
served as the church clerk.
He loved horseback riding
and he was a loving hus-
band, son, father, brother,
papaw and was a friend to
many.

Survivors include: his
wife of  33 years, Teresa
Stevens of Brodhead; a
daughter, Amanda Brook
(Bill) Hurt of Brodhead; his
mother, Helen (CJ) Petrey
of Lancaster; sisters, Ann
(Ricky) Pittman of
Brodhead and Vicki Lay
(Randy) Reynolds of
Eubank; granddaughter,
Keira; special nephew, Der-
rick; and five special
nieces, Angie, Whitney,
Kendra, Kali and Kassie.

In addition to his father,
he was preceded in death by
his brother, Alan Stevens
and his sister, Sandra
Stevens.

Funeral services were
held Tuesday, September
23, 2014 at Liberty Baptist
Church with Bro. Zandell
Hasty and Bro. Noah
Broughton officiating.
Burial was in Liberty Bap-
tist Church Cemetery.

Pallbearers were:  Der-
rick Pittman, Larry Taylor,
Jimmy, Dale and Jordan
Whitaker, John Payne, and
Randy Miracle and Bill
Hurt

Honorary pallbearers
were: Felmer Hawkins,
Keith Brown, Ricky
Pittman, and the Youth at
Liberty Baptist Church.

Memorial Contributions
can be sent to the Liberty
Youth Program In Memory
of Danny at 338 Gold Dust
Drive, Mt. Vernon, Ken-
tucky 40456.

Pate
Bullock, Jr.

Pate Bullock, Jr., 79, of
Brodhead, died Tuesday,
September 23, 2014 at the
Rockcastle Regional Hospi-
tal after a long illness. He
was born August 27, 1935
in Rockcastle County the
son of the late Pate and
Mildred Mize Bullock. He
was a retired Truck Driver
for Stewert Fertilizer, en-
joyed playing cards, going
to car shows, and was a
member of the Mt.Pleasant
Baptist Church.

Survivors are many
nieces and nephews.

Funeral services will be
conducted at 1 p.m. (today)
Thursday, September 25,
2014 at the Mt. Pleasant
Baptist Church with Bro.
Raymond Offutt  officiating.
Burial will follow in the Mt.
Pleasant Cemetery.

Arrangements are by the
Cox Funeral Home.
View the complete obituary, sign

the guest registry, or send
condolences to the family online
at www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

Douglas
Wayne Leece

Douglas Wayne Leece,
67, of Brodhead, died Sat-
urday, September 20, 2014
at his residence. He was
born January 24, 1947 in
Brodhead, a son of the late
Charlie and Altie Hazel
Leece, and had been a Car-
penter by trade. He attended
the Pentecostal Church and
found great joy in carpen-
try, working with his  hands.

He will be lovingly re-
membered by: his brother,
Willie Leece of Brodhead;

David
Singleton

David Harrison Single-
ton, 82, of Eubank, husband
of Judy Ann (Morris)
Singleton, died at his resi-
dence September 20 ,2014.

Graveside services were
conducted Wednesday, Sep-
tember 24, 2014 at the
Singleton Mountain Cem-
etery with Bro. Lonnie
McGuire officiating.
www.marvineowensfuneralhome.com

Timothy
Carl Henry
Timothy Carl Henry, 54,

of Mt.Vernon, died Satur-
day, September 20, 2014 at
the Wilkes-Barre General
Hospital in Wilkes-Barre,
PA. He was born April 11,
1960 in Lexington, the son
of Mrs. Clyde Leslie
Gilliam Blanton and step-
father Nelson Blanton of
Mt.Vernon. He was a horse
trainer, and a member of the
Baptist faith.

 Survivors besides his
mother are: three brothers,
Anthony Dean Henry of
Electic, AL, Joseph Dee
Henry of Lexington, and
Nelson Eugene Blanton of

Amberly Northern
The family of Amberly

Bernice Northern would like
to express our thanks and
appreciation to all of our
friends, relatives and well-
wishers who surrounded us
with their love and care dur-
ing our loss.

We were deeply touched
by all the numerous calls,
cards, visits, food, gifts,
flowers, prayers and words
of encouragement.

Your acts of kindness and
generosity made our burden
more bearable. The commu-
nity coming together was
very special.

Our hearts were there
with each and everyone of
those who helped get the
benefit together and also all
that attended.

We thank you from the
depths of our hearts.

May you all be blessed.
Matt and Serena

Northern

Denver Phelps
Words cannot begin to

express our sincere thanks,
during the brief illness and
death of our brother and
uncle, Denver Phelps, to
those who helped and loved
him.

Denver walked the
streets and visited people
everyday in Mt. Vernon. He
had so many friends --
Charlene Reynolds, Opie
Wynn, Bobbie Saylor,
Wilma Moddy, Buzz
Carloftis, Kevin Roberts,
Betty Kidwell, George and
Betty York, the guys and
gals from Back Porch BBQ,
McKinney Tire, Town and
Country, Renfro Valley,
Hardee’s, Wendy’s, Lime-
stone Grill, friends from
Wildcat Mountain and so
many more we can’t begin
to name them all.

Thank you for your
prayers, flowers, cards,
those who brought food,
Rockcastle Hospital, Dr.
Arvin, the Rehab Center,
Bro. Gary Reppert,
Dewayne Hutton for the
music, Marvin and Judy
Owens and our church fam-
ily at Brodhead Christian.

God bless each of you.
The Phelps Family

Conley, Doris, Sheary

Cards of Thanks

Card of
Thanks

In Loving
Memory of
Amberly B.
Northern

Perhaps you sent a lovely
card, or sat quietly in a
chair.

Perhaps you sent beautiful
flowers, if so, we saw
them there.

Perhaps you spoke the kind-
est words, as any friend
could say,
Perhaps you were not
there at all, just thought

of us on that day.
Whatever you did to con-

sole our hearts,
We thank you so very much,

whatever the part.
A special thank you from,
Matt & Serena Northern

Bill Reynolds
We, the family of Bill

Reynolds, wish to express
our heartfelt gratitude to all
who supported us during his
long illness and passing.

Thank you to the hospi-
tal and doctors for their care,
Hospice - all nurses and
staff were absolutely won-
derful, for the prayers of
everyone and to Cox Fu-
neral Home. God bless you
all.

Thanks to Tim’s friends
who brought food, etc., the
singers - Ralph, Emanuel,
Ruby and Mattie. Their
songs were beautiful.

Deepest appreciation to
Bro. Jim Miller for his com-
forting words and a special
thanks and love to all the
sweet sisters of Livingston
Pentecostal Church for their
labor of love in preparing all
that delicious food. We love
you all.

Tim Reynolds
and all the family

sisters, Mary Masden and
Betty (Joe) Reeks, all of
Lebanon Junction, Ollie
(Donald) King of Crab Or-
chard and Nellie Brummett
of Heledon, OK; a special
friend, Irene Bishop; and a
host of nieces/nephews,
friends and neighbors.

Besides his parents, he
was preceded in death by: a
brother, Donald Edgar
Leece; and two brother-in-
laws, Bill Masden, and Effie
Brummett.

Funeral services were
conducted Tuesday, Sep-
tember 23, 2014 at the
Marvin E. Owens Home for
Funerals.. Burial was in the
Piney Grove Cemetery.

Casketbearers were: Joe
Reeks, Kenny Dees, Jr.
Stout, Bobby Smith, Kerry
Self, and Wayne King.

Fayetteville, PA; one sister,
Leah Canaan McHone of
Lexington; and one step-sis-
ter, Anita Land Sparks of
Winchester. He is also sur-
vived by his father, Woodro
Henry and many nieces and
nephews.

Funeral services will be
conducted at 2 p.m. Satur-
day, September 27, 2014 at
the Cox Funeral Home with
Bro. Randy McPheron
officiating. Burial will fol-
low in the Cresthaven Cem-
etery.

 Arrangements are by the
Cox Funeral Home where
friends may visit from 6 to
9 p.m. Friday, September
26th.

Send condolences to the family
online at

www.coxfuneralhomeky.com

For those
who want
to know
who I am...

My name is Harry Potter and
I am running for the office
of Mayor of Mt. Vernon.

I am 45 years old and married to Brenda Wilds-Potter. We have two
sons, Tony and Jonathan, and one grandson, Tristin. My children have
attended and are attending Rockcastle County Schools.

I have owned and operated my own business and dealt with the public
for the last 15 years. My business, the Auto Repair Shop, is located be-
hind my home on Rose Hill Road. I am also employed full time by the
Rockcastle Co. Road Dept. I am a dedicated hard worker.

As a candidate for the office of Mayor of Mt. Vernon, I want voters to
know that I am against any increase in water rates, taxes, etc. I will be
devoted to keeping all city roads maintained and up to standards to
serve the people of this city. I will work to bring small businesses back
into the community. Let’s bring more activities to our town and make a
better atmosphere for our community for all ages.

I am open to any suggestions that will help make changes to our
community for the better.

I would like to ask for your vote come November!

Vote Harry Potter for Mayor
PD. FOR BY HARRY POTTER
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Bookmobile Schedule
Mon.,Sept. 29th: Brodhead and Copper Creek. Tues.,
Sept. 30th: Green Hill, Fairview, Lambert Road,
Sweetwater Road. Wed., Sept. 31st: Day Health, Senior
Citizens, Wayne Stewart Center.

Clear Creek/Disputanta Homecoming
The Clear Creek/Disputanta Homecoming will be held
Saturday, Sept. 27th at the Berry-Ramsey Park on Wildie
Road. Potluck “vittles” will be served around 12:30 p.m.

No Permit/Driver Testing
There will be be permit testing on Friday, October 3rd.
There will not be driver testing or permit testing on Fri-
day, October 31st.

Bus Drills - Early Dismissal
The Rockcastle County Schools will be conducting Emer-
gency Bus Evacuation Drills on Thursday, October 2,
2014. Rockcastle County High School and Middle School
will dismiss at 2:45 p.m. Buses will proceed to the el-
ementary schools where the drills will be conducted.
Please adjust your schedule for this early dismissal. There
will not be any school on Friday, October 3, 2014, KEA
Day.

American Legion Raffle Items
The Rockcastle American Legion Post #71 will be raf-
fling three items at the Bittersweet Festival. They are:
(1) A Dale Earnhardt “Tribute to a Legend” case knife
with collector case knife with collector case - $120 value.
(2) A basket filled with Rocket apparel - $75 value. (3)
17” Gator Back Hunting Knife with Red Pakka wood
handle and sheath - $50 value. Tickets may be purchased
from American Legion members or at our booth at the
festival. Tickets are $1 each or 6 for $5. Contact Joe
Howard 606-308-1594 or Bobby Kendrick 606-308-9918
for details.

Retired Teachers Meeting
The Rockcastle County Retired Teachers will meet on
Wednesday, October 8th at 11 a.m. for lunch at the Lime-
stone Grille. This is the first meeting of the new year and
important topics will be discussed. All retired teachers
are encouraged to attend.

Bittersweet Festival
The Bittersweet Festival has been scheduled for Friday,
Oct. 3rd from 4 to 11 p.m. and Saturday, Oct. 9th from 9
a.m. to 11 p.m. Applications for vendor sites can be picked
up at city Hall or call 606-256-3437 for more informa-
tion.

Parker Seal Picnic
The annual Parker Seal Picnic will be lheld Sat., Sept.
27th from 11 a.m. to 3 lp.m. at the Woodman of the World
Lodge on Haiti Road in Berea. Chicken will be furnished.
Please bring a covered dish and drinks. All former em-
ployees and their families are welcome. There will be an
auction, if you would like to bring an item. All proceeds
will go toward next year’s picnic. Please come and bring
your family. Let’s make this one a big one. For more
information, call Ruth Holman at 606-758-8544.

Florida Fruit/Nut Orders
The Rockcastle County Kentucky Farm Bureau 2014
Florida Citrus Fruit and Nut orders are being taken from
Monday, September 15, 2014 to Friday, October l27, 2014
during regular business hours. Please call 606-256-2050.

Class of 1994 Reunion
RCHS Class of 1994 will hold a Reunion Saturday, Oc-
tober 11th from 7 to 11 p.m. at the Western Rockcastle
Fire Dept. A potluck meal will be served. Bring a dish
and drinks and celebrate our 20 year reunion. For more
info, call Sharon Tompkins at 606-256-3496 or  Shanna
Lawson at 606-7578-0050. No charge. Donations for the
fire department will be appreciated.

Livingston School Reunion
The annual Livingston School Reunion will be held Oc-
tober 4th at Livingston. All former students, teachers,
family and friends are invited to attend. This year we
will be recognizing graduates of the classes of 1954 and
1964. Registration information will be mailed to previ-
ous attendees. For info, call Barbara M. Castleberry, 256-
9188 or Doris Thompson, 256-1843.

DAR Meetings
The Rockcastle Chapter of the Daughters of the Ameri-
can Revolution meet the first Monday of each month,
September-May at 6 p.m. at First Christian Church in
Mt. Vernon. All prospective members are welcome to
attend.

Brodhead Lodge Meeting
The Brodhead Masonic Lodge #566 meets every third
Saturday at 7 p.m. on Main Street in Brodhead above
Brodhead Pharmacy.

Alcoholics Anonymous
Alcoholics Anonymous meets Tuesday nights at 8 p.m.
behind Our Lady of Mt. Vernon Church on Williams St.
in Mt. Vernon.

Kiwanis Club Meetings
The Rockcastle Kiwanis Club meets every Thursday at
noon at the Limestone Grill. Everyone is invited.

Historical Society Hours
The Rockcastle Historical Society is open on Mondays
from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. in the RTEC garage building.

American Legion Post 71
American Legion Post 71 meets the second Thursday at
6 p.m. of each month at the Limestone Grill. Commander
Tommy Hodges invites all Rockcastle veterans to join
this organization that honors American soldiers, sailors
and airmen.

Our Readers Write

Dear Editor,
 We have collected sev-

eral coats and a few hats to
take to the Homeless Shel-
ters in Lexington in mid-
December. We have less
than three months  and still
need donations of coats,
gloves ,scarves, hats, socks
and blankets.to give to the
less fortunate. You can al-
ready feel the difference in
the weather as we get closer
to winter. Please help us
with this project by donat-
ing one or more items listed.
We are ONLY accepting
clean and gently worn items.
We may not be able to keep
everyone warm in the cold
months but we want to give
to as many as we can.. If you
want to donate, you may call
758-0277. All donations can
be picked up for your con-
venience. We cannot do this
without you, won't you
please be a part of this much
needed project?

Betsy  wants all her
friends to call with at least
one donated item. She said
she will be waiting for your
calls.Thanks to all for shar-
ing a little to make someone
else a little more comfort-
able. I will update monthly
on the progress as we get
closer to our distribution
date.Thanks to all.

Kathy Bretz
for Betsy's Project

Outerwear
needed for
winter...

Paint Rockcastle
Pink...
Dear Editor,

Breast Cancer Awareness
Month is just a few weeks
away, and the
GRANDTAZZZTICS are
once again encouraging ev-
eryone to "Paint Rockcastle
Pink!" during the month of
October!  Let's join together
as a united community to
show our pink!  We are sell-
ing our annual tee shirt, and
the money raised stays in
our county to help our
people!!   It is distributed to
the Hope Fund (Rockcastle
Regional), Hope Ministry
(Kaye Rader Heseltine), and
the Grandmas for Aware-
ness.

You can help by purchas-
ing and wearing our beauti-
ful lime "Paint Rockcastle
Pink!" shirts.  Sizes Small

through XLarge are only
$12.00; larger sizes are only
a few dollars more. Shirts
can be purchased from any
of the "grandmas" or at the
following places: A Cut
Above, Limestone Grille,
Main Street Pharmacy,
Sabrina's Hair Design, and
Sparks Flowers and More.

We would like to thank
this year's "PINK PART-
NERS" who have been so
generous to help:

A&J Nicely Insulation,
Brodhead Equipment,
Brodhead Pharmacy, Cedar
Rapids Recreation Center,
Citizens Bank, City of
Livingston, Collins' Respi-
ratory Care, Community
Trust Bank, D & S Design,
Debra Lambert Law Office,
EconLodge, Ford Realty,
His Heart Quartet, John
Hamm Auto Sales, Lime-
stone Grille, McDonald's,
Main Street Pharmacy, Mt
Vernon Drug, Mt Vernon
Signal, PBK Bank, People's
Bank, Richmond Street Eye
Care, Rockcastle Pharmacy,
Rockcastle Regional Hospi-
tal, Rocket Storage.

Some of these businesses
may plan to showcase "Pink
Specials" during the month
of October.

We appreciate them so
much, and we appreciate
you for your annual support.

Best blessings,
The Grandmas for

Awareness
PS Let's not forget those

mammograms!

To the coaches of
Rockcastle Co.
girls basketball
teams...

This letter is to thank all
of you who have put your
time, effort and, sometimes,
resources into the coaching
of these remarkable girls.

I have always felt that the
more adult role models, who
show love and support for
our children and grandchil-
dren, the better they will
succeed in life.

You coaches must be so
proud of the tremendous re-
sults you see each time these
girls take the floor. To those
of you who have not seen a
Rockcastle County girls
basketball game - you don’t
know what you’re missing!

In my opinion, these girls
also realize that without
their teammates fulfilling

their respective roles, the
individuals they are would
not be able to perform as
they do.

And, to each and every-
one fortunate enough to see
some of these games, please
remember that some of the
games are being played by
5 to 13-year-olds.

Sincerely,
Deborah Newland

“I See It”
(Cont. from A2)

it properly in a sentence.
Truth is, everyone expe-

riences some type of hard-
ships and failures in the
workplace, especially when
they are “learning the ropes”
of a new job. That is why I
chose Candidate B for the
job because when they expe-
rienced hardships and fail-
ures, they simply didn’t give
up and overcame adversity.
Therefore, I know Candidate
B has what it takes to work
through hardships or failures
and not let them affect their
overall job performance.

However, when Candi-
date A experiences hardships
or failures in their new job,
they will likely be devastated
and feel like a total failure in
life. Unfortunately, a lot of
people who fit the Candidate
A description simply give up
when they experience seri-
ous hardships or failures for
the first time.

Therefore, not only
would Candidate A’s melt-
down over failing for the first
time be bad for them, it
would be bad for the com-
pany too as it would affect
their job performance which
also affects the company.

I know someone I met in
college who fits the Candi-
date A persona to a tee and
she landed her dream job
right after graduation. How-
ever, she immediately started
experiencing numerous fail-
ures and hardships in several
of her job duties.

She ended up getting
fired from her job as a result
of her downward perfor-
mance. After being unem-
ployed for a while, she ended
up settling for a mediocre job
instead of her dream job.

So what happened? This
girl was on the dean’s list
every semester in college, an
officer in several organiza-
tions and was more than
qualified for her dream job.
How could someone like this
end up getting fired from
their first job after graduat-
ing college?

My generation and all
younger generations have

been termed as the “trophy
generations.” I first heard
this term from a professor I
had in college who said he is
seeing more students each
year in his classes that feel
like they are “entitled” and
believe they don’t have to
work hard to be successful.

It doesn’t take much re-
search to realize a negative
and devastating pattern de-
veloping with people that are
growing up in the trophy
generations.

We have children getting
trophies for just participating
on a sports team, sports
games are being played with-
out scores, children are get-
ting ribbons for just partici-
pating in a contest, etc.

Simply put, children are
being awarded for just par-
ticipating and even though
they may fail to win the game
or contest, the experience of
failure is hidden with every-
one receiving the same tro-
phy or ribbon.

When I look back on my
childhood and teenage years,
I remember being told things
like “you can be anything
you want to be when you
grow up. If you work hard,
you can accomplish anything
you set out to do in life.” But
I never remember anyone
telling me things like “some-
times you will experience
failure and hardships no mat-
ter how hard you work or
how much time you put into
what you want to accom-
plish.”

Luckily, I had experi-
enced failures and hardships
before I graduated high
school. If there is one thing I
am good at in life it’s giving
my 110% and still failing.
But through my experiences,
I learned at an early age to
overcome adversity and not
let my failures or hardships
define who I am as a person.

There are some sports
programs, organizations that
compete in contests and sev-
eral other things of this na-
ture that do a great job of
teaching young people to
overcome adversity. But
there are still a large number
of young people who are
“falling through the cracks”
and joining the ranks of the
trophy generation.

 Our society does a great
job of encouraging and
building up the confidence in
young people. But on the flip
side, our society does a poor
job of informing young
people about failure and
teaching them how to over-
come adversity.

I believe failure is an im-
portant lesson in life that is
better learned during child-
hood than during adulthood

like Candidate A. Failure
gives people the valuable
experience they need to over-
come adversity in order to be
successful in the end.

As you can probably tell,
I am not a big believer in
sheltering children from ex-
periencing failures or hard-
ships because I have seen
what that kind of sheltering
has done for a lot of my peers
as they grew older. They all
end up the same or similar
to candidate A.

As a society, we need to

throw children into the fire
(figuratively not literally), let
them experience failure, let
them experience hardships
and teach them how to over-
come those things in order to
be successful. We need to
simply quit giving trophies
or ribbons for participation
and start keeping score on
the scoreboards.

If we can quit hiding fail-
ure from people when they
are children, they will be
thankful when they grow
into adults.



Member of the Class of 1953 are shown above, front from left: Glennis McBee
Dick and Frances Dooley Todd. Back row from left:  John M Scott, Charles
Sheppard, Patsy Noe Baker, William K Bullen, Byron Crawford and John Payne.
Not pictured: Tincy McCall Payne.

Bullock Sisters - Judith Ervine, Class of 57; Suella Branaman, Class of 45; Sylvia
LeRoy, Class of 54; and Shirley Willoughby, Class of 54.
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Hines Family - Children of Charley Hines. From left: Jerry, Roy, Joyce, Wayne,
Judy and Marvin.

Members of the Class of 1972 are shown above, front row from left:  Etta McFerron
Chaney, Lisa Kelsey Howard and Mitzi McCauley Alexander. Back row from
left: Betty Cameron Frederick and Judy Hines Stevens.

Janie and Gary Cromer – Gary will be the incoming
President of the 2015 Reunion.

Members of the Class of 1964 attending the Mt. Vernon High School Reunion are shown above, front row from
left: Sandra Gail Parsons, Claretta Carter Hodges, Winona Rucker,Wanda Faye Berry, Jerry Hines, Sam
Ford, Barbara York and Joyce Faye Sigmon. Second row from left: Brenda Powell, Brenda Van Winkle, Donny
Thomas, Tommy Hodges, Delores Allen, Suzanne Mullins and Osborne. Back row from left: Terry Owens,
Gary Towery, Danny Mullins, Bobby Hayes, Charles Chock Machal, Ernest Swinford, Joe Fain, Jimmy
Cummins and Ben Dale Wilson.

Reunion Friends - June Burdette Coleman, Dr. Patsy Cummins Barnett and Faye
Saylor Thompson.

Annual
Mt. Vernon High School

Reunion held
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Call today
for an

appointment
with

Dr. Jamie
Settles
Carter

Suffering From Foot
or Ankle Pain?

DIAGNOSIS & TREATMENT OF:
Diabetic Foot Care, Ingrown & Discolored Toenails,

Heel Pain, Corns & Calluses, Bunions
& Hammertoes,

Fractures & Sprains, Nerve Problens
(burning and tingling feet), Wound Care.

ALSO OFFERING:
Full Service Diabetic/Therapeutic Shoe Program

and Custom Made Insoles

929 N. Main St.
London, KY 40741
(606) 862-0956
(606) 864-0488

1007 Cumberland Falls Hwy.
Corbin, KY 40701
(606) 258-8637
(606) 258-8640

Monday - Friday 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.

ELECT

Carlos
McClure

Rockcastle Jailer
I would like to thank the voters

who chose me as the Republican
nominee for jailer in the May
primary. The November 4th

general election is right around
the corner and I’m humbling

asking for the support and vote of
all Rockcastle countians.

I will:
• Be a full time jailer dedicated to running an efficient
and lawful jail.
• Maintain successful programs, including faith based
programs, while cutting inefficient programs and costs.
• Have honest interaction with the fiscal court and the
public—transparency.
• Have professional and properly trained jail staff who
are both courteous and respectful.
• Provide for routine and random drug testing pursu-
ant to county ordinance for ALL jail employees and staff.

Sincerely, Carlos McClure
I need your vote!Paid for by Carlos McClure

Attention Heat Vendors
The Daniel Boone Community Action Agency will
again be administering the Home Energy Assis-

tance Program (HEAP) for low-income people in
Clay, Laurel, Jackson and Rockcastle Counties

beginning November 3, 2014. Anyone wanting to
be a vendor in this year’s program will need to

attend a vendor meeting in their perspective
county.

The meeting for Rockcastle Co. will be held on
September 24, 2014 at 10 a.m.

The office in Rockcastle is located at
105 East Main St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.

Phone 606-256-5315

“Memories”
(Cont. from A2)

“Points East”
(Cont. from A2)

that he should just close
his eyes when he gnawed
down on the cob and
Keeter said he doesn't eat
anything without looking
at it.

Keeter said, “You know
that old Keith Whitley
song called Don’t close
your Eyes  where he’s
complaining that his girl
friend is closing her eyes
and thinking about some-
body else when they’re
making whoopee?”
Keeter said, “ Wonder why
it never crossed his mind
that maybe he was just too
ugly to look at while that
was going on and she
wasn’t thinking about
somebody else after all?”

He said, “I don’t think
it would help the taste a bit
if I closed my eyes when I
ate an ear of your corn be-
cause I don’t think that
would make it taste a bit
like Kandy corn or silver
queen.”

It’s taken me a lifetime
to realize that there is no
deader waste of time than
arguing with Keeter.

In other gardening
news, we just had a big
kettle of goose beans, the
seed of which I got from
Bertha McQuerry more
than a decade back.  We
only got one mess this year
because the bean bugs al-
most beat me to them but I
was able to save enough
seed to get a planting next
year.

Ditto for the Babe
beans that I got from
Tannie Cornett  in Letcher
County a few years back.
We only had three good
kettles full this year before
the Japanese beetles
swarmed and devoured

them overnight.  I did man-
age to save a cup of seed
from them, as well, and
Loretta says she wonders
why I grow any other
bean.  The Babe Bean has,
indeed, become our unri-
valed favorite, main-sea-
son bean until the Bufford
Caudill fall beans come
on.

The fall beans are just
now blooming and they
are looking good. I have
been faithfully spraying
them with Neem oil, a
non-toxic, organic, plant-
based insect repellant that
really works until rain
washes it off, which means
that all I have to do to
make black clouds roll in
is pull out a sprayer.  So
far I’ve been able to keep
the bugs at bay but I’ve
had to spray the vines at
least a dozen times.

In the meantime,
Loretta and I are planning
to get up to Letcher
County for Blackey Days
the week of October 12. I
don’t know the exact dates
right now but I do know
that it is like one huge fam-
ily reunion for folks who
grew up in the lower end
of the county.

If all goes as planned,
we will be taking the night
with Keeter and Nancy.

A couple of weeks af-
ter I first planted the
bodacious, I went back
through it and replanted a
few dozen hills that the
rabbits had eaten off be-
fore the corn had a chance
to much more than sprout.
The replanting is just now
silking out good.  Both it
and the Bufford Caudill
fall beans should be in per-
fect shape to take home
with me, if we don’t get an
early frost before then.

I know, for sure, that
Keeter’s fall beans are al-

and I noted that we were
now the eldest of our fam-
ily. It seemed so strange.

Consider the last pas-
sage of Bobby’s message:

“Life goes by quickly.
So, do what you can today,
as you can never be sure
whether this is your winter
or not! You have no prom-
ise that you will see all the
seasons of your life...so, live
for today and say all the
things that you want your
loved ones to
remember...and hope that
they appreciate and love you
for all the things that you
have done for them in all the
years past!”

I am very thankful that
as I enter my 70th decade,
my health is good and I am
not required to take any pre-
scription medications. Yes,
I have some aches and pains,
but all in all, I am able to
accomplish almost any task
that I need to achieve. Be-

cause I spend a large portion
of my time on my laptop
discussing the joys of my
youth in my columns and in
my books, I do have to take
over-the-counter pain medi-
cations for my arthritis. I
also need some Pepcid AC
for my acid reflux, but I can
eat almost anything I desire.

I am extremely thankful
that I have likely inherited
some of the genes for lon-
gevity from my mother and
my grandmother. I thank the
Lord above that I have good
health, and my mind is still
as sharp as it needs to be.

Kathy and I are looking
forward to the next stage of
our lives as we retire in our
little mountain-top A-frame
on Furnace Mountain in
Powell County. We look for-
ward to walking in our
woods and spending time
next to a fire – whether out-
doors or indoors.

I have a life that has
been blessed, and if this is
the winter of that life, I look
forward to sharing it with
my mate. We still have time
to create a few more of those
blessed memories.

(You can reach me at
themtnman@att.net or you can
drop me a line at 2167 Furnace

Road – Stanton, KY 40380. I
appreciate your comments and

suggestions.)

ready long gone and that
he hasn’t had any fresh
sweet corn since mid Au-
gust. I intend to try, yet
again, to change his mind
about bodacious.

Renner Family Reunion
Worship Concert
Grand Finale to area-wide

21 day revival

Sat., Sept. 27th * 6 p.m.
Northside Baptist Church

The Renner Family invites you to a night of worship
and celebration! Come and worship as we sing current
worship songs, bluegrass music, southern gospel and
more! The Renner Family sang gospel music for over
20 years and traveled all over the U.S. Now, they only
get together to sing ONE time a year and this is it! This
year’s reunion will be extra special since it will be the
grand finale for a 21 day revival of all the area churches.
Make plans now and show up early!
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Bus Drills
Early Dismissal

The Rockcastle County Schools will be
conducting Emergency Bus Evacuation
drills on Thursday, October 2, 2014. The
Rockcastle County High School and
Middle School will dismiss at 2:45 p.m.
Buses will proceed to the elementary
schools where the drills will be con-
ducted. Please adjust your schedule for
this early dismissal.

No school Friday, October 3rd
KEA Day

Livestock Producers Urged
to Enroll in Disaster
Assistance Program

The U.S. Department of
Agriculture (USDA) is en-
couraging producers who
have suffered eligible disas-
ter-related losses to act to se-
cure assistance by Sept. 30,
2014, as congressionally
mandated payment reduc-
tions will take place for pro-
ducers who have not acted
before that date. Livestock
producers that have experi-
enced grazing losses since
October 2011 and may be eli-
gible for benefits but have not
yet contacted their local Farm
Service Agency (FSA) office
should do so as soon as pos-
sible.

The Budget Control Act
passed by Congress in 2011
requires USDA to implement
reductions of 7.3 percent to
the Livestock Forage Disas-
ter Program (LFP) in the new
fiscal year, which begins Oct.
1, 2014. However, producers
seeking LFP support who
have scheduled appointments
with their local FSA office
before Oct. 1, even if the ap-
pointment occurs after Oct.1,
will not see reductions in the
amount of disaster relief they
receive.

Next FSA County Com-
mittee Meeting Date:

October 1, 2014     8:00
A.M. at the Mt. Vernon
USDA Service Center
Office Closure Schedule

The Mt. Vernon Service
Center (FSA, NRCS and
Rockcastle Co. Conservation
District) offices will be
closed the following dates in
2014 for observance of a Fed-
eral Holiday:

October 13-Columbus
Day

November 11-Veterans
Day

November 27-Thanksgiv-
ing Day

December 25-Christmas
Day

Important program dates
and Interest Rates

Farm Operating Loans-
Direct =2.125%

Farm Ownership Loans-
Direct=3.750%

Limited Resource
Loans=5.000%

Farm Storage Loans-7 yr
=2.125%, 10 yr.=2.500%, 12
yr.=2.625%

Commodity Loans-
1.125%

The US Department of
Agriculture (USDA) prohib-
its discrimination in all its
programs and activities on the
basis of race, color, national
origin, age, disability, and
where applicable, sex, mari-
tal status, familial status, pa-
rental status, religion, sexual
orientation, genetic informa-
tion, political beliefs, reprisal,
or because all or part of an
individual’s income is de-
rived from any public assis-
tance program.

Agricultural News
By: Warden Alexander, FSA Director

A former local high school student athlete will be
playing in a college football game nearby when Wash-
ington University in St. Louis visits Centre College
in Danville, this coming Saturday September 27th.
Junior Ben Lake, a 2012 graduate of Rockcastle
County High School, will be visiting the Centre Col-
lege campus as his WUSTL Bears take on the Cen-
tre College Colonels at Farris Stadium.  His fresh-
man brother, Jared Lake, may also make the trip.
Game time is set for 1:30 pm EST.

So often we hear that fall
or winter is a particularly
good time to do certain
things in the landscape. This
is usually due to the fact that
plants have entered into win-
ter dormancy.

You can compare dor-
mancy to an extended period
of "rest" for plants, when
they are relatively inactive in
terms of metabolic processes
(photosynthesis, respiration
and transpiration, for ex-
ample). I say relatively inac-
tive, because although these
processes slow during dor-
mancy, they do not cease al-
together. Most temperate pe-
rennial plants will enter dor-
mancy in autumn as daylight

Fall landscape care
Farm and Home News

Tom Mills
Rockcastle County Extension Office

Hannabeth Owens claimed her fourth individual
tournament win of the high school season this past
Saturday at the Lady Titan Invitational held at
Danville Country Club.  Hannabeth fired a 1 under
par back nine to finish with a score of 75  (+2) and a
one shot victory.  In 7 regular season tournaments
this fall Hannabeth had 4 wins, 1 runner-up, 1 third,
and 1 top ten finish.

shortens, temperatures (in-
cluding soil temperatures)
become cooler, terminal
buds are set, and perhaps as
a result of drier conditions
during late summer and fall.

Going dormant is the way
these plants survive the cold
of winter. It is important that
landscape maintenance ac-
tivities not interfere with the
plant's natural process of be-
coming dormant. Let's use
pruning and fertilization
practices as examples.

Fall is considered a poor
time to prune most woody
perennials. Pruning will re-
move terminal buds that help
to maintain dormancy in
many species. The presence
of the terminal bud, even in

a seemingly inactive state,
suppresses the growth of
lower buds through a pro-
cess called apical domi-
nance, a type of dormancy
imposed on the lateral buds.
If you remove the apical
bud, it may encourage lateral
buds to initiate growth in a
plant that has not yet fully
entered a dormant state.
Once lateral bud growth is
initiated, dormancy will be
hard to achieve, even with
the advent of shortening day
length and cooler tempera-
tures. So pruning in the fall
may trigger new growth that
delays dormancy and predis-
poses the plant to winter in-
jury.

It is better to prune plants
in late winter, around mid-
February to mid-March.
This also allows you to
evaluate and remove winter-
damaged limbs. Pruning in
late winter will occur just be-
fore one of the most active
times of plant growth, bud
break, when the plant is re-
directing stored nutrients
from the root system out to
the branches. This would be

the most rapid time for the
plant to heal wounds (in our
case the pruned surface),
while fall would be the slow-
est time for wound healing.
An exception is if you are re-
moving dead or severely
damaged limbs due to break-
age, insects or disease. In
that case, it is best for you to
remove them as soon as pos-
sible at any time of the year.
If the plant you are pruning
is spring-blooming (gener-
ally flowering before early
June), it would be better
from a flowering display
perspective to wait until af-
ter flowering to prune since
the pruning process will re-
move preexisting flower
buds.

What about fertilization
of woody plants? Fall and
winter are considered the
best times to apply fertilizer,
but you should only do this
once woody plants are fully
dormant. Otherwise, apply-
ing fertilizer might trigger
new growth and predispose
the plant to winter injury.

How can you tell if plant
is dormant? If leaves are fall-

ing, the plant has probably
entered dormancy suffi-
ciently to allow fertilization.
To be doubly safe, wait un-
til temperatures are unlikely
to climb into the 70-degree
range. In Kentucky this
could occur anytime from
mid-October to mid-No-
vember, so to be absolutely
safe this probably means
mid-November or later. It’s
best to get the fertilizer down
before the soil has frozen so
it won’t remain on the soil
surface and won’t be subject
to runoff with any additional
precipitation.

If you don't fertilize be-

tween Thanksgiving and
Christmas, wait until the
ground thaws in late Febru-
ary or early March to apply
fertilizer. However, you
must realize that February
and March are not the best
times for applying fertilizer
to lawns composed of cool-
season grasses (fescues,
bluegrass and perennial
ryegrass). If you are regu-
larly applying fertilizer to
your lawn, woody plants
growing nearby are likely
getting sufficient nutrients
from these applications and
probably don’t need addi-
tional fertilizer.
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Senior defensive back Kyle Denny zeros in on a Pulaski County Maroon receiver
during last Friday night’s 61-14 loss. The Rockets next game is this Friday at
home when they play Perry County Central at 7:30 p,m.

Sophomore tailback Dalton Rowe prepares to stiff-arm a Pulaski County defender
during last Friday night’s 61-14 loss. Rowe came out of the game with a broken
collarbone after a routine tackle went awry. The extent of his injury is unknown
but the coaching staff believes he will likely be out for the remainder of the sea-
son.

Freshman defensive back Brent Lovell plays chicken with a Pulaski County re-
ceiver during last Friday night’s game. Lovell saw limited action due to a severe
muscle contusion. Head Coach Scott Parkey said he will be back on the field for
this Friday night’s game.

Senior defensive end Chance Ansardi chases down a
Pulaski County Maroon running back during last
Friday night’s 61-14 loss. This Friday night  is Home-
coming for the Rockets. Festivities will be held at
halftime.

Libero Ileana Miller gets a dig during the Lady
Rockets 2-1 win over Madison Southern Monday
night. The Lady Rockets are now 8-10 on the sea-
son.

Abby Bray makes a backward hit during the Lady
Rockets 2-1 win over Madison Southern Monday
night.

Arie-Anna Lawson makes a pass during the Lady
Rockets match against Madison Southern Monday
night.

Katie Adams hits the ball over the net during the
Lady Rockets 2-1 win over Madison Southern. The
Lady Rockets next game is next Monday night when
they travel to London to take on North Laurel.

By: Doug Ponder
The Rockcastle County

Rockets are now 3-2 on the
season following a 61-14
loss to the Pulaski County
Maroons last Friday night.

The Rockets loss was
largely due to a number of
stalled drives on offense
and their inability to get the
ball into the end zone
against a Pulaski County
team that is ranked 672 in
the nation and 12th in the
state.

The Rockets offense
produced 267 yards on of-
fense with 238 yards rush-
ing and 29 yards passing.
The two touchdowns for
the Rockets came on a 57
yard touchdown run by
sophomore tailback
Chayse McClure in the sec-
ond quarter and a 4 yard
scramble for a touchdown
by sophomore quarterback
Dakota Bishop in the third
quarter.

The Maroons highly-
touted junior quarterback
Riley Hall was almost per-
fect on the night, complet-
ing 8 of 9 passes for 253
yards and five touchdowns.
Hall and the other Maroon
starters were benched in
the third quarter.

The Rockets were led
on offense by McClure
with 9 carries for 106 yards
and one touchdown. Other
Rockets picking up rushing
yardage were Dalton Rowe
with 10 carries for 32
yards, senior fullback
Chance Ansardi with 8 for
32 yards, junior fullback
Dalton Cole had 5 carries
for 20 yards, senior full-
back Isaiah Adams with 4
for 15 yards, sophomore
running back Devon
Robinson had 5 for 13
yards, sophomore wide re-

ceiver Tommy Benge with
one carry for 12 yards and
Lovell with 4 carries for 4
yards.

Bishop was 1 of 2 pass-
ing for 29 yards. He also
had one carry for 4 yards
and a touchdown.

Sophomore tailback
Isaiah Mercer caught the
Rockets only pass on of-
fense for 2 yards.

The Rockets defense
was led by senior defensive
backs Kyle Denny and
Tyler Langford who both
had 3 tackles each.

Other Rockets picking
up tackles and assists were
Ansardi, Lovell, Robinson,
sophomore defensive back
Isaac McClure, sophomore
defensive end Lucas Jones
and sophomore defensive
lineman Logan Coffey who
were all credited with 2
tackles each. Chayse
McClure and senior defen-
sive lineman both had one
tackle each.

Head Coach Scott
Parkey said the Maroons
had too many weapons on
both sides of the ball which
made it difficult for the
Rockets throughout the
game.

“They were just too
good for us last Friday
night. What you want to
see in a game like that is
kids playing with heart and
as a team,” Parkey said. “I
feel like those things were
evident throughout the
game. The entire team cel-
ebrates wins together and
suffers losses together.”

However, Parkey said
what hurts worse than los-
ing is the injuries the Rock-
ets suffered in last Friday
night’s game. Sophomore
tailback Dalton Rowe
came out of the game with

a broken collarbone after a
routine tackle, sophomore
linebacker Austin Mills hy-
perextended his knee while
attempting to make a tackle
and freshman tailback
Brent Lovell was limited
due to a severe muscle con-
tusion.

“Rowe will likely be out
for the remainder of the
season. We don’t know the
extent of Mills injury but
will know more toward the
end of the week. Lovell
will be back on the field
this Friday,” Parkey said.
“Hunter Hines and Jacob
Blair are within a couple of
weeks of returning from
their injuries. On the bright
side, Chayse McClure re-
turned to action last Friday
night.”

Parkey went on to say
that if the Rockets are go-
ing to be a good team and
make a run in the district,
they must show signs of
growth this week in prac-
tice.

“Players need to step up
their own game to take the
place of the injured play-
ers and backups must be
ready to enter the game at
any time,” Parkey said.
“There might be players on
the field this week who
haven’t been out there
much this season.”

The Rockets next game
is this Friday night at home
against the Perry County
Central Commodores.
Kick-off is at 7:30 p.m.
This Friday night’s game is
also homecoming for the
Rockets with homecoming
festivities taking place at
halftime.

Parkey said this Friday
night’s game is crucial for
his team before they head
into district play.

“The Commodores
have a new coaching staff
that has implemented the
air raid offense which
makes them difficult to de-
fend,” Parkey said. “We
really need to play well
heading into our open week
so we can gain momentum
before we start district play
in October.”

Rockets fall to tough
Pulaski team, 61-14

Work, family and school
commitments can leave
little free time in a day, but
hunters can help themselves
by carving out some time to
scout an area.

Kentucky’s archery sea-
son for deer is underway
with the crossbow, youth-
only firearm, muzzleloader
and modern gun deer sea-
sons still to come. So there’s
time to find a place to hunt
and scout it.

“I think it increases your
odds of success and your
chances for a big deer,” said
Chad Miles, an avid deer
hunter and executive direc-
tor of the Kentucky Fish and

Wildlife Foundation.
Studying topographical

maps and satellite imagery
is a good first step to learn-
ing the lay of the land and
scouting more efficiently.
But there’s no substitute for
personal experience; walk-
ing the terrain; seeing where
the deer bed, what’s avail-
able for them to eat and what
routes they travel.

“If you can spend enough
time at the property, know
how deer move through it,”
said David Yancy, deer bi-
ologist with Kentucky De-
partment of Fish and Wild-

Kentucky Afield Outdoors
Scouting for a successful deer hunt

(Cont. to A9)
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The Rockcastle County Rockets boys golf team recently won the CKBC regular season South Division Cham-
pionship. Members of the team who contributed to the championship were the following: Head Coach Jake
Woodall, John Cornelius, Grant Isaacs, Thomas Burdette, Sam Pensol, Carson Noble, Lucas Gentry, and
Cade Burdette. Not pictured: Zach Baker and Assistant Coach David Woodall

Three Rockets were
placed on the 1st team
All-Conference for the
South Division. John
Cornelius finished the
year as the CKBC Regu-
lar Season Player of the
Year while Sam Pensol
and Cade Burdette fin-
ished 3rd and 4th in the
overall conference.
Cornelius, Pensol, and
Burdette were consid-
ered to be three of the top
golfers in the conference.

Carson Noble is shown here hitting an approach shot
at Dix River Country Club this past Saturday. Noble
has really turned on his game at the right time as
the Rockets head in to Region play. Scores from the
tournament this past weekend were:  Sam Pensol 72
(4th place finish), John Cornelius 76, Cade Burdette
77, and Carson Noble 86. The Rockets shot a total of
311 for the Tournament and finished in 3rd place.

Rockcastle 5th grader Karalinn Loudermilk and 3rd
grader Lexi Dotson led the girls’ 6th grade and un-
der cross-country team to a 3rd place finish at the
Franklin County Invitational.  Karalinn  placed 16th
and Lexi 19th out of 219 competitors.  Both ran per-
sonal best times for 3,000-meters.

The Rockcastle girls’ 6th grade and under team placed 3rd out of 17 teams at the
Franklin County Invitational held at the Kentucky Horse Park.  Each girl ran a
personal best time for 3,000-meters. Team members are from left: Lexi Dotson,
Gracie Spoonamore, Allie Martin, Karalinn Loudermilk, Kylie Martin, Callie
Delph and Hannah Davis.

RCMS 7th grade cross-country runners Destiny Hamm (left), Alexandria Blair,
and Grace Gardiner, all ran personal best times for 3,000-meters at the Franklin
County Invitational held at the Kentucky Horse Park.

The RCHS girls’ cross-country team placed 9th out of over 40 schools and 2nd
among Class 2A schools that competed at the Franklin County Invitational at the
Kentucky Horse Park.  The team averaged a 22:38 for 5,000-meters  and is now
ranked 1st in Class 2A Region 5.  Team members are from left: Taylor Bullock,
Lanna Prewitt, Rachel Cain, Kensie Sheffield, Sierra Mercer and Tori Dotson.
Not pictured: Autumn Courtney.

RCHS sophomore Sierra Mercer and 7th grader Tori
Dotson led the way for the varsity team at the
Franklin County Invitational. Tori placed 7th out of
192 runners in a personal best 20:03.  Her time ranks
her 1st  among 147 Kentucky 7th graders who have
competed in a 5,000-meter race and 6th in the U.S.
out of 1073 competitors in 7th grade. Sierra shat-
tered her personal time, placing 33rd overall in an
impressive 21:18.   The girls are currently ranked #2
and #3 in the individual regional rankings.

life Resources. “Where are
the chokepoints? Know the
creek drainage pattern. The
low spot on the ridgeline?
That’s where they’re going to
cross because it’s less effort.
Those kinds of things are im-
portant during gun season.”

Miles prefers scouting
around midday and no closer
than two weeks before he
plans to hunt. Any later risks

“Deer hunt”
(Cont. from A8)

spooking the deer. To limit
human scent left behind, wear
rubber boots and be mindful
about touching or handling
tree branches and leaves.
Some may prefer to wear
scent control clothing or
spray.

Tracks, droppings and hair
caught on fencing are tell-tale
signs deer are in the area. Rub
lines and scrapes are addi-
tional clues that show up as
deer transition from their
summer pattern. Deer be-

come less visible in open
spaces as acorns begin to hit
the ground and the rut ap-
proaches. After the rut, avail-
able food sources and cover
become all-important.

A handheld Global Posi-
tioning System (GPS) is a
handy tool that can help a
hunter keep track of these key
spots and potential tree stand
locations.

When considering a stand
location, note the wind direc-
tion. This is easily accom-

plished with wind direction
powder or by simply crum-
bling a dried leaf and tossing
it into the air. Checking the
weather online the day of a
hunt can help determine
where to set up.

On wildlife management
areas and Otter Creek Out-
door Recreation Area, hunt-
ers may use a portable stand
or climbing device as long as
it does not injure a tree. Nails,
spikes, screw-in devices, wire
or tree climbers cannot be
used to attach a tree stand or
climb a tree. Portable stands
may not be placed in a tree
more than two weeks before
opening day and must be re-
moved within a week after
the last day of each hunting
period. The hunter’s name
and address should be clearly
marked on the portable stand.

Archery season for deer in
Kentucky continues through
Jan. 19, 2015.

Scouting after the season
can help a hunter get a leg up
on the following year, but it’s
important to be mindful of
season dates. If scouting dur-
ing the modern gun,
muzzleloader and youth fire-
arm deer seasons, or a fire-
arm elk or firearm bear sea-
son, wearing hunter orange is
highly recommended.

The crossbow deer sea-
sons are Oct. 1-19 and Nov.
8-Dec. 31, while the youth-
only firearms season for deer
is Oct. 11-12. Muzzleloader
season is Oct. 18-19 and Dec.
13-21. Statewide modern gun
deer season opens Nov. 8 and
continues through Nov. 17 or
Nov. 23, depending on the
zone.

For more information
about fall hunting opportuni-
ties in Kentucky, consult the
2014-15 Kentucky Hunting
and Trapping Guide. It is
available online at fw.ky.gov
or wherever licenses are sold.

Email sports items to
mvsignal@windstream.net
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Judge Executive Buzz Carloftis is pictured above with staff of the Rockcastle
Adult Education Center signing a Proclamation for National Adult Education
and Family Literacy Week, September 22-28th, 2014. Pictured with Judge
Carloftis from left are: Jenny Sweet, Kelli Loudermilk, Amy Nicely, and Rachel
Falin.

Rockcastle County’s old-
est race, the Bittersweet 5K
Run/2-Mile Walk will be on
Saturday, October 4. The
race will begin in front of the
courthouse on East Main St.
at 7:30 a.m.

Race day registration
will be from 6:30 – 7:20 am
for a fee of $20. You may
also pre-register through
September 29 at 12:00 noon
for a reduced rate of $15. A

Bittersweet 5K Run and
2-Mile Walk October 4th

free t-shirt will be given to
all pre-registered partici-
pants. Shirts will be avail-
able on race day in limited
quantities. Please visit
rockcastleregional.org/race
to register online or to
download the registration
form.

Awards will be given to
the overall fastest male and
female runners, tope three
male and female runners in

By Karen Hamm Adams
To celebrate and honor

the county’s American
Revolutionary War Patriots
and to enlighten the com-
munity about the service
and sacrifice of these brave
men, on behalf of the
Rockcastle Chapter of the
Daughters of the American
Revolution, I have complied
highlights of the service of
the known patriots living in
the county and who applied
for a pension between the
years 1818 and 1842. All
information was taken from
the patriot’s own account
from his pension applica-
tion and other historical
documents.  More informa-
tion can be found on each
patriot at the local library or
the Rockcastle Historical
Society.  (Copyright pend-
ing).  If you are interested
in joining the Daughters of
the American Revolution,
please contact Debbie
Brown (606) 758-8659 or
Iris Young (606)256-2851.

William Lawrence
New York

William Lawrence was
born in 1766 in Dutchess
County, New York and died
about 1847 in Rockcastle
Co. KY. According to his
pension application, Will-
iam gave the following ac-
count of his service on 8
May 1834 in Rockcastle Co.
KY and the age of sixty
eight:  He entered the ser-
vice as a private in Dutchess
Co. NY under Captain
Champlain and Colonel
Vandenberg in 1777.  He
served four months as a
guard in Dutchess County.
He served six months under
Captain Benjamin Knox.
This tour was performed on
the Hudson River about
Peekskill and Fishkill NY.
Part of the time he was sta-
tioned at Peekskill and
Fishkill and part of the time
he was scouting.

In 1778, for five weeks
he served under the same
officers and was marched to

the Hudson River and sta-
tioned as a guard to guard
the frontier.  For two weeks,
he served as a guard sta-
tioned between the city of
New York and Peekskill.
For two months in 1779, he
served as a guard at
Peekskill and Fishkill.  Four
months later, he served as a
guard part time at Peekskill
and Fishkill and part of the
time traveling the country
between the city of New
York and those places in the
later part of 1779 and early
part of 1780.  His service
was to prevent the British
from landing where they
would bring their shipping
into the Hudson and to
guard the frontier from the
attacks of the enemy.

William stated that he
lived in DutchessCo. NY
during the war and follow-
ing the end of the Revolu-
tion, he moved to Mont-
gomery Co. VA until about

Hidden Among Us

The American Revolutionary
War Patriots of Rockcastle

The GRANDTAZZZTICS have their annual "Paint Rockcastle Pink!" Shirts for
sale. This year's shirt is a beautiful green shirt with the pink letters.  You can help
support "Breast Cancer Awareness" month by purchasing these shirts. All pro-
ceeds stay in our county to help our cancer patients. The "Grandmas for Aware-
ness" are pictured: Sue Hamm, Carol Pybas, Gayla Winstead, and Bonnie Neely.
Shirts are available at the following locations: A Cut Above, Limestone Grille,
Main Street Pharmacy, Sabrina's Hair Design, and Sparks Flowers and More.

Gentlemen, start your en-
gines! We want you to get
revved up for the annual
Healthy Joe Expo men’s
health fair to be held Oct. 9
at Rockcastle Regional Hos-
pital.

The night will feature a
meal and short, informative
presentations amidst a
Nascar theme. It will also
offer plenty of health screen-
ings, education, giveaways
and door prizes.

Among the evening’s
presentations will be a panel
discussion about three of
Kentucky’s most common
diseases – cancer, heart dis-
ease and diabetes – which
will feature three well-
known local men. They’ll
talk about their diagnoses
and recovery, as well as how
they cope with their condi-
tions on a daily basis.

Urologist, Denis Yalkut,
M.D. will speak, and we’ll
have a break-out presenta-
tion scheduled for women in
a different room while the

men discuss male-specific
health issues. The women’s
group will have an informal
discussion led by Dr. Kevin
Rowe and, nurse practitio-
ner, Chasity Frakes. They
will talk about strategies to
help encourage the men in
their lives to engage in
healthy behaviors.

“We know that health de-
cisions aren’t made in iso-
lation,” Healthy Joe orga-
nizer Dwain Harris said.
“Family or social networks
have a big influence on our
health and lifestyle deci-
sions.”

As always, important
health screenings such as
blood pressure checks will
be available, and vouchers
will be handed out for free
cholesterol and blood sugar
checks, as well as PSA tests.
The PSA test measures the
blood level of PSA, a pro-
tein that is produced by the
prostate gland. A high PSA
level for a man may indicate
a possibility for him to have

Annual Healthy Joe Expo
scheduled for October 9th

age group categories and
top three fastest male and
female walkers.

The Bittersweet 5K Run/
2-Mile Walk is the tenth
race in the 2014 County-
Wide Stride run/walk series
sponsored by Rockcastle
Regional Hospital.

For more information or
questions contact Kayla
Martin at (606) 256-7767 or
k.martin@rhrcc.org

prostate cancer. However,
there are additional reasons
for having an elevated PSA
level, and some men who
have prostate cancer do not
always have elevated PSA.

The Healthy Joe Expo
was created to reach those
who are sometimes have
difficulty accessing health
education, and for whom
that education might be
most important. Men drink
more than women, smoke
more than women, don’t
live as long as women, and
engage in more high-risk
activities than women. Yet,
men are notorious for not
seeing a doctor when they
should. The American
Academy of Family Physi-
cians reveals that 55 percent
of U.S. men haven't seen
their health care provider in
the past year.

For more information
about this year’s Healthy
Joe Expo, contact Harris at

(Cont. to B2)

(Cont. to B2)
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Circuit Civil
Suits

District Civil
Suits

News from the
Rockcastle
Courthouse

Operation UNITE along
with Kentucky State Police
posts throughout southern
and eastern Kentucky will
be participating in the U.S.
Drug Enforcement
Administration’s 9th Na-
tional Prescription Drug
Take-Back Day on Satur-
day, September 27.

From 10 a.m. to 2 p.m.,
the DEA will collect poten-
tially dangerous expired,
unused and unwanted pre-
scription drugs at KSP Post
locations in Ashland,
Harlan, Hazard, London,
Morehead, Pikeville and
Richmond.

In addition, Operation
UNITE accepts medica-
tions year-round at 42
dropbox sites within its ser-
vice region. For a list of the
permanent drop-off sites
visit http://
operationunite.org/investi-
gations/med-drop-box-
sites/.

In the eight previous
take-back days, the DEA
and its state, local and tribal
law enforcement and com-
munity partners have re-
moved more than 4.1 mil-
lion pounds (2,123 tons) of
prescription medications
from circulation.

“Having a safe way to
dispose of prescription and
over-the-counter pills is a
proven method reducing the
potential for their abuse and
misuse,” said Dan Smoot,
president/CEO of Opera-
tion UNITE. “This spring
we collected nearly 1 ton of
pills and are hoping to top
that total this weekend.”

Kentucky had 1,007
overdose deaths in 2013,
with five of the top six
counties being in UNITE’s
service region, according to
the Kentucky Office of
Drug Control Policy.

Kentucky had the third
highest rate of overdose
deaths in 2010 (23.6 per
100,000 people), noted
Michael Botticelli, acting
director of the White House
Office of National Drug
Control Policy (ONDCP),
speaking to participants at

last week’s National Rx
Drug Abuse Summit in At-
lanta.

These deaths follow a
corresponding and dramatic
increase in number of pre-
scriptions being written for
opioid medications.
Enough pills were pre-
scribed in 2012 to give ev-
ery American 18 years of
age or older 75 opioid pills,
according to the IMS
Health’s National Prescrip-
tion Audit.

“This means there are a
lot of medications just sit-
ting around your home,”
Smoot said, adding a Sub-
stance Abuse and Mental
Health Administration
(SAMSHA) survey found
that more than 70 percent of
people abusing prescription
pain relievers got them
through friends or relatives,
a statistic that includes raid-
ing the family medicine
cabinet.

Another benefit of the
drop-box program is pro-
tecting the environment.

For years, the generally
accepted method for dis-
posing of old or left over
medications was to flush
them down the toilet. This
practice, however, has been
strongly discouraged be-
cause of concerns about po-
tential health and environ-
mental effects of antibiot-
ics, hormones, painkillers,
depressants and stimulants
making their way into our
water system and soil.

Residents are asked to
please remove all identify-
ing labels from prescription
bottles before bringing
them to the drop-off sites.

The National Prescrip-
tion Drug Take-Back Day,
which began in October
2010, aims to provide a
safe, convenient and re-
sponsible means of dis-
posal, while also educating
the general public about the
potential for abuse of these
medications.

For more information
about Operation UNITE
visit their website at
www.operationunite.org.

National Prescription
Drug Take-Back Sept. 27

Glenda Ferrell vs. Kojak,
Inc., complaint.

Sherri Michelle Bolin vs.
Stop ‘n Shop, verified com-
plaint.

Susanne Thacker vs.
John Harding, complaint.

Commonwealth of Ky.
vs. Jessica James, complaint
for child support and medi-
cal support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Joe Yates, com-
plaint for child support and
medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Heather Jones,
complaint for child support
and medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Amanda Renner,
complaint for child support
and medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Wendell Renner,
complaint for child support
and medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Chris Jones, com-
plaint for child support and
medical support.

Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky vs. Anthony Henson,
complaint for child support
and medical support.

Cherri Rae Day vs.
Ronald Glenn Warf, veri-
fied petition for child cus-
tody.

Americredit Financial
Services, Inc. vs. Charles
Mink, $17,302.21 plus
claimed due.

Vicki Chasteen vs.
Hastings Mutual Ins. Co., et
al, complaint.

Amanda L. Kerns and
Jonathan C. Kerns, joint pe-
tition for dissolution of mar-
riage.

Community Trust Bank
vs. Jimmy L. Prewitt, et al,
$50,005.15 plus claimed
due.

Credit Acceptance Corp.
vs. Makayla S. Hayes, et al,
$5,952.74 plus claimed due.

Deeds
Recorded

Secretary of Veterans
Affairs vs. Unknown Occu-
pants, forcible detainer
complaint.

Regency Finance Co. vs.
Amanda Blanton,
$1,516.31 plus claimed due.

Personal Finance Co. vs.
Amy Coleman, $2,640. plus
claimed due. C-00122

Marriage
Licenses

Samantha Jo Feltner, 22,
East Bernstadt, unem-
ployed to Ryan Scott
Owens, 24, East Bernstadt,
factory. 9/12/14

Sasha Elaine Bullock,
23, Brodhead, nurse to An-
drew Bennett Cromer, 27,
Mt. Vernon, factory. 9/18/
14

Gerald Miller, Barbara
Miller, Steven and Angie
Miller, property in
Rockcastle County to
Gerald Miller. No tax

Melanie Ann Abbott,
property on Wildie Road, to
Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky. Tax $4.50

Melanie Ann Abbott,
property on Wildie Road, to
Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky. Tax $4.50

Larry L. Cope, property
on Wildie Road, to Com-
monwealth of Kentucky.
Tax $2

Noah David Cope, prop-
erty on Wildie Road, to
Commonwealth of Ken-
tucky. Tax $1.50

Wallace and Minnie Lee
Stamper, property in
Rockcastle County, to Mat-
thew and Kayla Stamper.
No tax

256-0950, or go to the
events section of
www.rockcastleregional.org
or Rockcastle Regional’s
Facebook page. The Expo is
co-sponsored by the South-
ern KY Area Health Educa-
tion Center, which is hosted
by Rockcastle Regional
Hospital.

1812.  He moved to
Rockcastle Co. KY where
he was living at the time of
his pension application.
William was allowed a pen-
sion in the amount of fifty
eight dollars and seventy six
cents annually to commence
on 11 June 1834.

There is no mention of a
spouse or children in
William’s pension applica-
tion.  He married a woman
named Sarah around 1796.
Their burial place is un-
known.  The probable Chil-
dren of William and Sarah:
Charity Lawrence (1796-30
December1863 Rockcastle
Co. KY) married William
French (22 February 1797-
4 March 1882 Rockcastle
Co. KY) in 1817. They are
buried at the Renfro Valley
Cemetery in Rockcastle Co.
KY.  Their children were:
Mary (also known as Aunt
Polly of the local Aunt Polly
House)(Hiatt); James. Wil-
liam, John, Rebecca (Hiatt),
Jones, Ann (Lair). Talitha
(Fish).  Tartulas Lawrence

(1797VA-1876 Rockcastle
Co. KY).  Married Ruth
Carson (1799-1884).  She is
the granddaughter of David
and Elizabeth Dysart
Carson.  Elizabeth is a
descendantof James Dysart,
the American Revolution-
ary War Patriot.  Buried at
the Lawrence-Proctor Cem-
etery in Rockcastle Co. KY.
Their children were:  Will-
iam, Mary, Elizabeth,
Cynthia (Hawley), Marga-
ret (Reynolds), Susan and
Mary Jane.  Cornelius
“Neely” Lawrence (19 Au-
gust 1799 VA-31 October
1873 Rockcastle Co. KY)
married Elizabeth Nichols
(1805-1882) on 9 Novem-
ber 1826 Pulaski Co. KY.
They are buried at Poplar
Grove Cemetery in
Rockcastle Co. KY.  Their
children were: Thomas,
Lavenia (Brown), James,
Willia,Nancy, Surelda, Rob-
ert and Jemina.  Catherine
Lawrence (16 June 1801-11
May1882 Rockcastle Co.
KY) married David Carson
(2 April 1798-15 December
1876 Rockcastle Co. KY)
on 16 June 1819 VA.  They
are buried at the Lawrence-
Proctor Cemetery in
Rockcastle Co. KY.  David
is the brother of Ruth
Carson who married
Tartulas.  Their children
were: Permelia (Elder),
Martha, Joseph, Mary, Sally
(Payne), John, William,
Betsy C., Catherine,
Maryanne, Ruth and Eliza-
beth.

William Lawrence is a
recognized patriot of the
Daughters of the American
Revolution.

“Expo”
(Cont. from B1)

“Patriots”
(Cont. from B1)
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The Rockcastle County High School Class of 1984 held their 30 year class reunion recently at RCMS. Those
present were front from left: Roger Adams, Ronnie Thomas, Renee Owens Dick, Ryan Loudermilk, Shelley
Parkerson, Georgie Smith Cash, Sherry Creech Cox, Lisa Alsip Bowling, Netza Cash Mullins, Lonetta
Dillingham Daugherty, Teresa Renner Boling and Steve Clark. Second row from left: Susan Tallant Sharp,
Kim Farthing Tandy, Patricia Parker McGuire, Tim McGuire, Tammy Mullins Thomas and Robby Thomas.
Third row from left:  Manuel Shepherd, Tina Taylor Meade, Cassandra McCauley Daugherty, Chris Cornelius,
Jennifer Cox Mattingly, James Poynter and Edith Thomas Barnett. Fourth row from left:  Jeff Philbeck, Steve
Griffin, William Denny, Lisa Mize &Karen Bullock Ping. Those not present for picture were: Tim McKinney,
Tim Albright, James Ballard, Kevin Hamm and Larry Barnett.

Rockcastle County stu-
dents Carlee Cash, Rebekah
Lake, Maggie Franklin, and
Jackson Cromer graduated
from The Center for Rural
Development’s 2014 Rogers
Explorers youth leadership
program.

The Rogers Explorers
program is an educational
leadership program that pro-
vides hands-on learning op-
portunities  for middle
school students in Southern
and Eastern Kentucky to
build their math, science,
and technology skills.
Graduates are encouraged to
work toward pursuing ca-
reers in these in-demand ca-
reer fields.

“This year’s class of
Rogers Explorers showed
that there are tremendous
young leaders in our region
of Southern and Eastern
Kentucky,” said Delaney
Stephens, community liai-
son and youth programs co-
ordinator for The Center.
“By participating in this pro-
gram, students had the op-
portunity to learn more
about the importance of
math and science, and why
the career  fields are needed
in our area.”

The Rogers Explorers
program is presented by The

Center in partnership with
Lindsey Wilson College,
University of the
Cumberlands, Asbury Uni-
versity, Eastern Kentucky
University, and Morehead
State University.

A record 150 middle
school students attended this
year’s Rogers Explorers
program. Participants apply
when they are in the eighth
grade and attend during the
summer before the start of
their freshman year. There is
no admission charge to at-
tend Rogers Explorers.

Carlee is the daughter of
Chuck and Sherri Cash of
Brodhead. Rebekah is the
daughter of Mike and Julie
Lake of Lancaster. Maggie
is the daughter of Jill and
Shannon Franklin of
Brodhead.  Jackson is the
son of Todd and Lesha
Cromer of Mt. Vernon. All
four students represented
Rockcastle County Middle
School.

For more information
about Rogers Explorers,
contact Delaney Stephens at
606-677-6000 or email
youth@centertech.com.
Visit the website
www.centeryouthprograms.com
to learn more about youth
programs at The Center.

Local students graduate
from Rogers Explorers

Calendar
Wednesday, September

24 – Grandparent Support
Group

Thursday, September 25
– School Pictures

Friday, September 26 –
BFRC Advisory Council
Meeting at 12:00

Thursday, October 2 –
Bus Drill; Walkers dis-
missed at 2:45; Parent Pick
Ups 2:50

Friday, October 3 – No
School - KEA

Thursday, October 9 –
Tiger Pride Stride Registra-
tion 6:00 Race 7:00

The access code for your
Parent Portal account will

Tiger Pause

Fall pictures are this Fri-
day.  Wear your best smiles!

This Friday will be the
end of the grading period.  A
new grading period and a
new Encore will begin on
Monday.

School will not be in ses-
sion on Friday, October 3rd.

The Y-Club and Unite
Clubs have been holding
their membership drives.
This week is the last week
to join either of those clubs.
See Mrs. Cromer for more
information.

8th graders and
6thgraders should have
brought home information
about the KIP Survey.  This
survey is done throughout
the state and gathers infor-
mation from students about
drugs, tobacco, alcohol and
other school safety issues.
Forms should only be re-
turned if you do not want

Minds in the Middle
your child to participate.

Thanks to our Leadership
Team for heading up Hat
Day.  Over $500 was raised
to help 6thgrader Abby
Langford with her cancer
treatment.  The Leadership
Team has also raised over
$100 by selling coffee to the
staff in the mornings.
Thanks to all of our students
and staff on being so sup-
portive of Abby!

The KONA Ice trucks
will be back at RCMS on
Friday, October 10th.  Pro-
ceeds will go toward our 8th
grade trip.

Last week our students
participated in Pink Day in
support of 7th grade teacher,
Mrs. Karen Mackinnon,as
she faces treatment for can-
cer.  We wish her a speedy
recovery and look forward
to having her smiling face
back with us soon!

arrive by email beginning in
September.  You will acti-
vate your account on the
Rockcastle Co School
website.

Please make sure you
exit your vehicle only if you
are parked in the parking lot.
The pick-up and drop off
loop is not for parking.  You
must remain in your vehicle
if you are in this area.

Please collect and send
Box Tops for Education and
Campbell’s UPC codes to
school.  You may checkout
both websites for informa-
tion on what to collect and
send.

Campbell’s -

www.labelsforeducation.com
Box tops -

www.boxtops4education.com
Be on the lookout for a

BIG SMILES dental form
coming your way soon.
Students may see a dentist
on site and have minor den-
tal work completed.  If you
do not want your child to
participate please do not re-
turn the form.  No child will
be seen without completed
permission form.  BIG
SMILES first scheduled
visit is Tuesday, October 21.

Due to space limitations
the BFRC can’t accept
clothing donations.  Please
take all items to Grateful

Threads in Mt. Vernon, as
this is where all referrals are
made.

If you plan to attend the
Grandparent Support Group
at the Extension Office at
Noon on Wednesday, please
call Angie Payne at 256-
5484 by 10:00 am tomor-
row to reserve your spot.
Food and door prizes will be
provided.

BES would like to say
thank you to Woodmen of
the World for our new flag
that you see flying outside
the entrance to our school.
(see photo) Also, for their
recent donation to the
BFRC snack pack program.
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Fall Outdoorsman Revival
Fairview Baptist Church

520 Fairview Loop Road, Mt. Vernon

Revival Speaker: Bro. Randy McPheron

October 3rd is Bring your
Favorite Hat Night and there will be a

family  camp-out that night.
October 4th is Dress in Camo Night.
There will be a wild game dinner at

5 p.m. with a lot of giveaways.
(All hunters are encouraged to make their favorite dish).

October 5th is Bring Your Buddy to
Church Morning and evening service is

Pack Your Deer Stand.
Night services start at 6:45 p.m. with a time

of informal singing
Special Music each service featuring an

All-Men’s Choir
Pastor Vaughn Rasor and all members

of Fairview invite all to attend.
Call 606-256-3722

or email: fairviewbapt@aol.com for more information.

Free Bible Courses
Free Bible Corres-

pondence Course. Send
your name and address to
3168 Quail Road, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456.
Let the Bible Speak

Tune in to “Let the Bible
Speak,” with Brett Hickey,
on Sunday mornings at 8:30
a.m. on WDKY Fox 56.

Homecoming
Homecoming will be

held at Sand Springs Baptist
Church on Sunday, Sept.
28th, beginning at 11 a.m.
David Lawson will be
preaching.

There will be no Sunday
School or evening service.

Eugene Gentry, pastor
and congregation welcome
everyone.

Homecoming
Pleasant Run Missionary

Baptist Church will cel-
ebrate another homecoming
on Sunday, Sept. 28th, be-
ginning at 11 a.m.

Pleasant Run Missionary
Baptist was organized Nov.
2, 1820 at the home of John
O’Neal on Brush Creek.
Many prayer meetings have
moved us many times to our
present location at
Livingston at the foot of Old
Gauley Road.

Bro. Gary Bowling and
the congregation welcomes
everyone to come for sing-
ing, preaching and dinner.
To be with family and
friends is so special.

We love the Lord and we
love you. Please join us.

Fall Revival
Fall Revival at Maple

Grove Baptist Church will
be held Sept. 28th through
Oct. 3rd at 7 o’clock nightly
with Bro. Everett Vanzant
officiating. Call 859-779-
4635 for transportation. Ev-
eryone welcome.

The church is located at
1148 Big Cave Road, Or-
lando.
Services Resume at

Union Baptist
Union Baptist Church, in

the Red Hill section of

Rockcastle County out of
Livingston, will resume
church services on Thursday
night, beginning September
25th at 7 o’clock. Bro. Jack
Stallsworth, pastor of Flat
Rock Baptist Church will be
conducting the Thursday
night services.

Everyone in the
Livingston area is encour-
aged and invited to attend
these services and prevent
the closing of the church’s
doors. Let’s keep Union
Baptist Church open.

Thanks and we deeply
appreciate your love and
concern for the church.

Revival
Sand Hill Baptist Church

will be In Revival Septem-
ber 25, 26 and 27, beginning
at 7 o’clock each night. Bro.
Marlow Napier will be
preaching.

Pastor Tommy Miller
and congregation invite ev-
eryone to attend.

Outdoorsman
Revival

Fairview Baptist Church
will hold a Fall
Outdoorsman Revival Oct.
3, 4 and 5 with Bro. Randy
McPheron speaking.

October 3rd is Bring
Your Favorite Hat Night.
There will be a family camp-
out that night.

October 4th is Dress in
Camo Night and there will
be a Wild Game Dinner at 5
p.m. with a lot of giveaways.
All hunters are encouraged
to make their favorite dish.

October 5th is Bring
Your Buddy to Church
Morning and the evening
service is Pack Your Deer
Stand.

Night services will begin
at 6:45 p.m. with a time of
informal singing.

Special music each ser-
vice, featuring an All-Men’s
Choir.

Pastor Vaughn Rasor and
all the members of Fairview
invite all to attend. Call 606-
256-3722 or email
fairviewbapt@aol.com for
more information.

CROCK POT
CHICKEN CHILI

3 pounds boneless, skinless
chicken breasts
1/2 cup chopped onion
2 cloves garlic, finely
minced
32 ounces low-sodium
chicken broth
1/2 teaspoon salt
1 teaspoon chili powder
1 can (4 ounce) diced green
chilies, undrained
2 cans (15 ounces each)
white beans, rinsed and
drained
Juice of 1 lime
1/2 cup chopped fresh
cilantro
Garnishes: Sour cream,
diced avocado, chopped
cilantro, shredded cheese,
tortilla chips
Cut chicken into 1-inch
pieces; place in the bottom
of a 5-quart slow cooker.
Add the onion, garlic,
chicken broth.  Stir in the
salt, chili powder, and green
chilies. Cook on LOW for
6 to 8 hours. Stir in beans.
Cook on HIGH for 30 min-
utes until beans are heated
through. Stir in the lime and
cilantro.

SOUTHERN PEANUT
SOUP

1 cup finely chopped
cooked ham
2 cups unsalted peanuts,
blanched, chopped very
fine
2 cups fine cut green onion
(1 cup of onion and 1 cup
tops)

1/2 cup margarine or but-
ter
1 cup sifted flour
1 and 1/2 quarts chicken
stock
1 quart beef stock
Sauté (pan fry) the ham,
peanuts, and white part of
onion in the margarine.
Add the flour.  Blend and
cook 4 minutes.  Stir to pre-
vent sticking.  Add the soup
stocks.  Blend with a wire
whip;cook for 15 minutes.
Stir occasionally. Just be-
fore serving, add the onion
tops and simmer 10 min-
utes.
If you use blanched salted
peanuts wash the peanuts in
hot water to remove the
salt.

SHAKER TOMATO
CELERY SOUP

1 medium onion, chopped
1 cup finely chopped cel-
ery
2 tablespoons butter
1 can (family-sized) tomato
soup
1 teaspoon minced parsley
1 tablespoon lemon juice
1 teaspoon sugar
1/4 teaspoon salt
Chop onion and celery in
food processor.  Sauté in
butter, but don’t brown.
Prepare tomato soup with
the amount of water called
for on soup can.  Add on-
ion, celery, parsley, lemon
juice, sugar, and salt.  Sim-
mer 5 minutes. If desired,
top with unsweetened
whipped cream and
chopped parsley.

Mamaw’s Kitchen
By Regina Poynter Hoskins

The Daughters of the American Revolution promotes
American history throughout the year by honoring signifi-
cant historical people, places, dates and events. It does this
by sponsoring both the American History Essay Contest
and the Christopher Columbus Essay Contest in the school
system.

Each academic year, an essay topic is chosen for each
contest and contest instructions are made available to the
history teachers at the elementary, middle and high school
levels in the county. Winning essays will be chosen by the
Rockcastle Chapter and then submitted for judging on the
state level. Each state winner is judged on the divisional
level and the divisional winners move on to the national
level, where the winner is announced.

The American History Contest is open to grades 5, 6, 7
and 8. Students in both public, and private schools and those
who are home schooled are eligible to participate.

The 2014-2015 topic is: “A Child’s Journey through Ellis
Island”.  The year 2015 marks the 125th anniversary of
Ellis Island as an immigration station. On a typical day,
immigrants arriving on the island could expect to spend up
to seven hours in processing activities intended to deter-
mine whether or not they were legally and medically fit to
enter the United States.  Imagine yourself as a child travel-
ing through Ellis Island in 1892.  How would you describe
your experience to your cousin who has never heard of Ellis
Island?  Essay length spans from 300-600 words for 5th
graders and 600-1000 words for grades 6, 7 and 8. There
will be one winner from each grade level and those win-
ners will be submitted for state judging.

Since 1996, NSDAR has joined with the National Ital-
ian American Foundation to sponsor an annual national
essay contest on Christopher Columbus. This contest is open
to students in grades 9 through 12 in public and private
schools and those who are home schooled.

The national winner is invited to read their winning es-
say at the National Columbus Day celebration in Washing-
ton D.C. The 2014-2015 topic is: “Joining Christopher Co-
lumbus on His Voyage to the New World”. Imagine you
have chosen to join Columbus’ crew as he sets out for the
New World.

What are your thoughts and feelings as you prepare for
this potentially hazardous mission?  What skills do you pos-
sess that are essential to your success and survival?  Why
do you want to go on this voyage and what do you hope to
gain from this experience? Essay length is 800-1200 words.
This essay contest will have only one winner on the local
level and will be submitted for state judging.

All students are encouraged to participate.  Information
packets detailing each contest have been distributed to all
history teachers throughout the school system.

Further information may be obtained from your teacher
or you may contact Rockcastle Chapter Historian, Karen
Adams at (859) 273-9015 or email adamskaren11@cs.com.

The deadline for these essay contests is October 31,
2014.

DAR to sponsor
two essay contestsHappy

One Year
Anniversary
to my sweet
husband.
I love you

today
more than

I ever
have.
—Nikki

Upcoming Reunions
Carpenter &

Phillips Reunion
The Carpenter and

Phillips Reunion will be
held at the Lawrence
Phillips Place on Horselick
Creek in Jackson Co. on
Sat., Sept. 27, beginning at
11 a.m. with lunch served at
noon.

All family and friends
are welcome. Bring a cov-
ered dish and lawn chair.

For more information,
call 606-453-2181.

Todd Reunion
The Henry and Martha

Todd Reunion will be held
Saturday, Sept. 27th at Quail
Park, beginning at noon.
Bring food and drinks.

October 1st thru
October 31st is

Rockcastle Roadside
PRIDE Month

To volunteer, call
James Renner,

Rockcastle County
PRIDE Coordinator
at 606-256-1902

An Appreciation Dinner
for all fall volunteers

will be November 8th at the
Rockcastle County

Recycling Center at Noon.

• Lunch Provided • Games and Prizes
• Fun For The Whole Family •

Discount Grocery
& More

Monday - Friday
9 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Saturday 10 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Closed Sunday

EBT Welcome
45 S. Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon

256-3106

Subscribe to
the Signal

Call 256-2244



Poplar Grove
Baptist

145 Richlands Rd. •
Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Providence

church of Christ
1 mile off Hwy. 70

on Hwy. 618
Dan McKibben, Minister

758-8524 or 758-9316
Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.

Sunday Morning Worship
10:30 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

email:
dan.mckibben@juno.com

www.WhatSaithTheScriptures.com
Roundstone

Baptist
Rick Reynolds, Pastor

606-256-0306
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Sand Hill Baptist
Church

Sand Hill Rd.
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Night 5:00 p.m.
Thursday Night 6 p.m.
Pastor Tommy Miller

Sand Springs
Baptist

Directions: Take Hwy 1249, go
exactly 5 miles, church on right

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 6 p.m.
Pastor:

Bro. Eugene Gentry
Scaffold Cane

Baptist
Chris Cobb, Pastor

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.

Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Union Chapel
Pentecostal

1505 Union Chapel Rd.
Brodhead, Ky.

Letcher Napier, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.

Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.
United Gospel of Christ

4 miles off US 25 on Wildie Rd.
Church welcomes everyone
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.
Valley Baptist Church
4482 Copper Creek Rd.

Berea, Ky. 40403
Organized in December, 1908

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Evan Eckler, Pastor
Wildie Christian

Church
1478 Wildie Rd.  • Wildie

606-256-4494
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 10:55 a.m.
Family Fellowship 6 p.m.

Bible Study 6 p.m.
Bro. Gary Pettyjohn, Pastor

Mount Vernon
606-256-2500

McKee
606-287-8390

Somerset
606-451-2274

24 Hour Information Line 1-800-530-8561

Brodhead
606-758-8212

Rockcastle Professional
Pharmacy

Newcomb Ave. • Mt. Vernon
606-256-4613

Open Monday - Friday 8:30 a.m. to 7 p.m.
Sat., 8:30 a.m. to 1 p.m.

“Free Delivery”

Believers House of Prayer
156 Scenic View Lane

U.S. 25 N, left at 18 mile marker
Renfro Valley, Ky.

Sabbath School Sat. 10 -11 a.m.
Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Evening Worship 7 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Pastor: Bill Davis
bhop@ymail.com

Berea Gospel Tabernacle
131 US 25 South

Berea, KY
Tuesday Night 7 p.m.
Sunday Night 6 p.m.

Pastor: Ralph Chasteen
Bible Baptist Church

100 Higher Ground (off US 25)
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Church Phone 606-256-5913
e-mail: www.biblebaptist.org

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship/Children’s

Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Night Worship 6 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.

Video services Tues., Thurs., &
Sat. at 11 a.m., 4 p.m. & 9 p.m.

Channel 3 - New Wave
Cable Channel 5 in Berea and
Richmond 1 p.m. Wednesdays

Pastor: Don Stayton
Associate Pastor/Youth:

Bro. Jeremy Ellis
Kids for Christ

Children’s Ministry:
Bro. Jarrod Amyx

Secretary: Jo Roberts
Music Director: Dan Dull

Blue Springs
Church of Christ

7 miles south of Mt. Vernon on
Hwy. 1249 (Sand Springs Rd)

Services:
Sundays 10 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Preaching Brethren
Zade McClure, Gary Reppert,

Marcus Reppert
Contact Info:

Marcus Reppert
104 Byrda Way • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

606-308-2794
marcusreppert24@hotmail.com
Bride of Christ Church
100 High St. Mt. Vernon

Sundays 6:00 p.m.
Thursdays 7:00 p.m.

Pastor Darlisa Holder
606-416-7136
606-379-6335

Brodhead Baptist Church
Corner of Silver & Maple St.

Brodhead, Ky. 40409
606-758-8316

Sunday Bible Study 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m. &

7 p.m.
(Nursery Provided)

Sunday Youth Bible Study
5 p.m.

Wednesday Adult & Youth
Worship/Bible Study 7 p.m.

Children’s Programs:
RAs & GAs

Mission Friends and
Creative Ministry

Ralph Baker, Pastor
Brodhead Christian

Church
237 W. Main St. Brodhead

606-758-8721
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m. & 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

Tracy Valentine, Preacher
606-758-8662

Cell 606-305-8980

Church Directory
Brodhead Church of God

Hwy. 3245 • Brodhead
758-8216

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday evening 7 p.m.
Terry Orcutt, Pastor

Brush Creek
Holiness Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7 p.m.

Tuesday Prayer Meeting 7 p.m.
Lonnie R. McGuire,

Pastor
Buffalo Baptist Church
Located 15 miles south of
Mt. Vernon on Hwy. 1249

(Sand Springs Rd.)
606-256-4988

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11:15 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Tim Owens, Pastor

Calloway Baptist Church
76 Calloway Branch Rd.
(Off US 25) • Calloway
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 6 p.m.
George Renner, Pastor

606-224-4641
Central Baptist Church

86 Maintenance Rd.
Mt. Vernon, KY 40456

606-256-2988
centralbaptistky.org
Pastor: Mark Eaton

Home of “Central Baptist
Christian Academy”
K-12 Private School

“Central Time” Radio
Broadcast

WRVK 1460AM
Monday -Friday 11:15 a.m.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning and

Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study,

Prayer Meeting and “Patch
the Pirate Club”  7 p.m.

Transportation and Nursery
provided for all services

Mark Eaton, Pastor
Church of Christ at

Chestnut Ridge
2 miles south of Mt. Vernon

Turn left off US Hwy 25
Sundays 10:00 a.m.

Wednesdays 7:30 p.m.
Bro. Ova Baker

Bro. Dale McNew
Bro. Philip Scott

Church of Christ on
Fairground Hill

Sunday Worship 10 a.m.
Different speaker each

Sunday
Climax Christian Church

Hwy. 1912
308-2806 - 256-4138 - 256-5977

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Terry Thornton, Minister
Climax Holiness Church
Sunday Night Worship 6 p.m.

Thursday Nights 7 p.m.
3rd Sat. of every month at

7 p.m.
Conway Missionary

Baptist
U.S. 25 between

Mount Vernon and Berea

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6 p.m.
Wed. Prayer Service and

Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Meetings:
Sunday 5 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Bobby Turner, Pastor

606-758-4007
Crab Orchard Pentecostal

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
Tuesday Evening 7 p.m.
Pastor: Donald King

606-355-7595
Crossroads

Assembly of God
Hwy. 150 • Brodhead

Bro. Steven Vanhook, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 7 p.m.

Dixie Park Cornerstone
700 N. Powell St. Berea, Ky.

859-623-8292 • 859-985-
2484

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6
p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Gene Smith, Pastor

Fairview Baptist Church
520 Fairview Loop Road

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday Services

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Choir 6 p.m.

Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Sunday Adult Choir 8 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Creative Ministry 6 p.m.

Bible Study 7 p.m.
Youth Ministry QUEST 7 p.m.

RAs and GAs 7 p.m.
Mission Friends 6 p.m.
Vaughn Rasor, Pastor

606-256-3722
email: fairviewbapt@aol.com
Faith Chapel Pentecostal

S. Wilderness Road
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.
Jack Carpenter, Pastor
First Baptist Church

340 West Main Street
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 606-256-2922

Neal Thornton, Pastor
Jesse Wright,

Assoc. Pastor/Youth
website: www.fbcmvkyorg

email:fbcmtvernon@newwave.net
Sunday Services: 8:20 a.m.,

10:45 a.m. and 6 p.m.
Wednesdays: AWANA and

Adult Bible Study 6:30 p.m.
Live Broadcast WRVK 1460AM

Sundays at 11 a.m.
Broadcast on New Wave Cable
Channel 3 Tues., Thurs. & Sun-
day at 10 a.m., 3 p.m. & 8 p.m.

First Christian
Church

West Main St. Mt. Vernon
606-256-2876

Bro. Bruce Ross, Pastor
Sunday School: 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship
11 a.m. & 6 p.m.

Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.
Flat Rock Missionary

Baptist
504 Maple Grove Rd. Hwy. 1004

Orlando, Ky.
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Fellowship Hour 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 7 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

Jack Stallsworth, Pastor
Contact: 606-308-0124

Freedom Baptist Church
Freedom School Rd.

Mt. Vernon
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 6 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

7 p.m.
Wednesday Evening Prayer
Meeting & Youth/Children

Classes 7 p.m.
www.freedomsbc.com

email:
pastor@freedomsbc.com
Pastor: David Sargent

606-256-2968
Hickory Grove

Pentecostal Church
Hwy. 1505 (6 miles from Brodhead)

Brodhead,Ky.
Randal Adams, Pastor

Youth Pastor, Scott Adams
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sun. & Wed. Evening 7 p.m.
Lighthouse Assembly of

God
Hwy. 1004 • Orlando, Ky.

Tim Hampton, Pastor
606-256-4884 • 606308-2342

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Tues. Night Intercessory Prayer
7 p.m.

Wednesday Night Bible Study
7 p.m.

Little Country Church
Jarber Rd.

Turn left off Rev. Green Loop
onto Jarber Rd.

Jack Weaver, Pastor
Sunday 6 p.m.

Wednesday 7 p.m.
Livingston Baptist
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Adult Classes Available

Worship Service 11 a.m.
Bro. Steve McKinney, Pastor

606-758-4097
email: stevemc1964@gmail.com

Livingston Christian
Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Arthur Hunt, Minister

Livingston Pentecostal
Holiness Church

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Jim Miller, Pastor
606-256-1709

Macedonia Baptist
Scaffold Cane Road
Mount Vernon, Ky.

Bro. Barry Hurst, Pastor
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Maple Grove Baptist

Hwy. 1004 (Big Cave Road)
Orlando, Ky. • 606-256-1873

Bro. Jerry Owens, Pastor
 Home Phone 606-256-3075

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Morning Worship

11 a.m.
WRVK Broadcast 2 p.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Maretburg Baptist

Church
2617 New Brodhead Rd.
Mt. Vernon, KY 40456
Wayne Harding, Pastor

 Phone: 256-8844
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Sun. Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Sun. Discipleship Training/

Sunday Youth Missions
6 p.m.

Sunday Worship 7 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
www.maretburgbaptist.org

maretburgchurch@yahoo.com
McNew Chapel

Baptist
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Jerry Ballinger, Pastor

Mt. Vernon
Church of God
1025 W Main St.

Mount Vernon, Ky.
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7 p.m.

Bobby Owens, Pastor
859-986-1317

Mt. Vernon Church of
the Nazarene

40 Fair Street • Mt. Vernon
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.
David Smith, Pastor

Mt. Zion Baptist Church
606-308-3293

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 5 p.m.

New Hope Baptist Church
Jct. 1797 New Hope Tower Rd.

Orlando
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6 p.m.

Wednesday Evening 7 p.m.
Bro. David Carpenter, Pastor

Northside Baptist Church
777 Faith Mountain Rd.

(Off 461 bypass) Mt. Vernon
606-256-5577

Sunday
Sunday School 10 a.m.

Morning Worship 11 a.m.
Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Hispanic Services 6 p.m.
Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Tuesday
Celebrate Recovery 7 to 9

Wednesday
Adult & Youth Worship 7 p.m.

Time Warner Cable
Tues., Thurs., Sun.

9 a.m., 2 p.m., 7 p.m.
Pastor: Randy McPheron
Ottawa Baptist Church
1074 Ottawa Rd. • Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Children’s Church 11 a.m.
Sunday Discipleship

Training/Youth Mission
Groups 6 p.m.

Wednesday Services
Youth Choir 6 p.m.

Children’s & Youth Bible Study
6:45 p.m. • Service 7 p.m.

Jim Craig, Pastor • 758-8453
ottawabaptist@windstream.net
Our Lady of Mt. Vernon

Catholic Church
515 Williams St (across from MVES)

Mount Vernon, Ky.
606-256-4170
Mass Times:

Tuesdays at 5 p.m.
Sabbath Mass: Sat., 5 p.m.

Holy Days 5 p.m.
Fr. Michael Flanagan, Pastor

Sister Joyce Moeller,
Pastoral Associate

Jack Lawless, Groundskeeper
Tom Darst, Maintenance
Philadelphia United

Baptist
834 Bryant Ridge Rd. Brodhead

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Evening Service 6 p.m.

Wednesday Service 7 p.m.
Saturday Service 7 p.m.
Gordon Mink, Pastor

606-256-9724
Pine Hill Holiness

5216 S. Wilderness Rd.
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456
Chris Davidson, Pastor

256-5955
www.pinehillholiness.com

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sun. Evening Worship 6 p.m.

Thursday Night Worship
7:00 p.m.

WRVK (1460 AM) Broadcast
Noon Sundays

Pine Hill Missionary
Baptist Church

81 Limeplant Hollow Road
Mt. Vernon, Ky. 40456

Bro. Clyde Miller, Pastor
859-986-1579

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.

Discipleship Training 5:30 p.m.
Sunday Evening Worship

6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Prayer Meeting &

Youth Service at 7:00 p.m.
Prayer Partners Ladies Meeting
monthly every 2nd Tues. at 6:30 p.m.
Pleasant Run Missionary

Sunday School 10 a.m.
Sunday Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 5 p.m.

1st Sunday in Month Church at
2 p.m. at Rockcastle

Respiratory Care
Bro. Gary Bowling, Pastor

Open:
10 a.m. to 10 p.m.

7 Days a Week

U.S. 25 N - Mt. Vernon

606-256-4910

Brodhead Pharmacy
Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-4373
Howard Saylor

Pharmacist
David Collins

Owner

Open:
9:30 to 6:30
Mon. - Fri.

“We Deliver County Wide”

Collins Respiratory
Care

Main Street • Brodhead

606-758-9333
Home Health Equipment & Supplies

Insurance & Medicare Accepted
Owners: David Collins & Shelly Clements

Call changes to
Church  Directory

to 256-2244
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10 Piece Meal
$5 Fill-Up Box

For your family reunion or church
gathering -- we offer catering!

2 Sides *
4 Biscuits



Classifieds
CLASSIFIED RATES
• Local Rates - $4 for 25 words
or less - .10 each additional word

• Display Classifieds
$5.00/Inch

Deadline for Classifieds
is 10 a.m. TUESDAY

For Rent

For Rent

Maple St. Storage

of Brodhead

256-2884 or
606-308-2491
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Property
For Sale

NOTICE
NO classifieds can

be placed over
the phone without
paying at time of

placing
advertisement

CLASSIFIED
ADS NOTICE

For your  convenience,
we now  accept VISA

and Mastercard
To place your

classified, have your
credit card ready

and call
(606) 256-2244

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Help Wanted

Notices

Mobile Homes
For Sale

Posted

New House • Castlewood Subdivision • 55 Ruby Ln.
Large 2,044 sq. ft., 1,614 living space, 3 BR, 2 BA, kitchen/dining combo with
stove, microwave, dishwasher, energy efficient 15 Ceer heat/air pump, 2 car
garage, city water/sewer, concrete driveway, on large lot. Asking $138,000.

859-582-6469 • 859-200-2057 • 606-965-3263
Call anytime - shown by appointment

Rockcastle Health
& Rehabilitation Center

371 West Main Street • Brodhead, Ky  40409

Employment Opportunities
RN-Night Shift, FT; Physical Therapists-2, FT

SRNA-Day and Nights, FT; Dietary-FT and PRN
Housekeeping-FT and PRN

Please apply at our facility or call 606-758-8711
Signature HealthCARE is an Equal Opportunity Employer - EOE M/F/D/V

Garage For Lease: 2 lifts,
big air compressor, parts
washer, tire changer, cherry
picker, welder, torches, jack
stands, sink, stove, etc.
$550 month, electric in-
cluded. 606-308-5482.
40x2
1 1/2 Acre Trailer Lot. City
water. 859-358-3560.
40xntf
Mobile Home on Lake.
$425 month/$450 deposit.
Reference required. 606-
392-1774. 38xntf
Multiple 2 bedroom, 2
bath Mobile Homes, lo-
cated off 461. $200 deposit.
$275-$300 a month. W/D
hookup, appliances
incuded. Call Ronnie at
606-379-6058 or 606-802-
0450. 40x2p
3 Bedroom, 2 bath mobile
home in Sunnyside Estates.
$375 month/$375 deposit.
No pets. Call 606-256-8603
or 606-308-5459. 40xntf
2 Bedroom, 2 Bath mobile
home. 606-758-4985.
40xntf
Duplex in Brodhead. All
appliances furnished. Call
Patty, 758-9666. 17xntf
Duplex in Brodhead. Call
Amy Nicely 256-8700.
15xntf
Trailers and house in
Brodhead. No pets. 758-
8922. ntf
Accepting applications at
Mt. Vernon Housing Au-
thority on Mondays 4 to 8
p.m. and Wednesdays and
Fridays, 4 to 6 p.m. Rent
based on income. 256-4185.
14xntf
Accepting Applications:
For 2 and 3 bedroom units
at Valley View Apartments.
Rent based on income. Call
256-5912. Equal Housing
Opportunity, TDD for hear-
ing impaired only. 1-800-
247-2510. 36tfn

16 1/2 Acres, m/l,  with
24x60 mobile home, 20x20
attached garage, 2 large
barns, 2 large outbuildings
and carport. Blacktop drive-
way. $69,000. Call 606-
386-1470. 38x4p
2BR/2BA 1450 sq. ft. Sell-
ing for $89,900. Rick Szaks,
Broker. 859-255-7777. Lin-
coln Real Estate, Inc.
rickszaks@aol.com  18xntf
Between Mt. Vernon and
Somerset: 5.7 wooded
acres for $31,500. Near
Berea - 10.2 acres $31,900.
Owner financing available.
Call Dwight at 859-331-
4888. 8xntf

Lots in Castle Ridge Sub-
division. Use same entry
way as Bible Baptist
Church. All lots have city
sewer and underground
utilities. starting at $12,900.
606-256-5692 • 256-4504 •
308-3730. 50x1
Mobile home lots, located
in Sunnyside Mobile Home
Park. 1/2 acre lots - $500
down and $100 per month.
Call 606-256-5692 or 606-
256-5648. 50x1
House and 11.5 acres for
sale on Rich Farm Road.
Large shed, two small out
buildings, pond with dock,
creek. 1,440 sq. ft., two
story, 3 bedroom, 2 full
bath, utility room with deep
sink, gas fireplace, all hard-
wood and laminate flooring.
$150,000. No rent. 606-
308-4759.

Posted: No hunting or tres-
passing on land belonging
to Glen Roberts at 560 Dix
River Branch Road,
Brodhead. Violators will be
prosecuted. 35xntf
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or 4 wheelers on
property belonging to Will-
iam Johnson and Bill Parker
(formerly owned by Bar-
bara Setser) and located on
Hwy. 490, Mahaffey Hol-
low Road, Livinston. Viola-
tors will be prosecuted.
13x26
Posted: No hunting, tres-
passing or ATVs on land be-
longing to Jason and Sara
Coguer at Roundstone. Not
responsible for accidents.
Posted: No trespassing on
land belonging to James and
Dorothy Rash heirs on Rash
Branch Road off Chestnut
Ridge. No hunting, camp-
ing, ATVs, trespassing for
any purpose. Not respon-
sible for accidents. Violators
will be prosecuted. (1/15/
15)
Posted: No trespassing on
Crawford Place - Old
Brodhead Road. Danny
Smith. 47tfn
Posted: Absolutely no hunt-
ing, fishing or trespassing
on property belonging to
Mark and Debbie
Cummins. Violators will be
prosecuted. 9x52p
Posted: No trespassing,
hunting or fishing on land
belonging to Rachel
Denney on Hwy. 3245
(former Reggie Benge prop-
erty).
Posted: No trespassing on
property known as C.B.
Owens Farm across from
Fairgrounds in Brodhead.
Violators will be pros-
ecuted. 25tfn

By Owner (To Be Moved).
1989 14x70 mobile home.
3 bedrooms, 2 full baths w/
fireplace. $9,800 or best of-
fer. 606-872-1703. 40x4
Large 4 bedroom double-
wide with 4.69 acres in Lin-
coln Co. Bank foreclosure,
will finance. Price $64,900.
Ready to move into. Have
several repos without land.
Call Jim 859-985-0344. D&
D Transport. 39x2

Please be advised that the
mobile home, on lots 24, 25
and 26 in Dusty Trails Sub-
division, will be considered
abandoned if no claims are
made within 30 days. To
make a claim, contact
Benton or Theresa Bullock.
Bids will be accepted for
catering service for the
Rockcastle County Senior
Citizens Adult Day Health
Care Center, located in
Rockcastle County, Ken-
tucky, to provide 50 hot
lunches per day (excluding
weekends). Caterers must
be registered with the Ken-
tucky Department of Educa-
tion, Division of School and
Community Nutrition, prior
to submitting bids. Call 502-
564-5625 for more informa-
tion. Bid packets may be ob-
tained at the center, located
at 1260 South Wilderness
Road, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456. Bids will be ac-
cepted at the above address
on September 29, 2014 at 10
a.m. 39x2
Notice is hereby given that
Timothy J. Reynolds, 235
Joyce St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
Executor of the estate of
Billy R. Reynolds. Any per-
son having claims against
said estate shall present
them, according to law, to
the said timothy J. Reynolds
or Hon. John D. Ford, P.O.
Box 247, Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 by March 9, 2015 at
9:30 a.m. 39x3
Notice is hereby given that
Peggy S. Falin, 75 West
Main St., Mt. Vernon, Ky.
40456 has been appointed
executrix of the estate of
Freda Alcorn. Any person
having claims against said
estate shall present them,
according to law, to the said
Peggy S. Falin or Hon. John
D. Ford, Coffey & Ford,
PSC, P.O, Box 247, Mt.
Vernon, Ky. 40456 by
March 4, 2015 at 9:30 a.m.

Excellent Opportunity to
advance your career!
Malone Solutions is now
hiring for manufacturing
positions with a pay rate
between $9 and $13 per
hour. No high school or
GED diploma required. Ap-
ply online at
www.malonesolutions.com.

Help Wanted
Truck Driving Position/
Local Milk Hauling. Must
have tanker endorsement
with CDL or willing to get
it, 3-5 days a week. Caudill
Trucking. Call Myron 606-
308-1387.
Dump truck driver. Must
have CDL license for dump
truck. Caudill Trucking.
Call Myron 606-308-1387.

Yard Sales

Motor Vehicles
For Sale

Garage Sale: Frday and
Saturday, 9 a.m. to ? off new
Hwy. 150 at home of Joe
and Patty Barron on
Maretburg Cemetery Road.
Signs will be posted. Name
brand clothing, including
Tommy, Aeropostale, Levi
Strauss and Gap. Home In-
terior,, baby girl and boy
clothes, Queen Anne chair,
computer desk, TV cabinet,
baby bed crib set, primi-
tives, two small color tvs,
AB lounder, dishes, much
more. Rain cancels.
Large Yard Sale: At Scaf-
fold Cane, 3 miles from U,S,
25 on 1617 at the home of
Fred and Thelma Mullins
Gas stove, some material
and lots of other things. 9
a.m. to 4 p.m. Friday and
Saturday.
Yard Sale: Friday, Sept.
26th and Sat., Sept. 27th, 8
a.m. to 4 p.m. in Brodhead,
1 mile west of Dollar Store
on Hwy. 2250 (old 150).
Custom made entertainment
center, glassware, pictures,
Earnhardt Nascar, miscella-
neous tables, tail lights and
lenses for trailer, 2 rifle
scope s and mounts, DUI
racing distributor for small
block Chevy, clothes for
girls sizes 12-14, men’s 3X,
women’s 2X, many other
items including movies,
DVD player, CDs, belt
sander, palm sander. Some-
thing for everyone.

Miscellaneous
For Sale

1996 Ford Expedition,
Eddie Bauer Edition. 4
wheel drive. $2500 obo.
606-308-3670. 13xntf

Sigmon Farm now has
Kennebec Potatoes and red
sweet potatoes for sale. 256-
2781. 39x2
1997 27 ft. Fleetwood Wil-
derness travel trailer.
$1,800 as is, needs some re-
pair. 1998 20 ft. Bayliner
Bowrider. $1,500, needs
motor. 919-816-7902. 37x4

Subscribe to the Signal
Call 606-256-2244

Rockcastle County
Property Taxes

2014
The property tax bills will no longer be in a
letter form but will be a white postcard you
will need to mail with payment or bring with
you when making payment. Bills will be mailed
out October 1, 2014. Payment for bills cannot
be accepted before October 1st.
If you do not receive bill by October 5, 2014
please contact the Rockcastle Sheriff’s De-
partment, 205 East Main St. Box 2, Mt.
Vernon, KY 40456. 606-256-2032.

Business hours:
Monday - Wednesday & Friday 8:30 a.m. - 4:00 p.m.

Thursday 8:30 a.m. - 6:00 p.m.
Saturday 8:30 a.m. - 12 Noon

Property tax bills can also be viewed on the
Rockcastle County Department website at
rockcastlekentuckysheriff.com

Starting Date Ending Date
2% discount Oct. 1, 2014 Nov. 1, 2014
Face amount Nov. 3, 2014 Jan. 3, 2015
5% Penalty Jan. 5, 2015 Feb. 2, 2015
10% Penalty+ Feb. 3, 2015 Apr. 15, 2015
10% Add-On



Morgan Plumbing
Service & Repair

New Construction •
Commercial & Residential Service

Fully Insured • All Work Guaranteed

256-4766 • 606-232-0666

Mechanic
On Duty

All Types of Repairs
We do muffler &

exhaust replacement and
custom pipe bending

BEE Garbage
256-2334

Weekly residential
curbside pickup

$1700 per month with Curb Cart

MPL #6761

5076 S Wilderness Rd. • Mt. Vernon, Ky.

David’s Tire Center
24 Hr. Towing & Recovery LLC

1431 S. Wilderness Rd. (US 25)
Mt. Vernon

Save On All Major Brand
Tires For Cars & Trucks

Farm Tractors • Lawn & More

David & Josh Thompson, Owners
Office/24 Hr. Wrecker
606-256-4606

Town & Country
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE

All Types of Mechanic Work

Call 256-9634 days or
256-4650 nights

MADISON TERMITE
and PEST CONTROL
Call Paul Burton - Day or Night

256-2318 - Mt. Vernon
-----

STOP TERMITES  ROACHES  WATERBUGS

Winstead’s
Heating & Air

Pat Winstead
606-256-1038 • 606-308-4825

HM04434

On-Site
Computer

Service
Tired of sending your
computer

away to get
it fixed?

Call and let us come to
you for all your computer

needs!

Setup, Consultation,
Software/Hardware Conflicts

Virus/Spyware Removal

Reasonable Rates
Call

Spencer Benge
606-308-5653

Caudill Dump Truck Service
Rock • Gravel
Agr. Lime
Sand

Rock & Job Quotes
Driveway Spreading
Dumping/Stockpile

Contact for competitive pricing:
Myron - (606) 308-1387

Kentucky Auto Exchange
Public Auto Auction • Dealers Welcome

Every Saturday and Tuesday at 7 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
Located on Exit 38 in London on Hwy. 1006

(606) 878-7815

Financing Available
through Wells Fargo

*w/ approved credit

Visa, Mastercard,
Discover
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John’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’sJohn’s
Repair

Appliance
& Plumbing

Faucet & Toilet
308-5646

John Tyler, Owner

Rocket Carpet
Cleaners

Circular Dry Foam Cleaning

(606) 256-9870

Thinking About Cleaning Your Carpet!
Some things to think about…

What is the best way to clean my carpet, should I use the
old technology of steam cleaning or the new technology

of dry foam?

Test results from Consumer Report, 2008.

Option 1: Steam Cleaning-How does it work?
A. Steam Cleaners saturate your carpet and floor pad with hot (150*
degree) soapy water containing lye and beach to help dissolve stains.

B. After your carpet reaches its maximum saturation point the solution
is then extracted by means of a commercial shop vacuum.

The results: Removes less than 20% of the soil from the carpet driving
the remainder down deeper into the carpet fibers.  The lye/bleach

solution used by steam cleaners to dissolve stains fades carpet colors.
Drying time is 1 to 5 days depending on the carpet texture.  As a result
of the water saturation, carpet fibers harden and the floor pad remains
damp, which promotes bacteria growth and mildewing, causing carpet

threads to rot, shorting the life of your carpet.  Carpet manufactures
recommend that you do not steam clean carpets.

Option 2: Dry Foam-How does it work?
C. Carpet fibers are agitated with carpet combs to separate the fibers
loosening dirt particles, which are then dry cleaned with an industrial

strength vacuum.
D. The carpet is then shampooed with horse hair brushes using

Dry-Foam lather, a solution that contains six different cleaners and
fabric softener, color brightener, deodorizer, disinfectant, crystalline

agent, scotch guard, & degreaser. Does not contain lye or bleach.
E. Carpet fibers are then groomed to fluff up worn walk areas to give a

uniform look to the carpet.
The results: Removes over 90% of carpet soil.  Rejuvenates and

brightens colors and patterns of carpets.  Drying times is less than 2
hours.  Floor pads remain dry-Fabric Softener makes carpets soft again-

Promoting the life of the carpet.
Carpet manufacturers recommend Dry Foam to clean Carpets.

Professional
Services

Heating & Air

COMPLETE HOME
COMFORT

Locally owned and Located at:

523 West St. • Brodhead, Ky.
Rodney Smith

758-0155 • 256-1683 • 859-661-5986
We service all Brands and Models • 20+ years experience

Free Estimates - Affordable Service - Call for Rates
Expert Installation & Troubleshooting • Friendly Hometown Service

Heat Pumps and Gas Furnaces
Fully Licensed and Insured HVAC and Electrical • MO-4808 and CE63779

Now Buying Junk Cars
Hauling off appliances for free!

Call Mike
(606) 308-2487

256-0122

Gutters Cleaned and Repaired

General Construction

Tiling • Flooring859-302-0197

Award-Winning
Water Features &

Landscaping
Max Phelps
Member I.P.P.C.A

606-416-3911
www.rockcastles.net

Make $1,000 selling your old scrap cars-trucks and farm
equipment and machinery.

Call 24 hours a day. If no answer, leave message and your call will be returned.

859-358-3560 or 606-256-3841 anytime

We also buy
batteries, converters,
aluminum wheels and

radiators, starters,
and alternators.

Used tires and parts
for sale at dirt
cheap prices.

PERRY’S Autobody &
Auto Rental Service

24/7 Wrecker Service Available
PERRY & AMY MINK PROPERTIES, LLC
Storage and Rental Units • 12x20 units fully lined floor to

ceiling & fenced for your security
Fairground Hill off Hwy. 150 • 110 Old Somerset Rd. Mt. Vernon

606-256-5198 or 606-308-1008

Wanted

Jonathan Collins Remod-
eling and Repair Service.
Home improvements of any
kind from doors and win-
dows, painting, new floors
to roofs and decks - will do
it all. Any home, any prob-
lem, “we’re the one to call.”
606-308-3533. 37x4p
Owens Monument: Lo-
cated behind Owens Fu-
neral Home in Brodhead.
Open Mon-Fri. 8 to 5 and
Sat. 9 a.m. to noon. 606-
758-9600. 14xntf
Notice: Will haul off or buy
scrap metal, junk cars or
trucks. Metal hauled for
free. 231-6788. 14xntf
Grave Markers & Monu-
ments: In stock at all times.
McNew Monument Sales,
US 25, 4 miles north of Mt.
Vernon. Phone 256-2232.
U Call We Haul! Anything
that fits on a truck. Local or

long distance. Building -
demolition - moving -
clean-ups - bushhogging -
landscaping. No garbage.
606-256-9222 o4 308-1629.
Gail’s Pampered Pooch
57 West Main St.,
Brodhead. For appt. call
606-758-0064

Will pay cash for old gas,
oil, dealerships, parts manu-
facturer signs, old gas pumps,
L&N collectibles, anything
regarding the Cummins fam-
ily from Rockcastle County,
John Deere, International
Harvester, antiques, etc.
Coming to Mt. Vernon the
week end of October 3-4,
2014. Contact Kari Cummins
Ogle at 502-836-6922 with
any questions. 34x7
Wanted To Buy: Your an-
tiques and collectibles. An-
tique glassware, furniture,
quilts, all types of military
items, clocks, watches (work-
ing or not), pocket watches
and wrist watch parts, pocket
knives, coins and paper
money. All types of gold, sil-
ver scrap, cast iron banks,
toys, lighters, crock jugs, cast
iron skillets, marbles, pocket
knives, fishing items, Indian
Arrowheads, and much,
much more. Also buying par-
tial estates. Over 25 years ex-
perience. Call Clarence
Reece at 606-531-0467.
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Marching season for Rockets off to a strong start
Congratulations to the RCHS Marching Rockets who kicked off
their season with their first contest at North Laurel High School
this past Saturday.  The band premiered their 2014 Show "Pyra-
mids of Egypt" which features original music by composer Larry
P. Gilroy.  This year's show incorporates well written tunes along
with elaborate visuals in a musical salute to one of the seven
wonders of the world and Ancient Egyptain Culture.  The band
placed 2nd in class AAA-1 at North Laurel and will continue
their season at Corbin HS this Saturday September 27th when
they perform at 4:45 in the evening.  Good luck Marching Rock-
ets.
Pictured above Marching Rockets seniors with Saturday's tro-
phy, from left: Cassidy Adkins, Sierra Smith, Zach Hayes, Shelby Brown, Drum Ma-
jor (with trophy), Johnathan Case, Shelby Ponder, Jessica Harris, and Jacob Riley. At
right: Drum Major Shelby Brown giving her salute as the Rockets are ready to per-
form "Pyramids of Egypt".

Mt. Vernon Message
LMC videos go home each Friday and are to be returned each Monday for students

whose names have been drawn for having perfect attendance and/or on track behavior.
FRC Enrichment classes are each Monday from 3:00 until 4:25.  Parents must be here

promptly at 4:25.
There will be a Spirit Card Fundraiser for MVES PTG.  The fundraiser begins on

October 2 and ends on October 8.  Please check your child’s folder for more information.
There will be no school on Friday, October 3.  Enjoy your long weekend!

MVES UNITE Club News
“Wipe Out Drugs” toilet paper drive is scheduled for September 25-October 16.  Stu-

dents may bring in a 4 roll or larger pack or pennies for toilet paper to be purchased.  All
contributions go to local drug rehabilitation centers.

Mrs. Linda Clontz’s class has been studying about government.  As part of their
study, they had an election for class president. Co-presidents are from left, Rex
Parkey  and Zeke Fain.  Congratulations to Rex and Zeke.

On September 12th, the Rockcastle HOSA Chapter held their first meeting for
the 2014-2015 year.  During the meeting, the Officer Installation Ceremony was
held for the new officers.  Mrs. Rhonda Childress, the HOSA Advisor, started the
ceremony.  The 2014-2015 officers are: Matthew Newcomb, Parliamentarian;
Emily Childress, Historian; Samarah Lovins, Reporter; Brook Isaacs, Treasurer;
Levi Sparks, Secretary; Hannah Hillard, Vice President; and Anna Poynter, Presi-
dent.  The mission of HOSA is to enhance the delivery of compassionate, quality
health care by providing opportunities for knowledge, skill and leadership devel-
opment of all health science education students, therefore, helping the student
meet the needs of the health care community.

Stop by and see
Marlene Lawson

for all your life and
health insurance needs!

(606)
256-2050

Visit us on the Internet at https://www.kyfb.com/rockcastle/insurance/


